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Nancy Patton, Asst. Executive Director Keith B. Petersen

Commission on State Mandates SixTen and Associates

980 Ninth Street, Suite 300 5252 Balboa Avenue, Suite 807

Sacramento, CA 95814 . San Diego, CA 92117

Re:  Incorrect Reduction Claim
Collective Bargaining, 05-4425-1-11
Gavilan Joint Community College District, Claimant
Statutes 1975, Chapter 961
Fiscal Years 1995-96

Dear Ms. Patton and Mr., Petersen:

This letter is in response to the above-entitled Incorrect Reduction Claim. The subject
claims were reduced because some of the activities were not reimbursable and a lack of
sufficient documentation. The reductions were appropriate and in accordance with law.

The Controller’s Office is empowered to audit claims for mandated costs and to reduce
those that are “excessive or unreasonable.”’ This power has been affirmed in recent
cases, such as the Incorrect Reductions Claims (IRCs) for the Graduation Requirements
mandate.” If the claimant disputes the adjustments made by the Controller pursuant to
that power, the burden is upon them to demonstrate that they are entitled to the full
amount of the claim. This principle likewise has been upheld in the Graduation
Requirements line of IRCs.” In this case, the Claimant has not come forward with
sufficient source documentation or other reliable information to support all of the costs
claimed. The Claimant asserts that a mere lack of documentation is an insufficient basis

! See Government Code section 17561, subdivisions (d}(1)(C) and (d)(2), and section 17564.

? See for example, the Statement of Decision in the Incorrect Reduction Claim of San Diego Unified School District
[No. CSM 4435-1-01 and 4435-1-37], adopted Septernber 28, 2000, at page 9.

? See for example, the Statement of Decision in the Incorrect Reduction Claim of San Diego Unified School District
[No. CSM 4435-1-01 and 4435-1-37], adopted September 28, 2000, at page 16,
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to reduce a claim; there must be a finding that the claim is excessive or unreasonable.
This assertion misapprehends what the purpose of an audit is, and it also ignores the fact
that a claim that is unsupported by valid documentation is both excessive and
unreasonable. [Quote from Jim.] '

In addition, the Claimant sought reimbursement for activities that are outside of the scope
of reimbursable activities as defined in the Parameters & Guidelines. For example, the
Claimant sought reimbursement for salary costs for Dr. Glenn May, Superintendent, even
though Section E of the Parameters & Guidelines specifically states that “[tfhe costs for
salaries and expenses of the governing authority, for example, the School Superintendent
and Governing Board, are not reimbursable.”

Finally, the Claimant’s IRC was untimely, having been filed after time had expired
pursuant to Section 1183, Title 2 of the California Code of Regulations. Subdivision (b)
of that section provides that “all incorrect reduction claims shall be filed with the
commission no later than three years following the date of the Office of State Controller’s
final state audit report, letter, remittance advice or other written notice of adjustment
notifying the claimant of a reduction.” A letter/remittance advice was sent to the District
on July 30, 1998, notifying it that after review, the claim had been reduced by $184,842.
This resulted in an approved amount of $164,124. Pursuant to Section 1185, the time to
file a claim would have expired on July 30, 2001. The claim was not filed until
December 19, 2005, well after time had expired.

Even if we accept the Claimant’s implied argument that a subsequent letter from the
Controller’s Office dated July 10, 2002, started a new Statute of Limitations, the claim
was still time barred. Had the July 10, 2002 letter started running another Statute of
Limitations, that time period would have expired on July 10, 2005, five months before
this claim was actually filed. The Claimant cites no law for support of such proposition.
Had there been a substantial increase in the reduction of the claim, such an approach
might have some merit. However, in this case, the prior reduction was actually reduced,
increasing the approved amount by over $60,000, to $224,721.

Not satisfied with two bites at the apple, Claimant asserts that the period of the Statute of
Limitations “will be measured from the date of the last payment action ....” Again,
Claimant fails to cite to any law which would support such an approach. In fact, this
proposition is clearly at odds with the language of Section 1185. It is beyond doubt that
the Statute of Limitations has run, and this claim is untimely.
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Enclosed please find an analysis from our Division of Accounting and Reporting,
exhibits, and supporting documentation with declaration.

Sincerely,

Do 0. Ak

SHAWN D. SILVA
Staff Counsel

SDS/ac
Enclosure
cc:  Robert Miyashiro, Education Mandated Cost Network

Ginny Brummels, Div. of Acctg. & Rptg., State Controller’s Office (w/o encl.)
Jim Spano, Division of Audits, State Controller’s Office (w/o encl.)
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PROOF OF SERVICE

[ am employed in the County of Sacramento, State of California. At the time of service, [ was at least 18
years of age, a United States citizen employed in the county where the mailing occurred, and not a party to the
within action. My business address is 300 Capitol Mall, Suite 1850, Sacramento, CA 95814,

On March 22, 2010, I served the foregoing document entitled:

SC(O’S RESPONSE TO THE INCORRECT REDUCTION CLAIM FOR
GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICT, CSM 05-4425-1-11

on all interested parties in this action by placing a true and correct copy thereof enclosed in a sealed envelope,
addressed as follows:

Nancy Patton (original) Keith B. Petersen

Assistant Executive Director SixTen and Associates
Conunission on State Mandates 5252 Balboa Avenue, Suite 807
680 Ninth Street, Suite 300 San Diego, CA 92117

Sacramento, CA 95814

Robert Miyashiro

Education Mandated Cost Network
c/o School Services of California
1121 L Street, Suite 1060
Sacramento, CA 95814

[X] BY MAIL

I placed the envelope for collection and processing for mailing following this business’s ordinary practice with
which I am readily familiar. On the same day correspondence is placed for collection and mailing, it is deposited
in the ordinary course of business with the United States Postal Service.

[ ] BY PERSONAL SERVICE
1 caused to be delivered by hand to the above-listed addressees.

[ ] BY OVERNIGHT MAIL/COURIER
To expedite the delivery of the above-named document, said document was sent via overnight courier for next day
delivery to the above-listed party.

[ ] BY FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION
In addition to the manner of service indicated above, a copy was sent by facsimile transmission to the above-listed

party.
I declare that I am employed in the office of a member of the bar of this court at whose direction the
service was made. I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of California that the foregoing is true and

correct,

Executed on March 22, 2010, at Sacramento, California,

Ok & Como

Amber A. Camarena

Proof of Service - 1
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STATE QF CALIFORNIA ARNOLD SCHWARZEMEQGER, Governor

COMMISSION ON STATE MANDATES

980 MINTH STREET, SUITE 300
SAGRAMENTO, CA 95814
PHONE: (916) 323-3562

FAY: (B16) 445-0278

E-rnail: csniinfo@csm.ca.gov

March 9, 2006

M, Keith B. Petersen Ms. Ginny Brummels

SixTen and Associates Division of Accounting and Reporting
5252 Balboa Avenue, Suite 807 Qtate Controller’s Office

San Diego, CA 92117 3301 C Sireet, Suite 501

Sacramento, CA 95816

Re: Incorreet Reduction Claim
Collective Bargaining, 05-4425-1-11
Gavilan Joint Community College District, Claimant
Statutes 1975, Chapter 961
Fiscal Year 1995-1996

Dear My, Petersen and Ms. Brummels:

On December 19, 2005, the Gavilan Joint Community College District filed an incorrect
reduction claim (IRC) with the Commission on Stafe Mandates (Commission) based on the
Collective Bargaining program for fiscal year 1995-1996. On December 27, 2005, Commission
staff determined that the IRC was not timely filed. On December 30, 2005, the claimant -
appealed this decision, Based on the additional comments provided, Commission staff has
determined that the IRC filing is complete.

Government Code section 17551, subdivision (b), requires the Commission to hear and decide
upon claims filed by local agencies and school districts that the State Controller’s Office (SCO)
has incorrectly reduced payments i0 the local agencies or school districts.

SCO Review and Response. Please file the SCO response and supporting documentation
regarding this claim within 90 days of the date of this letter. Please include an explanation of the
reason(s) for the reductions and the computation of reimbursements. All documentary evidence
must be authenticated by declarations under penalty of perjury signed by persons who are
authorized and competent to do so and be based on the declarant’s personal knowledge,
information or belief. The Commission's regulations also require that the responses (opposition or
recommendation) filed with the Commission be simultaneously served on the claimants and their
designated representatives, and accompanied by a proof of service. (Cal. Code Regs., tit. 2,

§ 1185.01.)

The failure of the SCO to respond within this 90-day timeline shall not cause the Commission to
delay consideration of this IRC.

Claimant’s Rebuttal. Upon receipt of the SCO yesponse, the claimant and interested parties
may file rebuttals. The rebuttals are due 30 days from the service date of the response.

Prehearing Conference. A prehearing conference will be scheduled if requested.

i

3



Public Hearing and Staff Analysis. The public heating on this claim will be scheduled. after
the record closes. A staff analysis will be issued on the IRC at least eight weeks prior to the

- public hearing.
Dismissal of Incorreet Reduction Claims, Under section 1188.31 of the Commission’s
regulations, IRCs may be dismissed if postponed or placed on inactive status by the claimant for
more than one year, Prior to dismissing a claim, the Commission will provide 60 days notice
and opportunity for the claimant to be heard on the proposed dismissal.

Please contact Tina Poole at (916) 323-8220 if you have any questions.

Sincerely,
NANCY PATTON

Assistant Executive Director

Enclosure:  Incorrect Reduction Claim F iling - (SCO only)

<y oy Svlag

IWMANDATESMRC\2005\05-4425-1-1 Ncompleteltr.doc
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OFFICE OF THE STATE CONTROLLER
300 Capitol Mall, Suite 1850
Sacramento, CA 924250
Telephone No.: (916) 445-6854

BEFORE THE
COMMISSION ON STATE MANDATES

STATE OF CALIFORNIA

No.: CSM 05-4425-I-11
INCORRECT REDUCTION CLAIM ON:

Collective Bargaining
AFFIDAVIT OF CUSTODIAN

Education Code section 3540 et
seq

Statutes of 1975, Chapter %61

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE,

Claimant

T, Virginia Brummels, make the following declarations:

1) I am an employee of the State Controller’s Office and am over
the age of 18 years.

2) I am currently employed as an Accounting Administrator II,
and have been so for the past four vears. Before that I was
employed as a Staff Management Auditor for 16 years.

3) As a supervisor in the Department of Accounting & Reporting I
have access to, and am involved in, the intake and processing of

claimg for reimbursement for expenditures mandated by the state.

4) I am a duly authorized custodian of records or other
qualified witness with authority to certify such records.

Declaration of Virginia Brummels - 1
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5) BAny attached copies of records are true copies of records as
retained at our place of business.

4) The records were prepared or received by the personnel of our
office in the ordinary course of business at or near the time of
the act, condition, or event.

5) The records include claims for reimburgement, along with any
attached supporting documentation, remittance advices,
explanatory letters, or other documents relating to the above-
entitled Incorrect Reduction Claim.
6) A desk audit of this claim was commenced on July 30, 1998,
for fiscal year 199%5-96.

I do declare that the above declarations are made under
penalty of perjury and are true and correct to the best of my

knowledge, and that such knowledge is based on personal

observation, information, or belief.

Date: C{, L«Q%

OFFICE OF THE STATE CONTROLLER

By: l JAA r et ﬁw
Virginia Brummels

Section Manager
Local Reimbursements Section

Declaration of Virginia Brummels - 2







Coliective Bargaining
Gavilan Joint Community College
For Fiscal Year 1995-96
Analysis of Incorrect Reduction Claim

Prepared by Ginny Brummels
August 3, 2006

Exhibit 1:

Exhibit 2:

Exhibit 3:

Declaration of Virginia Brummels;

Analysis of the claim filed for fiscal year 1995-96 and a summary of the
differences; :

Includes a copy of the incorrect Reduction Claim (IRC) for the Collective
Bargaining Program for the Gavilan Joint Community College District;

These adjustments were made in accordance with Government Code
Section 17564 (c)(2), which states “...the Controller (2) may reduce any
claim which the Controller determines is excessive or unreascnable...”.

On November 25, 1996, Gavilan Joint Community College District filed an
actual claim of $348,966 for the state mandated Collective Bargaining
program for 1995-96. This claim was reduced by $124,245 for salaries
and benefits that were either not eligibie for reimbursement or not
supported by documentation to substantiate the charges, duplicate billing
for transportation and travel costs, and material and-supply costs that
were not substantiated. However, these disallowed costs were deducted
from future payments made to Gavilan Joint Community College District
so their balance owed to the State is zero,

Cost of Negotiations

The salary of Dr. Glenn Mayle, Superintendent, in the amount of
$2,813.01 was deemed by the State Controller's Office (SCO) Division of
Accounting and Reporting (DAR) staff, as activities not mandated or as
non-reimbursable components pursuant to the Parameters and Guidelines
(P's & G's), Section E., which states: "The costs for salaries and expenses
of the governing authority, for example, the School Superintendent and
Governing Board, are not reimbursable. These are costs of general
government as described by the federal guideline entitled “Cost Principles
and Procedures for Establishing Cost Allocation Plans and Indirect Cost
Rates for Grants and Contracts with the Federal Government.”

This claim contained $1,080.80 for mileage costs that were billed under
Transportation and Travel and also included in Contracted Services as
follows: Invoice #61413 contained charges for $602.55; invoice #61414

Tof2



Exhibit 4:
Exhibit 5:

Exhibit 6:

Exhibit 7:

contained charges for $248.85; invoice #61609 contained charges for
$229.40 for a total of $1,080.80.

No time sheets or detailed tasks were available for professional services
for March 1996 billed on invoice #60560 in the amount of $5,043.10. The
same for costs for analysis of accounts, computations and reports to
management billed on invoice #61609 for Thomas Brewer and Bonnie
Ruesch for $4,500 and $4,987.50 respectively and for mileage in the
amount of $229.40 for a total of $9,716.90.

Impasse Proceedings

Attorney fees were billed at 89.75 hours @$100 per hour for $8,975, of
that 16.5 hours were allowed for a total of $1,650.00 and $7,325.00 for
73.25 hours were disallowed due to a lack of supporting documentation. In
addition, the $38,845 billed for 457 hours @ $85 per hour was also
disallowed for the same reason.

Contract Administration

Contracted services for the Contract Administration component had
documentation to substantiate 459 hours @ $100 per hour for a total of
$45,900 instead of 89.5 hours @ $100 per hour for $6,950.00 as billed;
thereby adding $38,950 and consequently reducing the total amount

disallowed.
In addition, 143.5 hours billed @ $85 per hour for $12,197.50 was

disallowed for lack of documentation to substantiate the charges. Costs for
supplies were billed at $1,039.19, of that, $224.69 was disallowed for the

same reason.

Unfair Labor Practices

Contracted services for the Unfair Labor Practices component billed 644.5
hours @ $100 per hour for a total of $64,450 but had documentation for
only 217.5 hours for $21,750; 427 hours were not substantiated and were
therefore disallowed in the amount of $42,700. In addition, 390.5 hours
billed @ $85 per hour for a total of $33,192.50 and supplies for $5,029.71
were disallowed for the same reason.

Includes a copy of the reimbursement claim and supporting
documentation;

Includes a copy of the annual claiming instructions for Collective
Bargaining; '

Includes a copy of the Commission on State Mandates (COSM) Ps & Gs;

Copy of the SCO schedule of adjustments and copies of LRS database
screen-prints showing adjustments and payments made for these claims.

20f2



Gavilan Joint Community College District
Coliective Bargaining FY 1995-1996

Summary of Differences

Cost of Negotiations

HoursfAmount Hours/Amount %
Rate Billed Total Allowed Total Difference Difference Total
$66.58 4225 2,813.01 0 0 42,25 -2.813.01
1,080.80 1,080.80 0 0 1,080.80] -1,080.80
5,043.10 5,043.10 0 0 5,043.10f -5,043.10
$90.00 50 4,500.00 0 0 4,500.00 -4,500.00
$75.00 66.5 4,987.50 0 0 4,987.50 -4,987.50
2298.40 229.40 0 0 229.40 -229.40
-18,653.81
impasse Proceedings
Hours/Amount Hours/Amount $
Rate Billed Total Allowed Total Difference Difference Total
$66.58 75.5 5.026.79 0 0 75.5 -5,026.79
$100 89.75 8,975.00 16.5 $1,650.00 73.25 -7,325.00
$85 457 38,845.00 0 $0.00 457 -38,845.00
-51,196.79
Contract Administration
HoursfAmount HoursfAmount $
Rate Billed Total Allowed Total Difference Difference Total
$100 69.5 6,950.00 459 $45,900.00 389.5 38,950.00(
$85 143.5 12,197.50 4] $0.00 143.5 -12,197.50
1,039.19 1,039.19 814.50 814.50 224,69 -224.69
26,527.81
Unfair Labor Practices
Hours/Amount - Hours/Amount $
Rate Billed Total Allowed Total Difference Difference Tolal
$100 644.5 64,450.00 217.5 $21,750.00 427 -42,700.00
$85.00 390.56 33,192.50 0 0 3905 -33,192.50
5,029.71 5,029.71 0 0 5,029.71 -5,029.71
-80,922.21

-124,245.00

Disallowed amounts were deducted from paymnets to Gavilan Joint CCD so their balance owed is zero.
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Claim Prepared by:
Keith B. Petersen

'SixTen and Associates

5252 Balboa Avenue, Suite 807
San Diego, California 92117
Voice: (858) 514-8605

Fax: (858) 514-8645

/

/
BEFORE THE

COMMISSION ON STATE MANDATES
STATE OF CALIFORNIA

INCORRECT REDUCTION CLAIM OF:
No. CSM

Chapter 961, Statutes of 1975
GAVILAN JOINT

Community College District
, Annual Reim_bursernent Claims:

Claimant.

)

)

)

)

)

) Collective Bargaining
)

;

) Fiscal Year 1995-96
)

INCO'RRECT REDUCTION CLAIM FILING
PART I. AUTHORITY FOR THE CLAIM
The Commission on State Mandates has the authority pursuant to Government
Code Section 17551(d) to “. . . to hear and dgcide upon a claim by a local agency or
school district, filed on or after January 1, 1985, that the Controlier has incorrectly
reduced payments to the local agency or school district pursuant to paragraph (2) of
subdivision (d) of Section 17561.” Gavilan Joint Community College District (hereafter

"district” or “claimant”) is a school district as defined in Government Code Section

- 17519, Title 2, CCR, Section 1185 (a), requires the claimant to file an incorrect
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Incorrect Reduction Claim of Gavilan Joint Community College District
961/75 Collective Bargaining

reduction claim with the Commission.

This incorrect reduction claim is timely filed. Title 2, CCR, Section 1185 (b),
requires incorrect reduction claim§ to be filed no later than three years following the
date of the Controlier's remittance advice notifying the claimant of a reduction. In a
letter dated July 10, 2002, the Controller notified the District of its “resuits of review” of
the FY 1995-96 claim, adjusting the claim by the amount of $12_4,245 due to “no
supporting documentation.” The lettet stated $60,597 was due to the District, which
indicates there were to be subsequent payment actions, The period of limitations to file
the incorrect reduction claim will be measured from the date of the last payment action
made after this notification, which is known to the Controller. Title 2, CCR, Section
1185 (e) (5), requirés the claimant to provide a copy of a létter sent to the Controller
disputing the adjustment. In a letter dated August 5, 1998, the District notified the

Controller that the District was appealing the denial of the FY 1995-96 annual

reimbursement claim.

PART Il. STATEMENT OF THE CLAIM

The documentation available to the claimant indicates that the State Controller

adjudicated the claim for Fiscal Year 1995-96 as follows:

1 In a remittance advice dated January 24, 19986, the Controller paid $275,000 for
the FY 1995-96 estimate submitted as part of the FY 1994-95 annual

reimbursement claim.

2. On or about November 25, 1996, the District submitted its annual reimbursement
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Incorrect Reduction Claim of Gavilan Joint Community College District
961/75 Collective Bargaining

claim for FY 1995-86 actual costs in the amount of $348,0966.

3 In a remittance advice dated ‘Janu‘ary 36, 1997, the Controller paid $15,270 for
FY 1985-96 annual reimbursement claim. This increased the total amount paid
on the claim to $290,270. |

4, In a letter dated July 30, 1998, the Controller notified the District of its “results of

_review” of the FY 1995-96 claim, reducing the claim by the amount of $184,842
due to "no supporting documentation.” This resulted in an approved claim
amount of $164,124. The letter states $126,146 was due to the State.

5. Inaletter dated August 5, 1998, the District notified the Controlier that the

District was appealing the reduction of the FY 1995-96 annual reimbursement

claim.

- 6. In a remittance advice dated August 8, 2001, for the 1996-97 Open Meetings Act

annual reimbursement claim, the Controller offset the $487 due to the District on
the Open Meetings Act claim as a partial collection of the améunt due to the
state for the FY 1995-96 Collective Bargaining annual reimbursement claim.

7. In a remittance advice dated August 8, 2001, for the 1998-99 Open Meetings Act
annual reimbursement claim, the Controller offset $35 due to the District on the
Open Meetings Act claim as a partial collection of the amount due to the state for
the FY 1995-86 Collective Bargaining annual reimbursement claim.

8. In a letter dated July 10, 2002, the Controlier notified the District of its “results of

review” of the FY 1995-86 claim, reducing the claim by the amount of $124,245
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Incorrect Reduction Claim of Gavilan Joint Community College District '
8961/75 Collective Bargaining

due to “no supporting documetnation.” This letter states that there were “prior
- collections”™ iﬁ the amount of $126,146. This resulted in an approved claim

amount of $224,721. The ietter states $60,597 was now due to the District. The

letter states that "the balance due will be forthcoming when additional funds are

made available.” it cannot be ascertained from this letter why the amount

adjusted and amount approved changed, the source of the prior collections or

how the amount due was caiculated.

Therefore, the Con.troller has twice adjusted the claim, first in the amount of
$184,842 (July 30, 1998) and then later in the amount $124,245 (July 10, 2002). In
both cases, the only éxplanation provided was “no suppdrting documentation.” The

District has no record of any audit findings or any other explanation of the reason for

- the adjustments.

PART Ill. PREVIOUS INCORRECT REDUCTION CLAIMS
The District has not filed any previous incorrect reduction claims for this mandate
program annual reimbursement claim. The District is not aware of other incorrect

reduction claims having been adjudicated on the specific issues or subject matter

raised by this incorrect reduction claim.

PART IV. BASIS FOR REIMBURSEMENT

1. Mandate Legislation

Chapter 981, Statutes of 1975 (the “Rodda Act”) established Chapter 10.?,

Division 4, of Title 1 of the Government Code (commencing with Section 3540), and

4
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Incorrect Reduction Claim of Gavilan Joint Community College District
861/75 Collective Bargaining

repealed Article 5, Chapter 1, of Division 10 of the Education Code (the “Winton Act”).
The Rodda Act established the Public Employees Relaﬁons Board (PERB) and required
public school employers to meet and negotiate with their employees on matters of
wages, hours bf employment, and other terms and conditions of employment. The
provisions relating to the creation, certain duties of, and appropriations for the Public
Employment Relations Board were operative on January 1, 1976, The provisions
relating to employees’ organizational rights, the reﬁresentative rights of employee
organizations, the recognition of exclusive representaﬁves, and related procedures
were opérative on April 1, 19786.

Chapter 1213, Statutes of 1991, added Government Code section 3547;5, which
requires school districts to publicly disclose major provisions of a collective bargéining
agreement after negotiations but before the agreement becomes binding.

2. Test Claim

The State Board of Control, the predecessor agency with jurisdiction to the
Commission on State Mandates, at its meeting of July 17, 1978 determined the Rodda
Act constituted a reimbursable state mandate in that public school employees had a
new duty to meet and negofiate in good faith for binding contracts with employee group
representatives, duties which were not required by the Winton Act. Subsequent action
of the Board of Control recognized that compliance with the regulations of the Public
Employment Relations Board, to the extent that the regulations implement the

provisions of the Rodda Act and its subsequent amendments, is included within the
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incorrect Reduction Claim of Gavilan Joint Community College District
961/75 Collective Bargaining

scope of the mandate.

On December 29, 1997, the Commission on State Mandates determined that
Chapter 1213, Statutes of 1991, resulted in a new program or higher level of service by
requiring school districts to publicly disclose major provisions of a collective bargaining
agreemeht after negotiations before the agreement becomes binding.

3. Parameters and Guidelines

On October 22, 1980, the original parameters and guidelines were édopted.
Beginning on August 19, 1981 and through July 22, 1993, those parameters and
guidelines were amended seven times. On October 20, 1998, the parameters and
guidelines for Collective Bargaining Disclosure were adopted and consolidated with the
Collective Bargaining parameters and guidelines. The consolidated parameters and
guidelines were amended on January 27, 2000 and became effective on January 28,

2000. When the Districts's 1996-97 claim was prepared, the version of the parameters

~and guidelines effective on July 22, 1993 were applicable. A copy of those parameters

and guidelines are attached.

4. Claiming Instructions

The Controller has periodically issued or revised claiming instructions for the
Collective Bargaining claim. The statements of reimbursable components in the
claiming instructions, for the purposes and scope of this incorrect reduction claim, have
been consistent with the parameters and guidelines. A copy of the October 1986

revision of the claiming instructions is attached which was the version extant at the time
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Incorrect Reduction Claim of Gavilan Joint Community Colfége District
861/75 Collective Bargaining

the claim which is the subject of this Incorrect reduction claim was filed. However,
since the Controller's claim forms and instAructions have not been adopied as

regulations, they have no force of law, and, therefore, have no effect on the outcome of

this incorrect reduction claim.

PART V. STATEMENT OF THE ISSUES

1. The documentation standard was not noficed

The District reported its actual reimbursable costs in the manner required by the
parameters and guidelines, and in the form requested by the Controller's claiming

instructions. The Controller has nof specified how the claim documentation was

- insufficient for purposes of adjudicating the claim. Both adjustment letters of July 30,

1998 and July 10, 2002 merely state that the District’s claim had “no supporting

- documentation.” The Controller's explanation of “no supporting documentation” does

not appear in the applicable state code sections, the parameters and guidelines or the
Controller’s claiming instructions. By providing no notice for the basis of its actions, the

Controller is creating a standard of general application without the benefit of law or due

process of rulemaking.

2. No audit was conducted

The adjustment made by the State Controller to the anhual reimbursement claim
is procedurally incorrect in that the Controller did not audit fhe records of the district as
required by Government Code Section 17561(d)(2) to verify the actual amount of the

mandated costs prior to making a determination that amounts adjusted are excessive or '-
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incorrect Reduction Claim of Gavilan Joint Community College District
961/75 Collective Bargaining

unreasonabie.

3. The reason for adjustment was confrary to statute

None of the adjustments were made because the costs claimed were excessive
or unreasonable. The Controller does not assert that the claimed costs were excessive
or unreasonable, which is the only mandated cost audit standard in statute
(Government Code Section 17561(d)(2)). It would therefore appear that the entire
findings are based upon the wrong standard for review. If the Controller wishes to
enforce other audit standards for mandated cost reimbursement, the Contrbﬂer should
comply with the Administrative Procedure Act.

PART VI. RELIEF REQUESTED

The District filed its annual reimbursement claims within the time lirhits
prescribed by the Government Code. The amounts claimed by the District for
reimbursement of the éosts of implementing the program imposed by Chapter 961,
Statutes of 1975 (the “Rodda Act"), and Chapter 10.7, Division 4, of Title 1 of the
Government Code {commencing with Section 3540), represent the actual costs incurred
by the District to carry out this program. These costs were properiy claimed pursuant to
the Commission’s parameters and guidelines. Reimbursement of these costs is
required under Article XHiIB, Section 6 of the California Constitution. The Controller
denied reimbursement without any basis in Iaw-orfaét. The District has met its burden
of going forward on this claim by complying with the requirements of Section 1185, Title

2, California Code of Regulations. Because the Controller has enforced and is seeking
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to enforce these adjustments without benefit of statute or regulation, the burden of
proof is now upon the Controller to establish a legal basis for its actions.

The District requests that the Commission make findings of fact and law on each
and évery adjustment made by the Controller and each and every procedural and
jurisdictional issue raised in this claim, and order the Controller to correct its payment
pursuant to the findings of the Commission. |
/

/
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PART VIl. CERTIFICATION
By my signature below, | hereby declare, pnderthe penalty of perjury under the
taws of the State of California, that the information in this incorrect reduction claim
submission is true and complete to the best of my own knowledge or information or
belief, and that the attached documents are true and correct copies of docﬁments.
received from or sent by the state agency which originated the document.

Executed on December _/3”, 2005, at Gilroy, California, by

TOJEPA D Jae ~——

Joseph D. Keeler, Vice-President Administrative Services
Gavilan Joint Community Coliege District

5055 Santa Teresa Bivd.

Gilroy, CA 85020-9599

Voice: 408-848-4715
Fax: 408-848-4994
. E-Mail: jkeeler@gavitan.cc.ca.us

APPOINTMENT OF REPRESENTATIVE

Gavilan Joint Community College District appoints Keith B. Petersen, SixTen and
Associates, as its representative for this incorrect reduction claim.

CSorEpa D s (/)5 /+3”
Joseph D. Keeler, Vice-President Date
Gavilan Joint Community College District
Attachments:
Exhibit “A” Controller's Remittance Advices and Letters
Exhibit “B” Claimant's Letter dated August 5, 1998
Exhibit “C” Parameters and Guidelines as amended July 22, 1993
Exhibit “D” Controller's Claiming Instructions October 1696

10



State of California SR

COMMISSION ON STATE MANDATES FotOfidialitige-Grily
980 Ninth Street, Suite 300
Sacramento, CA 95814 . joraliE T
(916) 323-3562 o 13 2005

- oomztzE COMMISSION ON
JCORRECT REDUCTION CLAIM FORM | STATE MANDATES
‘ Claim No.
Local Agency or School District Submitting Claim
GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICT
Contact Person Telephone Number
Keith B. Petersen, President Voice: 858-514-8605
SixTen and Associates ' Fax: 858-514-8645
5252 Balboa Avenue, Suite 807 E-mail: Kbpsixten@aol.com
San Diego, CA 92117
Address
Joseph D. Keeler, Vice-President Administrative Services
Gavilan Community College District
5055 Santa Teresa Blvd.
Gilroy, CA 95020-9598
Representative Organization to be Notified Telephone Number
Robert Miyashiro, Consultant, Education Mandated Cost Network ~ Voice: 916-446-7517
¢/o School Services of California Fax; 916-446-2011
1121 L Street, Suite 1060 E-mail: robertm@SSCal.com

Sagramento, CA 95814

This claim alleges an incorrect reduction of a reimbursement claim filed with the State Controfler's Office pursuant fo section 17561 of the
Government Code. This incorrect reduclion ¢laim is filed pursuant to section 175661(b} of the Government Code.

CLAIM IDENTIFICATION: Specify Statute or Executive Order

Coliective Bargaining Chapter 961, Statutes of 19756
Fiscal Year Amount of the Incorrect Reduction
1995-96 $124,245

IMPORTANT: PLEASE SEE INSTRUCTIONS AND FILING REQUIREMENTS FOR COMPLETING AN
INCORRECT REDUCTION CLAIM ON THE REVERSE SIDE.

Name and Title of Authorized Representative Telephone No.

Joseph D. Keeler, Vice-President Administrative Services Voice: 408-848-4715
Fax:  408-848-4094

E-Mail; jkeeler@gavilan.cc.ca.us

Signature of Authorized Representative Date

R B December /S, 2005
\;Qs:‘p,é\ D [<hal—
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SixTen and Associates
Mandate Reimbursement Services
KEITH B. PETERSEN, MPA, 1D, President Talephone. (858) 514-8605
5252 Balboa Avenue, Suite 807 Fax: (858) £14-8645
San Diego, CA 92117 E-Mail; Kbpsixten@aol.com

December 30, 2005

FAX TO 916-445-0278 S
HELEED
Paula Higashi, Executive Director : N
Ccommission on State Mandates i JAE G2 B
U.8. Bank Plaza Building . .
j ) GCOMMISSIO
980 Ninth Street, Suite 300 | STATE RO, |

Sacramerito, California 95614

RE: Incorrect Reduction Glaim of Gavilan Joint CCD
Collective Bargaining
Fiscal Year 1995-96

Dear Ms. Higashi:

| have received today the letter dated December 27, 2008, signed by Cathy Cruz on
your behalf, in which, in your capacity as Executive Diractor, you reject the incorrect
reduction claim referenced above, to which 1 respond on behalf of the Gavilan Joint
Community Coltege District.

The commission staff has concluded that the claim was not timely filed, pursuant to
Title 2, CCR, Section 1185 (b). The claimant is appealing your decision pursuant {0 -
Section 1181. This appaal is timely filed within ten days of receipt of notification. This
appeal is being faxed to the Commission on the date indicated and will be served by
mail when | receive a copy of the mailing list referenced in Victaria Sorianag’s
Dacember 27, 2005 declaration of service by mail.

The decisian to reject the claim is contrary o your executive authority. The incorrect
reduction claim presents several issues of first impression which require findings of fact
and law before there can ba a conclusion that the claim was not timely filed.

Government Code Section 17553, subdivision (d), requires the Commission to
determine within tan days of receipt whether an incarrect reduction claim is “complete.”
Your action wag not a dstermination of ‘completeness,” rather it was a conclusion of
law concerning subject matter jurisdiction for which there is no basis in Section 17553.
The Gavernment Code does riot allow the Executive Director to adjudicate questions of
law and fact. Nor does the Government Code provide a statute of limitation for the
filing an incorrect reduction claim.

The commission action relies upon Title 2, CCR, Section 11 85 (b) to assert as a matter
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paula Higashi, Executive Birector December 30, 2006

of law that the incorrect reduction claim was filed more than three years following @
Controller's notice of reduction. To the contrary, the incorrect reduction claim assens
as a matter of fact that the Controller's July 10, 2002 letter reparts an amount payable
tt the claimant, which means a subsequent final payment action notice occurred or is
pending from which the uitimate regulatory period of limitation s to be measured, which

the claimant has so alleged,

The evidence regarding the date of iast payment action, notice, of remittance advice, is
in the possession of the Controlier, While it would be convenient for the claimant to
have all of this documentation available, it is not a prerequisite for the claim. The
Gommission can obtain this information from the Controller without prejudice to the
tolling of the regulatory periad of limitation, while the claimant would be subject to the
convenience of the Contraller's response while the regulatory period was running.

Therefore, there are several issues to be determinad by the hearing process, which the
Executive Director cannot unitaterally determine:

1. What Controller documents constitute "notice’ from which a regulatary period of
limitation can be measured?

2. What is the claimant’s burden in going farward with an incorrect reduction claim
regarding documentation originated and maintained by the Controller?

3. What is the authority of the Executive Director to unilaterally deny a claimant’s
statutory right to the incorrect reduction claim due process?

This letter also transmits the original and one copy of the incorrect reduction ¢laim you
returned with the letter of Dacember 27, 2005.

CERTIFICATION

| hereby declare, under penaity of perjury under the laws of the State of Califbrnia, that
the information in this document is true and correct to the best of my own knowledge or
information or belief.

Sinceraly,
Kaith B. Petersen

Copies without enclosures: Per COSM Distribution List

2
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Incorrect Reduction Claim of Gavilan Joint CCD

RE:
Collettive Bargaining
Fiscal Year 1995-06

| declare:

| am employed in the offi
appointed representative

ce of SixTen and Associates, which Is the
of the above named claimant. | am 18 years of

age or older and nota party to the entitled matter. My business address is

52562 Balboa Avenue,

On the date indicated below,
December 27, 2005 letter signed by

Suite 807, San Diego, CA 92117.

| served the attached response to the
Cathy Ctuz, Program Analyst,

Commission on State Mandates draft staff analysis to:

Paula Higashi, Executive Director
Commission on State Mandates
980 Ninth Street, Suite 300
Sacramento, CA 85814
016-445-0278

L

| declare under penalty of perjury under the |
foregoing is true and correct and that this decl

Us. MAIL: | am familiar with the
business practice st SixTen and
Associates for the collection and
processing of comespondence for mailing
with the United States Postal Service. In
socordance with that practice,
carrespondence placed in the intemai
it colloction nystem at SixTen and
Associates is deposited with the United
States Postal Service that same day in
the ordinary course of business.

OTHER SERVICE: | caused such
envelope(s) to be delivered to the office
of the addressee(s) listed above by:

{Doscribe)

2005, at San Diego, California,

X

FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION: On the
date below from facsimile machine
numbec (858) 514-8845, | personally
transmitted to the above-named
person(s) to the facsimile number(s)
shown above, pursusni to California
Rules of Court 2003-2008. A true capy of
the above-described documont(s)
was(were) transmitted by facsimile
transmission and the transmission was
reported as complete and without errar,

A copy of the transmission report issued
by the transmitting machine is attached o
this proof of service.

PERSONAL SERVICE: By causing a true
copy of the above-describad document(s)
to be hand detivered to the office(s) of the
addressea(s).

aws of the State of Galifornia that the
ration was executed on Decamber 30,
T

/ N O Py

Wil C. Trimm

PAGE 83
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Subj: Gavllan Incorrect
Date: 12/30£2005 2.05:54 PM Paclfic Standard Time

From: Kbpsixen
To: paula higashi@gsmm.ca.qoy, nancy.patton@cesm.ca.9ov

| received your 12/27 rejection of the Gavlian incorrect, | am going to appeal. However, i need the mailing list
which was referenced in the declaration of service. Please fax or amail it to me.

Thanks
Kaith

BIxTen and Associates

5252 Balboa Avenue, Suite 807
San Diego, 92117 :
Volca: 868-814-B605

Fax: 858-514-8645

Friday, December 30, 2005 America Online: Kbpsixten
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Subj: RE: Gavilan Incorrect A
Date: 1/3/2006 11:11:44 AM Pacific Standard Time

From: paula higashi@csm.ca.gov
To! Kbpsixten@aol.com

ur Chii

Happy New Year Keith! Thanks for yo

Re Gavilan — No oneT§on the mailing list.

I'd fike to talk with you about “mandate reform® within next two weeks if possible. Let me know where and when
it is ok to call you.

Paula Higashi, Executive Director
Commiasion on State Mandates
080 9" Street, Suite 300
Sacramento, CA 95814

(916) 323-8210

From: Kbpsixten@aol.com [mailto:Kbpsixten@acl.com]
Sent: Friday, December 30, 2005 2:06 PM

Tae: Paula Higashi; Nancy Patton

Subject: Gavilan Incorrect

| received your 12/27 rejection of the Gavilan incorrect. | am geing to appeal. However, | need the mailing list
which was referenoed in the declaration of govice. Ploass fex or email it ta me.

Thanks
Keith

SixTen and Associates

5252 Balboa Avenue, Suite 807
San Diego, 92117

Voloe; B58-514-8605

Fax: 858-514-8845

Tuesday, January 03, 2006 America Online: Kbpsixten



SixTen and Associates
Mandate Reimbursement Services

.£ITH B. PETERSEN, MPA, JD, President Telephone: (858) 6514-8605
5252 Balboa Avenue, Suite 807 Fax: (858) 514-8645
San Diego, CA 92117 E-Mail: Kbpsixten@aol.com

December 16, 2005

| RECEIVED
Paula Higashi, Executive Director -
Commission on State Mandates DEC 14 2005
980 Ninth Street, Suite 300 COMM
Sacramento, CA 95814 | STATE ﬁgﬂ%ﬁ%\é

RE: Incorrect Reduction Claim ,
Chapter 961, Statutes of 1975
Collective Bargaining
Fiscal Year 1995-96

Dear Ms. Higashi:

Enclosed is the original and two copies of the above referenced incorrect reduction
claim for Gavilan Joint Community College District.

SixTen and Associates has been appointed by the District as its representative for this
matter and all interested parties should direct their inquiries to me, with a copy as
follows: :

Joseph D. Keeler, Vice-President Administrative Services
Gavilan Joint Community College District

5055 Santa Teresa Blvd.

Gilroy, CA 95020-9599

Thank-you.

Sincerely,

LElz=_

Keith B. Petersen
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KEITH B. PETERSEN, MPA, JD, President
5252 Balboa Avanue, Sulte 807
San Diego, CA 92117

Talephona: (858) 514-8605
Fax: (858) 514-8645
E-Mail; Kbpsixten@aol.corm

December 30, 2005

FAX TO 916-445-0278 PO
AL e ED

paula Higashi, Executive Director :

Commission on State Mandates i

U.8. Bank Piaza Building Lo

980 Ninth Street, Suite 300 | A IESION ON

Sacramento, California 95814 - ATES !

LR e g, Low
LEEYR BTN );fs} :

RE: Incorrect Reduction Glaim of Gavilan Joint CCD
Collective Bargaining
Fiscal Year 1995-96

Dear Ms. Higashi:

| have received today the letter dated Dacember 27, 2005, signed by Cathy Cruz on
your behalf, in which, in your capacity as Execuitive Director, you reject the incorrect
reduction claim referenced above, to which | respond on hehalf of the Gavilan Joint

Community Coltege District.

The commission staff has concluded that the claim was not timely filed, pursuant to
Title 2, CCR, Section 1185 (b). The claimant is appealing your decision pursuant to -
Saction 1181. This appeal is timely filed within ten days of receipt of notification. This
appeal is being faxed to the Commission on the date indicated and will be served by
mail when | recelve a copy of the mailing list referenced in Victaria Soriana's
December 27, 2005 declaration of service by mail.

The decision to reject the claim is contrary to your exacutive authority. The incorrect
reduction claim presents several issues of first impression which require findings of fact
and law before thare can be a conclusion that the claim was not timely filed.

Government Code Section 17553, subdivision (d), requires the Commission to
determine within ten days of receipt whether an incorrect reduction claim is “complete.”
Your action was not a determination of “completeness,” rather it was a conclusion of
law concerning subject matter jurisdiction for which there is no basis in Section 175653.
The Government Code does not allow the Executive Director to adjudicate questions of
law and fact. Nar doas the Government Cade provide a statute of limitation for the
filing an incorrect reduction claim.

The commission action relies upon Title 2, CCR, Section 1185 (b) to assert as a matter



El_l'/QB/QBBS B2:59 B858h148645 SIXTEN AND ASSOCIATS PAGE B2

paula Higashi, Executive Director Dagember 30, 2005

of law that the incorrect reduction claim was filed more than three years following &
Controlier's notice of reduction. To 1ha conteary, the incorrect reduction claim asgens
as a matter of fact that the Controller's July 10, 2002 Jetter reports an amount payable
to the claimant, which means a subsequent final payment action notice occurrad or is
pending from which the ultimate regulatory pariod of limitation is to be measured, which

the claimant has so alleged.

The evidencs regarding the date of last payment action, notice, or ramittance advice, is
in the possession of the Controller. While it would be convenient for the claimant to
have all of this documentation available, it is not & preraquisite for the claim. The
Commission can obtain this information from the Controller without prejudice to the
tolling of the regulatory periad of limitation, while the claimant would be subject to the
convenience of the Controller's response while the regulatory period was running.

Therefore, there are several issues to be determined by the hearing procass, which the
Executive Director cannot unilaterally determine:

1. What Controller documents constitute "motice” from which a regulatory period of
limitation can be measured?

2. What ia the claimant's burden in going forward with an incorrect reduction claim
regarding documentation originated and maintained by tha Controller?

3. what is the authority of the Executive Diractor to unilaterally deny a claimant's
statutory right to the incorrect reduction claim due process?

This latter also fransmits the original and one copy of the incorrect reduction claim you
 returned with the letter of Decembeér 27, 2005.

CERTIFICATION

| hereby declare, undsr penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of California, that
the information in this document is true and correct to the best of my own knowledge or

information or belief.
Sinceraly,
Kaith B. Petersen

Copies without enclosures: Per COSM Distribution List
2
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| am employed in the
appointed representative

8585148645

SIXTEN AND ASSOCIATS

EC TION.OF SERVIC

Collective Bargaining
Fiscal Year 1985-96

| declare:

RE: Incorrect Reduction Claim of Gavilan Joint CCD

office of SixTen and Associates, which is the
of the above named claimant. | am 18 years of

age or older and not a party to ihe entitled matter. My business address is

5252 Balboa Avenue,

Suite 807, San Diego, CA @2117.

On the date indicated below, | served the attached response to the
December 27, 2005 letter signed by Cathy Cruz, Program Analyst,
Commission on State Mandates draft staff analysis to:

Paula Higashi, Executive Director
Coramission on State Mandates
980 Ninth Street, Suite 300
Sacramento, CA 95814
916-445-0278

a

| declars under penalty of perjury under the |

U.8. MAIL: | am famillar with the
pusiness practice at SixTen and
Associates for the collection and
procassing of carrespondence for mailing

with the United States Postal Service. In

accordance with that practice,
correspondence placed in the internal
mail collection system at SixTen and
Assoclates is deposited with the Unfted
States Postal Service that same day in
the ordinary course of business.

OTHER SERVIGE: | caused such
snvelopa(s) to ha delivered to the office
of the addressea(s) listed above by:

{Dascribe)

2005, at San Diego, California.

X

FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION: On the
date below from facsimile machine
number (858) 514-8645, | personally
fransmitted to the ahove-named
person(s) to the facsimile number(s)
shawn above, pursuant 1 California
Rules of Court 2003-2008. A true copy of
the above-described document(s)
was(were) transmitted by facsimile
transmission and the transmission was
reported as complete and without errar.

A copy of the trans'misslon report issued
by the transmitting machine is attached fo
this progf of service.

PERSONAL SERVICE: By causing atrue
copy of the above-described document(s)
1o be hand delivered to the office(s) of the
atidressea(s).

aws of the State of California that the

foregoing is true and correct and that this dezrfation was executed on December 30,

L

/ S Yol M

Will C. Trimm

PAGE. @3
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Subj: Gavilan Incorrect
Date: 12/30/2005 2:05:54 PM Pacific Standard Time

From: Kbgsixten
To: . paulg bigashi@csm,ca.goy, nancy patton@esm.ca.gow

sction of the Gavlian Incorrect, | am going to appeal. However, | noed the malling list

| roceived your 12/27 rej
he declaration of service. Ploase fax or email It to me.

which was referenced in ¢
Thanks

Keith

BixTen and Associates

5252 Balboa Avemie, Suite 807

8an Diego, 92117
Volca: 8568-514-B805
Fayx: 858-514-8645

Friday, December 30, 2005 America Online: Kbpsixten
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Subj: RE: Gavilan Ihcomect

Date: 17312006 11:11:44 AM Pacific Standard Time
From: paula higashi@gcsm.ca.gov

To! Khpsixtien@aol.com

Happy New Year Keith! Thanks for your Chul

Re Gavilan — No one§an the mailing list.

I'd Tike to talk with you about *mandate refarm” wihin next two weeks if possible. Let me know where and when
it is ok to call you.

Paula Higashi, Executive Director
Commission on State Mandates
980 9t Street, Suite 300
Sacraments, CA 95814

(916) 323-8210

From: Kbpsbden@aol.com [mailto:Kbpsixten@aot.com]
Sent: Friday, December 30, 2005 2:06 PM

Yo: Pauta Higashi; Nancy Patton

Subject: Gavilan Incorrect

I raceived your 12/27 rejeciion of the Gavijan incamrect. | am going to appeal. However, | naed the malling list
which was referenced in the declaration of service, Pleass fax or aemail itto me.

Thank
Keith

SixTen and Assoclates

5252 Balboa Avenue, Suite BO7
San Diego, 92117

Volce; 858-514-8605

Fax: 8568-514-8645

‘Tuesday, January 03, 2006 America Online; Kbpsixten



SixTen and Associates
~Mandate Reimbursement Services

ATH B. PETERSEN, MPA, JD, President
5252 Balboa Avenue, Suite 807
San Diego, CA 92117

December 16, 2005

Paula Higashi, Executive Director
Commission on State Mandates
980 Ninth Street, Suite 300
Sacramento, CA 95814

RE: Incorrect Reduction Claim
Chapter 961, Statutes of 1975
Collective Bargaining
Fiscal Year 1995-96

Dear Ms. Higashi:

Telephone: (858) 514-8605
Fax: (858) 514-8645
E-Mall; Kbpsixten@ aol.com

TRECEWES )

DEC 19 2005

COMMISSION
bIéTE M&{@A%s

Enclosed is the original and two copies of the above referenced incorrect reduction

¢laim for Gavilan Joint Community College District.

SixTen and Associates has besn appointed by the District as its representative for this
matter and all interested parties should direct their inquiries to me, with a copy as

follows:

Joseph D. Keeler, Vice-President Administrative Services

Gavilan Joint Community College District
5055 Santa Teresa Blvd.

Gilroy, CA 95020-9599

Thank-you.

Sincerely,

L8 lr=_

Keith B. Petersen
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GAVILAN
COLLEGE

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILHOY, GA 95020
408 B47-1400

Jeff Yee

Manager

Local Reimbursements Section
P.0O.Box 942850

Sacremento, CA 94250-5875

August 5, 1998
Re: Your letter dated July 30, 1998

This is to notify you that Gavilan College is appealing your denial of Mandated Costs
Claim for FY 1995/96. Gavilan College has all supporting documentation to validate our
] claim for $348,842. It is possible you need additional information to validate our claim.
{ Please provide me with a listing of the areas where you do not have adequate support {0

verify this claim.

Until Gavilan College is satisfied that you have all documentation in support of our claim
we 50 not intend to make a reimbursement payment to you. You may contact me at (408)

848-4715 if need to discuss this matter further.

Sincerely,

S it

Steven M. Kinsella
Dean of Business Services

=,

DAR. ROSE MARIE JOYCE

BOARD OF TRUSTEES MA. BOR BOUCHARG CMDR. GEORIGE CHARPION RS, JEAN OTTHAR
SUPERINTENDENT-PRESIDENT

A HERDERT PECKHAM  LAURAA PEARY, ESD ELVIRA ZARAGOZA ROBINSON, E5Q. TIMC.)TEO L. VASQUEZ
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s ,;,“.'{E OF CALFORNIA : "PETE WILSON, Governor

COMMISSION ON STATE MANDATES
1414 K Street, Suite 315

{ RAMENTO, CA 95814

' 3233562

July 23, 1993

Mr. Keith B. Petersen
Legislative Financial Specialist
San. Diego Unified School District
4100 Normal Street

San Diego, California 92103-2682

Re: Request to Amend Parameters and Guidelines
Chapter 961, Statutes of 1975
Collective Bargaining

Dear Mr. Petersen:

Your proposal to amend the parameters and guidelines for

Chapter 961, Statutes of 1975, Collective Bargaining, was
approved by the Commission on State Mandates at its hearing of
July 22, 1993. Attached for your review is a.copy of the amended

parameters and guidelines.

If you have any guestions or- concerns, please feel free to
contact me.

Sincerely,

Assistant Executive Director

SRL: :G:\SRL\CH961.AMD

Enclosure: Amended Parameters and Guidelines
cciw/encl: Mr. Jim Apps, Departmént of‘Finance

Mr. John Korach, State Controller’s Office
Ms. carol Miller, Education Mandated Cost Network
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Adopted: October 22, 1980

amendments Adopted: 8/19/81

(Amendments applicable only to claims for costs incurred
after June 30, 1881)

Amended: 3/17/83

‘Amended: 9/29/83

Amended: 12/15/83

‘Amended: 6/27/85

Amended: 10/20/88
Amended: 7/22/93
G:\PG\CH961.75

PARAMETERS AND GUIDELINES
Chapter 961, Statutes of 1975

Collective Bargaining

An act to repeal Article 5 (commencing with Section 13080) of
Chapter 1 of Division 10 of the Education Code, and to add
Chapter 10.7 (commencing with Section 3540) to Division 4 of

Title 1 of the Government Code, relating to public educational

employment relations, and making an appropriation. This bill,
which was operative July 1, 1976, repealed the Winton aAct and
enacted provisions to meet and negotiate, thereby creating a
collective bargaining atmosphere for public school employers.

A. Operative Date of Mandate

The provisions relating to the creation, certain duties of,
and appropriations for the Public Employment Relations Board
were operative on January 1, 1976. The provisions relatin
to the organizational rights of employees, the -
representational rights of employee organizations, the
recognition of exclusive representatives, and related
procedures were. operative on April 1, 1976. The balance of
the added provisions were operative on July 1, 1976.

B. Period of Claim

Only costs incurred after January 1, 1978, may be clainmed,
The initial claim should have included all costs incurred
for that portion of the fiscal year from January 1, 1878, to
June 30, 19878.

Pursuant to language included in the 1980-81 budget, claims
shall no longer be accepted for this period. All subseqgquent
fiscal year claims should be filed with the State
Controller’s Office for processing.

C. Mandated Cost

Public school employers have incurred costs by complying
with the requirements of Section 3540 through 3549.1
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established by Chapter 961, Statutes of 1975. In addition,
some costs have been incurred as a result of compliance with
regulations promulgated by the Public Employment Relations
Board (PERB). Since these-activity costs (referred to
collectively as "Rodda Act" activities and costs in this
document) , in many respects, simply implement the original
legislation, it is intended that these parameters and
guidelines have embodied those regulations or actions taken
by PERB prior to December 31, 1978.

D. County Superintendent of Schools Filing
If the County Superintendent of Schools files a claim on
behalf of more than one school district, the costs of the
individual school district must be shown separately.

E. Governing Authority
The costs for salaries and expenses of the governing
authority, for example the School Superintendent and
Governing Board, are not reimbursable. These are costs of
general government as described by the federal guideline
entitled "Cost Principles and Procedures for Establishing
Cost Allocation Plans and Indirect Cost Rates for Grants
and Contracts with the Federal Government," OASC-10.

F. Certification
The following certification must accompany all claims:
I DO HEREBY CERTIFY:

THAT Section 1080 to 1096, inclusive, of the Government
Code and other applicable provisions of the law have been
complied with; and
THAT I am the person authorized by the local agency to

file claim for funds with the State of California.

Signature of Authorized Representative Date

- Title

Telep

heone Number
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Claim Components (Reimbursable Costs)

“Reimbursable activities mandated by Chapter 961, Statutes of

18975 are grouped into six components, Gi through G6. 'The
cost of activities grouped in components G1, G2, and G3 are
subject to offset by the historic cost of similar Winton Act
activities as described in H2.

1.

Determination of appropriate bargaining units for

representation and determination of the exclusive

representation and determination of the exclusive

representativeés.

a‘

Unit Determination: Explain the process for

determining the composition of the certificated
employee council under the Winton Act, and the
process for determining appropriate bargaining
units including the determination of management,
supervisory and confidential employees, under

" Chapter 961, Statutes of 1975, if such activities

were performed during the fiscal year being
claimed.

Determination of the Exclusive Representative:

Costs may include receipt and posting of the
representation and decertification notices and, if
necessary, adjudication of such matters before the
PERB. :

Show the actual increased costs including salaries
and benefits for employer representatives and/or
necessary costs for contracted services for the
following functions:

(1) Development of proposed lists for unit
determination hearings if done during the
fiscal year being claimed. Salaries and
benefits must be shown as described in Item
H3,

(2) Representation of the public school employer
at PERB hearings to determine bargaining
units and the exclusive representative.
Actual preparation time will be reimbursed.
Salaries and benefits must be shown as
described in Item H3.

(3) If contracted services are used for either
(a) or (b) above, contract invoices must be
submitted with the claim. Contract costs
must be shown as described in Item HS.
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(4) Indicate the cost of substitutes for release
time for employer and exclusive bargaining
unit withesses who testify at PERB hearings.
The job classification of the witnesses and
the date they were absent must also be
submitted. Release time for employee
witnesses asked to attend the PERB hearing by
bargaining units will not be reimbursed.

(5) 1Identify the travel costs for employer
representatives to any PERB hearing. -
Reimbursement shall reflect the rate
specified by the regulations governing
employees of the local public school
employer,

(6) Cost of preparation for one transcript per
PERB hearing will be reimbursed.

Elections and decertification elections of unit
representatives are reimbursable_in the event the
Pupblic Employment Relations Board determines that a
guestion of representation exists and orders an
election held by secret ballot.

a. Submit with your claim any Public Employment
Relations Board agreements or orders which state
how the election must be held.

b. If a precinct voting list was required by PERB,
indicate the cost of its development. Salaries
and benefits must be shown as described in Item

H3.

c. The salary and benefits of a school employer
representative, if required by PERB for time spent
observing the counting of ballots, will be
reimbursed. The representatives’ sdlary must be
shown as described in Item H3.

Negotiations: Reimbursable functions include --
receipt of exclusive representative’s initial contract
proposal, holdinag of public_hearings, providing a
reasonable number of copies o the emplover’s proposed
contract to the public, development and presentation of
the initial district contract proposail, negotiation of
the contract, reproduction and distribution of the

final contract agreement.

a. Show the costs of salaries and benefits for
employer representatives participating in
negotiations. Contracted services will be
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reimbursed. Costs for maximum of five publ ic
school employer representatives per unit, per
negotiation session will be reimbursed. Salaries
and benefits must be shown as described on Page 7,
Item H3.

Show the costs of salaries and benefits for
employer representatives and employees
participating in negotiation planning sessions.
Contracted services for employer representatives
will be reimbursed. Salaries and benefits must be
shown as described in Item H3.

Indicate the cost of substitutes for release time
of exclusive bargaining unit representatives
during negotiations. Give the job classification
of the bargaining unit representative that
required a substitute and dates the substitute
worked. Substitute costs for a maximum of five
representatives per unit, per negotiation session
will be reimbursed. The salaries of union
representatives are not reimbursable.

Reasonable costs of reproduction for a .copy of. the .
initial contract proposal and final contract,
which is applicable and distributed to each
employer representative (i,e. supervisory,
management, confidential) and a reasonable number
of copies for public information will be
reimbursed. Provide detail of costs and/or
include invoices. Costs for copies of a final
contract provided to collective bargaining unit
members are not reimbursable,

If contract services are used for a. and/or b,
above, contract invoices must be submitted,
Contract costs must be shown as described in Item

HS.

A list showing the dates of all negotiation
sessions held during the fiscal year being claimed
must be submitted.

Inpasse Proceedings

a.

Mediation

(1) Costs for salaries and benefits for emp loyer
representative personnel are reimbursable,
Contracted services will be reimbursed.
Costs for a maximum of [ive public school
employer representatives per mediation




(2)

(3)
(4)
(5)
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session will be reimbursed. Salaries and

-benefits must be shown as described in Item

H3.

Indicate the costs of substitutes for the
release time of exclusive bargaining unit
representatives during impasse proceedings, -
The job classification of the employee
witnesses and the date they were absent shall
be indicated. Costs for a maximum of five
representatives per mediation session will be
reimbursed.

Renting of facilities will be reimbursed,
Costs of the mediator will not be reimbursed.
If contract services are used under 1,
contract invoices must be submitted with the

claim. Contract costs must be shown as
described in Item HS.

Fact-finding publication of the findings of the
fact-finding panel. (To the extent fact-finding
-was required under the Winton Act during

the 1974-75 fiscal year, costs are not
reimbursable.)

(1)

(2)

(3)

All costs of the school employer panel
representative shall be reimbursed. Salaries
and benefits must be shown as described in
Item H3.

Fifty percent of the costs mutually incurred
by the fact-finding panel shall be
reimpursed. This may include substitutes for
release time of witnesses during fact-finding
proceedings, and the rental of facilities
reguired by the panel.

Special costs imposed on the public school
enployer for the development of unigue data
required by a fact-finding panel will be
reimbursed. Describe the special costs and
explain why this data would not have been
required by a fact-finding panel under the
Winton Act, Salaries and benefits must be
shown as described in Item H3,
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Contract administration and adijudication of contract

disputes either by arbitration or litigation.

Reimbursable functions include grievances and

administration and enforcement of the contract,

d.

Salaries and benefits of employer personnel
involved in adjudication of contract disputes,
Contracted services will be reimbursed. Salaries ,
and benefits must be shown as described in Item

H3.

Indicate substitutes necessary for release time of
the representatives of an exclusive bargaining
unit during adjudication of contract disputes.

The job classification of the employee witnesses
and the dates they were absent shall also be
indicated.

Reasonable costs incurred for a reasonable number
of training sessions held for supervisory and
management personnel on contract
administration/interpretation of the negotiated
contract are reimbursable. Contract
interpretations at staff meetings are not
reimbursable. Personal development and
informational programs, i.e., classes,

~ conferences, seminars, workshops, and time spent

by employees attending such meetings are not
reimbursable, Similarly, purchases of books and
Subscriptions for personal development and
information purposes are not reimbursable.
Salaries and benefits must be shown as described
in Item H3,

The cost of one transcript per hearing will be
reimbursed.

Reasonable public school employer costs associated
with a contract dispute which is litigated are
reimbursable, as follows:

1. "Reasonable public school employer costs
associated with issues of contract ‘disputes
which are presented before PERB are
reimbursable.

2. Reasonable public school employer cost of
litigation as a defendant in the court suit
involving contract disputes may be
reimbursable. ‘



-

8

3. Where the public school employer is the
plaintiff in a court suit to appeal a PERB
ruling, costs are reimbursable only if the
public school employer is the prevailing
party {(after all appeals, final judgment) .

4. No reimbursement is allowed where the public
school employer has filed action directly
with the courts without first submitting the
dispute to PERB, if regquired.

5. No reimbursement shall be provided for filing
of amicus curiae briefs.

Expert witness fees will be reimbursed if the
witness is called by the public school employer.

Reasonable reproduction costs for copies of a new
contract which is required as a result of a
dispute will be reimbursed.

If contract services are used under "a" above,
copies of contract invoices must be submitted with
your claim. Contract costs must be shown as
described in Item HS.

Public school employer’s portion of arbitrators’ ‘
fees for adjudicating griecvances, representing 50%
of costs, will be reimbursed.

Unfair labor practice adijudication process and public

notice complaints,

a.

Show the actual costs for salaries and benefits of
employer representatives. Services contracted by
the public school employer are reimbursable.
Salaries and benefits must be shown as described
in Item H3.

Indicate cost of substitutes for release time for
representatives of exclusive bargaining units
during adjudication of unfair practice charges,

The cost of one transcript per PERB hearing will
be reimbursed.

Reasonable reproduction costs will .be reimbursed.

Expert witness fees will be reimbursed if the
witness is called by the public school employer.
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f. If contract services are used under "a* above,
contract inveoices must be submittedq. Contract
costs must be shown as described in Item HS.

g. No reimbursement for an appeal of an unfair labor
“practice decision shall be allowed where the
Public Employee Relations Board is the prevailing

party.

h. No reimbursement for filing of amicus curiae
briefs shall be allowed.

Supporting Data for Claims--Report Format for Submission of

1.

Clajim,

Description of the Activityv: Follow the outline of the

claim components. Cost must be shown separately by
component activity. Supply workload data reguested as
part of the description to support the level of costs.
claimed., The selection of appropriate statistics is
the responsibility of the claimant.

Quantify "Increased" Costs: Public school employers
will be reimbursed for the "increased costs'. incurred
as a result of compliance with the mandate.

a. For component activities Gi, G2, and G3:

1. Determination of the "increased costs" for each of
these three components requires the costs of ‘
current year Rodda Act activities to be offset
[reduced) by the cost of the base-year Winton aAct
activities. The Winton Act base-year is generally
fiscal year 1974-75. '

Winton Act base-year costs are adjusted by the
Implicit Price Deflator prior to offset against
the current year Rodda Act costs for these three
components. The Implicit Price Deflator shall be
listed in the annual claiming instructions of the
State Controller.

2. The cost of a claimant’s current Yyear Rodda Act
activities are offset [reduced] by the cost of the
base-year Winton Act activities either: by
matching each component, when claimants can
provide sufficient documentation to: segregate each
component of the Winton Act base-year activity
costs; or, by combining all three components when
claimants cannot satisfactorily segregate each
component of Winton Act base-year costs,
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b. For component activities G4, G5, and Gé:

All allowable activity custs for these three Rodda
Act components are "increased costs" since there
were no similar activities reguired by the Winton
Act; therefore, there is no Winton Act base-year
offset to be calculated.

BASE YEAR ADJUSTMENT

.490 1979-80 FY
.560 19580-81 FY
.697 1981-82 FY
.777 19B2-83 FY
" 1.884 1983-84 FY

18974-1975%
1"

e

Salary and Employees’ Benpefits: Show the

classification of the employees involved, amount of
time spent, and their hourly rate. The worksheet used
to compute the hourly salary rate must be submitted
with your claim. Benefits are reimbursable. Actual
benefit percent must be itemized. If no itemization is
submitted, 21 percent must be used for computation of
claim costs. Identify the classification of employees
committed to functions required under the Winton Act
and those required by Chapter 961, Statutes of 1975,

Services and Supplies: Only expenditures which can be
identified as a direct cost as a result of the mandate
can be claimed. .

Professional and Consultant Services: Separately show
the name of professionals or consultants, specify the
functions the consultants performed relative to the
mandate, length of appointment, and the itemized costs
for such services. Invoices must be submitted as
supporting documentation with your claim. The maximum
reimbursable fee for contracted services is $100 per
hour. Annual retainer fees shall be no greater than
$100 per hour. Reasonable expenses will also be paid
as identified on the monthly billings of consultants.
However, travel expenses for consultants and experts
(including attorneys) hired by the claimant shall not
be reimbursed in an amount higher than that received by
State employees, as established under Title 2, Div, 2, =~
Section 700ff, cCacC,

Allowable Overhead Cost: Public school employer’s
indirect costs may only be claimed through an indirect
costs rate proposal prepared in accordance with the
provision on Federal Regulation OASC~-10 (formerly OMB
Circular A-87 and FMC 74-4), For the 1978-79 fisca)l
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year, public school employers may use the J-86
nonrestrictive indirect cost rate approved by the State
Department of Education (SDE). For the 1979-80 and
subsequent fiscal years, public school employers may
use the J~41A nonrestrictive indirect cost rate
approved by SDE. Public school employers that do not
have an approved J-41A must use the J-85 restrictive
indirect cost rate for the 1978-79 fiscal year, and
J=73A rate for the 1980-81 and subsequent fiscal years,
The J-41A or the J-13A must be submitted with your

Costs previously included in the J-86 indirect cost
calculation which are now included in the J-41A direct
support cost category are eligible for reimbursement if
the method of computation is explained in the claim.

Indirect cost rate -should not be applied to costs
classified as General Support in the J-41A or J-73A
under EDP codes 400, 405, and 410 in column three.
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State Controlier's Office ' : School Mandated Cost Manual

 COLLECTIVE BARGAINING -

4.  Summary of Chapter 961/75

"The Rodda Act repealed Education Code Aricle 5 (commencing with § 13080), of Chapter
1 of Division 10 and added Chapter 10.7 (commencing with § 3540) to Division 4 of Title 1
of the Govemment Code, relating to public educational employment relations. ’

The Rodda Act which became operative July 1, 19786, repealed the Winton Act and

" enacted provisions requiring the employer and employee fo meet and negotiate, thereby
creating a collective bargaining atmosphere for public school employees. It also
established the Public Employment Relations Board' (PERB). PERB is responsible for
issuing formal interpretations and rulings regarding collective bargaining under the act.

OnJuly 17, 1978, the Commission on State Mandates, (formerly Board of Controf),
determined that Chapter 961, Statutes of 1978, resulied in state mandated costs which are
reimbursable pursuant fo Part 7 (commencing with Govemment Code § 17500) of Division
4 of Titie 2. '

2. Eligible Claimants

Any school district (K-12), county office of education, or community college district that
incurs increased costs as a result of this mandate is gligible to clalm reimbursement of
these costs.

3. Appropriations

Claims may only be filed with the State Controlter's Office for programs that have been
funded in the state budget, the State Mandates Claims Fund, or in special legislation. To
delermine if current funding is available for this program, refer to the schedule
"appropriation for State Mandated Cost Programs" in the "Annual Claiming Instructions for
Stale Mandated Costs" issued in September of each year to county superiniendents of
schools and superiniendents of schools,

4, Types of Claims

A. Reimbursementand Estimated Claims

A claimant may flle a reimbursement and/or an estimated claim, A reimbursement
claim details the costs actuaily incurred for-a prior fiscal year. An eslimated claim
shows the costs o be incurred for the current fiscal year.

B. Minimum Ciaim

Govemment Code § 17564(a), provides that no claim shall be filed purstiani to
Govemment Code § 17561 unless such a claim exceeds $200 per program per fiscal
year. However, any county superintendent of schools, as fiscal agent for the school
district, may submit a combined ctaim in excess of $200 on behalf of one or more
districts within ihe county even if the individual district's claim does not exceed $200.
A combined claim must show the individual costs for each districl. Once a combined
claim is filed, all subsequent years relating to the same mandate must be filed in a
combined form. The county receives the reimbursement payment and is responsible
for disbursing funds to each participating district. A district may withdraw from the
combined claim form by providing a written notice to the county superintendent of
schools and the State Controlier's Office of ils inlent to file a separate claim at least
180 days prior o he deadiine for filing the claim.

Chapter 961/75, Page 1 of @ Revised 10/96
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5. Filing Deadline

Refer to the itern, "Reimbursable State Mandated Cost Programs", contained in the annual
cover lefter for mandated cost programs issued annually in Sepiember, which identifies the
fiscal years for which claims may be filed. If an "x" is shown for the program listed under )
"{9 _/ Reimbursement-Claim", and/or "19__/ Estimated Claim", claims may be filed as

follows:
A.  Anestimated claim must be filed with the State Controlier's Office and postmarked by

Novermnber 30 of the fiscal year in which costs are to be incured. Timely filed
estimated claims will be paid before lale claims.

After having received payment for an eslimated claim, the claimant must file a
reimbursement claim by November 30 of the following fiscal year, If the district fails
lo file a reimbursement claim, monies received for the estimated claim must be
relumed to the State, If no estimated claim was filed, the agenoy may file a
reimbursement claim detalling the actual costs incurred for the fiscal year, provided
there was an appropriation for the program for that fiscal year, For information
regarding appropriations for reimbursement claims, refer o the “"Appropriation for
State Mandated Cost Programs" in the previous fiscal year's annual claiming
instructions. '

A reimbursement claim detailing the actuat costs must be filed with the State
Controlier's Office and postmarked by November 30 following the fiscal year in which
costs were incurred. If the claim is filed after the deadiine but by November 30 of the
succeeding fiscal year, the approved claim must be reduced by a late penalty of 10%,
not to exceed $1,000. Claims filed more than one year after the deadline will not be
accepted,

6. Reimbursable'Components

The objective of the reporting forms is to determine the Rodda Act costs incurred during
the curent year and-compare them with the adjusted costs incurred in the base yearunder
the Winton Act. The firstthree:claim components listed below apply to both the Winton Act
and Rodda Act. Componenis D through F, which apply only to the Rodda Adt, represent
aclivities that were not required under the Winton Act.

A,

Determining Bargaining Units and Exclusive Representation

The cost of determining appropriate bargaining units, exclusive representation and
representatives are reimbursable. Activities determined to be eligible reimbursements
for this component are as follows:

1. Bargaining Unil Lists '

Developmental costs of proposed lists for the bargaining unit determination
hearing. :

(8) Contracted services necessary for development of proposed lists.

(b} Salaries and benefits of district employees and related costs necessary 1o
develop proposed lists.

2. PERB Hearings

Representation cost for the schoo! employer at PERB hearings held (o determine
the bargaining units and their exclusive representative,

(a) Salaries and benefits of district employees used to prepare for and re present
employer at hearings.

{b) Contracted services used 1o prepare for and represent the employer at hearings.

Revised 10/96
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3. Subsfiftnes '

The cost of hiring substitutes to replace the employer and exclusive bargaining
unit witnesses required to testify at PERB hearings. The claimant must include
with the claim, a list of teacher witnesses, their job classifications and the date
they were required 1o testify. ’

The cost of substitute release time for employee witnesses asked to attend
PERB hearings by bargaining unlts, but not required to testify, is not
eligible for reimbursement in this component.

4. Travel Costs

Travel expenses incurred by district employer representatives required to attend
PERB hearings. Reimbursement shall comply with the rate specified by the
regulations goveming employees of the local school districl, However, lhe
reimbursement cannot exceed the rate adopted by the Board of Controt for state
employees, | ’ .

5. ']'rahscm'pts
The cost of preparing one transcript for each PERB hearing.

B, Election of Unit Representation

 The cost of elections and decerification elections of unit representatives are
reimbursable in the event PERB determines that a question of representation exists
and orders an election by secret ballot. The claimant must inciude with the claim, any
PERB agreements or orders which state how the election must be heid.

Activities determined to be éIigiblé reimbursements for this component are as foliows:
1.  Precinct Voting List

The salaries, benefits, and related. cost.of developing and preparing a-precinct
voling list, if.required by PERB..

2. Baliot Tally Observers

The salary and benefits of a school employer represeniative required by PERB 10
ohserve the baliot count.

C. Costof Negotiations

The cost associated with the receipt of the exclusive representalive's initial contract
proposal, holding of public hearings, providing a reasonable number of copies of the
em ployer's contract proposal, negotiation of ihe coniract, and reproduction and
distribution of the final contract agreement are reimbursable, The cl aimant must
include with the ciaim, a fisting of the dates of all negotiation sesstons held during ihe
period for which the claim is being filed.

Activities determined to be eligible reimbursements for this component are as follows:
1. Representative's Contract Proposal

The employer's cost of analyzing the exclusive representative’s inilial contract
proposal.

(a) Salaries and benefits for public school district employer representatives and
supporting personnel participaling in planning sessions and related contracted
services.

2. Public Hearings

The cos! of holding public hearings reiated 1o the contract negotialions.

Chapter 961/75, Page 3 of 8 Revised 10/96
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3. Public Distribution of Proposed Contract

The cost of providing a reasonable number of copies of the district's proposed
contract to the public,

{a} Reproduction of copies of the initial contract proposal for the district's
supervisory, management, and confidential representatives are reimbursable,

(b} A reasonable number of copies of the initial contract for distribution 1o the public
is reimbursable. .

4.  District Contract Proposal

The cost of empioyer salaries and benefits necessary for development and
presentalion of the initial district contract proposal and related coniracted
services,

8, Nepotiation .
The cost of negotiating a contract with the employee representatives,

{a) Salaries and benefits for district employer representatives participating in
negotiations and related contracted services, Reimbursable costs for a
maximum of five school disirict representatives per unit per negotiating session
will be reimbursed. !

(b) Subsfitutes hired so that exclusive bargaining unit representatives can attend
" negoliations. List the job classification of the bargaining unit representative that
required a substitule. List the dates and time the substittle worked. Substiiute
cost for & maximum of five representalives per unit negotialing per session are
reimbursable, ‘

6. Public Distribution of Finai Contract

The cost of reproduction of the contract and distribution of the final contract
agreement,

(8) Reproduction of copi'es of the initial contract for distribution to the district's
supervisory, management, and confidential employee represenlatives.

(b} A reasonable number of copies of the final contract for purposes of public
" information.

- The following costs are not eligible for reimbursement for this component:

(c) The cost of copies of the final contract provided to the collective bargaining unit
members. '

(d) The salaries of union representatives,

D. Impasse Proceedings

The cost of impasse proceedings are reimbursable. Activities delermined 1o be
reimbursable for this component are as follows:

1. Mediation

Representation costs for the school employer al medialion sessions are
reimbursable,

{a) Salaries and benefils for districl employees to prepare and represent the
employer at the sessions, :

{b) Contracled services used {o prepare for and represent the employer at the
sessions,
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(c} Substitutes hired to aliow exclusive bargaining unit representatives to attend
impasse proceedings. List the job classification of the employee witnesses and
the dates and time they atiend mediation sessions. Reimbursemepts 1o a public
school district employer are limited to the cost of hiring a maximum of five
substitutes to replace five representatives so they can attend a mediation
session.

(d) The cost of renting facilities for the sessions,
2. FaotFi ndlng
The cost of development and publncat:on of the ﬁndings of the pane[

(a} All the costs of the district employer representatwe serving on the fact finding
panel,

{b) Fifty percent of the cost of the fact finding panel mutually incurred by the
empioyer representative and the employee bargaining unit representative. This
may include the cost of teacher substiiutes so that witnesses can .aitend fact
finding proceedings and the renta! of facilities required to-conduct the fact finding
hearing.

(c) Special costs imposed on the district for the development of unigue data required
by a fact finding panel. Describe the special costs and explain why this data
would not have been required by a fact finding panef under the Winton Act.

{d) Cost of the mediator is not eligible for reimbursement for this component,

E. Contract Administration

“The cost of contract administration and adjudication of contract disputes either by
arbitration.or htlgat{on are reimbursable, -

Activities determined 10-be reimbursable for this component are as foliows:
1. Training Sesslons

Reasonable cost incurred for a reasonable number of training sessions held for
supervisory and management personnel regarding contract administration and
interpretation of the negoiiated contract,

2, Grievances

(a) Salaries and benefits of public school district personnel involved in adjudication
of contract disputes along with related contracied services.

(b) Substitutes hired so that representatives of an exclusive bargaining unit can
altend adjudication hearings regarding contract disputes. List the job
classifications of the employee witnesses and the dates and time they were
required to attend adjudication hearings.

{c) The cost of one transcript per hearing is reimbursable.
3. Contract Dispuies Presenied Before PERB

{a) Public school employer costs regarding contract disputes which are presented
before PERB.

(b) Litigation costs incurred by a public school employer as a defendant in a court
suil involving contract dzspuies may be reimbursabte. (See (4), "Appeal of PERB
Ruling", below, if claimant is the plaintiff),

(c) Expert witness fees if the wilness is called by the public school employer.

(d) Reasonable reproduction costs for copies of a new contract which are required as
a result of a dispute,
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(e) A public school employer's portion of an arbitrator's fees {50% of costs) for
adjudicating grievances,

4. Appeal of PERB ruling

Reasonabie claimant costs assoclated w:th a contract dispute are reimbursable
when the claimant is the plaintiff in a court suit to appeal a PERB ruimg and the
claimant is the prevailing party.

(a) The cosls incurred become eligible for reimbursement in the fiscal year in which
the appeal process has been exhausted;

(b) The claimant must include with the claim a copy of the court’s nuling.

~(c) 1If the claim includes costs associated with more than one appeal, the costs
associated with each appeal must be shown separalely

No reimbursement is atlowed where the:public school-employer has filed action
directly with the courts without first submiitting the dispute to PERB, if required.

No reimbursement shall be provided for filing of a brief with the court by a person
who is not party to a litigation (i.e., amicus curiae).

The following costs are not eligible for reimbursement for this component.
(d) Contract interpretations conducted at staff meetings.

(e) Personal development-and informational programs {i.e., classes, conferences,
seminars, workshops) and time spent by employees attending such meetings.

(f)y Labor/management non-adversarial training sessions.

(g) Purchase 6f books and-subscriptions for personal development and information
purposes.

F.- Unfair Labor Practice Charges

The cost of unfair labor practice adjudication process and public nolice complaints are
reimbursable.

Activilies determined to be eligible for reimbursement for this component are as
follows:

1. Unfair Labor Practice Presenied to PERB

(a) Salaries and benefits of public school district emp!oyer representatives and
relaied coniract services.

(b) Thie cost of subsiilutes hired to replace representatives of an exclusive
bargaining unit required to allend adjudication hearings regarding unfair tabor
praclice charges.

(c} The cost of one transcript for each PERB hearing.

(d} Reasonable reproduciion costs,

(&) Exper withess fees if the witness is called by the public school emplayer.
2. Appeal of a PERB Ruling

Claimant costs associated with the appeal of a PERB unfair fabor practice
decision are reimbursable If the claimant is the prevailing party.

(a) The costs incurred become eligible for reimbursement in the fiscal year in which
the appeal process has been exhausled,

{b} The claim must include a copy of the court's ruling.
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(c) If the claim includes costs associated with more than one appeal, the costs
associated with each appeal must be shown separately.

The followmg costs are not eligible for reimbursement for this component,
(d) Appeal of an unfair labor practice decision if PERB is the prevailing party.

(e) The filing of a brief with the court by a person who is not party to the litigation
{i.e., amicus curiag).

7. Reimbursemanti.lmltations_
A. Fringe Benefits

The actual fringe benefit costs may be claimed if supported by an itemized tist of the

costs, such as for : Retirement, Social Security, health and dental insurance, workers
compensation, efc.. If no itemization is submitied, twenty one percent of direct salary
may be used for computing the fringe benefit costs.

B. Contracted Services

The contracted services guldelines in Claiming Forms and Instructions [See B.A.(3))
shall prevalil, except that the reimbursable fee for-collective bargaining contracted
services will not exceed $100 per hour,  Additionally, annual retainer fees shail be
based on a fee not greater than. $100 per hour. Those ¢laims which are based on
annual retainers shall contain a certification that the fee is no greater than $100 per
hour. Reasonable expenses will also be paid if identified on the monthiy billings of
consultants. However, travel expenses for consultants and experts (including
attomneys) hired by the claimant shall not be reimbursed in an amount higher than that
received by Stale employees, Prior to the 1987/88 fiscal year, the confracted service
fee was at a rate no greater than $85 per hour.

C. Travel Expenses

Reimbursement for-business-and travel expenses is fimited in an amount ant type to
those that can be claimed by State Employees. Refer to Appendix A, State of
California, Travel Expense Guidelines, for current per.diem rates,

D. Other Revenue Sources

Any offsetting savings or reimbursement the claimant recerved from any source (e.g.
service fees collected, federal funds, olher state funds, etc.,) as a result of this
mandate shall be identified and deducted so only net local costs are claimed.

E. Governing Authority

Salaries and expenses of the goveming autharity, for example, the Board of Trustees
and the Superintendent of Schools, are not reimbursable as a direct cost.

B. Claiming Forms and Instructions

The diagram "Hustralion of Claim Forms" provides a graphical presentation of forms
required 1o be filed with a claim. A claimanl may submit a computer generated report in
substitution for forms CB-1 and CB-2 provided the format of the repori and data fields
contained within the report are identical 1o the claim forms included in these instructions.
The claim forms provided with these instructions shoutd be duplicaled and used by the
claimant 1o file estimated or reimbursement claims. The State Controller's Office wiil
revise the manuat and claim forms as necessary. In such instances, new reptacement
forms will be maited to claimants.
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A. Form CB-2, Component/Activity Cost Detall

This form is used 1o segregate the detalled 'oosts by claim component. ‘A separate
form CB-2 must be completed for each cost component being claimed. Costs
reported on this form must be supported as follows;

(1) Salaries and Benefits

Identify the employee(s), and/or show the classification of the employee(s)
involved. Describe the mandated functions performed and specify the actual
time devoled to each function by each employee, the productive hourly rates
and related fringe benefits,

Source documents required to be maintained by the claimant may include, but
are not limited fo, employee time records that show the employee's actual time
spent on the mandate, . :

{2) Materials and Supplies

Only expenditures which can be identified as a direct cost of the mandate may be
claimed, List the cost of materials which have been consumed or expended
specifically for the purpose of the mandate, )

Source documents required to be maintained by the claimant may inc'lude, but are
not limited to, invoices, receipts, purchase orders and other documents evidencing
the validity of the expenditures. : _

{3) .Contracted Services

Contracting costs are-reimbursable to'the extent that the function 1o ‘be performed
requires-special skill or knowledge that is not.readiiy available from the claimant's
staff-or the service to be provided by the contraclor is cost effective. Use of
contract services must be justified by the claimant. :

Glve the name(s) of contractor(s) who performed the service(s). Describe the
aclivities performed by each named contractor. actual time spent on the
mandate, inclusive dates when services were performed, and itemize ali costs for
services performed. Attach consullant invoices with the claim. .

Source documents required to be maintained by the claimant may include, but
are nol fimited to, contracts, invoices, and other documents evidencing the
validity of the expenditures.

(4) Travel Expenses

Travel expenses for mileage, per diem, lodging and other employee entitlements
are reimbursable in accordance with the rules of the local jurisdiction. Give the
name(s) of the fraveler(s), purpose of travel, inclusive fravel dates, destination
points and cosls.

Source documents required to be maintained by the claimant may include, bui
are not limited to, receipts, employee travel expense claims, and other
documents evidencing the validity of the expenditures,

For audit purposes, all supporting documents must be retained for a pericd of two
years after the end of the calendar year in which the reimbursement claim was filed or
last amended, whichever is later. Such documents shall be made avallable fo the
State Controlier's Office on request,
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B. Form CB-1, Claim Summary

This form is used to summarize direct costs by claim component and compute
allowable indirect costs for the mandate. The direct costs summarized on this form
are derived form CB-2 and are carried forward to form FAM-27,

Schoo! districts and local offices of education may compute the amount of indirect
costs utilizing the State Department of Education's Annual Program Cost Data Report
J-2380 or J-580 rate, as applicable. Community college districts have the option of
using a federally approved rate (i.e., ulilizing the cost accounting principles from the
Office of Management and Budget Clrcular A-21), or form FAM-29C. The cost data
on this form is camied forward to form FAM-27. :

C. Form FAM-27, Claim for Payment

Form FAM-27 contains a certification ihat must be signed by an authorized'
representative of the district. All applicable information from form CB-1 must be
camied forward to this form for the State Controller's Office to process the claim for
payment.

Nlustration of Claim Forms

r Form CB-2 Component/Activity Cost Detail

[ Complete a separate form CB-2, for each cost
| component in which expanses are claimed.

1. Determining Bargaining Units and Exclusive Representation
Fom CB-2 A. Baraaini .

L . Bargaining Unit Lists
ComponentiActivity B. PERSB Hearings
Cost Detail I C. Substiues

. — D. Travel Costs
E. Trenscripts

2. Election of Unh Representation
A, Precinct Voting Lists
B. Ballot Tally Observers

3. Cost of Nepdtiations
. Representatives' Contract Proposal
. Public Hearings

. Public Distribution of Proposed Contract
. District Contract Proposal
. Nagotiation
. Public Distribution of Final Contract

¥

Form CB-1
Claim Summary

TMmMmoOmwe

4, lmpasse Proceedihgs
A. Mediation
B. Fact Finding

5, Contract Administration
A. Training Sessions
B. Grievances
C. Contract Disputes Presented Before PERB
D. Appeal of PERB Ruling

FAM-27

Claim 8. Unfair Labor Practice Charges
for Payment A. Unfair Laber Practice Eresented to PERB
B. Appeal of a PERB Ruling
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b D
CLAIM FOR PAYMENT (19) Program Number 0001 1
""F Pursuant to Government Code Section 17561 (Z0) Dete File / /
¥ COLLECTIVE BARGAINING {21) LRS Input /. /
!," ‘[ ¢0f) Claimant Identification Number : Y Reimbursement Claim Data
| g |(02) Mailing Address (22) CB-1, (O3)(1)(e)
| Claimart Name (23) CB-1, (BK2(e)
H | County of Location ' (24) CB-1, (03)(3){s)
E
R | Street Address or P. O.. Box {25) CB-1, (03)(4)(e)
E
Ciy State Zip Code {26} CBA1, (03)(5)(e)
\ : AL
Type of Claim | Estimated Claim Reimbursement Claim [{27) CB-1, {03){6}(e)

|{03) Estimated [ ] |(09) Refmbursement [ ] |(28) ¢B-1, (04)(d)

(04) Combined ] {15) Combined . [7] (20} cB1, o4)(e}

(0S) Amended [ ] |(11) Amended 1 [te cB, (os)e) -

Fiscal Year of {08) (12} (31)

Cost 10/ 18__/

Total Claimed (on {13) {32)

Less; 10% Late Penalty, but not to exceed {{14) {X3)

$1000 (If applicable) _

Less: Estimated Claim Payment Received |(15) {34)

Net Claimed Amount (1g) {35)

Due from State o - (17 - |38

Due to State 2 (18) (37

(38) CERTIFICATION OF CLAIM

In accordance with the provistons of Government Code 17561, | certify that | am the person authorized by the local agency to file
clalims with the State of Californla for cost= mandated by Chapter 981, Statutes of 1878§; and certify under penalty of perjury that |
have not violaled any of the provisfons of Government Code Sections 1090 1o 1085, Inclusive,

I turther certify that there was no application other than from the clatmant, nor any grant or payment recelved, for reimbursement of
costs claimed herein; and such costs are for a new program or increased level of services of an exlsling program mandated by
Chapler 851, Statutes of 1875,

The amounts for Estimated Claim and/or Relmbursement Claim are hereby claimed from the State for payment of estimated andfor
actual costs for the mandated program of Chapter 861, Statutes of 1875, set forth on the attached statements.

Signature of Authorized Representative Date
Type or Print Name Title
{38) Name of Contact Person for Claim Telephone Numbser
IO O SO0 O A A Y O 2 O Y OO QN VO O T I L,.L.I_L__I Ext, T O

Form FAM-27 (Revised 10/96) Chapter 961/75
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COLLECTIVE BARGAINING FORM
Certification Clalm Form , : FAM-27
Instructions ‘

(01}
(02)

(3)
(04)
(O3}

{08}
o7

(03)
(=)
(10)
{11)
(12)

(13)
(14)
(15)
(16)
(17)
(18)

{19) to (21)
(22} 10 (37)

{38

(39)

Leave blank.

A set of maliing labels with the clatmant's .D. number and address has been enclosed with the claiming instructions, The mailing
{abels are designed to speed processing and prevent common errors that delay payment, Affixa label in the place shown on form
FAM-27. Cross out any emmors and print the comect information on the iabel, Add any missing address tems, except county of
location and & person's name, If you did net recsive labels, print or type your agency's mailing eddress.

It filing an original estimated claim, enter an *X* in the box on line (O3) Estimated.
lf fiing an original estimated claim on behalf of districts within the county, enter an "X* in the box on fine (04} Combined.
it filing an amended o combined claim, enter an "X" in the box on line {05) Amended, Leave boxes {03} and {04} blank.

Enter the fiscal year in which costs are to be incurred.

Enter the amount of estimated claim. If ,és‘limata exceeds the previous fiscal year's actual costs by more than 10%, complete form
CB-1 and enter the-amount from line (11). If more than one form CB-1 is completed dus to mukiple department invohement in this
mandate, add line {11} of each form CB-1. '

Enter the same amount as shown in line (07).

It filing an original reimbursement claim, enter an "X* in the box on line {08) Reimbursement,

It filing ah original reimbursement ¢laim on behalf of districts within the county, enter an * X* inthe box on line (10) Combined,
|f filing an amended or a combined claim on behalf of districts within the county, enter an *X " in the box on line (11) Amended.

Enter the fiscal year for which actual costs are being elaimed. If actuaf costs for more than one fiscal year are being claimed,
complets a sepatate form FAM-27 for each fiscal year,

Enter the amount of reimbursement claim from form CB-1, line (11). !f mote than one form CB-1 Is c'ompleted due fo muttiple
cepanment involvement 1n this mandate, add line {11) of each form CB-1, .

If & reimbursement claim is filed after November 20 of the fiscal year in which costs were incurred, the claim must be raduced by a
iate penalty. Enter the product of multiplying fine-(1 3)-by.the factor 0,10 (10% penalty) or $1,000, whichever 1s less.

If you are filing a reimbursemert elaim.and have previously filed an estimated-claim for the sams fiscal yeal, enter the smount
received for the estimated claim. - Otherwise, entera zero,

Enterthe result of sublracting ling (14) and line {15) from line (13),

I line {16) Net Claimed Amount is positive, enter that amount on line {17) Due from State..
If line {16} Net Claimed A'.mount Is negative, enter that amount in fine (18) Due o State, )
Leawe blank. '

Reimbursement Claim Data. Bring forward the cost information as specliied on the fef-hand column of lines {22) through {30)
for the reimbursement ciaim je.g.. CB-1, (O3). means the information 1s located on form CB-1, fine {03). Enter the informastion
on ihe same line but in the right-hand column, Cost information should be iounded to the nearest dollar, (i.e.. no cents).
Indirect cost percentage should be shown as a whole number and without the percent symbol (ie., 7.548% should'be shown
a5 8). The claim cannot be pracessed for payrent unless this data block is correct and complete,

Read the statement “Cerlfication of Claim." If the statement is true, {he claim must be daled, signed bythe agency's
authorized representative and must include the person's name and title. typed or printed. Claims cannot be paig unless

accompanied by a signed cedification,

Enler the name of the person and telephone number that this office should contact if additional information is required,

SUBMIT A SIGNED ORIGINAL AND A COPY OF FORM FAM-27. AND A COPY OF ALL OTHER FORMS AND SUPPORTING
DOCUMENTS TO! .

Address, i delivered by: Address, If delivered by:
LS. Postal Service Cther delivery service

OFFICE OF THE STATE CONTROLLER OFFICE OF THE STATE CONTROLLER
ATTN: Local Reimburseinent Section ATTN: Local Relmbursement Section
Diviston of Accounting and Reporting Dlvision of Accounting and Reporting
P.O, Box 842850 3301 C Street, Sulte 501

Sacramento, CA 94250 Sacramento, CA 95816

-hapter 861/75 Form FAM-27 {Revised 10/96)
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' MANDATED COSTS
FORM
COLLECTIVE BARGAINING CBA
CLAIM SUMMARY

(01) Claimant (02) Type of Claim Fiscal Year
Reimbursement D '
Estimated [:j 18 M9
Rodda Act Direct Costs Cost Elements
(03) Reimbursable Gomponents @ (b) (c} (d) (e}
Salaries and | Matenials and Travel Contracted Total
Benefits Supplies Services

1. Determination of Bargaining Units and
Exclusive Representation

2. Election of Unit Representation

3, Cost of Negotiations

4. Impasse Proceedings

5. Contract Administration

(04) Total Rodda Act Direct Costs

Winton Act Direct Costs*-

< | (05) Base Year, 1974/75 Direct Cosls

(06) Base Year Direct Costs Adjusted by IPD [Line (05)(e) x 2.841) for 1996/67 L.y.

(07) increased Direct Costs . [Line {04)(e} - line (O6)]

indirect Costs

(08) Total Rodda Act Direct Costs less Contracted Services [Line (04)(e} - tine (04)(d))

(09) Base Year Costs less Contracted Services adjusted by IPD [iLine (OS){e) - Hine (05)(d)) x 2.841)

(10) Increased Direct Costs less Contracted Services {Line (08) - line (08))
(11) indirect Cost Rate ) From J-380, J-580 or FAM-27C %
(12) In.creased Indirect Costs [Line {10) x line {11)}
(13) Total Increased Direct and Indirect Costs Line (07) + fine (12)]

Cost Reduction

(14) Less: Offsetting Savings, if applicable o

(15) Less: Other Reimbursements, if applicable

(18) Total Claimed Amount [Line {13} - {Line {14} + line (15)}]

Revised 9/97 ' Chapter 961/75
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School Mandated Cost Manual

State Controlier's Office

COLLECTIVE BARGAINING FORM
CLAIM SUMMARY _ cB-1
Instructions

(01)
(02)

- {03)

{04)
{05}

(08)

©7)

(08)

(09)

(10}

{11)

{12)
(13)
(14)

(15}

{16)

Enter the name of the claimant.

Type of Claim. Check a box, Reimbursement or Estimated, to identify the type of claim being filed. Enter the fiscal
year for which costs were incutred or are to be incurred.

Form CB-1 must filed for a reimbursement claim, Do not complete form CB-1 if you are filing an estimated claim
and the estimate does not exceed the previous fiscal year's actual costs by more than 10%. Simply enter the
amaunt of the estimated claim on form FAM-27, line {07). However, if the estimated claim exceeds the previous
fiscal year's actual casts by more than 10%, form CB-1 must be completed and a statement attached explaining the
increased costs, Without this information the high estimated claim wiil autornatically be reduced fo 110% of the

‘previous fiscal year's actual costs,
For each of the reimbursabie components, enter the total allowable cost.from form CB-2, line {05) columns (d}

tiitough {g) onto form CB-1, block (03), lines (1) through (6), columns (a) through (d). Total each line and enter in
cofumn (e).
Afid columns (d) and {e) for Cost Elements, block (03) and enter the totals on this line.

Method A. Enter the 1974/75 Winton Act {base year} costs on line (08)(e). Enter on line (05){d) any contracted
services costs included in line (05)(e). :

Method B. Enter the amount from form CB-1.1, line {(04)(b) onte line (05)(e). Enter on line (05)(d) any contracted
services costs included in line (D5)(e).

Method A. Multiply the base year cost on line {05){e) by the implicit price defiator (IPD). The 1896/87 implicit price
deflator is 2.841.

Method B. Enter the amount from form CB-1.1, line {04)(d).

Subtract the Base Year Direct.Costs Adjusted by the Implicit Price Defiator, -line (06), from Tota! Rodda Act Direct
Cost, line (04){e). ' )
Subtract Total Contracted Services, line (04)(d), from Total Rodda Act Direct Costs, line (04){e).

Subtract Base Year Contracted Services, line (05)(d) from Base Year, 1974/75 Direct Costs, line (05)(e) and
multiply the remainder by the Implicit Price Deflator. .

Subtract Base Year Costs less Contracted Services adjusted by IPD, line {09) from Total Rodda Act Direct Costs -
less Contracted Services, line (0B).

Enter the indirect cost rate. Schoal districts (K-12) rnay compute the amount of indirect costs tb claim by
multiplying thelr total direct costs by the State Department of Education forms J-380 or J-580 rate applicable to the
fiscal year of costs, Community coliege districts may use the federally approved OMB A-21 rale, or the rale

computed using form FAM-28C.
Multiply Incremental Direct Costs less Contracted Services, line (10), by Indirect Cost Rate, line (11},
Enter the sum of incremental Costs, line (07), and Incremental Indirect Costs, line {(12).

Less: Offsetting Savings, if applicable. Enter the total savings experienced by the claimant as a direct result of this
mandate, Submit a detailed schedule of savings with the ciaim.

.ess: Other Reimbursements; if applicable. Enter the amount of fees that could have been collected by the
school district as authorized under the California Public Records Act {Government Code § 6250 el. seq.) for
providing information requested by interested persons regarding its schools. In addition, enter the amount of any
other reimbursements received from any source {i.e., service. fees collected, federal funds, other state funds, etc.,)
which reimbursed any portion of the mandated cost program. Submit a detaited schedule of the reimbursement

sources and amounts.

Tatal Claimed Amount, Subtract the sum of Offsetting Savings, line (14}, and Other Reimbursements,
line (18), from Total Increased Direct and Indirect Costs, line (13). Enter the remainder of this line and
carry the amount forward to form FAM-27, line (07) for the Estimated Claim, or line {13) for the
Reimbursement Claim.

Chapter 961/75 Revised 9/87
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State Controlier's Office ) School Mandated Cost Manual

MANDATED COSTS FORM
COLLECTIVE BARGAINING CB1.1
DETERMINING WINTON ACT COSTS
{01) Claimant (02) Fiscal Year
_ 19_1/

NOTE: Beginning with the 1892/83 claims, a school district has the option of using Method A or Method B for

{his segment of the claim to determine increased costs due to the Rodda Act.

Method A: School districts have been using this method in previous fiscal years to determine increased
costs, The school district reduces the current Rodda Act costs by the total 1974/75 Winton Act (base
year) cost adjusted by annual changes in the implicit price deflator, Rodda Acl costs in excess of the
adjusted Winton Act costs are claimable. If a school district chooses to continue with this method, do not

complete form CB-1.1.

Method B: This method is new. It may be advantageous for a school district to use this method if the

district can provide cost documentation for each 1974/75 Winton Act cost.component listed below. The
Rodda Act has the three similar matching cosl components. Under sach matched component, report
only the amount of Winton Act costs adjusted by changes in the implicit price defiator for which current
Rodda Act costs exist, Examples: (1) If the Rodda Act.costs exceed the adjusted Winton Act costs for

_the component, all Winton Act costs of the- component - must be reported for purposes of reducing the
‘Rodda Act costs. (2) If the adjusted Winton Act costs exceed current Rodda Act costs for the

componenf, residual Winton Act costs do not have to be applied against current Rodda Act costs of other
components. If Method B is chosen, the claimant must complete {he following:

(01)  Enter the name of the claimant.
(02)  Enter the fiscal year for which costs are being filed.
(03}  Compiete the following schedule to-determine the amount of Winton Act base year costs for offset
against the current Rodda Act costs.
{a) Enterin column (a) the current Rodda Act costs for each of the three cost components, if any.
(b) Enterin column (b) the ambunt of 1974/75 Winton Act costs applicabie fo each of the three
components. The total on line {4) column (b) should be the same as shown on form CB-1, line (5)(e).
(¢} Enter in column {c) the product of muliiplying the 1974775 Winton Acl cost component in column (b)
by the tmplicit price deflator specified for the fiscal year of the claim.
(d) Enter in each row, column (d), the lesser amount of column (a) or colurnn (c). Total column {d) and
forward the amiount o form CB-1, line (0B). -
Similar Cost Components of the Rodda Act and Winton ) (b () (d)
Act 197475 197475 Winlon | Winton Act
Current Rodda Winton Act Act Costs Costs to be
Act Cosls Costs Applied | Adjusted by IPD Applied
1. Determination of Bargaining and Exclusive $ % $ $
Representation '
2. Eleclion of Unit Representation
3. Meet and Confer (Cost of Negoliations)
4. Tolals $ 5 $ $

Chapter 961/75 Revised 10/96
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State Controller's Office

School Mandated Cost Manual

MANDATED COSTS
COLLECTIVE BARGAINING
COMPONENT/ACTIVITY COST DETAIL

FORM
. CB-2

(01) Claimant

(02) Fiscal Year Costs Were Incurred

[:] 2. Cost of Negoliations

A | 3, Impasse Proceedings

C:] 1. Determination of Bargaining Uniis and Exclusive Representation

:} §. Contract Adminisiration
() &. Unfair Labor Practice Charges

(03) Reimbursable Components: Check only one box per form to identify the component being claimed.
(C) 4. Election of Unit Representation

) (04) Description of Expenses: Complete columns (a) through (g},

Object.Accounts

(@ {b) {©) {d) (e n 1]
Employee Names, Job Classifications, Hourly Hours
Functions Performed Rate Worked Salaries | Materals |Contracted| Travel
and or or and and Services
Description of Expenses Unit Cost | Quantity | Benefis | Supplies

(05) Total ] subtotal [ ]  Page:

of

Chapter 361/75

Revised 10/96



N hool Mandated Cost Manual

State Controller's Office

[

COLLECTIVE BARGAINING
COMPONENT/ACTIVITY COST DETAIL
instructions

FORM
CB-2

(01)  Enter the name of the claimant,
(02)‘ Enter the fiscal year in which costs were incurred.
(035 Reimbursable Components, Check the box which indicates the cost component being claimed. Check
only one box per form. A separate form CB-2 shall be prepared for each component which applies.
(04} Descriplion of Expenses. The following table identifies the type of information required to.suppon
reimbursable costs. To detail costs for the component aclivity box "checked" in line (03), enter the -
employee names, position titles, a brief description of their activities performed, actual time spent by
_each. employee, productive houry rates, fringe benefits, supplies.used, coniracted services, etc. For
audit purposes, all supporting documents must-be retained by the claimant for a period of not less
than two years after the end of the calendar yeaqin which the-reimbursement claim was filed or lasl:
amended, whichever is later. Such documents shall be made available to the State Controller's
*Office on request.

Chject/ Columns Submit these
Subobject T supporting
Accounts {a} {b) (c} {dj {e) {f {o documents

with the claim
Selaries =
Salaries Employee Name Hourly Hours Hourly Rate
. Rate | Worked" X :
- Hours Worked
C Tite Benefits =
o Benefits Benefit Benefit Rale
Aclivities Rate X
Performed Salaries .
!
l Materials and | Description of Unit Quantity Unil Cost’
Supplies Supplies Used X
PP P Cost Used Quantity
Name of Hours
Contracted Coniractor Worked llemized
. Howsl Inclusive Cost for Invoice
Services Specific Tasks Rat Y Dates of Services
Performed ale Service Pettormed
Purpose of Trip |Per Diem Rate Days Rate x Days
Name gnd Tille | Mileage Rate’ Miles or Mites
Travel Total
Departure and | Transperation [ Transporiation Transportation
i Return Date Cost Made Cost
(05}  Total line (04), columns (d}, (e}, {f) and (g) and enler the sum on this line. Check the appropriate box 1o

indicate if the amount is & 1otal or subtotal. If more than one form is needed for the component/activity,
number each page. Enter totals from line (05), columns (d), (e}, (f) and (@) to form CB-1, block {04),
columns (a}, (b), (¢) and {d),

~ Revised 10/96

Chapter 961/75
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For State Controller Use Only

program mandated by Chapter 981, Statutes of 1875.

statements.

Signature of Authorized Representative

CLAIM FOR PAYMENT {19)Program Numbsar 000
Pursuant to Government Code Section 17561 (20)Date File ___/ /
COLLECTIVE BARGAINING (21)Signature Present
[ Y Claimant dentification Number, Reimbursement Claim Data
$43060
U] (02) Mailing Address | 22)
S |5055 Santa Teresa Bivd. CB-1(03)(1)(e} $0.00
E| Claimant Name (23)
Gavilan Joint Community College District CB-1(03)(2){(e) $0.00
L [ County of Location (24) _
A |Santa Clara County CB-1(03){(3){e} $158,856.00
B[ Street Address or P.C. Box {25)
E |5055 Santa Teresa Blvd. , CB-1(03){(4)(e) $63,152.00
Ll City Stat Zip Code (26}
Gilroy CA 95020 CB-1(03)(5)(e) $22,891.00
Type of Ciaim  |Estimated Claim Reimbursemeant Claim (27) .
CB-1(03){6)(e) $102,672.00
{03) Estimated X (09) Reimbursement X | (28)
, CB-1{(11) 7.0%
(04) Combined ___ | (10) Combined _ 129
(05) Amended ___ |(11) Amended | (30}
Fiscal Yearof | (06) {12) (31)
Cost 1996/97 1995/96
Total Claimed | (07) (13) {32)
Amount $300,000.00 $348,866.00
Less: 10% Late Penalty, but not to (14 {33)
exceed $1000 (if applicable) $0.00
Less: Estimated Payment Received (15) {34)
$275,000.00
Net Claimed Amount (16) {35)
/ $73,966.00
8 : from State | (08) {17} (36)
) $300,000.00 $73,866.00
Due to State e ] (18) . (37}
(38) CERTIFICATION OF CLAIM

In accordance with the provisions of Government Code 17661, | cerfify that | am the person authorized by the local agency
lo file claims with the State of California for costs mandated by Chapter 961, Slatutes of 1975, and certify under penaity of
perjury that | have not violated any of the provisions of Govemment Code Sections 1080 to 1098, inclusive,

I further certify that there were no applications for nor any grant or payments received, other than from the claimant,for
1 reimbursement of costs claimed herein; and such costs are for a new program or increased level of services of an existing

The amounts for Estimated Claim and/or Reimbursement Claim are hereby claimed from the State for payment of
estimated and/or actual costs for the mandated program of Chapter 961, Statutes of 1975, set forth on the attached

Date

./J ﬁaw\. // [, Epadﬁd_la, 25-Nov-96
Steven Kinsella Dean of Busingss Services
Type or Print Name Title
(39)Name of Contact Person for Claim Telephone Number
~ "“iayen Kinseila {408) 8484715 Ext.
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MANDATED COSTS FORM
COLLECTIVE BARGAINING CB-1
CLAIM SUMMARY
Claimant: {02) Type of Claim: Fiscal Year: 1995796
. ilan Joint Community College District Reimbursement X
Estimated
Rodda Act Direct Cpshs Cost Elements
(03) Reimbursable Components: (a) (b) {c) (d) {e)
Salaries | Transportation Contracted
and Benefils | and Travel Supplies Services Total
1, Determination of Bargaining and Exclusive
Representation, $0
2, Election of Unit Representation. $0!
|
3. Cost of Negotations. $27,934.70 $1,080.80 | $6,373.19 |$123,567.65 | $158,956.34 !
1
4. Impasse Proceedings. 11918.95 0.00] 341270| 47820.00 63151.65 '
5. Contract Administration. 2703.95 0.00; 1039.18 18147.50 22890.64
6. Unfair Labor Practices, 0.00 0.00! 5020.71: 97642.50 102672.21
{04} Total Rodda Act Direct Costs $42,557.59 $1,080.80 1515,854.79 |$288,177.65 | $347,670.83 5
WINTON ACT DIRECT COSTS :
{05) Base Year, 1974/75 Direct Costs $500.00 50.00 $0.00 $500.00 E $1,000.00
) Base Year Direct Costs Adjusted by 1995/96 GNP Deflator: Line (05)(e)x 2,772 $2,772.00
(07) Increased Direct Costs Line (04)(e)-line (06) $344,898.83 .
indirect Costs | '
!
{08) Total Rodda Act Direct Costs less Contracted Services: Line {04)}e)-line {4)(d) $59,493.18 !
{09) Base Year Coslis less Contracled Services adjusted by GNP {{Line {05)(e)-line (05){d)]x 2772 } $1,386.00§
i
(10) Increased Direct Costs less Contracted Services Line (08)-fine (09) $58,107.18 i
11) Indirect Cost Rate From J380 7.0% l
12) In¢reased Indirect Costs Line {(10) x line (11) $4,067.50 '
{13) Total Increased Direct and Indirect Costs Line (07} + line {12) $348_956_33: ’
Cost Reduction i
(14) Less: Offset Savings, if applicable $0.00
(15) Less: Cther Reimbursements, if applicable $0.00 i
!
16) Total Claimed Amount: {Line (13)-{[Line(14) + line(15)}} $348 966.33 :
N
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MANDATED COSTS

FORM

COLLECTIVE BARGAINING CB-2
COMPONENT/ACTIVITY COST DETAIL
N1} Claimant: Gavilan Joint Community College District ](02) Fiscal Year costs were incutred: - 1995/96
Reimbursable Component:  COST OF NEGOTIATIONS )
, Description of Expense: Complete columns (a) through (g). Cost Elements
@ () © (d) @) M )
Employee Name, Job Classification and Activity Hourly Rate | Hours Salaries Transporta- ’
Performed or Dascription of Expense or Worked or and tion and Supplies Contracted
Unit Cost | Quantity Benefits Travel Services
Representative's Contract Proposal
Public Hearings
i
“[Public Distribution of Praposed Contract
:
i
District Contract Proposal
Carol Cooper Assoc. Dean 49.29 68.8 3388.69
Kent Child Assoc. Dean 47.99 83.5 400717
Lucha Ortega Affirm, Action Off 49.72 86.0 427592
Karen Mc Cracken Admin. Sec. 21.08 84.0 1771.56
Suzanne Bulle Admin. Sec. 22.81 84.0 1916.04

R__OS) Total

Sublotal

A Page 1of2




( MANDATED COSTS FORM
COLLEGTIVE BARGAINING cB-2
GCOMPONENT/ACTIVITY COST DETAIL
‘M) Claimant: Gavilan Joint Community College District [(02) Fiscal Year costs were incurred: 1995/96
1) Reimbursable Component: COST OF NEGCOTIATIONS
»4) Description of Expense: Complels columns (a) through (g). Cost Elements T
@ ) © o) ) 0 @
Employee Name, Job Classification and Activity Hourly Rate Hours Salaries Transporta-
Performed or Description of Expense or Worked or and tion and Supplies Contracted .
Unit Cost | Quantity Benefits Travel Services
Planning Sessions
Carel Cooper Assoc. Dean $49.29 5.5 $271.10
Kent Child Assoc. Dean 47.99 3.0 143.97
Larry Carrier Dean of Business 56.38 8.0 451.04
Marcia Hannum Admin, Sec, 22.45 104.3 2340.41
John Hansel! Direct, of Learning 44,11 14.3 628.57
Jack Harpster Dean of Businass 47.47 47.0 2231.09
Dr, Glann Mayle Superintendent 66.58 42.3 2813.1
Dr. Rose Marle Joyce Dean of Instruction 51.87 10.3 531.67
Lucha Ortega Affirm, Action Off. 49.72 10.5 522.086 :
Dr, TJ Owans Dean of Std. Serv. 51.87 10| 51.87 i
Vavrinek, Trine, Day & Co. Consuitanis . i
inv. #60560 5043.10 |
inv. #60913 22810.05¢
inv.#61413 9926.35 |
inv, #61414 9716.90
Travel & Mileage 1080.80
Ruiz & Shapiro, Attorney : 6373.19
100.00 726.5 72650.00
85.00 40.3 3421.251
1
!
“At The Table" Negotiations - Certificated :
Kent Child Assoc. Dean 47.99 13.5 647.87 :
Carol Cooper Assoc. Dean 49.29 1.0 542,19
Dates of Negotiations 3115/96
3122196
4/8/36
4116796
422/96
"A{ The Table" Negotiations - Classified
John Hansel! Direct. of Learning 44,11 26.8 1179.94
Dates of Negotiations 711795
7/24/195
7i27195
10/27185
1277185
Public Distribution of Final Contract
John Hansell Direct. of Learning 4411 5.0 220,55
{ ;
{{05) Total ¥ Sublotal Page 2 of 2 $27.93470] $1.08080) $6.373.19; $122.567.65,
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1
MANDATED COSTS FORM !
* ~ COLLECTIVE BARGAINING cB-2 |
. COMPONENT/ACTIVITY COST DETAIL :
“{) Claimant: Gavilan Joint Community College Distiict [{02) Fiscal Year costs were incurred: 1995/86
) Reimbursable Component:  IMPASSE PROCEEDINGS
4) Description of Expense: Complete columns {a) through {g}. Cost Elements
a ®) (© &) © M @
Employee Name, Job Classification and Aclivity Hourly Rate | Hours Salaries Transporia-
Performed or Description of Expense or Workedor{ - and tion and Supplies Contracted
Unit Cost | Quantity Benefits Travel Services
Mediation Sessions
Fact Finding
Dr. Glenn Mayle Superintendent 66.58 75.5 5026.79 .
Larry Carrer Dean of Business 56,38 73.8 4158.03 ) '
Dr. TJ Owens Dean of Std. Setv. 51.87 i7.3 894.76 i
Dr, Rose Marie Joyce Dean of fnstruction 51.87 7.5 389.03 )
Lucha Ortega Affirm, Action Off. 49.72 16.8 832.8%1: :
John Hansell Direct. of Learning 44,11 14.0 617.54 | ; :
Ruiz & Shapiro, Attorney ! 3412.70: ;
100.00 89.8 ! i 8975.00 |
85.00 457.0 | 38845.00 |
!
i
! ! I
‘ I
! .
! !
. ! :
| | %
|
!
1
i
:
lTOS) Tolal X Subtctal Page 1 of 1 [ $11,018.05 $3.412.701 $47,820.00




MANDATED COSTS FORM
COLLECTIVE BARGAINING CB-2
] COMPONENT/ACTIVITY COST DETAIL
™) Claimant: Gavilan Joint Community College District [(02) Fiscal Year cosls were incurred: 1955/06
*Reimbursable Component: CONTRACT ADMINISTRATION
- +} Description of Expenss: Complete columns (a) through {(g). Cost Elements
@ (B) © @ (o) - ® (@
Empioyee Name, Job Classification and Activity Hourly Rate | Hours Salaries Transporta-
Performed or Description of Expense or Worked or and tion and Supgplies Coentracted
Unit Cost | Quanfity Benefits Travel Services
Grievances
Howard Bell Maint & Oper. Suprv $31.84 4.0 $127.36
Dr. TJ Owens Dean of Std. Serv, 51.87 41.5 2152.61
é
Training Sessions
Dr. Rose Marie Joyce Dean of Instruction 51.87 6.0 311.22
i ’
o :
Contract Disputes Presented Before PERB i
L i
Dean of Business 56.38 20 112,76

Larty Catrier

- |(08) Total

Subtotal X

Page 1of 2
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MANDATED COSTS FORM
COLLECTIVE BARGAINING cB-2
COMPONENT/ACTIVITY COST DETAIL
Y Claimant Gavilan Joint Community College District [(02) Fiscal Year costs were incurred: 1995/96
Reimbursable Component:  CONTRACT ADMINISTRATION
v} Description of Expense. Complete columns (a) through (g). Cost Elements
(a) ) b . © (@) (e ) (@)
Employae Name, Job Classification and Activity Hourly Rate | Hours Salaries Transporta-
Performed or Description of Expense or Worked or and tion and Supplies Contracted
Unit Cost | Quantity Bensfils Travel Services
Appeal of PERB Ruling
Contract Interpretation
Ruiz & Shapiro, Aftomey 1039.19 i
"160.00 69.5 ! £950.00 |
85.00 143.5 © 12197.50
3 i
E .
t
3 i
J
|
| |
!
| :
3 1
z !
|
i
i
i
I
i
i
[
| |
\_‘_ - .
“1{05) Total X Subtotal Page 2 of 2 §2703.95 $1,039.191 $19147.50:




MANDATED COSTS FORM
COLLECTIVE BARGAINING cB-2
COMPONENT/ACTIVITY COST DETAIL
7 ™4) Claimant; Gavilan Joint Community Coliege District [(02) Fiscal Year costs were incurred. 1805/36
s y Reimbursable Component: UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE
-nwd) Description of Expense: Complete columns (a} through (g). ] Cost Elements
@) : (b) (©) @ (e) ® @
Employee Name, Job Classification and Activity Hourly Rate ] Houws’ Salaries Transporta-
Performed or Description of Expense or Worked or and tion and Supplies Contracted
Unit Cost | Quantity Benefits Travel Services
Unfair Labor Practice Presented fo PERB -
Ruiz & Shapiro, Attomey ) $5,029.71
100.00 644.5 64450.00
85.00 390.5 33192.50
Appeal of PERB Ruling :
i
i
|
i
!l
i
|
. |
[(05) Total X Subtotal ____ Page 1of1 $5,029.71] §$97.642.50 |

o My
pic

Ll






r CLAIM FOR PAYMENT
Pursuant to Government Code Section 17561
COLLECTIVE BARGAINING

For State Controlier Use Only

{19)Program Number 000’ DT
(20)Date File / / ot
(21)Signature Present

(01) Claimant Identification Number.

Reimbursement Claim Data

_S43060— C.CYinbo
U (02) Mailing Address : (22)
S |5055 Santa Teresa Bivd. CB-1(03)(1)(e} $0.00
E Claimant Name
Gavilan Joint Community College District CB-1(03)(2)(e) $0.00
L County of Location (24)
A 1Santa Clara County CB-1(03){(3)(e) $158,956.00
B| Sireet Address or P.Q. Box (25)
E {5055 Santa Teresa Bivd, CB-1(03)(4)(e) $63,162.00
L City Stat Zip Code (26)
_ |Gilroy CA 95020 CB-1(03)(5)(e) $22,891.00
Type of Claim  |Estimated Claim Reimbursement Claim 7N
CB-1(03)(6){e) $102,672.00
(03) Estimated X {09) Reimbursement X | (28)
CB-1(1D 7.0%
{04) Combined ____ | (10) Combined i)
(05) Amended ___ | (f1) Amended | G0
Fiscal Yearof | (06) (12) {(31)
Cost 1996/97 1995/96 \
Total Claimed | (07) (13) T3
Amount $300,000.00 $348,966.00 .
Less: 10% Late Penalty, but not to (14) Ve {4 (33)9 7'5’0 [
exceed $1000 (if applicable) {124 i‘a 45”86 f>r L AT S g Yz
Less: Estimated Payment Received {15) L G an O (34) A
ngfé;%é/{)}ﬂa 9905 frior Potend
Net Claimed Amount {18) Lo, 5 (35) _ d
~$73:966:007
Due from State | (08) (17N bogg (36)
$300,000.00 $73,966:00
Due to State S RD) (37
e % a

(38) CERTIFICATION OF CLAIM

statements.

Signature of Authorized Representative

In accordance with the provisions of Government Code 17561, | certify that | am the person authorized by the local agency
to file claims with the State of California for costs mandated by Chapter 961, Statutes of 1975, and cerlify under penaity of
perjury that | have not viclated any of the provisions of Government Code Sections 1090 to 1096, inclusive.

[ further ceriify that there were no applications for nor any grant or payments received, other than from the claimant, for
reimbursement of costs claimed herein; and such costs are for a new program or increased level of setvices of an existing
program mandated by Chapter 961 , Statutes of 1975,

The amounts for Estimated Claim and/for Reimbursement Claim are hereby claimed from the State for payment of
estimated andfor actual costs for the mandated program of Chapter 961, Statutes of 1975, set forth on the attached

Date

/,///;zﬁu. M. Kiiwelloo 25-Nov-96
Ste;en Kinsella Dean of Business Services

Type or Print Name Title

(39)Name of Contact Person for Claim Telephone Number
Steven Kinsella {408) 8484715 Ext.
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MANDATED COSTS FORM
COLLECTIVE BARGAINING cB-1
CLAIM SUMMARY
{01) Claimant; (02) Type of Claim: Fiscal Year: 1995/06
Gavilan Joint Community College District Reimbursement X
Estimated
Rodda Act Direct Costs Cost Elements
(03) Reimbursable Components: (a) (b) {c) () (2}
Salaries Transportation Contracted
. and Benefits { and Travel Supplies | Services Total
1. Determination of Bargaining and Exclusive
Representation. 50
2. Election of Unit Representation, $0
/
P ‘
3. Cost of Negotiations. $27, Qgi 70 “$1,080:80 | $6373.19-{$123.56765 $158,956.34
éd" e .
4. impasse Proceedings. +H918:85 0.00| 3442:70| #7820000 315165
= y
5. Contract Administration. . 2703.95 0.00] 103%:19; 4914750 22890:64
8. Unfair Labor Practices. 0.00 0.00| . 502071 | 97642380 16267271
_ B052048 S0 g5t 0o 170,57/
{04) Total Rodda Act Direct Costs $42—557 $1 080.80 [$15,854.79 |$288/477-65 $347,670:83
75377 $T6d” b5/ e
WINTON ACT DIRECT COSTS 3 ” / %00&9 /CP é\ // ’5\ /(;3 é ?
Fd
. —
(05) Base Year, 1974/75 Direct Costs $500.00 £0.00 $0.00 $500.00 $1,000.00
(06) Base Year Direct Costs Adjusted by 1985/96 GNP Deflator: Line {05){e)x 2772 $2,772.00 -
0,98
PW) Increased Direct Costs Line {04){e)-line (06) /4 44«898—3&-
Indirect Costs
. . i 77,07 zﬂ
(08) Total Rodda Act Direct Costs less Coniracted Services: Line {04)(e)-fine (4)(d) 9,493:
{09) Base Year Costs less Contracted Services adjusted by GNP +{[Line (05)()-line {(05)(d)]x 2772 } $1,386.00 4
: , 4$5793
(10 increased Direct Costs less Coniracted Services Line {08)-line {09) —$5é—10?—-18-1l-
(11) Indirect Cost Rate From J380 7.0%
2R0¢
(12} Increased Indirect Costs Line (10) x fine (11) $4,067-50
; [0/ A
{13} Total Increased Direct and indirect Costs Line {07} + line (12) $348,065;
Cost Reduction
(14) Less: Offset Savings, if applicable $0.00
(15) Less: Other Reimbursements, if applicable $0.00:
!
{16) Total Claimed Amount: {Line {13)-{[Line{14) + line{(15)}} $£348,966.33 ;




SE¢306L0

. h
MANDATED COSTS FORM
COLLECTIVE BARGAINING cB-1
CLAIM SUMMARY
(01) Claimant: (02) Type of Claim: Fiscal Year: 1995/96
Gavilan Joint Community College District Reimbursement X
Estimated o
Rodda Act Direct Costs Cost Elements
{03) Reimbursablae Components: (a) {bj (c) (d} (&)
Salaries | Transporiation Contracted
. and Benefits | and Travel | Supplies | Services Total
1. Determination of Bargaining and Exclusive
Representation. 30
2. Election of Unit Representation. 30
A pd 3/ fﬁf 28
3. Cost of Negatiations. $27.934.70 $1,080.80 | 3537319 125.567:85 $458,066.24
6874 165700 -
4, Impasse Proceedings. +4948:85 0.00] 3442:70| 47820000 6315165
- 1990 00
5. Contract Administration. 2703.95 0.00; 183918 4750 -22890:84
5130w
6. Unfair Labor Practices. 0. % 0.00] . 5029:74 é?‘é#?ﬁ 10967771
LN soLCol e ST
(04) Total Rodda Act Direct Costs $1,080.80 |$15,854.79 % 334767083 o
7573 &~ $5Ld /6571 O
WINTON ACT DIRECT COSTS ; / 7490& g // ; /é—f}é—‘?
/ ?f 10§ ZEEaY ]
(05) Base Year, 1974/75 Direct Costs $500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 -
- {08) Base Year Direct Costs Adjusted by 1995/96 GNP Deflator:- Line (05)(e)x 2.772 = $52,772.00 =
20,918
{07} Increased Direct Costs Line (04)(g)-line {06) 71%344%98-&3—
T ;}r -5’ N
Indiract Costs 22d,
-
: : , 707G 1
(08) Total Rodda Act Direct Cosis less Contracted Services: Line (04){e)-line (4)(d) 493,
(09) Base Year Costs less Contracted Services adjusted by GNP :{[Ling {05){e}-line (05){d))x 2772} $1,386.00 ";/
5,793 I\
{10) Increased Direct Costs less Contracted Services Line {08)-line (09} %-5@1—6—7—4—8--
(11} Indirect Cost Rate From J380 7.0% /
_ _ 2206 |
{12) Increased Indirect Costs . Line (10} x line (11) -$4.067.50-
oman 7 H2T
(13) Total Increased Direct and Indirect Costs Line (O7) +line (12) $348,866:33
i N
Cost Reduction == gy !
{14) Less: Ofiset Savings, if applicable $0.00
(15) Less: Other Reimbursements, if applicable $0.00
|
i
{16) Total Claimed Amount: {Line (13)-([Line(14) + lins(15)]} $348.068.33 |
r) J} 'éf{ffé!:b'



i
MANDATED COSTS FORM !
GOLLECTIVE BARGAINING cB-2 !
COMPONENT/ACTIVITY COST DETAIL
01) Claimant: Gavilan Joint Community College District [{02) Fiscal Year cosls were incurred: 1995/96
{03} Reimbursable Component:  COST OF NEGOTIATIONS
{04) Description of Expense: Complete columns (a) through (g). Cost Elements
@ b (©) @ (&) ) @
Employee Name, Job Classification and Activity Hourly Rate| Hours Salaries Transporta-
Performed or Description of Expense or Worked or and tion and Supplies Contracted
Unit Cost | Quantity Benefils Travel Services
Representative's Contract Proposal
Public Hearings
Public Distribution of Proposed Contract
District Contract Proposal
Carol Cooper Assoc. Dean 49.29 £8.8 3388.60 | 337}
Kent Child Assoc. Dean 47.99 83.5 400717 ¢~
Lucha Ortega Affirm. Action Off 49.72 86.0 427592
Karen Me Cracken Admin. Sec. 21.09 84.0 177156~
Suzanne Bulle Admin. Sec, 22,81 84.0 1916.04 7
|
i
]
((05) Totai Sublotal X Page 10of2 ]




- MANDATED COSTS FORM
COLLECTIVE BARGAINING CB-2
COMPONENT/ACTIVITY COST DETAIL
(01) Claimant: Gavilan Joint Community College District 1(02) Fiscai Year costs were incurred: 1995/96
(03) Reimbursable Component:  COST OF NEGOTIATIONS
04) Description of Expense: Complete columns {a) through (g). Cost Elements
(@ (b) (c) {d) (e) 4] @ -
Employee Name, Job Classification and Activity Hourly Rate | Hours Salaries Transporta-
Performed or Description of Expense _or Worked or and tion and Supplies Contracted
Unit Cost | Quantity Benefits Travel : Services
Planning Sessions
Carol Cooper v Assoc. Dean $49.29 5.5 $271.4047
Kent Child Assoc. Dean 47.99 3.0 143.97 -
Larry Carrier Dean of Business 56.38 8.0 451.041 / e}
Marcia Hannum Admin. Sec. 2245 1043| 23404125407 ]
John Hansell Direct. of Learning 4411 14.3 6285762
Jack Harpster Pean of Business 47 47 47.0 2231.091
Dr. Glenn Mayle Superintendent {6658 _ 423| 281301 szzif;*’gdc
Dr. Rose Marie Joyce Dean of Instruction 5187 10.3 531.67 |2 2%
Lucha Ortega Affirm, Action Off. 49.72 10.5 522,08 ’/
Dr. TJ Owens Dean of Std. Serv. 51.87 1.0 51.87( -
Vavrinek, Trine, Day & Co. Consuilants
‘ inv. #60560 qua hats~—p 5048407
inv, #60913 5-22810.05 1.4
Inv#ie 413 ( 1Y $926:35 ¢
inv:H#ET4t4 £ 1o 9716.90,
Travel & Mileage 1080.80 |~
Ruiz & Shapire, Attorney T L 40 6373.18 T
100.00 728.5 \f\‘a ’ 72650.00
85.001 . 403/} 3421.25
"At The Table" Negotiations - Certificated
Kent Child Assoc. Dean 47.99 13.5 647.87 ;
Carol Cooper Assoc. Dean 48,29 11.0 542.19
Dates of Negofiations 315196
3/22/96
4/8196
4/16/96
4/22/96
"At The Table" Negotiations - Classified
P -
John Hansell Direct. of Learning 44,11 26.8 1479.94 | / [ ?J' A5
Dates of Negotiations 7111795
71241395
7/27195
10/27/85
1217195
Public Distribution of Final Contract
John Hansell Direct. of Learning 4411 50 220.55 -
A5, 191,69 P
[(05) Total X Subtotal Page2of2 $27.034.70 $1,080.80 $6,373.19 ¢ $1253.667.65
S A el
/_ 7 C/? T 7 i )

7



MANDATED COSTS FORM
COLLECTIVE BARGAINING CB-2
COMPONENT/ACTIVITY COST DETAIL
{01) Claimant: Gavilan Joint Community College District [(02) Fiscal Year costs were incurred: 1995/96
(03) Reimbursable Component:  IMPASSE PROCEEDINGS
(04) Dascription of Expense: Complete celumns (a) through (g). Cost Elements
@ ® | @ d) ) M o -
Employee Name, Job Classification and Activity Hourly Rate | Hours Salaries Transporta-
Performed or Description of Expense or Worked or and tion and Supplies Contracted
Unit Cost | Quantity Benefils Travel Senvices
Mediation Sessions
S
//( i
- o
‘|Dr. Gilenn Mayle Superintendent __....Bessl 755 .. 502679 -
Larry Carrier T —""""Dean of Business 56.38 73.8 4158.03 |4/ { b £
Dr. TJ Owens Dean of Std. Serv. 51.87 173 894.76 |5 7. 20
Dr. Rose Marie Joyce Dean of Instruction 51.87 7.5 389.03 1 .
Lucha Ortega Affim. Action Off, 49.72 16.8 832815 2. 30>
John Hansel! Direct. of Learning 44,11 14.0 B17.54 1
Ruiz & Shapiro, Attorney LT 3412.70 i
100.00} - 898" 7 8975.00| -
85.00 457.0 |7 " 38845.00 |
ce g AL
/"'1_‘_5.'.-) f}é"’L)-
! LEGL T / Joy )
{05) Total X Subtotal Page 1 of 1 $11,918.95 $3,412.70 ] $47%820:00 |




MANDATED COSTS

FORM

COLLECTIVE BARGAINING cB.-2
COMPONENT/ACTIVITY COST DETAIL
{01) Claimant: Gavilan Joint Community College District [{02) Fiscal Year costs were incurred: 1995/86
(03} Reimbursable Component: CONTRACT ADMINISTRATION .
(04) Description of Expanse; Complete columns {a) through {g). Cost Elements j
@ () © (d) ) ) @ -
Employee Name, Job Classification and Activity Hourly Rate | Hours Salaries Transporta-
Performed or Description of Expense or Worked or and tion and Supplies Contracted
Unit Cost | Quantity Benefils Travel Services
Grievances
Howrard Bell - Maint & Oper. Suprv $31.84 4.0 $127.36
Dr. TJ Owens Dean of Std. Serv. 51.87 41.5 215261
Training Sessions
Dr. Rose Marie Joyce Dean of Instruction 51.87 6.0 311.22 -
Conlract Disputes Presented Before PERB
Larry Carrier Dean of Business £8.38 2.0 112.76 -
|
i
i
. I |

Subtotal X

Page 1 of 2

{05} Total



MANDATED COSTS FORM ]
COLLECTIVE BARGAINING CB.2 i
COMPONENT/ACTIVITY COST DETAIL !,
{01) Claimant: Gavilan Joint Community College District 102} Fiscal Year costs were incuired: 1995/98 :
{03) Reimbursable Component:  CONTRACT ADMINISTRATION |
(04} Description of Expense: Complete columns (a) through (g). Cost Elements
: @ ' (b) (© (d) (e) ) @ - ﬂ
Employee Name, Job Classification and Aclivity Hourly Rate | Hours Salaries Transporta-
Performed or Dascription of Expense or Worked or and tion and Supplles Contracted g
Unit Cost | Quantity Benefils Travel Services |
!
Appeal of PERB Ruling I
i
!
Contract Interpretation
Ruiz & Shapiro, Attormey R 1039.19 e 2
100.00 '69.5] . +6950.00] }
85.00 143.5 | 12197.50+ i
c.f.’“j. LT Gorgd
f: Yi,
|
; i
i i
i i
| |
- | %
(05) Total X Subtotal Page 2 of 2 $2.703.95 [ 51039191 $19.147.5Q




MANDATED COSTS FORM
COLLECTIVE BARGAINING cB-2
COMPONENT/ACTIVITY COST DETAIL
{01) Claimant: Gavilan Joint Community College Disirict [{02) Fiscal Year costs were incurred: 1995/98
{03) Reimbursable Component:  UNFAIR LABCR PRACTICE
{04) Description of Expense: Complete columns (a) through (g). Cost Elements ]
@ _ b ) &) fe) ® 5]
Employes Name, Job Classification and Aclivity Hourly Rate | Hours Salaries Transporta- :
Performed ar Description of Expense or Worked or and tion and Supplies Contracted
Unit Cost | Quantity Benefits Travel Services
Unfair Labor Practice Presented to PERB
Ruiz & Shapiro, Attorney - $5,029.71 - T ~
100.00 644.5] - 64450.00{ -
85.00 380.5 33192.50 (.-
o (H: / ?,‘ e
Appeal of PERB Ruling
? |
i
: R
I - ! . S |
Jo5) Toial X Subtotal Page 1 of 1 $5,020.71 ~-$97,6842.50 |




S W RV I A A

[

DQ.MNMQ =0t .\,\ww.\(T L M_\M 2|
N ety YUY S sy QoISTgILS R @opoklsh + aolsLo O8]
zimuﬁu\% D20/ @0/ A Q,Q\x_ G0l A e
—Z = Ry GOt oy
: \N:\IIW.W\NN IWN\W\:\N« fﬂN\GNMM ~ SEOCT
A
| _sd 900/
| ~ s sbd 7Y -
- — TS PZo
B Py fo 7@/ 9401/ 7
0
-. et ~ ¥ —eeto :
T o
o o O for e /
00 yad
127 s 0] f107 g1/ s
o L
] la\u\Q\
— T g Ty .
s <74 - b7 ol
_rZ9t _s/07 3 Ak
52
L &1
e \\rsu.\mm.‘.\m. W I\M.N..M.\ EMQ.Q\
o2 5

Bl @7 wm\%ﬁm

con i R Ty

o 9E XY



oLs

o0 v
L7 E

o

S70L
RrAA
DA
sz
R4
Q.57
o
v
2074
(RS
QQ%@"
SZ
SZ-
@ 7
LT
s’
L
S/
nids
<S4 S oo/

Aot o/
%w\\v s IS

- \AN\\Q\QQ
90/)

—



SZ.5% 52757 Y
<5 _s7o7 24 /9t/7
- L LS5 220
- / Sz [ 227
SZEh 5/ 0/ @\m\\\
_5Z°Z .
Q\M\\. \..V\Q\ B
00 'hb 2 @0 |
—p . 1 T
_— Ryvarcn YA LY YT séjbiry
EWN\.\\ :\mi.M.ﬁ 9007
—EE= 777 L0
_SL S 220/
L _sTZ7 ¢/ o
A o A0/
_ A
N —7¢ /¢ = E s/ _56/8/ 01
- = ST/ 9 007
e o5 LS -
_EL5
MSQN@Q - PR
e L * ' : -
L . N I

. ‘.,w. qx%



State Controller's Office School Mandated Cost Manuatl

Program ‘ COLLECTIVE BARGAINING
CLAIM SUMMARY FORM

G ? ? instructions’ CB1

{01) Enter the name of the ¢laimant.

{02} Type of Claim. Check a box, Reimbursement or Estimated, to identify the type of claim being filed.
Enter the fiscal year for which costs were incurred or are 1o be incurred.

Form CB-1 must be filed for a reimbursement claim. Do not complete form CB-1 if you are filing an
estimated claim and the estimate does not exceed the previous fiscal year's actual costs by more than
10%. Simply enter the amount of the esfimated claim on form FAM-27, line (07). However, if the
eslimated claim exceeds the previous fiscal year’s actual costs by more than 10%, form CB-1 must be
completed and a stalemen! attached explaining the increased costs. Without this information the high
estimated claim will aufomatically be reduced to 110% of the previous fiscal year's actual costs.

(03) For each of the reimbursable components, enter the total allowable cost from form CB-2, line {05),
columns (d} through (g) onto form CB-1, block (03}, lines (1) through (7), columns (a) through (d). Total
each line and enter in column (e).

(04) Add columns (03){(d) and (e) for Cost Elements, and enter the totals on this line.
{05) Method A. Enter the 1974-75 Winton Act (base year ) costs on line (05)e). Enter on line (05)(d) any
contract service costs included in line (05)(e).

Method B. Enter the amount from form CB-1.1, line (04)(b) onto line (05)(e). Enter on line {05)(d) any
contract service costs included in line {05)(e). .

{0B) Method A. Multiply the base year cost on line (05)(e) by the implicit price deflator {IPD}. The 2001-02 .-
{PDis 3.219.

Methad B. Enter the amount from form CB-1.1, liné (04){(d).

(07) Subtract the Base Year Direct Costs Adjusted by the IPD, line {06}, from Total Rodda Act Direct Cost,
line (04)e)."

(08) Subtract Total Contract Services, line (D4){d), from Tolal Rodda Act Direct Costs, line {04)(e).

{09) Subtract Base Year Contract Services, line (05)(d), from Base Year, 1974-75 Direct Costs, line (05){e),
and multiply the remainder by the IPD. ‘

{10} Subtract Base Year Cosis less Contract Services adjusted by the IPD, line {(09), from Total Rodda Act
Direcl Costs less Contract Services, line (08).
(11} Enter the indirect cost rate. School districts (K-12) may compute the amount of indirect costs to claim

by multiplying their total direct cosis by the State Department of Education forms J-380 or J-580 rate
applicable to the fiscal year of costs. Community college districts may use the federally approved OMB
A-21 rate, or the rate computed using form FAM-29C.

{12) Multiply Incremental Direct Costs less Contract Services, line (10), by Indirect Cost Rate, line {11).
- {13) - Enter the sum of Incremental Costs, line {07), and Incremental Indirect Costs, fine (12).-
(14) Less: Offsetting Savings. If applicable, enter the total savings experienced by the claimant as a direct

result of this mandate. Submit a detailed schedule of savings with the claim.

(iS) Less: Other Reimbursements. If applicable, enter the amount of other reimbursements received from
any source including, bul not limited to, service fees collected, federal funds, and other state funds,
which reimbursed any portion of the mandated cost program. Submit a schedule defailling the

reimbursement sources and amounts.
(16) Total Claimed Amount. Subtract the sum of Offselting Savings, line (09), and Gther Reimbursements,

line (10}, frorn Total Direct and Indirect Costs, line (08). Enter the remainder on this line and carry the
amount forward to form FAM-27, Tine (13) for the Reimbursement Claim.

Revised 9/02 Chapters 961/75 and 1213/81



Galivan Community College District

. Ruiz & Shagire

Page 1 of 13

120

25"

Date MNegotiations Unfair Labor Contract Admin lmpasse

07-10-1995 4,50
07-10-1995 0.75
07-10-1995 5.50
07-11-1995 1.50
07-11-1995 (.50
07-11-1995 1.256
07-12-1995 0.25
07-12-1995 1.50
07-12-1995 1.75
07-12-1995 0.50
07-13-1985 2.75
07-13-1895 5.00
07-14-1985 3.75
07-14-1995 0.75
07-17-1995 1.00
07-17-1995 1.75
07-17-1995 1.00
07-17-1995 1.00
07-18-1995 1.75
07-18-1995 0.50
07-18-1985 0.25
07-19-19985 1.50
07-19-1995 0.25
07-20-1995  1.25 40.%5"
07-20-1995 0.50
07-20-1995 7.00
07-21-1995 1.00
07-21-1995 1.00
07-22-1995 2.50
07-24-1995 8.00
07-24-1995 4.50
07-24-1895 3.00
07-24-1995 0.25
07-25-1995 5.75
07-25-1995 8.50

- 07-25-1995 68.00 2.00
07-26-1995 2.00
07-26-1995 8.50
07-26-1995 2.25 3.00
07-26-1995 1.25 .
07-27-1995 8.75
07-27-1995 1.75
07-27-1995 2.25
07-28-1995 4.00
07-28-1995 375
07-28-1995 2.75
07-28-1995 2.50
07-28-1995 4.00
07-28-1995 8.256
Q7-28-1995 1.75
07-31-1985 2.00
07-31-1995 4.50
08-01-1995 3.00
08-02-1995 0.75
08-02-1995 425 _ .-



3

* Galivan Community College District

Pate Negotiations Unfair Labor Contract Admin Impasse Name
08-03-1995 3.50 CMR
08-03-1995 0.25 MK
(8-03-1995 5.75 RAS
08-04-1995 3.00 CMR
08-04-1995 1.00 MK
08-04-1985 575 RAS
08-07-1995 8.00 CMR
08-07-1995 7.50 MK
08-07-1995 7.75 RAS
08-07-1995 1.25 WMQ
08-15-1995 1.25 MK
08-15-1995 7.00 RAS
08-16-1985 0.75 CMR
08-18-1995 2.00 MK
08-17-1995 1.00 CMR
08-17-1995 5.00 RAS
08-17-1995 5.50 RAS
08-18-1995 4.50 CMR
08-18-1995 7.25 MK
08-18-1995 8.25 RAS
08-19-1995 7.25 RAS
08-21-1995 3.00 CMR
08-21-1995 6.00 RAS
08-21-1995 1.25 JsJ
08-22-1995 2.50 CMR
08-22-1995 2.50 MK
08-22-1995 7.00 ‘RAS
08-22-1995 4,00 JsJ
08-23-1995 3.50 CMR
08-23-1995 5.00 MK
08-23-1995 8.50 RAS
(8-23-1995 11.75 RAS
08-23-1995 1.00 JSJ
08-23-1995 3.50 DGL
08-24-1995 8.50 CMR
08-24-1995 9.50 MK
08-24-1995 0.25 Jsd
08-24-1995 8.75 DGL
08-25-1995 .8.00 CMR
08-25-1995 6.00 MK
08-25-1985 4.25 RAS
08-25-1995 5.50 JSJ
08-25-1995 8.50 DGL
08-26-1995 2.00 CMR
08-26-1995 11.75 RAS
08-26-1995 1.00 JSJ
08-27-1995 6.00 CMR
08-27-1995 2.25 MK
08-27-1998 10.25 RAS
08-28-1995 8.00 CMR
08-28-19895 7.50 MK
08-28-1995 11.75 RAS
08-28-1995 1.25 WMQ
08-28-1995 4,50 JSJ
08-28-1994 2.75 DGL

Page 2 of 13



Galivan Community College District

Date Negotiations Unfair L.abor Contract Admin Impasse: Name
08-28-1985 1.25 . DGL
08-29-1995 12.00 CMR
08-29-1995 11.00 MK
08-29-19495 12.00 RAS
08-29-1995 1.50 WMQ
08-29-1995 0.75 JSJ
08-29-1995 4.50 : DGL
08-30-1995 10.00 CMR
08-30-1995 11.25 RAS
08-30-1995 2.75 WMQ
08-30-1995 1.50 Jsd
08-30-1995 3.50 DGL
08-30-1995 2,75 DGL
08-30-1995 4,50 CK
08-31-1995 3.50 : CMR
08-31-1995 11.00 MK
08-31-1995 2.50 _ _ ) DGL
09-01-1095  37¢5 4,25 DGL
09-05-1995 3.75 DGL
09-06-1995 2.50 DGL
09-07-1995 3.75 DGL
09-08-1995 0.25 JLS
09-08-1995 3.00 DGL
09-11-1995 ) 0.50 CMR
09-11-19956 0.50 JLS
09-11-1995 0.50 DGL
09-12-1995 - 550 DGL
09-13-1995 0.50 CMR
- 09-19-1995 0.50 CMR
09-19-1995 0.25 JLS
09-19-1995 0.25 DGL
09-20-1995 0.50 CMR
09-20-1995 2.25 JLS
09-20-1995 0.756 DGL
09-21-1995 1.75 JLS
06-13-1995 2.00 CJK
09-18-1995 0.25 . JLS
09-01-1995 8.00 CMR
09-01-1995 9.50 RAS
09-01-1995 0.50 DGL.
09-02-1995 1.50 CMR
09-04-1995 2.00 CMR
09-05-1995 13.00 CMR
09-05-1995 11.50 MK
09-05-1995 12.25 RAS
08-05-1995 .50 , DGL
09-06-1995 2.00 CMR
09-06-1995 0.75 MK
09-07-1995 2.00 CMR
09-07-1995 0.75 MK
09-08-1995 3.50 CMR
09-08-1995 475 MK
09-08-1995 0.50 DGL
09-11-1995 2.00 CMR
09-11-1995 2.50 CMR

Page 3 of 13



Galivan Community College District

Page 4 of 13

Date Negotiations Unfair Labor Coniract Admin Impasse Name
09-11-1995 0.50 CMR
09-11-1995 1.00 CMR
09-11-1995 9.50 MK
09-11-1995 2.50 CJdK
09-12-1995 7.50 CMR
09-12-1995 1.00 CMR
09-12-1895 A4.75 RAS
09-12-1995 2.50 CJK
09-13-1995 2.50 CMR
09-13-1985 0.50 DGL
09-14-1995 1.00 CMR
09-14-1995 1.00 CMR
09-14-1995 0.25 MK
09-14-1996 5.25 RAS
09-14-1995 4,25 DGL
09-15-1995 2.00 "CMR
09-15-1995 0.75 CMR
09-15-1995 0.50 CMR
09-15-1995 0.50 CMR
09-15-1995 2.25 RAS
09-15-1995 2.50 DGL
08-18-1995 3,50 CMR
09-18-1995 1.00 CMR
09-18-1995 0.75 RAS
09-19-1995 2.00 CMR
09-19-1995 0.25 CMR
09-18-1995 0.50 CMR
09-19-1995 2.25 RAS

- 09-20-1995 2.00 CMR
09-21-1995 3.00 CMR
09-21-1995 2.25 RAS
09-22-1995 1.50 CMR
098-22-1995 0.75 RAS
09-25-1995 1.50 CMR
09-25-1995 225 MK
09-25-1995 5.50 RAS
00-25-1995 1,25 CJK
09-26-1995 1.00 CMR
09-26-1995 0.50 CMR
09-26-1995 3.25 RAS
09-26-1995 3.25 CJK
09-27-1995 2.00 CMR
09-27-1995 0.25 PSC
09-27-1995 2.00 RAS
09-28-1995 7.25 CMR
09-29-1995 2.00 CMR
09-29-1985 0.25 MK
09-29-1995 0.50 RAS
09-29-1995 1.25 WMQ
10-03-1995 1.60 CMR
10-03-1995 0.75 RAS
10-03-1995 0.50 JLS
10-04-1995 10.50 RAS
10-04-1995 0.25 JLS
10-05-1995 1.50 CMR



‘Galivan Community College District

Date Negotiations Unfair Labor Contract Admin |mpasse Name
10-05-1895 1.25 RAS
10-06-1995 1.25 _ JILS
10-07-1995 9.75 IAD
10-08-1995 575 [AD
10-09-1995 0.50 CMR
10-09-1995 1.25 RAS
10-09-1985 1.75 JLS
10-09-1995 7.25 IAD
10-10-1995 2.00 JLS
10-10-1985 9.00 (AD
10-11-1995 0.25 RAS
10-11-1995 0.75 JLS
10-11-1995 : 10.50 IAD
10-12-1995 0.50 CMR
10-12-1985 6.25 IAD
10-13-1995 0.75 JLS
10-13-1995 4.50 : IAD
10-13-1995 1.25 IAD
10-16-1995 1.25 JLS
10-16-1995 . 1.25 IAD
10-17-1995 ' 0.75 JLS
10-17-1995 1.50 IAD
10-18-1995 0.50 CMR
10-18-1985 ‘ 1.25 CMR
10-18-1995 2.50 CMR
10-18-1995 1.75 MK
10-18-1995 3.75 IAD
10-19-1995 3.00 IAD
10-20-1995 6.00 IAD
10-22-1995 4.25 IAD
10-23-1995 0.50 CMR
10-23-1995 2,75 JLS
10-23-1995 7.50 |AD
10-24-1995 .00 JLS
10-24-1995 8.75 1AD
10-25-1995 0.50 CMR
10-25-1995 ‘ 575 IAD
10-26-1995 8.50 IAD
10-27-1995 1.50 CMR
10-27-1995 0.75 MK
10-27-1985 8.00 tAD
10-30-1995 1.00 CMR
10-30-1995 0.50 MK
10-02-1995 2.50 MK
10-02-1395 4.25 DGL
10-09-1995 1.00 CMR
10-09-1995 2.50 MK
10-10-1995 3.50 MK
10-11-1995 0.50 LMR
10-18-1995 1.50 ' MK
10-19-1995 1.25 DGL
10-20-1995 2.00 DGL
10-27-1995 7.50 : MK
10-27-1995 8.50 DGL
10-30-1995 6.00 DGL
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Galivan Community College District

Date Negotiations Unfair Labor Contract Admin Impasse Name
10-16-1995 2.50 : CJK
10-23-1995 1.00 MK
00-25-1995 1.25 CJK
09-26-1895 34968.00 ' 3.25 CJK
10-02-1995 2.00 CMR
10-02-1995 3.75 MK
10-02-1995 0.25 ) WMQ
10-03-1995 4.25 MK
10-04-1995 3.25 CMR
10-04-1995 1.50 MK
10-04-1995 225 CJdK
10-05-1995 9.00 CMR
10-05-1995 _ 8.00 MK
10-05-1995 1.60 RAS
10-05-1995 2.00 CJK
10-06-1995 0.75 RAS
10-09-1995 2.75 CMR
10-09-1995 1.00 CMR
10-09-1995 1.50 MK
10-09-1995 1.25 RAS
10-09-1995 1.25 CJK
10-10-1995 1.00 CMR
40-11-1995 1.25 CMR
10-11-1895 0.50 _ MK
10-11-1985 0.75 RAS
10-12-1995 1.25 ‘ CMR
10-12-1995 5.50 MK
10-13-1905 1.00 CMR

- 10-16-1985 0.25 CMR
10-16-1995 1.50 MK
10-18-1995 0.50 CMR
10-18-1995 0.25 CMR
10-18-1995 1.50 . MK
10-19-1995 1.75 CMR
10-19-1995 0.50 CMR
10-19-1995 3.50 MK
10-20-1995 2.50 MK
10-20-1995 0.75 JLS
10-24-1995 1.50 CMR
10-24-1995 2.50 CMR
10-25-1995 0.25 RAS
10-26-1995 1.50 ‘RAS
10-27-1995 7.50 CMR
10-27-1985 0.25 MK
10-30-1995 1.00 CMR
10-30-1995 1.50 MK
10-30-1995 0.75 RAS
11-01-1985 1.00 MK
11-06-1895 1.00 TAD
11-07-1995 . 0.25 CMR
11-07-1995 2.75 IAD
11-09-1995 3.25 IAD
11-10-1995 1.75 CMR
11-10-1985 5.50 IAD
11-12-1995 ) 3.00 IAD
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Galivan Community College District

Date Negotiations Unfair Labor Contract Admin Impasse Name
11-13-1995 0.50 CMR
11-13-1995 0.50 MK
11-13-1995 7.50 IAD
14-14-1995 7.50 IAD

- 11-15-1995 0.50 CMR
11-15-1995 0.25 JLS

- 11-15-1995 10.25 IAD
11-16-1995 9.25 IAD
11-17-1995 6.00 MK
11-17-1985 10.00 IAD
11-18-1995 10.75 IAD
11-18-1995 15.00 IAD
11-20-1995 0.25 CMR
11-20-1995 2.50 MK
41-20-1995 15.00 IAD.
11-21-1995 12.00 MK
11-21-1995 12.00 1AD
11-22-1995 4.50 MK
11-25-1895 4.00 IAD
11-26-1995 8.50 IAD
11-27-1995 2.00 MK
11-27-1995 8.00 IAD
11-28-1995 0.50 CMR
11-28-1995 _ 2.00 MK
11-28-1995 6.75 IAD
11-29-1995 8.00 IAD
11-30-1995 6.75 IAD
07-10-1995 3.00 LPS

~07-11-1995 0.50 LPS
07-12-1995 1.00 LPS
07-20-1995 3.50 LPS
07-21-1985 1.25 LPS
07-24-1995 2.50 7 . LPS
07-25-1995 7.50 LPS
(07-28-1995 1.00 LPS
07-31-1995 1.00 LPS
08-11-1995 0.25 LPS
08-22-1995 3.00 LPS
09-01-1995 0.25 LPS
11-01-1995 1.00 CMR
11-01-1995 5.50 _ MK
11-01-1885 1.00 RAS
11-02-1995 5.00 MK
11-02-1995 7.25 RAS
11-03-1995 2.25 RAS
11-03-1995 4.25 DGL
11-06-1995 0.50 CMR
11-06-1895 2.50 RAS
11-07-1995 0.25 : CMR
11-07-1995 0.50 RAS
11-08-1995 1.50 RAS
11-08-1995 1.50 CMR
11-09-1985 1.0 MK
11-10-1995 3.00 MK
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Galivan Community College District

Date Negotiations Unfair Labor Centract Admin Impasse Name
11-13-1995 1.00 . CMR
11-13-1995 0.25 MK
11-13-1995 1.50 RAS
11-14-1995 1.50 : CMR
11-15-1995 1,00 CMR
41-20-1995 0.50 CMR
11-20-1995 3.50 RAS
11-21-1995 450 RAS
11-27-1995 8.50 CMR
11-28-1995 2.50 MK
11-29-1995 1.00 MK
11-30-1995 0.50 CMR
11-30-1995 0.75 CMR
11-30-1995 575 RAS
12-07-1995 0.75 CK
12-12-1995 0.50 J48J
12-20-1995 _ 2.75 RAS
12-21-1995 2.00 MK
12-21-1995 0.50 RAS
12-01-1995 1.75 ‘ DGL
12-04-1995 1.00 CMR
12-05-1995 0.75 CMR
12-(05-1995 4.50 RAS
12-06-1995 2.00 . CMR
12-07-1995 12.00 CMR
12-07-1995 225 RAS
12-07-1995 1.75 DGL
12-11-1995 2.00 MK

. 12-18-1995 1.50 RAS
12-18-1995 0.50 JSJ
12-19-1995 3.75 JsJ
12-19-1995 2.25 DGL
12-20-1995 0.50 JSJ
12-20-1995 2.50 DGL
12-22-1995 2.00 RAS
12-22-1995 . 0.25 DGL
12-26-1995 2.00 MK
12-27-1995 1.00 CMR
12-27-1995 0.50 ' MK
12-28-1995 0.50 CMR
12-28-1995 0.50 MK
01-18-1996 4,00 CMR
01-04-1996 1.25 DGL

~ 01-05-1996 0.25 DGL
01-02-1896 1.50 RAS
01-03-1996 0.25 . CMR
01-03-1996 0.75 RAS
01-03-1996 1.25 DGL
01-04-1995 0.75 CMR
01-04-1996 1.25 DGL
01-05-1996 1.25 CMR
01-05-1996 375 RAS
01-05-1996 0.25 DGL
01-08-1996 525 RAS
01-09-1996 2.00 CMR

Page 8 of 13



Galivan Community College District

Date Negotiations Unfair Labor Coniract Admin Impasse Name
01-09-1986 3.25 RAS
01-10-1996 1.00 CMR
01-10-1996 2.50 1AD
01-11-1996 8.50 CMR
01-12-1996 2.25 CMR
01-12-1996 3.75 RAS
01-12-1996 1.25 JLS
01-16-1996 1.00 CMR
1-16-1996 1.00 RAS
01-18-1998 2.00 DGL
01-19-1996 0.75 RAS
01-22-1996 1,50 CMR
01-25-1996 1.50 CMR
01-29-1996 0.75 RAS
02-05-1998 0.50 WMQ
02-06-1996 0.25 WMQ
02-12-1996 1.50 WMQ
02-28-1996 0.75 WMQ
02-06-1996 0.50 CMR
02-07-1996 7.00 CMR
02-08-1996 0.50 RAS
02-09-1996 0.75 RAS
02-12-1996 0.50 CMR
02-13-1996 0.50 CMR
02-13-1996 3.75 1AD
02-16-1996 1.00 CMR
02-23-1996 0.50 CMR
02-26-1996 1.50 CMR
02-27-1996 0.76 CMR
02-28-1996 1.00 CMR
03-01-1996 2.00 CMR
03-01-1996 3.25 WMQ
03-01-1996 475 KON
03-02-1996 3.00 KON
03-04-1096 1.00 CMR
03-04-1996 5.50 KON
03-056-1996 575 KON
03-06-1996 1.50 CMR
03-06-1996 7.00 KON
03-07-1996 7.50 KON
03-08-1996 5.75 JLS
03-08-1996 5.50 KON
03-12-1906 6.00 CMR
03-12-1996 2.50 WMQ
03-13-1996 0.25 WMQ
03-18-1986 3.50 DEF
03-19-1996 0.50 CMR
03-12-1996 2.50 DEF
03-22-1996 0.50 _JLS
03-22-1996 1.50 WMQ
03-23-1996 0.75 WMGQ
03-26-1996 1.00 CMR
03-26-1996 2.25 DEF
03-27-1996 2.50 DEF
03-01-1996 0.75 CMR
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~ Galivan Community College District
Dale Negotiations Unfair Labor Contract Admin [mpasse Name

03-01-1996  6.50 . CMR
03-01-1996  0.25 RAS
03-03-1996  5.00 CMR
03-04-1996  1.50 CMR
03-04-1996  0.25 RAS
03-04-1996 0.75 MT
03-06-1996  2.50 CMR
03-05-1996  7.50 CMR
03-05-1996 0.25 JLS
03-06-1996  2.00 CMR
03-06-1996  0.75 CMR
03-06-1996  1.00 RAS
03-07-1996:  0.50 CMR
03-07-1996 225 RAS
03-07-1996 1.75 MT
03-08-1996  1.00 CMR
03-08-1996 1.00 MT
03-08-1996  1.25 - MT
03-11-1996 050 CMR
03-11-1996 0.50 CMR
03-11-1996  0.75 RAS
03-11-1996 0.75 a MT
03-11-1996 050 MT
03-12-1996  1.00 _ CMR
03-12-1996  1.25 ' _ : RAS
03-12-1996 0.50 MT
03-13-1996  0.50 | CMR
03-13-1996  0.50 CMR
03-13-1996  2.50 RAS
03-13-1996 1 0.25 MT
03-13-1996  4.25 MT
03-14-1996  2.00 . CMR
03-14-1996  1.75 : MT
03-15-1996 6.0 CMR
03-18-1996  6.50 ~ CMR
03-18-1998 0.75 MT
03-18-1996  2.75 MT
03-19-1996 1.0 CMR
03-19-1996 2.75- MT
03-19-1996  1.50 MT
03-19-1996  1.75 DEF
03-20-1996  2.50 CMR
03-20-1996 1.75 MT
03-20-1996  1.50 MT
03-20-1996 525 DEF
03-21-1996  2.00 CMR
03-21-1996 5,50 DEF
03-22-1996  7.50 CMR
03-22-1996  0.25 MT
03-22-1996  0.25 MT
03-22-1996  0.25 DEF
03-26-1996  1.25 CMR
03-26-1996  0.25 DEF
03-28-1996  0.75 , DEF
03-29-1996  3.50 : CMR
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Galivan Community College District

Page 11 of 13

Date Negotiations Unfair Labor Contract Admin Impasse Name
03-29-1996 0.25 DEF
04-02-1996 0.25 RAS
03-11-1996 3.50 KON
03-13-1996 0.50 IAD
03-18-1996 4.50 IAD
04-03-1996 1.25 DEF
04-05-1996 2,75 DEF
04-08-1996 1.75 DEF
04-09-1996 0.75 DEF
04-12-1996 0.50 CMR
04-15-1996 0.25 DEF
04-18-1996 1.00 CMR
04-18-1996 0.50 DEF
04-19-1996 1.25 DEF
04-22-1996 1.50 CMR
04-22-1996 1.50 DEF
04-24-1096 2.00 PEF
04-25-1996. 0.50 CMR
04-25-1996 1.75 WMQ
04-25-1996 4.25 1AD
04-25-1096 1.50 DEF
04-03-1998 3.25 DEF
04-01-1996 1.50 CMR
04-01-1986 2.00 MT
04-02-1996 0.50 CMR
04-02-1996 0.25 DEF
04-04-19396 1.00 CMR
04-04-1996 4.25 DEF

- 04-05-1996 4.75 DEF
04-08-1996 7.50 CMR
04-08-1996 1.00 DEF
04-09-1996 1,50 CMR
04-09-1996 5.25 WMQ
04-09-1996 1.75 DEF
04-10-1998 4.75 WMQ
04-10-1996 1.75 DEF
04-11-1996 1.50 CMR
04-11-1996 2.75 WMG
04-12-1996 1.00 CMR
04-12-1996 3.25 WMQ
04-15-1996 2.00 CMR
04-15-1996 8.75 WMQ
04-16-1996 5.00 CMR
04-16-1996 0.25 WMQ
04-18-1996 1,00 CMR
04-18-1995 0.50 WMQ
04-19-1996 0.75 CMR
04-22-1996 4.00 CMR
04-23-1996 1.75 CMR
04-23-1996 4.00 WMQ
04-24-1996 1.00 CMR
04-24-1996 1.50 WMQ
04-25-1996 2.50 CMR
04-25-1996 0.25 WMQ
04-26-1996 1.00 CMR



Galivan Community College District

Date Negotiations Unfair Labor Contract Admin Impasse Name
04-26-1996 3.50 : WMQ
04-29-1996 4.00 CMR
04-29-1996 0.75 WWMQ
04-30-1996 1.00 CMR
04-12-1996 0.75 CMR
04-19-1996 6.50 IAD
04-20-1996 1.50 WMQ
04-22-1996 0.75 CMR
04-30-1996 0.75 1AD
05-01-1996 1.75 : CMR
05-06-1995 8.50 CMR
05-09-1996 4.50 IAD
05-10-1996 6.75 WMQ
05-10-1996 4.00 IAD
05-13-1996 1.00 CMR
05-13-1996 . 0.75 WMQ
05-13-1998 1.00 1AD
05-01-1996 1.00 CMR:
05-01-1996 0.75 WMQ
05-03-1996 9.25 DEF
05-08-1996 0.50 CMR
05-10-1996 0.50 DEF
05-14-1998 1.00 CMR
05-15-1998 1.00 ) CMR
05-15-1996 0.50 RAS
05-16-1996 1.50 CMR
05-16-1996 8.75 WMQ
05-16-1996 2.00 |AD

- 05-17-1996 3.50 : CMR
05-17-1996 2.50 WMQ
05-21-1996 0.50 ) WMQ
05-29-1996 1.50 CMR
05-31-1896 2.00 CMR
05-01-1996 4.00 DEF
05-02-1996 2.25 : ' WMQ
05-02-1996 9.25 DEF
05-03-1096 5.50 WMQ -
05-03-1996 1.50 IAD
05-04-1996 7.25 : WMQ
05-04-1996 - 5.00 IAD
05-05-1996 6.50 WMQ
05-05-1996 3.00 |1AD
-05-06-1906 8.75 WMQ
(5-06-1996 4.00 IAD
05-06-1996 3.25 DEF
05-20-1998 ‘ 0.25 DEF
06-03-1996 1.00 CMR
06-03-1996 8.50 : WMQ
06-04-1996 2.00 CMR
06-04-1996 0.50 . WMQ
06-05-1996 1.25 CMR
08-07-1996 0.75 WMQ
06-10-19986 2.00 : CMR
06-14-1996 0.50 CMR
06-17-1996 1.80 CMR
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Galivan Community College District

Date Negotiations Unfair Labor Contract Admin Impasse Name
06-17-1996 1.00 . , CMR
06-17-1986 1.25 WMQ

TOTALS  36211.00 217.50 459.00 ./ 1650+
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Gavilan Joint Community College District
Collective Bargaining

Incorrect Reduction Claim

For fiscal year 1995/1996

Ps & Gs Section E [ Governing Authority (overhead)]

The cost for Salaries and expenses of the governing authority, for example,
the School Superintendent and Governing Board, are not reimbursable.
These are costs of general government. . ..

Dr. Glenn Mayle Superintendent  $2,813.01

42.3 hours at $66.58/hour

Vsvrinek, Trine, Day & Co.

Invoice # 60913 for services through 4/30/96 $18,810.05

Invoice # 60560 for services through 3/31/96 $ 5,043.10

Invoice # 61413 for services through 4/30/96 $18,810.05

Appears to be the details for Invoice # 60913 (invoice totals $1 5,810.55,
CB-2 claims $22,810.05; $22,810.05 Less the WORK IN PROGRESS
figure of $,000.00 = $18,810.05. CB-2 claims invoice #60913 which is for

$18,810.05. What is Correct?).

Invoice 61414 totals $13,926.35, but, CB-2 claims $9,926.35 ( invoice

#61414 totals $9,926.35 plus the $4,000.00 work in progress.
$9,926.35+$4,000.00=:$13,926.35. What is the story on the Work In
Progress? This figure is subtracted from one work and added to another).

Invoice # 61609 totals the amount claimed; however the CB-2 claims milage
of $1,080.80/ This $1,080.80 was included in the claims for Contracted

Services.

Invoice # 60560 1is claimed for $5,043.10, however there is no detail shown
for this amount ( how many hours at how much per hour).



AVILAN COMMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICT
USINESS SERVICES

505 SANTA THRESA BLVD.

ILROY CA 95020

Please return lop portion with remittance Check Number:

Description

Professional Services for March 1996:

Assistance with negotiations.

Client (D: TAB-29
Invoice #: 60560

For Services Through:  3/31/96

Anount Enclosed 8

Page 1 of 1

Amount

5,043.10

New Charges: $5,043.10
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GAVILAN COMMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BUSINESS SERVICES

5505 SANTA THRESA BLVD.

GILROY CA 95020

Pleaseé return tap portion with remittance Check Number;

Client [D: TAB-19
[nvoice : 80913

For Services Through:  4/30/96

Amount Enclosed §

Page 1 of 1
Description Amount
Negotiations assistance. 18,810,05
Fro= F5aD
— Stz
ap
’ New Charges: $18,810.05
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ﬁ %m/,é CB 2

s+

meé Moe/z.



April 30, 1996

Gavilan Community College
5505 Santa Thresa Blvd, Client: TAB-29
Gilray, CA 95020 Invoice: 61413

Analysis'of financial statements and transactions, gathering of documents, and computations
to assist District in collective bargaining negotiations.

Thomas Brewer, Partner 70hours @  $90/hr $6,300.00 ~~
Ann Weaver, Consultant 6L5hours @  $80/hr 4,920.00
George Landon, Manager 365hours @ $75mr 2,737.507
Bonnita Ruesch, Consultant 110 hours @ $73Mr 8,250,007
Travef and Mileage : 602.55
Less work in progress -4,000.00
Total Due $18.810.05



May 31, 1996

Gavilan Community College
5505 Santa Thresa Blvd. Client: TAB-29
Gilroy, CA 95020 nvoice: 61414

Analysis of financial statements and transactions, gathering of documents, and conlputations
to assist District in collective bargaining negotiations.

‘Thomas Brewer, Partner 36 hours @  $90/Mmr  $ 3,240.00 ¢~
Ann Weaver, Consuitant Shours @  $80/Mr 400.00"
Bonrita Ruesch, Consultant 80.5houwrs @  375r 6037.30 g
Travel and Mileage 248.85 ¢ /_} 7 i, 3 S
Add prior month work in progress 4,000.00

Total Due ‘ $ 1392635 ¢



GAVILAN COMMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BUSINESS SERVICES

5505 SANTA THRESA BLVD.

GILROY CA 95020

Client ID:  TAB-29

Invoice #: 61609

For Services Through:  6/30/96

Please return top portion with remitiance  Check Number: Amount Enciosed 8

Description

Analysis of accounts, computations and reprbts to management for
collective bargaining negotiations

Parner - Thomas Brewer 50 hours @ 3$90/hr
Consultant - Bonnie Ruesch 66.50 hours @ 3$75/hr
Mileage '

Accounting assistance with closing the 1995-96 District financial
statements

Consultant - Bonnie Ruesch | 8 hours @ $75/hr
Consultant - Keiko Mizumo 62 hours @ 350/hr
Mileage
New Charges:

Page 1

Page 1 of 1

Amount

4,500.00/

4,987.50 a 4Ntk g0

229.40

600.00
3,100.00+ | 7/t~

2170 )

$13,438.60 ,
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SIAIEMEN)

(" CELIA M. RUIZ
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

5055 SANTA
GILROY, CA
ATTENTION:

9?5020
DR.

g .
| vl
GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE /é;g
TERESA BLYD. J -1

GLENN MAYLE

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005 p
o I >

1

5
)

Y

LS

%,
i "\

~
\

FILE #1000 SUMMARY FILE (10)
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF:
FILE #1000 SUMMARY FILE (10)
FILE #1015 ARBALLD (10)

CURRENT HOURS: 194,25

PREVIOUS DALANCE: " 16779.94 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS

PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:

PLUS CUR COSTS: 636.73, EQUALS NEW BALANCE:
FILE #1019 CONSTRUCTION (10)

CURRENT HOURS: 0.00

PREVIOUS SALANCE: 675.46 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:

PLUS CUR COSTS: 0.21/ EQUALS NEW BALANCE:
FILE #1014 CSEA (10}

CURRENT HOURS: 2al5

PREVIOQUS BALANCE: 185773.69 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:

PLUS CUR COSTS: 99.83, EQUALS NEW BALANCE:
FILE #1013 DIAZ (10)

CURRENT HOURS: 0.00

PREVIOUS BALANCESs 70.20 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:

PLUS CUR COSTS: U.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:
FILE #1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE (10)

CURRENT HOUERS: 41.25

PREVIOUS BALANCE ¢ 7598.17 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS =

PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:

“PLUS CUR C0NST5: 110.65 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:
FILE #1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE (10

CURRENT HOURS: 0.00

PREVIOUS BALANCE: 7385.52 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:

PLUS CUR COSTS: 1.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

DEC T4, 1995

PLEASE PAY $282475.19

-
I

v

$282475.17

g.00
18378.75/
35795.427

0. 00
0.00
6754677

15000.00
233,75
1?310?.32/’

0.03
0.00
70,20/

0.n0
4935.00
12643.82

0.00
0.00
7386.52




STATEMENT-

(2503-10-1000 DEC 14, 1995 PAGE 2
(FILE #1017 JOHNSON'S DFEH COMPLAINT (10)
' CURRENT HOURS: 0.25
PREVIOUS BALANCE:  9657.00 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 0.00
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: 32.50
PLUS CUR COSTS: 39.66 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 9729.16,”
FILE #1021 JOHNSON TORT (10)
CURRENT HOURS: 2.25
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 130.00 HMINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 0.00
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: 292.50
PLUS CUR COSTS: 13.47 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 435,97,
FILE #1012 KARCICH (10)
CURRENT HOURS: 0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 65.00 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 0.00
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: 0.00
PLUS CUR €O5TS: 0.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 65.00v
FILE #1006 LABOR RELATIONS (10>
CURRENT HOURS: 96.50
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 31716.87 mINus cuR PAYMENTS ; 0.00
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: 12211,25
PLUS CUR COSTS: 637.99 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 44566.11./
TOTAL OF PREVIOQUS STATEMENT BALANCES: 259851.85
MIMUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT PAYMENTS: 15000.00V/<
UNPAID FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENTS: 244851,.85 N
PLUS: TOTAL oFf CURRENT LATE CHARGES:: 0.00
PLUS: TOTAL ¢F CURRENT FEES: 36083,.75
PLUS:  TOTAL OF CURRENT COSTS: 1539.59
375327
EQUALS: TOTAL BALANCE bDYyE THIS STATEMENT: 282475.19
,
e b gy ¥ e
STATEMENT DATE: DEC 14, 1995 FILE #1000
RUIZ & SCHAPILRO
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(" CELIA M. RUIZ SYATEMENT DEC 14, 1995
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $35795.42
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

£ L7

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE f./i &

S05S SANTA TERESA BLVD. l A

GILROY, CA 95020 - .

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE (f -

,%{,4’7

FILE #1015 ARBALLO 19y /-
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: 3$35795.42
FILE #1015 aARBATLD - (10)

PROFESSTONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT ¢ HOURS - FEES

MK 11/ 1 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DR.’ﬁaYLE ”T’ .00 130.480
RE HEARING; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE HITHV/J
OPPOSING COUNSEL PATTY LARSEN RE
HEARING, TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
DR. OWENS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
SAM BOZZ0, MONTEREY COUNTY BOARD OF
EDUCATION, RE HEARING OFFICER.

IAD 11/ 6 DRAFTING SUMMARY OF INTERVIEWS WITH 1.00 35.00
L. ORTEGA AND T, OWENS. -7
CMR 11/ 7 TC WITH CLIENT RE CASE PREPARATION. «25 32.50

IAD 11/ 7 PHONE CALLS TO L.ORTEGA; RESEARCH RE  2.75 233,75
WORKERS' COMPENSATION TIME OFF AND

OVERTIME,
IAD 11/ 9 DRAFTING SUMMARY OF INTERVIEW FOR L. 3.25 276,25
) ORTEGA,
CMR 11/10 HEARING PREPARATION. 1.75 227,50
TAD 11/10 DRAFTING AND REVISING SUMMARY OF 5.50 467 .50

NOTES FROM INTERVIEW WITH L.ORTEGA
AND DR. OWENS.

IAD 11/12 REVISE DR. OWEN'S INTERVIEW NOTES. 3.00 255.00

CMR 11713 TC RE HEARING OFFICER. .50 65. 00

MK 11713 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH POTENT IAL -50 65.00
HEARING: OFFICER»: CECILIA s:uvrer ~:cevriars san s <

CASTELLANOSSREVIEYW RESUME;REVIEW
DRAFT LETTER TO DR. MAYLE RE HEARING
AND HEARING OFFICER.

LAD 11/13 REVISE DR, OWEN'S TESTIMONY; RESEARCH ?.50 637,50
RE SUSPENSION; REVISE L. ORTEGA'S
INTERVIEW NOTES, DRAFT AND REVISE /
LETTER TO DR, MAYLE RE HEARING
OFFICER; MEET RE HEARING OFFICER;,?
TELEPHONE CALL TO L. ORTEGA RE MEMO;

' REVISE NOTICE OF HEARING.

TAD 31/14 HORE MESSAGES AND CONVERSATIONS W/ 7.50 637.50
He SCHAFFER AT WILLLIS CORROON; LETTER
T0 N. SCHAFFER RE REPRESENTATION OF
GAVILAM roll FRFI RFSFARPH Na e£n ranc




2503-10-1015 DEC Ths 19Y5

CMR 11/15
JLS 11/15
IAD 11/15

IAD 11716

MK 11/17

[AD 11/17

1A 11/138

TAD 11719

CHR 11/20
MK 11720
IAD 11/20

MK 11721
1AD 11/21

AND GOV. CODE PROVISIONS RE NOTICE OF
HEARING AND HEARING PROCEDURES;
RESEARCH RE SEARCH FOR HEARING
OFFICERSS

ASSIST WITH TERMINATION ISSUES.
REVIEW R EOIT DRAFT LETTER & NOTICE.
PREPARATION OF BRIEF FOR ARBALLO
OQUTLINE; CALLS TO G. MAYLE, DR.
OWENS, L. ORTEGA AND CECILIA
CASTELLANOS RE SCHEDULING OF HEARING:
ORAFT LETTER TO ARBALLO & LARSEN RE
MOTICE OF HEARING; MEETING RE NOTICE
OF HEARING; TELECONFER RE PROGRESS OF
FILE; PHONE CALL TO SCHAFFER AND
MCLEAN AT WILLIS CORROON RE WORKMAN'S
COMP CLAIMS; MEETING RE PREP OF
HEARING MATERIALS.

PREP OF BRIEF FOR ARBALLO HEARING:
PREP OF HEARING QUESTIONS FOR L.
ORTEGA, REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS; DRAFTING
OF L. ORTEGA®'S HEARING QUESTIONS;
PHONE CALL TO C. CASTELLANOS; REVIEW
OF WILLIS CORROON DOCUMENTS; PREP FOR
METING W/ L. ORTEGA AND DR. OWENS:
REVIEW OF ARBALLO TESTIMONY AT
PREVIOUS HEARING; PREP OUTLINE OF
CLAIN.

HEARING PREPARATION; MEET WITH
WITNESSES, DRa.. OWENS AND LUCIA
ORTEGA.

PREPARATION FOR MEETINGS WITH L.
ORTEGA AND DR. OWENS; DRAFT AND
REVISE QUESTIONS FOR L. ORTEGA AND
DR. OWENS; TRAVEL TO AND FROM GAVILAN
COLLEGES MEET W/ L. DRTEGA AND DR.
OWENS. booe 5.0
DRAFT AND REVISE QUESTIONS FOR L.
ORTEGA AND DR. OWENS FOR HEARING;
PREP OF INFQO AND CHARTS; REVIEW
DOCUMENTS; REVIEW ABSENCE REPORTS.
DRAFT AND REVISE QUESTIONS FOR L.
DRTEGA AND DR. OWENS FOR HEARING:
DRAFT AND REVISE CROSS EXAMINATION OF
ARBALLO;

FAGLE Z

«30 - 65.00
-25 32.50
10425 871.25

.25 786,25

6.00 780.00

10.00 350.00

10.75 ?13.75

15.00 1275.00

REVIEW HEARING PREPARATION. e m i W25 . 32.50.
PREPARE FOR HEARING,. cr e e 2450 325,00
DRAFT AND REVISE QUESTIONS FOR L. 15.00 1275.00 °

DRTEGA AND DR. OWENS FOR CRDSS
EXAMINATION OF ARBALLO; DRAFT OPENING
STATEMENT; PREP OF CHARTS AND

EXHIBITS:; PREPARATION OF BRIEFS FOR «@
)

HEARING AND HEARING DOCUMENTS; PHONE,
L. ORTEGA TO PREPARE TESTIMONY FOR
HEARING; PHONE CALLS TO C.
CASTELLANOS & A. OROPEZA.

ATTEND HEARING.

PREP OF DOCUMENTS FOR HEARING, TRAVEL
TO AND FROM GAVILAN COLLEGE:
ATTENDANCE AT HEARING FOR TERMINATION
OF ARBALLD,

12.00 1560.00
12.00 1020.00

I
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@ YA
MK 11/22 HEARING PREPARATION, 4.50 585.00

IAD 11/25 PREPARARTION OF CHARTS SUMMARIZING 4.00  340.00
TIME SHEETS (1993-94); REVISIONS OF |
DR. OWENT'S HEARING QUESTIONS; PREP OF
REDIRECT FOR L. ORTEGA; REVIEW OF
DOCUMENTS FOR HEARING. ,
IAD 11/26 PREPARARTLON OF CHARTS SUMMARIZING 6.50  552.50
TIME SHEETS (1993-94); REVISIONS OF
DR. OWEN'S HEARING QUESTIONS; PREP OF
REDIRECT FOR L. ORTEGA; REVISION TO
CROSS EXAMINATION OF ARBALLO; PREP
FOR HEARING; REVIEW DOCUMENTS.
MK 11/27 ATTEND HEARING. 9.00 1170.00
IAD 11/27 PHONE CALLS TO L. ORTEGA; PREPARATION 8.00  680.00
FOR HEARING; TRAVEL TO AND FROM
HEARING,; ATTENDANCE AT ARBALLO
DISCIPLINARY HEARING,

CMR 11/283 REVIEW HEARING STATUS AND 50 65.00
FREPARATION.

MX 117235 HEAQRING PREPARATION;TELEPHONE 2.00 260,00
CONFERENCE WITH DR. MAYLE.

IAD 11/28 ORAFTING AND REVISING NOTES FROM 6,75 573.75

HEARING FOR TESTIMONY OF L. ORTEGA,
DR. OWENS, AND DIRECT EXAMINATION OF
T. ARBALLO; PHONE CALLS WITH L,
ORTEGA. P25
IAD 11/29 PHONE CALLS TO DR. OWENS, L. ORTE?A; 8.00 680.00
ORGANIZATION OF DOCUMENTS FOR <%~
HEARING, ORAFTING AND REVISING NOTES
FROM DIRECT EXAMINATION OF T.
ARBALLO; RESEARCH RE SUBPOENAS AND
CIVIL PROCEDURE; REVIEW OF T.
AR3ALLO'S MEDICAL RECORDS. .3
IAD 11/30 PHOME CALL TO L. ORTEGA; PREPARATION 6.75  573.75
OF COMPARISON LIST BETWEEN EXHIBITS
UNION A 2 B AND OUR EXHIBITS/
PREPARATION OF CROSS EXAMINATION OF
T. ARCALLO. PREPARATION OF LIST OF
ERRORS WITH UNION'S EXHIBITS; REVIEW
OF T. ARBALLO MEDICAL RECORDS AGAINST
DATES OF ABSENCES.

---------------- SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES=wwwsmommmomonan

CMR HOURS: 3.75 & $130.00 PER HOUR $487,50
MK HOURS: 37.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR™ $4875.00°"
JLS HOURS: . ...25 .2 3130.00 PER HOUR 332.50
1AD—HOURST 5 & $85.00 PER HOUR $12983.75
NET TOTAL HOURS: 194.25 ET TOTAL FEES: $18378.75
""""""""""""" T T IIEATT T T T T e
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: £OSTS
12710 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 414,51
12/10 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES. 16,22
12/10 CURRENT TRAVEL, TOLLS % PARKING CHARGES. 15%.00
12/40 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 10.00
12/10 CURRENT EXPEDLITED MAIL CHARGES. )]
£OSTS: $636.73
-




STATEMENT: — |

@ CELIA M. RUIZ DEC 14, 1995
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $12643.82

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE )
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. ;
GILROY, CA 95020 P /

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE - ) é::::::j:>

|FILE #1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE (10)
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $12643.82
FILE #1001 GAVIUAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE (10)
PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES

wMa 11/ 6 (MACHADO) MEETING RE STATUS OF WORK —T.25 162.50
AND RESPONSE; REVIEW GOVERNMENT CODE
RE TORT CLAIMS, AND SUFFICIENCY;
REVIEW CASES AND WAIVER ISSUES.

IAD 117 6 RESEARCH RE TIME LINES, 1.08 845.00

CHMR 11/ 7 TC WITH DR MAYLE RE GRAND JURY «50 65.00
INVESTIGATION; TC TO GRAND JURY.

WMa 11/ 7 LEGAL RESEARCH RE INVESTIGATORY 2.75  357.50

AUTHORITY OF CIVIL GRAND JURY.

IAD 11/ 7 PREPARATION OF CHRONOLOGY AND MEMO RE 3.25 276425
TIME LINE,

WMQ 11/ 8 LEGAL RESEARCH RE LIMITS OF GRAND 4.00 520.00
JURY AUTHORITY LN INVESTIGATING
SCHOOL DISTRICT, OPERATIONAL VS.

. SUSBSTANTIVE DISTINCTIONS, PROBABILITY

’ OF SUCCESS IN SEEKING TO QUASH
SUBPOENA, TELECON S$SC. COUNTY GRAND
JURY OFFICE,

IAD 11/ 8 RESEARCH RE TIME LINE; DRAFTING AND 4.00 340.00
REVISING CHRONOLOGY FOR FILE+ CALL TO
DR. MAYLE'S SECRETARY RE WHEN MACHADO

. CLAIM WAS RzCEIVED:

WwMn 11/ 9 REV. MATERIALS, OFFICE CONF. RE MEMO, 1,00 130,00

IAD 11/ 9 REVIEW OF OPINION LETTER FOR MACHADD 1.5 106.25
CLAIM,

WMQ 11/10 REVIEW DONOSO MEMORANDUM AND 8.75 1137.50
TIMELINE; REVIEW FACTUAL AND
DOCUMENTARY RECORD; DRAFT MEMORANDUM
TO CMR RE ANALYSIS OF CLAIM;

RAS 11/22 CONFERENCE RE GRAND JURY 2a75 487.50
INVESTIGATIONs PREP OF CORRESPONDENCE
RE GRAND JURY RESEARCH.

RAS 11/27 PREP OF CORRESPONDENCE TO DA RE GRAND 4.50 585.00
JURY INVESTIGATION; RESEARCH RE SAME,

CMR 11/28 FINAL LETYER TO DA RE GRAND JURY - 30 65.00

VISIT,
RA3 11723 PRFEP OF (FDORAESPONDFNCE TN DA RF ARAND 4 7% &17 S0




[ S iy LIV | oA e [ A 4 LI

JURY INVESTIGATION:; RESEARCH RE SAME.

TOTAL AMOUNTY DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: »*

*

STATEMENT DATE: DEC 14, 1995 FILE #1001

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

---------------- SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES====r==
CMR HOURS: 1.00 a3 $130.00 PER HOUR $130.
RAS HOURS: 13.00 a2 3$3130.00 PER HOUR £1690.
WM HOURS: 17.75 2 $130.00 PER HOUR 32307,
92.50 @3 $85.00 PER HOUR $807.
NET TOTAL FEES: $4935.
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
12710 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES.
12/10 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES.
12710 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES.
' COSTS:
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE:

Ak kdk ki bk ki &k

hkhkhkkhhkhkhd ki

- - - —

00
a0
50
50
iy
COSTS
62475
3.90
P 56—
110465
- $7598.17
$5045.65

$12643.82
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600 HONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE };
'

(S

FILE #1006 LABOR REUATIONS (10)

PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF:

FILE #1006 LABOR RELATIONS (10
PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS

LPs 7/10 TELECONFERENCE ON PERS FACTFINDING: N 3.00
MEET ABOUT SELECTION OF FACTFINDER,
TIMING FOR DISTRICT ON VARIOUS STAGES
OF THE FACT FINODING PROCESS; REVIEW
EDUCATIONAL EMPLOYMENT RELATIONS ACT
AND LEGAL RESEARCH RE SAME.
LPS 7711 PREPARATION FOR THE DISTRICT OF 'p/ .50
PROCEDURES FOR FACTFINDING IN
TELEPHONE CALL REGARDING THE UPCOMING
DISTRICT/CSEA FACTFINDING HEARING.
LPS 7/12 VARIOUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES ON J 1.00
PREPARATION OF DISTRICT PRESENTATION
FOR CLASSIFIED FACTFINDING HEARING.
LpS 7/20 MEETING RE PERS PROCEDURES ON N 350
. FACTFINDING AND NEGOTIATION
, BACKGROUND INFO.; FACTUAL
INVESTIGATION OF FACTFINDERS BEING
PROPOSED FOR SSLECTION BY PERS OF ONE
AS NEUTRAL FACTFINDER AND
TELECONFERENCE W/ LES CHISHOLM, PERB
REGIONAL DIRECTOR,
LPS 7/21 REVIEW OF FACTFINDING DECISIONS N 1.25
PREVIOUSLY DONE BY THE PANEL OF
‘PROPOSED FAETFINDERS -FOR -SELECTION.OF.
ONE FACTFINDER. , ...
LPS 7/24 CONVEY OF [NFORMATION ON FACTFIMDING J'z 5g°
PROCESS TO THE DISTRICT. PREPARATION
OF DISTRICT POSITION IN CLASSIFIED
NEGOTIATIONS RE SUPERVISORY I[SSUES,
INCLUDING POSSIBLE PERB UNIT
CLARIFICATION PETITION.
TELECONFERENCE REGARDING EFFECTS OF
SARGAINING NEGOTIATIONS ON REDUCTILON
OF FORCE AND THE PERB FACTFINDING
PROCESS. TELEPHONE CALL RE DISTRICT
ISSUES ON EFFECTS OF CLASSIFIED
NEGOTIATIONS; PREPARATION OF OUTLINE

$44566.11

$44566.11

FEES

390.00

65.00

130.00

162.50

325.00




LFS

LPS

LPS

LPS

LPS

LPS

LPS

LPS

CHMR

MK

RAS

MK

RAS

o

YLL 14y YYD

FORM TO BE USED FOR DISTRICT
PRESENTATION TO THE FACTFINDING
PANEL.

7/25 MEETING TO PREPARE ISSUES FOR N
DISTRICT'S PRESENTATION OF IT's —
CLASSIFIED NEGOYIATIONS PROPOSALS FOR
FACTFINDING AND PREPARE STRATEGY FOR
BARGAINING.

7/28 REVIEW FOR PRESENTATION TO THE PERSB d
ON THE VARIOUS OUTSTANDING
NEGOTIATIONS PROPOSALS.

7/31 TELECONFERENCE ON SELECTION OF THE N
NEUTRAL FACTFINOER AND HOLDING OF

FALE 2

7.50 975.00

1.00 130.00

1.00 130.00

FACTFINDING HEARING. T T
8/ 2 TELECONFERENCE ON PROCEDURES FORPERB 4 .?5\3 ?7.50

UNIT MOODIFICATION PETITION, I CLUDING
PERB RULES AND REGULATIONS, &\~_“~—
SUPERVESORY STATUS UNDER THE
EDUCATION EMPLOYMENT RELATIONS ACT
AND ISSUES ON UNFAIR PRACTICE LAY
DEALING WITH UNILATERAL ACTIGN.

5/11 MEETING TO REVIEW BINDING ARBITRATION
AND FINANCE ISSUES FOR THE CLASSIFIED
FACTFINDING.

8722 REVIEW AND REVISE MATERIALS FOR H
DISTRICT®S WRITTEN FACTFINDING
PRESENTATION AND LEGAL RESEARCH ON
PERTINENT EDUCATION CODE PROVISIONS.

9/ 1 TELECONFERENCE RE SUPERVISORY ISSUES ﬂ
INVOLVED IN NEGOTIATIONS AND UNIT
MODIFICATIONS, BASED UPON PERB

7/ 3 REVIEW LEGAL PRECEDENT FOR PERB LEGALP

—_—

«25 32.50

3.00 390.00

«25 32.50

——

PRECEDENT. T T
;

[SSUE ON SUPERVISORY STATUS POSSIBLY _
REMOVING AN EMPLOYEE FROM THE _ N

CLASSIFIED BARGAINING UNIT.
9/ 5 TELECONFERENCE R]E ANALYZING PERE ?

LEGAL CASES ON SUPERVISORY STATUSz——

T1/¢1 REVIEW STATUS OF VARIOUS NEGOTIATION M
ISSUES.

11/ 1 PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE N Y N
| C§%GELEPHDNE CONFERENCE ?fgq/yﬁf MAYL €,

<CAROL COOPER, AND KENWZCHTLD RE GCFA
NEGOTIATI { AELEPHONE CONFERENCE
WITH JOH! SELL; REVIEW AND REVISE
DRAFT CONTRACT WITH.CSEAL ORAFT -COVER .
LETTER TO JOHN HANSELL RE CONTRACT.
117 1 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CSEA-s
TELECONFERENCE W/ L. CARRIER RE
SALARY SCHEDULE AND OPEN ENROLLMENT.
11/ 2 REVIEW NEWS ARTICLE RE
FACTFINDING; TELFPMONE CONFERENCE WITH
DR. MAYLE RE ARTICLE AND FACTFINDING
REPORT, DRAFT MEMO RE FACTFINDING
REPORT/DRAFT MEMO RE CONTRACT DRAFT:
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING
COUNSEL RE ESPINOSA RETIREMENT ISSUE.
11/ 2 RESEARCH REGARDING VARIOUS N
OUTSTANDING [SSUES; CONFERENCE RE
SAME; TELECONFERENCE W/ S, AMES RE:

i

.25} 32.50
1.00 130,00
5.50  715.00

N 1,00 130,00

N 5.00  650.00

725 942,50

(.5)




STATEMENT.

03=10-1006 DEC 14, 1995 PAGE 3

NEW CONTRACT AND FACT FINDING/

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO B. MURPHY

RE: SAME.
AL 1/ 3 PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO 8. MURPHY ﬂ 2.25
RE: NEW CONTRACT AND RELATED ISSUES:
CONFERENCE RE: OUTSTANDING COLLECTIVE
BARGAINING ISSUES, REVIEW DOCUMENTS.
RESEARCH RE NEW CONTRACT. N 4.25
REVIEW REDUCTION AND FORCE AND o .50
EFFECTIVE DATE OF NEW AGREEMENT.
1S 11/ & REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM L. ﬂ 2.50
CARRIER; PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO 3.
MURPHY RE: RECLASSIFICATION OF M,
YUSTE POSITION; CONFERENCE RE:
QUTSTANDING COLLECTIVE BARGAINING
ISSUES.
FACT FINDING ISSUES,. M .25
TELECONFERENCE RE QUTSTANOING d -50
RESEARCH; PREP OF CORRESPONDENCE TO
3. MURPHY RE RECLASSIFICATION.
A3 11/ 8 TELECONFERENCE RE OUTSTANDING N

COLLECTIVE BARGAINING ISSUES,

AR 11/ & RESEARCH AND COPY CASES. AN IY:
K 11/ 9 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH oRe—MAYLE ‘N 1.50
Q@)@e MATTERS, TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH

VY I0HN HANSELL RE CONTRACT.
K 11/10 REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT CONTRACT. N 3.00
INCORPORATING REVISIONS BY JOHN

(o

sLo11/
4R 11/

o

MR 11/
AS 11/

~ ~d

1.50

HANSELL. N

MR 11/13 REVIEW COLLECTIVE BARGAINING ISSUES. IV 1.00

K 11/13 TELEPHONE CALL TO LARRY CARRI E .25
SALARY SCHEDULE FOR REVISED '
CONTRACT; TELEPHONE CALL TO JOHN
HANSELL RE CONTRACT REVISIONS. -

AS 11/13 CONFERENCE RE COLLECTIVE BARGAINING N 1.50
RESEARCH; PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO
G. MAYLE RE SAME.

MR 11/14 REVIEW GAVILAN CONTRACT; TC WITH N
CLIENT RE BOARD MEETING.

MR 11/15 REVIEW FACT FINDING SURVEYS TC RE \( 1.00
ISSUES DATE OF IMPLEMENTATION.

MR 11/20 TC WITH2MURPHY RE RECLASSIFICATION; N .50
REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE; PREPARE
PETITION. _

AS 11/20 RESEARCH RE GRAND JURY INVESTIGATION, 3.50
INCLUDING PERMISSIBLE SCOPE AND
PROCEDURE.

AS 11/21 PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO G. MAYLE RE 4.50
OUTSTANQING E_BARGAINING 5 .o

;I RESEARCH RE GRAND JURY '

INVESTIGATION, INCLUDING SCOPE

PROCEDURE; [RESEARCH RE PRO RE FOR

RECLASSIFLCATIONS, TELEPHONE

CONFERENCE WITH PERB RE SAME.

#. .1/27 PREPARE FOR NEGOTIATIONS; NEGOTIATION f/8.50
SESSION WITH CSEA; NEGOTIATION
MEETING WITH OR. HAYLE, N

K 11/28 REVISE CS5EA CONTRACT; TELEPHONE 2.50
CONFERENCE WITH CAROLCOOPER RE LABOR

292.50

361.25
65.00

325,00

32.50
65.00

195.00

52.50

195.00

390.00

130.00
32.50

195.00

195.00
130,00

65.00

455.00

585.00

\v

1105.00

325.00

HATTER. WA o e




: STATEMENT. :
2503-10-1906 DEC 14, 1995 PAGE 4‘*1

MK 11729 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CAROL hj 1.00 130.00
COOPER RE FACULTY LABOR C‘
ISSUE;TELEPHONE CONFERENCE urrn HN -
HANSELL RE CSEA CONTRACTS ORAFT.

LETTER TO CSEA RE CONTRACT.
CHMR 11/30 LETTER NEGOTIATION. k} <50 65.00
CMR 11730 TC FRO ARL; REVIEW AND REVISE N .75 97.50
FINAL CSEA CONTRACT.
RAS 11/30 RESEARCH RE ISSUES INVOLVING R. 5.75  747.50

HERNANDEZ; CONFERENCE RE SAME. hﬁ%)

---------------- SUMHARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES*-mwommemoe— e
CMR HOURS: 15.50 a $130.00 PER HOUR $2015.00
LPS HOURS: 26.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $33412.50
MK HOURS: 18.75 & 3$130.00 PER HOUR $2437.50
RAS HOURS: 30.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $3932.50
a
a

DGL HOURS: 4.25 385.00 PER HOUR $361.25
PAR HOURS: 1.50 $35.00 PER HOUR $52.50
KET TOTAL HOURS: 96.350 . NET TOTAL FEES: $12211.25

_ﬂff?7 Ui
[0STS ADVANCED SINCE THe ﬁng?;;;;ENT. COSTS

1/30 COMPUTER RESEARCH. 41 65.00
</10 CURRENT POSTAGE CHARGES. 6.52
2/10 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 155.20
2/10 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES. 63.57
2/10 CURRENT WORD PROCESSING CHARGES. 204.50
¢ ) CURRENT TRAVEL, TOLLS & PARKING CHARGES. 54.20
27 .0 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 25.00
2/10 CURRENT EXPEDITED MAIL CHARGES. 3
COSTST ;3“}363?.9 <
e L [

ALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: ' . 331716.87
LUS:  CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: 312849.24

hkkkokAhh hk kok
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE., PLEASE PAY: %  $44566.11

Ak Ak Atk L

Bt T T

STATEMENT DATE: OEC 14, 1995  FILE #1006

RUIZ & SCHAPIROD




STATEMENT

" CELIA M. RUIZ DEC 12, 1995
RUIZ &-'SCHAPIRO

" 600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-%005

PLEASE PAY $435.97

B "_\“
GAVILAN COMMUNITY COLLEGE /)
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD - |
GILROY, CA 95020 ’X(ﬁ‘
N
o
U -
LE #1021 JOHNSON TORT (10)
EASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $435.97
LE #1021 JOHNSON TORT (10)
‘OFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
117 1 REVIEW DRAFT TORT CLAIM REJECTION; — .75 97.50
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING
COUNSEL RE EXTENSION OF TIME FOR
BOARD ACTION; REVIEW DRAFT
STIPULATION FOR EXTENSIONZ DRAFT
LETTER TO DR. MAYLE RE STATUS OF
- CASE. ,
iJ 11/ 1 RESEARCH STATUTE OF LIMITATIONS FOR -50 65.00
RESPONDING TO TORT CLAIM; DRAFT
STIPULATION; CONFER RE BOARD®S
REJECTION. '
¢ 11/ 2 REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT NOTICE RE -50 65.00
' TORT CLAIM.
1R 11/ 6 REVIEW CASE STATUS AND FUTURE ACTION. .50 65.00
--------------- SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES~-————=—=ww-=——-
CMR HOURS:  0.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $65.00
MK HOURS:  1.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $162.50

JsJ HOURS: - \® $130.00 PER HOUR $65.00
lET TOTAL HOURS: 2.25 | — NET TOTAL FEES: 3292.50

e

YSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
»f10 CURRENT POSTAGE CHARGES. 0.32
»/10 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. _ 6. 00
»/10 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES. 0.15
>/10 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 7.00
LOSTS: ~$13.47

e

AL, sCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: 3130.,00°
_us: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $305.97
Ahk ki dkk kk kxkk
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: » $435.97

ok ko okok kg ok ok ok ok




STATEMENT-

CELIA M. RUIZ
RUIZ .& SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 24111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT
5055 SANTA THERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: GLENN MAYLE

FILE #1012 KARCICH (10)
SLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $65.00
FILE #1012 KARCICH (10

PREVIQUSLY BILLED AND UNPAID AMOUNTS.

STATEMENT DATE: DEC 12, 1995

RUIZ & SCHAPIRD

PLEASE PAY: = $65.00

DEC 12, 1995 )

PLEASE PAY $65.00

]\J

ek ko ko ke Rk

dodk o o ko ok ek

FILE #1012




d . STATEMENT-

CELIA M. RUIZ DEC 12, 1995 )
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

6080 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY  $9729.16

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT £CD

LE #1017 JOHNSON®S DFEH COMPLAINT (1o
.EASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $9729.16
"LE #1017 JOHNSON'S DFEH COMPLAINT ' &)
'OFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
1R 11/30 REVIEW EEOC RESPONSE. .25 32.50
--------------- SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES————==—=—=—=———me
CMR HOURS: (0.25 $130.00 PER HOUR $32.50
TTTTTTTTTT T TR T T T e - TTTTTmmnmT T
}ST5 ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
'/10 CURRENT POSTAGE CHARGES. 0.55
/10 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 7.20
’/10 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES ' 6291
/10 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 12200
1/10 CURRENT EXPEDITED MAIL CHARGES. . 13,002
COSTS: = $39.66
___________________________________________________ N ]
.LANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: 59657.00
US: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $72.16

Tk Ak hkxhkhkhkkkk

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: =x $9729.16

khkkkhkkhkkhkkhkik

STATEMENT DATE: DEC 12, 1995 FILE #1017

" RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

§?




STATEMENT- —

CELIA M. RUIZ DEC 12, 1995
RULIZ-% SCHAPIRO : )
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR  PLEASE PAY  $7386.52

SAN FRANCISCO., CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD -

ILE #1016 JOHNSON'S WRITTOF MANDATE (1)

LEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $7386.52

ILE #1016 JOHNSON®S WRIT OF MANDATE (16)

OSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS

2/10 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 1.00 //,/////
COSTS: " $1.00 ¢

ALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $7385.52

Ll CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: £1.00
: dA Ak kk kR kA kk

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: = $7386.52
*ok Rk ok ok ok ok ok kk

STATEMENT DATE: PEC 12, 1995 FILE #1016

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




. STATEMENT:
CELIA M. RUILZ DEC 12, 1995
RUIZ % SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY - 370.20
SAN FRANCILSCO., CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020 J\}
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE i

ILE #1013 TTAZ (S N1
'LEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $70.20

ILE F1013 0IAZ am

Fode ks ded v ok ko ok ok

REVIOQUSLY BILLED AND UNPAID AMOUNTS, PLEASE PAY: »  »~— 370.20
: ek e e Kk ko ok

i s Frv et e e

STATEMENT DATE: DEC 12, 1995 FILE £1013

RUIZ & SCHAPIRQ




STATEMENT.

CELTA M. RUIZ DEC 12, 1995 )

RUIZ.&Z SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $171107.32

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE
ILE #1014 GSEA . am
LEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $171107.32
ILE #1014 CSEA (1)
ROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
GL 11/ 1 RESPONSE TO CSEA REPLY BRIEF. ¥ 2.75 233,75
——————————————— SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEESw==—c——mm——c—amn

DGL HOURS: i:ji?/a $85.00 PER HOUR $233.75

05.5 ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
2/10 CURRENT POSTAGE CHARGES. 1.28
2/10 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 73.60
2/10 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 5.00
2/10 CURRENT EXPEDITED MAIL CHARGES. 20.007

COSTS: 4~  $99.88

\YMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

2/10 3$15000.00 THANK YQU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.

RSy D D Gt e Sy S S A PP NS R wnh e WY e 000 S . SR M R Syl d S . A Gl A Y . W e e ot b

\LANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $185773.69
.uUs: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $333.63
[HUS:  PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $15000.00

khkAkkhkA kkkk ki

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: = 3171107.32
Ak dkokkrtk Ak kok

STATEMENT DATE: DEC 12, 1995 FILE #1014

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

>



CECIA M. RUIZ
RULZ.& SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN COLLEGE

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTN: DR. MAYLE

PN Ll St

FILE #1019 GONSTRUCTION

STATEMENT-

DEC 12, 1

PLEASE PAY

“LEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YQOUR PAYMENT OF:

FILE #1019 CONSTRUCTION

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

12/10 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES.

e ——— it O S A i P DS bt W SO0 S Ty S Sk S o S i S e el S S 4 oy

3JALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:
il S CHARGES LISTED ABOVE:

(10)

* ok ok k%

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: *

STATEMENT DATE: DEC 12, 1995

RULIZ & SCHAPIRO

kA ok kK

FILE #1019

— o e

995 )

3675.67

$675.67

CO57S

0T

3675.446
$0.21

%* A& Ak ok ok

$3675.67

Kok kA A%k




STATEMENT.

. CELIA M, RUIZ
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (€415) 395-9005

%

TERESA BLVD,
95020
DR

5055 SANTA
GILROY, CA
ATTENTION:

FILE #1000 SUMMARY FILE

PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH

1000 SUMMARY FILE

FILE
FILE #1015 ARBALLO
CURRENT HOURS: 163.75
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 3870.35
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00
PLLUS CUR COSTS: 554 .94
FILE #1020 CERONA
CURRENT HOURS: 0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 332.50
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00
PLUS CUR COSTS: 0.00
FILE #1019 CONSTRUCTION
CURRENT HOURS: 3.50
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 1038.95
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00
PLUS CUR COSTS: 220,46
FILE #1014 CSEA
CURRENT HOURS: 41.00
PREVIQUS BALANCE: 225663.28
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00
PLUS CUR COSTS: 1323.87
FILE #1013 DIAZ
CURRENT HOURS: 0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 1153.80
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00
PLUS CUR COSTS: 13.90

17.50
6338.17
0.00
34.20

CURRENT HOURS:
PREVIOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES:
PLUS CUR.COSTS:

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE

GLENN MAYLE

FILE H1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE

Y Y

NOV 16, 1995

PLEASE PAY 3259851.85

_:) ~ T }
/ /AET;QW}_

L

éfg 2 Lj

(o
YOUR PAYMENT OF: $259851.35
(10)
(10)
MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:  3870.35
PLUS CUR FEES: 16225.00
EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 16779.94 ./
(10
MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 332.50
PLUS CUR FEES: 0.00
£QUALS NEW BALANCE: 0.00
am
MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:  1038.95
PLUS CUR FEES: 455.00
EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 675,467
102
MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 45558.46
PLUS CUR FESS:  4340.00
£QUALS NEW BALANCE: 185773.49
(10)
MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:  1097.50
PLUS CUR FESS: 0.00
FQUALS NEW BALANCE: 70,26
o
MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 486,70
PLUS CUR FEES:  1712.50
EQUALS NEW BALANCT:  7598.17

45



STATEMENT-

2503-10-10600 NOV 16, 1995 PAGE 2
FILE #1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE (10)
CURRENT HOURS: 2.25
PREVIOUS BALANCE:  7118.52 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 32.50
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: 292.50
PLUS CUR COSTS: 7.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:  7385.52 /
FILE #1017 JOHNSONYS DFEH COMPLAINT (10)
CURRENT HOURS: 82.50
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 422,50 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 422.50
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:  9206.25
PLUS CUR COSTS: 450.75 FEQUALS NEW BALANCE:  9657.00/
FILE #1021 JOHNSON TORT (10)
CURRENT HOURS: 1.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 0.00 MINUS CUR PAYMSENTS: 0.00
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: 130.00
PLUS CUR COSTS: 0.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 130,00
FILE #1012 KARCICH {(10)
CURRENT HOURS: 0.50
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 0.00 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 0. 00
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: 65.00
PLUS CUR COSTS: 0.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 65.00
FILE #1006 LABOR RELATIONS (10
CURRENT HOURS: 91.75
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 44300.96 MINUS CUR PAYMSNTS: 24794.71
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: 11477.50
PLUS CUR COSTS: 733.12 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 31716.87
TOTAL OF PREVIOUS STATEMENT BALANCES:  290244.03
MINUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT PAYMENTS: 77634.,17
UNPAID FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENTS: 212609.867 -
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT LATE CHARGES: 0.00
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT FEES: 43903.75
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT COSTS: 3338,24
| .99
EQUALS: TOTAL BALANCE DUE THIS STATEMENT: 259851.8?ﬁ/ .
L T LR ¥ IS B & O //
STATEMENT DATE: NOV 16, 1995 FILE #1000
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT.

FILE #1015 ARBALLO | (10)

PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF:

FILE #1015 ARBALLO (10

PROFESSTONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOUR'S

CHMR 10/ 3 PREPARE TERMINATION, & 1.00

RAS 10/ 3 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE RE RECENT ISSUESE .75
INVOLVING ARBALLO, ‘

JLS 10/ 3 CONFER RE NEW EVENTS AND EVALUATION L 50
MTG & WORKERS COMP, ,

°AS 10/ 4 REVIEW OF D “”””éﬁ% EETIN C 10050
ARBATX O, O GA AND A RE

LLO PERFORMAMNCE; DISCUSSION W/
A RE ARBALLO PERFORMANCE.

JLS 10/ 4 CONFER RE WORKERS COMP CLAIM & — .25
POTENTIAL STRESS CLAIM.

CMR 10/ 5 TEQMINATION. ¢. 1.s50

RAS 10/ 5 CONFERENCE RE UNDERLYING FACTS? i 1.25
CONFER RE LEAVE CALCULATION AND
RELATED ISSUES.

JLS 10/ & CONFER RE DOCUMENTS & STRATEGIZS . 1.25
INVESTIGATION, DRAFT MEMO RE '
STRATEGY; ORAFT CLIENT LETTER. ,

1AD 10/ 7 REVIEH AND ORGANIZE CORRESPONDENCE & 9.75
AND DISTRICT DOCUMENTS7 PREPARATION
OF CHRONOLOGY.

1AD 10/ 8 REVIEW AND ORGANTZE CORRESPONDENCE L. 3,75
AND DISTRICT: DOCUMENTSJ PREPARATION . . . ..
OF CHRONOLDGY.

CMR 107 9 REVIEW CASE STATUS AND INVESTIGATION ¢ .sp
PLAN.

RAS 10/ 9 CONFERENCE RS DOCUMENT REVIEW AND Q/ 1.25
INTERVEEWS W/ L TEGA AND T.Jdd
oueuiij;y (EE? '

JLS 107 9 DRAFY CLIENT LETTERS; STRATEGIZE CASE( 1.75
FOLLOW UP; CONFER WITH L. ORTEGA.cﬁV/

IAD 10/ 9 REVISING OF CHRONOLOGY ON ARBALLOT (Q_ 7.25
MATTER; MEET RE CHRONOLOGY.

JLS 10710 REVIEW % ANALYSE DRAFT CHRroONnOLOGY. (¢ 2.00

IAD 10710 REVISION OF CHRONOLOGY; REVIEW (. 9.00

CELIA

M. RUIZ NOV 16, 1995
RUIZ % SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH fLOOR PLEASE PAY
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 24111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE

S055 SANTA TERESA 8LVD. )

GILROY, CA 95020
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

DOCUMENTS AMD DPRAFTING OF QUESTIONS

TENe PUNNE AL TN ORTEMRAZ PHONE

$16779.94

$16779.94%

FEES

130,00
?7.50

65.00

1365.00

32.50
175.00
162.50

828.75

488.75

= EalEn s |

65.00

162.50

227.50
616,25

260.00
765.00




STATEMENT.

RAS
JLS

I1AD

CHR

LAD

JLS

IAD

IAD

JLS

IAD

JLS

IAD

€ MR
CHR
cHe
MK

IAD

10/11
16/11

10711

10/12

10712

10713

10/13

10713
10716
10716

10717

10/17

10/18
10/18
10718
10718

10718

CALL W/ g;?EGA RE PREP OF MEMO TO

ARBALLO; DRAFT MEMO TO ARBALLO RE
ABSENTEEISM; MEET RE ARBALLO FILE.
CONFERENCE REGARDING DOCUMENTS. & .25
REVIEW & EDIT DRAFT MEMO TO ARBALLO; ~ .75
STRATEGIZE FURTHER MEMO; CONFER RE

CASE STATUS. .

REVISION OF MEMO TO AgsALLo rRe v C 10.5D
ABSENTEEISHM; PHONE CONVERSATION' W/ L.
ORTEGA RE FILE; MEET TO DISCUSS

STATUS OF CASE; PREPARE LETTER TO L.

ORTEGA EXPLAINING THE MEMO AND

ADVISING WHEN IT SHOULD BE PRESENTED:

DRAFT OF MEMO FROM L. OTEGA 10

ARBALLO RE POOR WORK PERFORMANCE.

REVIEW STATUS OF DOCUMENTATION AND (1, .50
COURSE OF CONDUCT.

PHONE CONVERSATIONS W/ L. ORTEGA HT (. 6.25
REVISIONS TOQ MEMO; PREPARE LIST OF

PEOPLE INVOLVED IN ARBALLO CASE;

PREPARE INVESTIGATION PLAN FOR

ARBALLO FILE.

REVIEW & EDIT CLIENT MEMD RE .75
PERFORMANCE; REVIEW & EDIT REVISED
DISCIPLINE PROCEDURES.

FINISHED INVESTIGATION PLAN; REVISIONG 4.50
OF CHRONOLOGY; MEETING TO DRAFT

EVALUATION; REVISION OF MEMO RE POOR

WORK PERFORMANCE; DRAFTING AND

REVISING OF CORRESPONDENCE ON DRAFT
EVALUATION AND WHEN TO PRESENT THE

MEMO; REVIEW OF LATEST DOCUMENTS FRON
GAVILAN RE ARBALLO FILE; PHONE CALL.L-

TO L. ORTEGA RE ARBALLO'S EVALUATION.
RESEARCH ON TERMINATION LAWS AND C 1.25
TERMINATION OF ACADEMIC AND

CERTIFICATED EMPLOYEES.

REVIEW DRAFT EVALUATION, REVIEW % L 1.25
STRATEGIZE INVESTIGATION PLANS

STRATEG JFERMINATION,

PHONE LITORTEGA RE ARBALLOS THAT WAS (L1.25
DUE ON OCTOBER 15; DISCUSSION OF

DRAFT EMALUATION.

UPDATESHR, MAYLE; -DRAFT MEHO-RE——— —£. 2725
TERMINATION NOTICE. . S
REVIEW OF NEW DOCUMENTS RECIEVED FROM (. 1.50
GAVILAN; CONFER RE CALL TO DR. MAYLEFS) /
MEETING RS CALL TO DR. MAYLE AND

TIMING OF TERMINATION LETTER€>
CONFERENCE CALL TO DR. MAYLE.
REVIEW CASE STATUS AND APPROACH. 13
REVIEW CASE STATUS AND FACTUAL. e 1
CASE PREPARATION FOR TERMINATION. 4 2.50
REVIEW CHRONOLOGY OF EVENTS; REVIEW 4 1.7
PROPOSED INVESTIGATION

PLAN; CONFERENCE RE STRATEGY.

MEETING TO DISCUSS SCHEDULING OF £ 3.73
ARBALLO FILE AND CHRONOLOGY; REVISION

OF CHROMNOLOGY TO BRING IT UP TO DAVE

WITH PRESFNT FVENTG._

(2503~10-1015 NOV 16, 1995 PAGE 2

32.50
97. 50

892.50

65.00

531.25

97.50.

382.50

106.25
162.50
106.25

= ;"Ql?'cES G'

127.50

65.00
162.50
325.00
227.54

318.75




— STATEMENT N
2503-10~1015 NOV 16, 1995 PAGE 3

IAD 10/19 REVISING OF CHRONOLOGY; ATTEMPTED L 3_00 255.00
PHONE CALLS TO DR. OWEN; CALL TO A.
OROPEZA;
12D 10/20 REVISIONS TO CHRONOLOGY; PHONE CALLS C 6.00D 510,00
TO A. OROPEZA; NUMEROUS MESSAGES LEFT
W/ DR. OWEN'S SECRETARY; DRAFTING AND
REVISING CORRESPONDENCE FOR DR.
OWMENS, OROPEZA, AND L. ORTEGA;
MEETING RE CORRESPONDENCE AND
REVISING STRATEGY FOR GAVILAN
INTERVIEWS.
IAD 10/22 REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS AND O 4.25 361.25
CORRESPONDENCE IN PREPARATION OF
INTERVIEWS ON 107247 REVISIONS TO
' CHRONOLDGY.
CHR 10/23 REVIEW DISCIPLINARY HISTORY. Q .50 65.00
JLS 10723 PREPARE FOR WITNESS INTERVIEWS. Q 2.75 357450
IAD 10/23 REVISING CHRONOLOGY DF EVENTSS (G 7.50 637.50
) REVISING LIST OF PSRSONS INVOLVEDS
DRAFTING & REVISING LIST OF QUESTIONS
FOR INTERVIEWS W/ DR. TJ OWENS AND L.
ORTEGA. 0
JLS 10724 WITNESS INTERVIEWS. - 11.00 1430.00
IAD 10724 INTERVIEW W/ LUZ ORTEGA; INTERVIEW W/ 8.75 743,75
DR. Td OWENS.D (® :
CMR 10725 REVIEW INVESTIGATIVE HISTORY AND Q .50 65.00
STRATEGY.
IAD 40/25 RESEARCH RE:z ED CODE AND GENERAL LAW (* 5.75 488,75
OF TERMINATION/WRONGFUL DISMISSALS :
DRAFT REVISED NOTICE OF TERMINATION:
REVIFW OF INTERVIEW NOTES FROM
INTERVIEWS W/ ORTEGA AND OWENS.
TAD 10/26 REVIEW OF EDUCATION CODE~ TeErRMINATIONC. 8,50 722.50
MANUALS AND FMLA MATERIALS; DRAFTING
AND REVISING OF ARBALLO NOTICE OF
TER"ItgﬂFON’ PHONE CALLS TO LUZ

ORTEGALAND NANCY SCHAFFER RE:

ARBALLO'S WORKMANS COMP. CLAILMS,
CMR 10727 REVIEM/EDIT TERMINATION. ¢ 1.50 195.00
MK 10/27 REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT AMENDED L 97.50

7 NOTICE OF TERMINATION.
IAD 10/27 REVIEW OF FMLA MATERIALS? prafrTING C B.00 630.00
: AND REVISING ARBALLO REVISED NOTICE .
OF TERMINATION, ORAFTING AND REVISING
LETTERS TO DR, MAYLE AND LUZ ORTEGA
RE: AQBALLO REVISED NOTICE OF

TERMINATION. o
CMR 10730 REVIEW/REVISE TERMINATION. 1.00 130.02
MK 10/30 REVISE DRAFT NOTICEZDRAFT COVER o .50 65.00

LETTER TO DR. MAYLE.

S P SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEESm-=mm=mmow=ran===s
""" - CHR HOURS: 11.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1462.50

MK HOURS:  3.00 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $390.00

RAS HOURS: 14.00 @ $130.00 PSR HOUR  $1920.00

JLS HOURS: . 23.00 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $2990.00

TAD HOURS: 112.5 $85.00 PER HOUR $9562.50
MET TOTAL HOURS: 163.?%3ﬂ NET TOTAL FEes: (316225.00 » 3>10)

@ e &




STATEMENT.
(2503=-10-1015 NOV 165 1995 PAGE 4 )
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
9730 COMPUTER RESEARCH, 205,50
10719 PHOTOCOPIES, 53.38
10724 MILEAGE. : 54,00
10726 TELEPHONE TOLL CHARGES. 7.86
10731 HORDPROCESSINGIDOCUHENT PRODUCTION. 40.00
10731 PHOTOCOPIES., 150,20
10731 FACSIMILIES. ¢¢?B&§
COST :”fmsa.% i
=/
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
117 64 $3870.35 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT ¢ $3870.35
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $146770.94
MINUS: _PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: 33870.3%
' Thhhkhkhhkhh &k
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYARLE, PLEASE PAY: « L16779.94
Akdkkdohkk kb ik
ot ed b Noi AL DY A EAT Y T
STATEMENT DATE: NOV 16, 1995 FILFE %1015
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT.
f. CELTA M, RUIZ
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 24111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

PLEASE paAY

GAVILAN COLLEGE

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTN: DR. MAYLE

PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

*

TOTAL AMOUNT puyE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE pAY:

o

NOV 16,

1995

3675.46

FILE #1019 CONSTRUCTION (10)
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $675.464
FILE #1019 CONSTRUCTION - €10)
PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
WMW 9713 REVIEW CONSTRUCTION CONTRACT ¢ .50 65,00
ARBITRATION PROVISIQONS: TELEPHONE
CALL.
WHNW 9714 REVIEW DOCUMENTS . .25 32.50
WMW  9/25 REVIEW FAX RE GAVILAN COLLEGE. .50 65.00
WMW  9/28 REVIEW TWO SETS OF FAXES AND 2.00 2460.00
TELEPHONE CALL W/ GAVILAN COLLEGE;
JLS 10/ 2 REVIEW & EpIT REVISED LETTER 710 «25 32,50
FAROTTE,
----- TUEsmmss-m~~SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES—memmmccme o
JLS HOURS: 0.25 @ 3$130,00 peg HOUR $32.50
WMW HOURS: ; 3-3130.00 PER HOUR $422.50
NET TOTAL HOURS: NET TOTAL FEES: $£455.00
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEM:=NT: COSTS
/30 COMPUTER RESEARCH, 199,00
10/26 TELEPHONE ToLL CHARGES. e ew e i b6.45
10/30 FEDERAL EXPRESS. . . . T - 12,00
10/31 FACSIMILIES, e o R i
T 7 COSTS: S220.46L/
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: ——
117 6 $1038.95 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YoUu.
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT = $1038.95
PLUS : CHARGES LISTED ABOvE: £675.46
MINUS: $1038,.95

EERNRAR AR AR *RA

$675.46

AR AA AR £ &k



STATEMENT:

CELIA

M. RUIZ NOV 16, 1995 )

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $185773.69
- SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. . }
GILROY, CA 95020 -

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

/
Yl

$185773.69

FILE #1014 CSEA (10
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF:

FILE #1014 MSEAT- (10)
PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOUR'S

MK
bGL
CMR

AK

MK

CHR

MX

BGL
bGL
K

bGL
bGL

107 2

107 2
107 9

10/ 3

10710

10/11

10/18

10719
10/20
10727

10727
10730

RESPOND TO TELEPHONE INQUIRY FROM A 2.50

OFFICE OF OPPOSING COUNSELS ORGANIZE
AND FILE MATERIALS FROM HEARING AND ¢
BRIEFING,

LETTER RE: EXHIBIT CORRECTIONS.,
FILES.

REVIEW ISSUES REGARDING SETTLEMENT OF
UNFAIR 1759 AND LETTER TO CSEA RE
SANME,

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING
COUNSEL; REVIEW SETTLEMENT DOCUMENTS;
DRAFT AND REVISE RESPONSE TO
CORRESPONDENCE.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING
COUNSEL? REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT
RESPONSE TO OPPOSING COUNSEL; DRAFT
CORRESPOMDENCE TO FIELD
REPRESENTATIVE BERNETTE MURPHY RE
SETTLEMENT IN CASE NO. 1759, REVIEW
CONTRACT TO PREPARE FOR INCORPORATION
OF CHANGES? REVIEW LETTER FROM
RICHARD PEARL RE FACT FINDING REPOQRT,
REVIEW SETTLEME AND TC WITH OR.
MAYLE RE SAME,

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING
COUNSEL, CONFERENCE RE STRATEGY, DRAFT
LETTER TO DR. MAYLE.

LOCATING ANOD RECEIVING PERB
REGULATIONS. .
PUBLICATION OF FACT FINDING REPORT.
REVIEW CSZA REPLY BRIEF; RESEARCH RS
RESPONSE TO CSEA BRIEF, DRAFT
RESPONSE TO CRLA BRIEF.

RESPONSE TO CSEA'S REPLY BRIEF.
RESPONSE TO CSEA'S REPLY BRIFF.

1.25

2.00
7.50

FEES

325.00

361.25

130.00

325.09

455.00

65, G

195.00

106.25
170.00
975.00

722.50
510.00




NET T

COSTS

97238
9730
10/26
10731
10731
10731

PAYMEN
10731

117 6

BALANC
PLUS:
MINUS:

STATEMENT-
(2503-10-1014 NOV 16, 1995 PAGE 2 )
------ mosmmmummeSUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES—mmmmmmmacacene-s
CMR HOURS: 1.50 @& $130.00 PER HOUR $195.00

MK  HOURS: 17.50 & $130.00 PER HOUR $2275.00
DGL HOURS: 22.00 (Ez:fBS.OU PER HOUR $1870.00

OTAL HOURS: 41.00

ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
WORDPROCESSING/DOCUMENT PRODUCTION. 170.00
COMPUTER RESEARCH. 1027.50
TELEPHONE TOLL CHARGES. 7.81
PHOTOCOPIES 103.60
FACSIMILIES. 14.00
POSTAGE CHARGES. D.%6
COSTS: $1323.87
T ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

315000.00 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU,

$30558.46 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.
E FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $225668.28
CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $5663.87
PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: F45558.46

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: * $185773.69

"STATEMENT DATE: NOV 16, 1995

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

NET TOTAL FEES: $4340.00
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(" CELIA M. RUIIL NOV 16, 1995
RUIZ & SCHAPIROD
400 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $70.20

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. .
GILROY, CA 95020 \ A
ATTENTION: DR, GLENN MAYLE y‘dg‘”
i

FILE #1013 DIAZ (10

PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $70.20
FILS #10{3€Exrrﬂ (10)

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
9/30 COMPUTER RESEARCHa. 10.50

10/31 PHOTOCOPIES. T O]
£osTS: T $13.90

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

111 6 $1097.50 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.

e L L L L L

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: ' $1153.80
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $13.90
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $1097.50
kkkhkkdkdhhdkhk

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: +# $70.20

kkkkhkhkhkhkkkh

STATEHMENT DATE: HOV 16, 1995 FILE #1013

RUIZ &R SCHAPIRO

STATEMENT. ~




STATEMENT

RUIZ & SCHAPIROD

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 147TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY
SAN FRANCISCO., CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395~9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

6ILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

PR, o ey

FILE #1001 GAVILANTGENERAULUEGAL "ADVICE (10)

PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOQUR PAYMENT OF:

FILE #1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE (10)
PROFESSTONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOQURS

CMR 107 3 NOTICE OF UNPROFESSIONAL CONDUCT. 1.25

CJK 107 3 RESEARCH MATTER OF PAUL LATZISKY FOR 1.25
DISCIPLINARY ACTION.

CJK 10/ 3 RESEARCH AND DRAFT DISCIPLINARY 2.25
PROCEDURES.

CJK 107 6 REVIEYW PROCEDURES TO ISSUE A NOTICE 5.00
OF UNPROFESSIONAL CONOUCT, '

CMR 10/10 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MAYLE RE 1.00
NEW INCIDENT; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE

‘ FROM JOHNSON AND ARRANGE STRATEGY. j

CJX 10716 REVIEW COLLECTIVE BARGAINING ' r. 2.50

' AGREEMENT AND RESPOND TO UNION LETTER

RE: NOTICE OF UNPROFESSIONAL CONDUCT.

CJK 10717 FINALIZE DISCIPLINE PROCEDURES. 150

CMR 10/23 REVIEW ISSUES ON NEW MATTER RE .50
JOHNSON.

MK  10/23 TELEPHONE CONFEZRENCE WITH DR. MAYLS C/ 1;00

RE NOTICES, EMPLOYEE GRIEVANCE
MATTERS,REVIEW CHRONOLOGY AND OUTLINE
. FOR INTERVIEHS.
WMQ 10/25 MACHADO MATTER; REVIEW CLAIM PAPERS 1.25
. AND FACTUAL BACKGROUND, CONSULT I.
ODONOSD RE RESPONSE.

---------------- SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEESw~me~rm=c—re—en=-

CHR HOURS: 2.75 3 $130.00 PER HOUR $357.50

MK HOURS: 1.00 & 3130.00 PER HOUR $130.00

- WMQ HOURS: 1.25 8 $130.00 PER HOUR $162450

r/g;K_HQURS }  $35.00 PER HOUR $1042.50

NEF TOTAL HCURS: 17.50 NET TOTAL FEES: $1712.50)
COSTS ADWMANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: §; CnsTS
10726 TELEPHONE TOLL CHARGES, 9.20
10/30 FEDERAL EXPRESS. 13.00
4NN

AnNn+sTH nNnuUATAArADTICC

-CELIA M. RUIZ NOV 16, 1995

T

$7598.17

$7598.17

FEES

162.50
106425

191.25
425,00

130.00
212,50
127.50

65.00

130.00

162.50




- NT.
(2503-10-1001 NOV 161995 PAGE )

10/31 FACSIMILIES. &§.00
COSTS: $34.20

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

117 6 $486.70 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.

SALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $6338.17
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $1746.70
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $486.70

ddh kA ko h Aok a

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: = $7598.17
fkdkohkhkhok k ok

t

STATEMENT DATE: NOV 16, 1995 FILE #1001

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT CCOD

FILE #1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF 'MANDATE 10)

PLZASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF:

FILE #1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE (10)

PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS
CMR 10/16 REVIEW VARIOUS MEMORANDUM RE .50
DISCIPLINARY MATTER.
CMR 10/17 REVISE AND FINAL LETTER. 1.00
CMR 10/18 REVIEW CHRONOLGY AND ISSUES RE .50
DISCIPLINE.
CMR 10/24 TC WITH MAYLE RE LETTER. .25
-------------;,«sﬁﬁﬁiE?“Br OURS, RATES & FEES=—=—~-=
CMR HOURS:  2.25 $130.00 PER HOUR 3292,
S = U

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

10731 FACSIMILIES.

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

117 6 $32.50 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE:
HINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

TOTAL AMOUNT OUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: #

]

STATEMENT DATE: NOV 16, 1995 FILE #1016

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

. STATEMENT.

({  CELIA M. RUIZ NOV 16, 1995 )
.RUIZ & SCHAPIRO )
400 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY  $7385.52

e Y ke

- e —
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Fhkkk hkkdkk khk bk

dok ko ke ok ek kA

$7385.52

FEES
65.00

130.00
65.00

32.50

£299.50
$32.50

$7385.52

&




STATEMENT.

CELIA

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

M., RUIZ NOV 16, 1995 Y

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY  $9457.00
SAN FRANCISCO- CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

% o

} f
GAVILAN JOINT CCD [ 5K

//_ ‘

FILE #1017: Jnﬁﬂsoui‘“bffﬁ"tonPLAznr

PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YQUR PAYMENT OF:

FILE #1017 JOHNSON®'S DFEH COMPLAINT

PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

MK
dSJ
CMR
MK

JLS

Jsd

CHMR

MK

JLS
NI

J4Sd

MK

JLS
4354

107 2
107 2

107 3

107 4

10/ 6

107 6

107 ¢
10/ 9

10/
10/

-2 0

10710

10711

10/11
10/11

REVIEW MATERIALS; CONFERENCE RE DFEH
RESPONSE AND TORT CLAIM,

REVIEW MATERIALS FROM DR. MAYLE RE
MR. CASIMEREZ CONFER RE CASIMERS
MATERIALS.

REVIEW DOCUMENTATION,

REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE;CONFERENCE RE
RESPONSE.

ARRANGE DOCUMENT REVIEW FOR
SUSPENSION: DRAFT CLIENT LETTER:
CONFER RE SUSPENSION STRATEGY.
RESEARCH STATUTE OF LIMITATIONS
REGARDING FILING CLAIM UNDER TORT
CLAIMS ACT.

REVIEW DFEH RESPONSE AND
DOCUMENTATION RE PERFORMANCE.
REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM MS.
JOHNSON? REVIEW MEMOS, TELEPHONEC
CONFERENCE WITH DR. MAYLE; REVIEW

HEMO RE TELEPHONE INTERVIEW WITH DY)’

JOYCEFMEETING, RE STRATEGY. - -
CONFER WITH DR. MAYLE RE oocunrurs.
CONFER RE TORTS CLAIM; REVIZH TORTS
CLAINM.

CALL TO DR. MAYLE'S OFFICE RE DR,
HOLLOMAN.

CONFERENCES RE WITNESSES AND LEGAL
RESARCH, TELEPHONE CONFEENCE WITH DR.
MAYLE.

CONFER WITH RE CHRONOLOGY.

CALLS TO CASIMERE RE AFFIRMATIVE
ACTION POLICY, CALLS TO DR. HOLLEMAN
RE SAME; RESEARCH STATUTE OF
LIMITATIONS ISSUES IN FILING TORTS
CLAIM, CONFERENCE RE TORTS CLAIM;

pcwrcuy ho MAVEIEC o FrTe o~ A B ogaay

(|

ao

HOURS

PLTRS Dow

-50

2253

1.00

25
k.25

$9657.00

FEES
97.50
130.00
260,00
65.00

130.00
?7.50

130.00

227.50

32.%2
65. 00

32,51
130,00

3z.zs¢C
552450




CHMR

IAD

CMR

IAD

IAD
IAD
JLS
IAD
CHMR
CMR

JsJ

IAD

CMR
MK

JLS

WMa

JSJ

TAD

JLS
WHa

1AD

STATEMENT-

10/12
10712

10713

10713

10714
10715
10717
10717
10113
10/18

10/18

10/18

10/19
10719

10719

10419

10719

10719

10720
10729
10/20
10/24

10725

[2503-10-1017 NOV 16, 1995

REVIEW CASE STATUS AND INVESTIGATIVE
FOLLOW UP.

ORGANIZATION OF FILE AND DOCUMENTS:
REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND PREPARE BRIEF
OUTLINE OF EVENTS FOR MEETING W/ CMR.
REVIEW DISCIPLINARY FILE AND
STRATEGY,

REVIEW JOHNSON FILE; MEETING TO
DISCUSS CASE AND WHAT ARE THE NEXT
TASKS TO COMPLETE,

REVIEW JOHNSON FILE; DRAFTING OF
CHRONOLOGY.

REVIEW JOHNSON FILE; DRAFTING AND
EDITING OF CHRONOLOGY.

CONFER RE RESPONSE TO JOHNSON
LETTERSS STRATEGIZE RE SAME.
REVISING OF CHRONOLOGY? CONFER RE
CHRONOLOCGY.

REVIEW CHRONOLOGY AND PREPARED CASES
TC WITH DR MAYLE.

REVIEW CHRONOLOGY ANO IDENTIFIED
ARSEAS FOR INVESTIGATION.

CALL TO OR. HOLLOMAN RE CASIMERE,
DRAFT CASIMERE DECLARATION, CONFER RE
SAME,

REVISING OF CHRONOLOGY; MEETING RE
FURTHER STEPS TO TAKE IN THIS FILE;
DRAFTING OF TWO MEMOS IN RESPONSE TO
JOHNSON®'S MEMNMOS OF 2, 5 AND 9.
CHRONOLOGY AND ANALYSIS.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DFEH
INVESTIGATOR; CONFERENCE RE WITNESS
STATEMENTS AND RESPONSE TO DFEH.
CONFER RE RESPONSE TO 10/2 & 1079
LETTERS.

CONF. RE JOHNSON LETTERS AND
RESPONSE; REVIEW FILES; CONF LAW
CLERK RE CHRONOLOGY OF EVENTS, DRAFT
RESPONSIVE MEMORANDUM; REVISIONS AND
EDITS YO DRAFT,

TWO CALLS TO MRS NELSON RE
DECLARATIONS, CALL TO DPR. MAYLE®S
OFFICE; CONFER RE STATUS OF CASE.
MEET RE REVISION OF DRAFT MEMQS; MEET

- 5.50

2.00

7.25

3.00
« 75

« 75

3.75

RE JOHNSON FILE AND BACKGROUND ™~ ———— —— ~~-

INFORMATION ON MEMOS RESPONDING TO
JOHHSON'S ALLEGATIONS; PHONE CALL TO
A. FLOOK; MEET RE CALL TO FLOOK AND
REVISIONS TO RESPONSE MEMOS.

REVIEW RESPONSE MEMA,

REVISIONS TO JOHNSON MEMORANDUM;
DRAFT LETTER TO CLIENT; CONF. I.D. TO
REVIEW DRAFT.

REVIEW OF RESPONSE MEMO FROM DR.
MAYLE TO JOHNSON.

CALL YO DR, MAYLE'S QFFICE pE
DOCUMENTS RE CASIMERE; REVIEW FILE,
REVIEW AND RESVISE DECLARATION OF JOHK
HOLLEMAN;? CONFERENCE RE STRATEGY,
ORAFT DECLARATIONS OF G, CASIMERE AND

25
.25
50
=20
-50

3.00

2 )

32.50

148.75

130.00

191.25

446,25
573.75

65.00
467.50
260.00
162.50

260.00

616.25

390.00
97.50C

3Z2.50

877.50

2750

318.75

32.50
552.50
42.50
65.00

65.00

390.00



STATEMENT:
(3563-10-1017 NOV 16+ 1995 PAGE ER

DR. HOLLEMAN; CALLS TO DR. HOLLEMAN
AND CASIMERE; CONFERENCE RE STATUS OF

CASE,
IAD 10/25 MEET RE: MACHADO CLAIM, 75 63.75
J5J 10726 REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN CASIMERE'S 4.50 585.00

PERSONNEL FILESZ CALL DR. HOLLEMAN RE
SAME; REVISE DR. HOLLOMAN'S
DECLARATION; CALL TO DR. HOLLEMAN RE
SAME; DRAFT DR, MAYLE'"S DECLARATIONS
REVISE DR, CASIMERE®"S DECLARATION.
JSJ 10/27 DRAFT COVER LETTER TO MRS. NELSON RE 25 32.50
DECLARATIONS? CALL TO DR. MAYLE®'S
OFFICE RE DEZCLARATIONS.

MK 10730 REVIEW SUBMISSION TO DFEH; DRAFT .25 32.50
LETTER TO DR.MAYLE,
JSJ 10/30 REVIEWED CASIMERE®S DECLARATION: 1.50 195.00

DRAFT COVER LETTER TO MRS NELSON,
RESEARCH REJECTION OF JOHNSON'S TORTS
CLAIMZ DRAFT REJECTION.,

---------------- SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES 8 FEES—mmmmmmomme < comn
CHR HOURS: 10.50 @& $130.00 PER HOUR  .$1365.00
MK HOURS 2 S50 3 31303.00 PER HOUR $£715.00
JLS HOURS: 2.50 & 3130.00 PER HOUR $£325.00
WHMQ HOURS: 11.00 & $130.00 PER HOUR  $1430.00
JSJ HOURS: 19.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $£2502.50
D—HOURS2 a 385.0D0 PER HOUR $2868.75
NET TOTAL HQOURS: 82.5 NET TOTAL FEES: 59206 25
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
10725 DELIVERY/MESSENGER. 44,85
10726 TELEPHONE TOLL CHARGES. 6.5¢%6
10726 DELIVERY/MESSENGER. L. 26
10/26 DELIVERY/MESSENGER. 66. 70
10726 DELIVERY/MESSENGER. 66.70
10/26 DELIVERY/MESSENGER. 44,85
10731 PHOTOCOPIES. 71.28
10731 FACSIMILIES. 75.00
10731 WORD PROCESSING/DOCUMENT PREP. 70.00
10731 POSTAGE CHARGES. .. oTw
COSTS&\\\thjjflii/
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
117 6 $422.50 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU. &
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $422.50
PLUS:  CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: _ £9657.00
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $422.50

Ak ok Ak dokodkok
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: % $9657.00

*hkhh Ak kok ki kk

STATEMENT DATE: NOV 16, 1995 FILE #1017

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT:

(. CELIA M. RUIZ NOV 16, 1995

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY 3130.00

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN COMMUNITY COLLEGE

5055 SANTA TERESA BLYD :
GILROY, CA 95020 (i::EEz:i::)

FILE #1021 JOHNSON TORT (10)
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: 3130.00
FILE #1021 JOHNSON TORT (10)
PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
MK 10/18 REVIEW CHRONOLOGY OF EVENTS: 1.00 130.00
CONFERENCE RE STRATEGY.
_f”ﬂf#yt::—

—eemme s m—m—eaa~=SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FECSwmucara- ————————
) MK HOURS: 1.00 /3 $130.00 PER HOUR 1$130.00
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: 0.00
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $130.00

; Ak hkkkdhkhdk N

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: + $130.00

LER S 88 F 22X T

STATEMENT DATE: NOV 16, 1995 FILE #1021

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT-
(f__FCELIA M. RUIZ NOV 16, 1995 \

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE pay 365,00

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT
5055 SANTA THERESA BLVD. -

GILROY, CA 95020
ATTENTION: GLENN MAYLE

FILE #1012 KAREITH® (10)
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF- 365,00
FILE #1012 KARCICH (10)
PROFESSLONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT = HOURS FEES
CMR 10/ 9 REVIEW NOTICE OF UNPROFESSTONAL 30 65,00

CONDUCT AND CBA PROVISIONS.

----------- ~m===SUMRARY OFYHOURS, RATES & FEESememmmmmmecmae oo
CMR HOURS:/ 0.50 $130.00 PER HOUR $65.00
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: : 0.00
PLUS:  CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: : $65.00

FRAAN AR AT RNERA
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: * $65.00

Ahkkk kit hhkhkhk k&

STATEMENT BDATE: NOV 16, 1995 FILF #1017

RUIZ & SCHAPIRGO




STATEMENT-

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395~9005

2l

7
GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE [E -
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. H
GILROY, CA 95020 -
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE t\) .

PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF:

PROFESSTONAL FEES SINCE THZ LAST STATEMENT :

OF EE TO SUPERVISOR.
OF EE TO SUPERVISOR,
CONTRACT,

FACT FINDINNG RE CONTRACT
IMPASSE;REDRAFT PROPOSED CONTRACT
PROVISIONS,;REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM
DR. HAYLEéiiﬁbﬁPHONE CALL T0 DR,
MAYLE,

ACCIDENT AND ILLNESS LEAVE;

FOR FACT FINDING RﬁfORT; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH LJ}ORTEGA RE LABQOR
MATTERS AND UPCOMING CONFERPENCE WITH
CSEA; REVIEW MATERIALS FROM GCFA FOR
COLLECTIVE BARGAINING:

CHR 1D/ & C

MK 10/ 4 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLAU AME S
RE FACT FINDING RE RY:TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH b AYLE; REVIEW

CMR 10/ 5 REVIEW OUTSTANDING CBA ISSUES/FACT M

DR. MAYLGSRE VARIOUS LABOR RELAT JONS
MATTERS. 5/

PROCEDURES.

CONCLUDF FACT FINNTNM betonnt

f_ CELIA M. RUIZ NOV 16, 1995

600 MONYGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY 3$31716.87

FILE #1006 LABOR RELATIONS €10

FILE-#1006 LABOR RELATIONS _ ao

CJK 9725 LEGAL RESEARCH RE: RECLASSIFICATION @ 1.25 106,25
CJK 9726 LEGAL RESEARCH RE: RECLASSIFICATI (} 3.25 27 6.25
CMR 10/ 2 PREPARE QUTSTANDING ISSUES RE Nt¥W ﬁj 2.00 260,06

MK 10/ 2 REVIEW LATEST OFFER RE SETTLEMENT DF{J 3.75 487.50

WMQ 10/ 2 FINALIZE LETTER REGARDING INDUSTRIAL C. .25?:i>32.50

MK 10/ 3 DRAFT AND REVISE CONTRACT PROVISIONS?J 4.25 552.50

NEW CONTRACT; FACT. FINDING. -i%)d-‘hﬁ*3;2s= 422,50 |[~°~
DE /A :

| MATERIALS FOR THURSDAY MEETING.

CJK 10/ 4 DRAFT OF DISCIPLINE PROCEDURES. c:él::;:;;:p 191.25
FINDING. e

HK 10/ 5 CONFERENCE RE ARBALLO; MEETING HITH ¢ ¢ 8.00 3040.00

RAS 10/ S CONFER RE OUTSTANDING FACT FINDING ﬁ} 1.50 195.00
LSSUES; RESEARCH FACT FINDING [SSUFS '
CIK 107 5 RESEARCH CASE LAW FOR DISCIPLINE .~ ¢, 2.00 170.00

RAS 10/ & CONFERENCES RE STATUS AND ATTEMPTIS TO /

i

A

$31716.87

HO! FEES

)

pr'SO 195.00

?.00 1170.00

« 75 97. 50



STATEMENT

CHR

CMR

MK

RAS

€JK

CMR

CMR

MK
RAS

CHR

MK

CHR

CHMR

MK

CMR
CHR
MK

CHR

CHR
MK

MK

(2503~10-1006 NOV 16, 1995 PAGE

10/ 9 REVISE FACT FINDING REPORT AND DRAFT A/Z.?S
LETTER TO PEARLZ TC WITH AMES,
ARRANGE NEW MAILING.

16/ 9 RESCHEDULE BARGAINING MEETING AND N
REVIEW PREPARATION FOR SAME.

107 9 REVIEW FACT FINDING PROVISION AND M 1.50
REVISE; REVIEW CONTRACT PROVISIONS
FOR REVISION, DRAFT AND REVISE PRESS

1.00

RELEASE.

10/ 9 CONFERENCE RE REVISIONS TO FACT ﬂ 1.25
FINDING REPORT AND RELATED ISSUES?
REVISE FACT FINDING REPORT;
PREPARATION OF CORRESPONDENCET YO R,
MURPHY RE RECLASSIFICATIONZ? REVIEW OF
RECLASSIFICATION FORM. -7

10/ 9 RESEARCH AND ORAFT DISCIPLINARY ( ( 1.25
PROCEDURES.

10710 DRAFT LETTER TO PRESIDENT MAYLE AND N 1.00
FAXED LETTER TO AMES;CONFERENCS.HITH
MAYLE RE OPTIONcﬁﬁzb 5TR¢$§§Y gﬁ#

10711 0ISCUSSION WwITH(HANLE, p
RE LAST MINUTE REVISIONS: REVISE
REPORT TO REFLECT CHANGES; LETTER T0
PEARL RE CHANGES.

10711 PREPARE FOR CONTRACT REVISION - A .50
DRAFTING.

10/11 CONFERENCE RE STATUS; TELECONFERENCE A .75
W/ FREEMAN RE GRAND JURY INQUIRY.

10712 CONFERENCE WITH AMES RE FINAL REPORT; Af1.25
TC WITH MAYLE; REVISE REPORT AND FAX
TO FACT FINDER.

10/12 REVIEW AND REVISE CONTRACT, A 5.50
INCORPORATING CHANGES.

10/13 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BERNIE A/ 1.00
MURPHY RE NEGOTIATIONS; REVIEW NOTES
AND OUTSTANDING MATTERS.

10/16 REVIEW STATUS OF FINAL FACT FINDING A

REPORT. N,
10716 REVISE CONTRACT-INCORPORATING NEW 1.50

PROVISIONS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
(:)/5 MAYLE RE FACULTY RSTIREMENT

PROVISIONS.
10718 REVIEW FACT FINOING REPORT. N .s0
10/18 TC WITH HURPHY-RE NEGOTIATION. N Les
10/18 TELEPHONE CONFRENCE WITH KENT Ao1.50
CHILDSDRAFT RESPONSE TO OPPOSING
COUNSEL RE RETIREMENT INCENTIVE
ISSUE;REVIEW CONTRACT.
10/19 FINAL FACT FINDING PROCESS AND Noo1.7s
PROCEDURES. N,
10/19 PREPARE NOTICE FOR FACT FINDI .50

10/19 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OR v/ ﬁ} 3.50
MAYLEZLEGAL RESEARCH RE PUBLICATION
OF FACT FINDING REPORT: DRAFT PRESS
RELEASE RE FACT FINDING REPORTZREVIEW
CONTRACT PROVISIONS RE FACULTY
RETIREMENT BEWMFF LEPHONE CALL
TO CAROL COOQPER V//E

10/20 REVIEW LETTER RE“POSTING OF L) Z2.50

MATICFCIRRAFT MNATIFCE D0 TYAFQT

357.

130.

195.

162,

106.

130.

162.

65.

97

162.

715,

130,

32.

195.

65,
3‘2-
195.

227,

65.
455,

325,

2 o= /o2t

50

00

0o

50

25
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5C

00

«50

50

00

D4

50
00

Go
50
00

50

0o
00

00

/y12252:



STATEMENT.-

[2503-10~1006 NOV 16, 1995 PAGE

FINDING/REVIEW LETTERS TO DR. OMENS,
LUZ ORTEGA AND HER ASSISTANT RE
INTERVIEWS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
DR. MAYLE;CONFERENCE RE ABOVE,

8 EDIT PRESS RELEASE RE FACT FINDING,
CONFER RE NOTICE REQUIRED BY PERB,

FINDING, REVIEW LETTER FROM CSEA RE
NEGOTIATION PROCESS.

ON OUTSTANDING ISSUES; REVIEW CSEA
LETTER AND RESPONSE TO IT; REVIEW
OUTSTANDING ISSUES IN NEGOTIATION IN
PREPARATION FOR MEETING. :

RAS 10/25 TELECONFERENCE W/ CMR RE OUTSTANDING A/ «25

CASH BACK ELIMINATION AND CONTRACT;
PREP OF CORRESPONDENCE TO CARRIER,
PREP OF UPDATED SALARY SCHEDULE,
CMR 10/27 NEGOTIATION SESSION CScA, p/ 7.50

NEGOTIATIONS, A/
CMR 10/30 REVIEW OUTSTANDING CBA ISSUES.

JUDGE LINK; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH
DR. MAYLE, '
yoars

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

11/ 6 $24794.71 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.

]

JLS 10720 CONFER RE NOTICE REQUIREMENT, REVIEW ﬁ/ «75 ?7.50
CMR 10/24 REVIEW FINAL PROCEDURES RE FACT Pj 1.50 195.00

CMR 1U/éj9TC WITH DR MAYLE RE MEETING WITH CSEAﬁ/Z.SD 325.00

32.50

ISSUE.
RAS 10/26 PREP OF CORRESPONDENCE T0 CSEA RE A/ 1.50 195.00

975.00
MK 10/27 CONFERENCE RE STRATEGY ON ﬁ/ .25 32.50

1.00  130.00
MK 10/30 REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT LETTER TO Ao/ 1.50 195 00

RAS 10/30 REVIEW OF MEMO RE OUTSTANDING ISSUES: 97.50
RESEARCH RE SAME. :

----- memmemm=e o= SUNMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES—ommmemmecooo e oo

CMR HOURS: 38.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $64972.50

MK HOURS: 35.75 3 $130.00 PER HOUR $4647 .50

RAS HOURS: 6.75 @ 3130.00 PER HOUR $877.50

JLS HOURS:  0.75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $97.50

WHMQ HOURS: 0.25 Q $130.00 PER HOUR $32.50

CJK HOURS: 10.00 4385.00 PER HOUR $350.00

NET TOTAL HOURS: 91.7 NET TOTAL FEES: $11477.50

/828 = ?3.SA Y -

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STA ENT: COSTS
9730 COMPUTER RESEARCH. 331.00
10/26 TELEPHONE TOLL CHARGES. L6, 84
10731 PHOTOCOPIES., 85.00
10731 FACSIMILIES, 98.00
10/31 POSTAGE CHARGES., 4.28
10/31 WORDPROCESSING/DOCUMENT PREP. : 60,00
10731 MILEAGE. 108,00

cosrs:(?l) $733.12

3ﬂ

W

1

-

- 7

P
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p—— STATEMENT ,
Ctixﬁ M. RUIZ 0CY 13, 1995
KUTZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $290244.03

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-~9005

3

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE

TERESA BLVD.
95020
DR«

5055 SANTA
GILROY, CA
ATTENTION:

ILE #1000 SUMMARY FILE

LEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH

ILE A1000 SUMMARY FILE

ILE F1015 ARBALLO
CURRENT HOURS:
PREVIQUS BALANCE:

39.50
0.00

PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00
PLUS CUR COSTS: 85.35
{LE #1020 CERONA

C ENT HOURS: 3.25

Pu cVIOUS BALANCE: 0.00
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00
PLUS CUR COSTS: 0.00
LE #1019 CONSTRUCTION
CURRENY HOURS: 8.50
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 162.50
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00
PLUS CUR COSTS: 35.20
LE #1014 CSEA

CURRENT HOURS: 270,00
PREVIQUS BALANCE: 238209.07
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00

PLUS CUR COSTS:

LE K1013 DIAZ

CURRENT HOURS: 12.25

PREVIOUS BALANCE: 71.82
PLUS LATE CHARGES: .00
PLUS CUR COSTS: 0.00

LE #1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE

2.75
6586.68
0.00
'230.45

CURRENT HOURS:

P 'IQUS BALANCE:
Lo LATE (HARGES:
LUS CUR COSTS:

GLENN MAYLE

1702.21"

/f—
A)

l Ia

[
1.
E}

€10)

YOUR PAYMENT OF:

Qo

(103

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS CUR FEES:
EQUALS NEW BALANCE:
102

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS CUR FEES:
FQUALS NEW BALANCE:
(102

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:
EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

(%56%AKO (10)

MINUS qLR PAYHENTS:

e '7J 75
,} e f N
y \ Y

C}U

3290244.03

0.0D
3785.00
3870.35.

0. 00
332.50
332.50"

162.50
1003.75
1038.95

43099.25

US—CUR FEES: " 288564.25

pil FET
“FQUALS NEW BALANCE-

QR

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS CUR FE=S:
EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

(1m
MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:
EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

225668.28

15,52
1097, 50"

1153.80

735.21
256425
6338.17

\

1445

o



r*@503-10-1000 0CT 13, 1995 . PAGE 2
FILE #1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE (10}
CURRENT HOURS: 0.25
PREVIOUS BALANCE: ?301.12 HMINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 2215.10
PLUS LATE CHARGES: " 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: 32.50
PLUS CUR COSTS: 0.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 7118.52
FILE #1017 JOHNSON'S DFEH COMPLAINT (10)
CURRENT HOURS: 3.25
PREVIDUS BALANCE: 130.00 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 130.00
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: 422,50
PLUS CUR COSTS: 0.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 422.50
FILE #1006 LABOR RELATIONS (10)
CURRENT HOURS: 183.75
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 78663.47 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 59157.22
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: 23066.25
PLUS CUR COSTS: 1728.46 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 44300.95%
TOTAL OF PREVIOUS STATEMENT BALANCES: 333124. 66
MINUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT PAYMENTS: 105514.80
UNPAID FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENTS: 227609.86
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT LATE CHARGES: 0.00
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT FEES: 58852.50
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT COSTS: 3781.67

‘ 2,03 17
EQUALS: TOTAL BALANCE DUE THIS STATEMENT: (iii?%ifjfijb,¢;

STATEMENT DATE: 0CT 13, 1995 FILE #1000

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

STATEMENT -




STATEMENT.

CELIA M. RUIZ ocr 11,
RUIZ % SCHAPIRO
500 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR  PLEASE PAY
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005
ﬁ_%
GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE 3.§’f
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. oy
GILROY, CA 95020 {j
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE
FILE #1015 AREALTD (10)
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF:
FILE #1015 ARBALLO (o)
PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT : HOURS
DGL 9/ 1 RESEARCH LAY=0FF ISSUE. L o4l2s
OGL 9/ S RESEARCH AND WRITE MEMO. £ 3.75
DGL 9/ 6 RESEARCH AND COPY CASES RE MATTER. (0 2.50
OGL 9/ 7 RESEARCH, READ CASES, CONFERENCE RE & 3.75
SAME .
JLS 9/ 8 INSTRUCT 0. LEVI RE COLLECTIVE g .2s
BAGGAINING AGREEMENT & LETTER
RESPONSE,
DGL 9§/ 8 RESEARCH MATTSR; CONFERENCE RE SAME; O 3.00
RETRIZIVE COLLECTIVE BARGAINING
AGREEMENT FROM FILES.
CMR  9/11 REVIEW PROCEDURES AND TIMELINE. ¢ ,sp
JLS  9/11 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE & MEMO, £ .50
DGL  9/11 UPDATT MEMO; CONFERENCE RE SAME. ¢ .50
JLS  9/12 CONFER RE PROCEDURES; REVIEW % EDIT 1.75
ORAFT CLIENT LETTYER: REVIEW & EDIT
DRAFT RESPONSE TO OPPOSING COUNSELS
REVIEW APPLICABLE EDUCATION CODE
PROVISIONS. 3
BGL 9712 RESEARCH HEARING ISSUE; WRITE LETTERS ©s5.50
TO CLIENT AND CSEA. 0
CMR 9713 REVIEW ISSUES AND PROCEDURES. .50
CHR 9719 REVIEW SUSPENSION PROCEDURE AN o L uso
PROCESS. o8
JLS 9719 STRATEGIZE HEARING; CONFER WITH bR.. (L .25
MAYLE,
DGL 9719 CONMFERENCE REf POTENTIAL HEARING. L .25
CHR  9/20 REVIEW PROCESS AND PROCEDURE. ¢ .so
JLS 9720 CONFTZRENCE RE MEW DSVFLOPMENTSS t,2.25
STRATEGIZE ISSUES TO SXPLORE IN
PRIPARATION FOR TERMINATION;
CONFEREMNCES WITH MS. 535; REVIEW
DOCUMENTS,
DGL  9/20 RESEARCH AND CONFERENCE. & .75
JLS 9721

REYIEW CODE SECTIONS RE cgﬁgiér D 1.75
DISCIPLINE; CONFEQR WITH MS ) THRTEGA;
PIVIEW UNION CORRESPNNAEMAC: noarT

1995

$3870.35

$3870.35

FEES

361.25
318.75
212.50
318.75

32.50

255.00

65.00
65.00
42.50
227.50

467.50

65.00
65.00

32.50
21.25

65.00
292.50

63.75
227.50

ﬂ




RESPONSE TO UNION LETTER,

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
9730 PHOTOCOPIES.
9730 FACSIMILIES.

9/30 POSTAGE.
COSTS:

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE:

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: =

STATEMENT DATE: 0CT 11, 1995 FILE #1015

RUIZ % SCHAPIRO

i STATEMENT-
! @503—10-1015 0cT 11, 1995 PAGE 2 )

DGL  9/21 WRITE LETTERS RE: HEARING. 5.75 488,75
CMR  9/25 REVIEW CASE STATUS RE ARBALLO LEAVE. .50 65.00
JLS 9/25 CONFERENCE RE TERMINATION. .25 32.50
---------------- SUMMARY OF HOURSs RATES & FEES~~-mmmeccacomma.
CMR HOURS: 2,50 & $130.00 PER HOUR $325.00
JLS HOURS:  7.00 & $130.00 PER HOUR $910.00

DGL HOURS: _30.00_ a3 $85.00 PER HOUR  $2550.00
NET TOTAL HOURS: NET TOTAL FEES: $3785.00/

khkdkhdhkh hhk hk

khhkhhkhkhkh hhk ki

COSTS

71. 80
13.00

n.55 | -

C385.35]

0.00
$3870.35

$3870.35,




{  CELIA M, RUIZ 0CT 11, 1995
" RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $332.50

SAN FRANCISCO., CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD

GILROY, CA 95020

ATTN: DR, GLEN MAYLE

FILE #1020 CERONA | (10)
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $332.50
FILE #1020 CERONA (10)
PROFESSIONAL FFES‘SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEFS

JLS 9712 REVIEW CLIENT MEMD RE CASE: REVIEW & 1.00 130.00
EDIT CLIENT MEMO RE PROCEDURES.

CJK 9713 RESEARCH PROCEDURE FOR TERMINATION, & 2.00 170.00

JLS 9719 CALL TO DR. JOYCE.Ci%D ¢ .25 32.50

---------------- SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES % FEESemmwrmemccrooee—-
JLS HOURS: 1,25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $162.50
CJX HOU®S: 00 3 385.00 PER HOUR $170.00
NET TOTAL HOURS: NET TOTAL FEES: $332.50
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: 0. 00
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: C $332.50
Ak khkhkhkhkk Ak ki
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: + $£332.50V
KX hkhkhhdkhhkhi
STATEMENT DATE: OCT 11, 1995 FILE #1020

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

STATEMENT- ~




STATEMENT-

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE

9127 $3162.50 PAYMEN

CELIA M. RUIZ ocT 11, 1995 )
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY  $1038.95
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 941119
TELE PHONE (415) 395-9005
GAVILAN COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020
ATTN: DR. MAYLE
FILE #1019 SCONSTRUCTION Y Qo)
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $1038.95
FILE #1019 CONSTRUCTION ¢10)
PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
|WMW  8/30 REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE CONSTRUCTION 1.75  227.50
DISPUTE; TELECON RE SAME.
WMW 8731 TELECON RE CONTRACT, LETTER TO 1.50 195.00
SPEROW.
JUS 9/13% CONFER RE CONSTRUCTION ISSUES. .25 32.50
JUS 9714 CONFER WITH J. HANSELL AND B. WRIGHTZ .50 65. 00
UPDATE C. RUIZ RE SAME. _ '
DGL 9/16 RESEARCH CONSTRUCTION ISSUE. 1.00 85.00
DGL 9717 RESCARCH CONSTRUCTION ISSUS. .75 63.75
DGL 9/18 RESEARCH ISSUE. .50 42.50
JUS 9719 CONFERENCES RE CONSTRUCTION ISSUE. .25 32.50
JLS 9/28 CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. HANSELL, L. 2.00 260.00
CARRIER & W. WRIGHT; CONFER WITH W. :
WRIGHT; CONFER WITH JOHN HANSELL RE
LETTER.
---------------- SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES R FEfS—wmmmomecmoom—ma-
JLS HOURS:  3.00 2 $130.00 PSR HOUR 3$390.00
DGL HOURS:  2.25 a3 $85.00 PER HOUR £191.25
HMW HOURS: 3 $130.00 PER HOUR $422.50
NET TOTAL HOURS: NET TOTAL FEES: $1003.75Y
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
9/30 PHOTOCOPIES. 13.20
9/30 FACSIMILIES. 22.00 |
COSTS: $35.20

THE LAST STATEMENT:

5\\_,,///f?
/6—

T RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.




(2503-10-1019

L T e et bt e R e L R TR L R R R R R P S ——

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $162.50
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $1038.95 V
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $162.50

STATEMENT.
0CT 11, 1995 PAGE 2 )

Rkt hkkhhkhhhkhh

TOTAL AMOQUNT OUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: * $1038.95"
Ak hkhkhkh kR kh dk

B it S Sl RS WP S S S [ |

R SR i S S, T N U O U N S S Y

]

STATEMENT DATE: CCT 11, 1995 FILE #1019

RUTZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT:

4 CELIA M. RUIZ

RULZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOTINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

0CT 11, 1995 )

PLEASE PAY $225668.28

GILROY, CA 95020 {7
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE \
plér?;

FILE #1014 CSEA (10) £

PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $225668.28

FILE #1014 C3EA (13

PROFESSIONAL FESS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES

OGL 9/ 1 OUTLINE ISSUES. P o2.25 191.25

DGL 9/ 9 READ CASES: UPDATE QUTLINE. Y 4,25 361.25

DGL 9711 UPDATE OUTLIMNE, CONFERENCE RE SAME, P 6.00 S10.00

MK 9712 CONFEREMCE RF OPPOSITION BRIEF, T 6,00 780.00
REVIEW LEGAL RESEARCH; DRAFT BRIEF.

DGL $/12 UPDATE RASEARCH, CONFERENCE RE SAME. T 3.25 276425

MK 9f/13% DRAFT OPPOSITION BRIEF. T 4.00 520.00

DGL 9/13 UPDATE OUTLINE. P 6.50 552.50

MK 97146 DRAFT AND REVISE DRAFT OPPOSITION + 2.00 260.00

" BRIFF.

DGL 9714 RESEARCH MATRIXS READ INTRODUCTION. 7 5.50 467.50

MK 9/15 DRAFT AND REVISE DRAFT OPPOSITION 7 6.00 780.00
BRIEF.

0GL /15 CONFERENCE RE RESEARCH. ¥ 4,75 403,75

DGL 9/716 WORK ON BRIEF. ' 7 6.00 510,00

MK 9/17 DRAFT AND REVISE DRAFT OPPOSITION P 4.00 520.00
BRIEF,

MK /18 DRAFT AND REVISE DRAFT OPPOSITION P s.s50 715.00
BRIFF.

DGL 9/18 WORX ON BRIEF, ? B8.75 743,75

MK 9/19 DRAFT AND REVISE DRAFT OPPOSITION . . ©.9.00 1170.00
BRIEF.

DGL  9/19 RESTARCH AND WRITE BRIEF, ~ " “:°°° ~7P-9.00°" 765.00

MK 9/20 DRAFT AND REVISE DRAFT OPPOSITION f s5.50 715.00
BRIEF.

DGL  9/20 WORK ON BRIEF, f 9.25 786.25

MK 9/21 REVIEW AND REVI3E DRAFT OF OPPOSITION 78.00 1040.00
ARIEF, *

DGL 9/21 WORK ON BRIFF, ¥ 6.75 573.75

WMQ 9/22 CONFERENCE RE GAVILAN BRIEF; EDIT 7 1.50 195,00
REVIEW BRIEF.

DGL  9/22 UPDATE RESEARCH; WRITE BRIEF. { 11.25 956,25

MK 9/2% DPAFT AND REVISE DRAFT OPPOSITION . 8.00 1040.00

. BRISF, ¥

WMR  7/23 REVIZW TESTIMONY, DRAFT & REVISE P 7.75 1007.5D0
PORTIONS OF 17377641 BRIEF,

b5l 9723 w0k 0N ARITF. { 10.50  892.50 )




\\‘V

(3503-10-1014 0CT 11, 1995 PAGE 2 )
MK  9/264 REVIEW AAND REVISE DRAFT OPPOSITION T 4.00 520.00
BRIEF,
MK  9/25 REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OPPOSITION ¥ 4,50 585.00
BRIEF; TELECON WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL.
WMQ 9/25 REVIEW TESTIMONY; WORK ON RETALIATIONT 8.50 110S5.00
SECTION OF 1739741 BRIEF.
MK 9726 DRAFT AND REVISE DRAFT OPPOSITION Y 4.00 520.00
ARIEF.
WMQ 9726 DIT AND REV. RETALIATION SECTION OF P 8.25 1072.50
, BRIEF; WORK ON FACT STATEMENT.
DGL 9/26 WORK ON BRIEF. ¥ 9.75 828.7S
MK- 9727 DRAFT AND REVISE OPPOSITION BRIEF. I 10.25 1332.50
WMQ 9/27 REVISIONS TO 1739 SRIEF; CONFERENCE 7 4.75 617.50
' RE SAME, A
DGL 9/27 WORK ON BRIEF, ¥ 12.00 1020.00
MK 9723 DRAFT AND REVISE OPPPOSITION BRIEF.T 11.50 1495.00
pGL  9/28% WORK ON BRIEF. Y 13.25 1126.25
MK 9729 REVIEW AND REVISE OPPOSITION BRIEF. 8.25 1072.50
DGL 9729 WORK ON BRIEF, 9.75 828.75
---------------- SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEfS—re-moreromcmma="
MK HOURS: 100.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $13065.00
WMR HOURS: 30,75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $3997.50
DGL HOURS: 138.75/ @ $85.00 PER HOUR $11793.75
NET TOTAL HOURii:ijff?iE;E:> NET TOTAL FEES: $28856.25
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
8/31 LEXI3 RSSEARCH. 173.00
9711 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 75.00
9/12 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 50.00
9/13 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 5.00
9/13 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCFSSOR. 25.00
/14 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 30.00
9714 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 50.00
2/15 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR, 62.50
9716 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 40.00
9/18 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 81.25
9719 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 50.00
9/19 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 37.50
9/20 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 20,00
9721 DOCUMEMT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 40.00
9721 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 50.00
9/21 DOCUMEMT PRZPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 30.00
9/22 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 87.50
9723 DOCUMENT POSPARATION, WORD PROCESSOR. 150.00
9/24 DOCUMENT PREPARATION; WORD PROCESSOR. 90.00
9725 DOCUMENT PREPAPATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 10.00
9/28 DOCUMENT PREZPARATION; WORD PROCESSOR. 80.00
9/30 PHOTOCOPI:S. \ 380.00
9/30 FACSIMILIES. 65.00
9/30 TELEPHONE TOLL CHARGES., J— 8.31
9/30 POSTAGE, P 2.15
3 o~
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
2/15 $15000.00 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.
L 7/27  313597.25 PAYMINT RSCIIVED ON ACCOUYT, THANK YOU. J




(2503-10-1014 0CT 11, 1995 PAGE
9727 $15000.00 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $238209.07
PLUS : CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $30558.46
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $43099.25

STATEMENT- ~
3

hhkhkkhhkkhk ki L

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: * $225668.28 V]
Ak AR K& KR

1]

STATEMENT DATE: 0CcT 11, 1995  FILE #1014

RUTZ & SCHAPIRO

[ S



SIATEMENT
~

4 CELIA M. RUIZ 0CcT 11, 1995
“ RUIZ % SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMFRY STREST, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $1153.80

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020 g
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE | i})_’

FILE #1013 DIAZ (1o

PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOQUR PAYMENT OF: $1153. 80
FILE #1013 DT (10)

PROFESSIONAL FFEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
DGL 9/ 5 TAX WITHHOLDING ISSUE. P 1.50 127.50
0GL 9/ & WORK ON TAX MEMO. P 3.50 297.50
MK - 9/ 7 TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH OPPOSIN P .75 97.50

COUNSELs TELECON WITH L, CARRIER?
REVIFW CORRESPONDENCE FROH OPPOSING
COUNS" L,

DGL 9/ 7 READ CASES; CALL IRSS WRITE AND FAX P 3.25 276.25
MEMO RE TAX ISSUE.

MK 9/ 3 REVIEW AND REVISE CORRESPONDENCE TO ® .50 65.00
DPPOSING COUNSEL RE SETTLEMENT.

PGL 9/ 8 WRITE LETTER. P 2.75  233.75
---------------- SUMMARY OF HOURSs RATES & FEFf§=—=—m-m=mmmmmmm——-
MK  HKOURS: 1.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $162.50
DGL HOURS: _14,00—a $85.00 PER HOUR $935.00

NET TOTAL HOURSZ 32,25 sz) NET TOTAL FEES: $1097.50
¢=f=“==“‘;==;'ﬁi::i,x? At sees
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

9/27  $15.52 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.
BRALANCFE FRCM THE LAST STATEMENT: $71.82
PLUS:  CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: | $1097.50
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $15.52

Kk Ak hkhkhhkhd

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: =% $1153.80V/
AhkAhhAhhrkn

STATENINT DATE: 0CT 11, 1995 FILE R1013

RUTIZ & SCHAPIRQ




STATEMENT- N

( CZLIA M. RUIZ ocY 11, 1995
RUIZ & SCHAPIRQ
400 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY  $6338.17

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

!
GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE ; )1
S055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. L =
GILROY, CA 95020 7
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

)

FILE #1001 GAVITAN GENERALTLEGATEABVEIEE ' (10)

PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $6338.17

FILE #1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE (10)

PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES

CHMR 9/ 6 REVIEW STATUS OF DISCIPLINARY =50 65.00
MATTERS.

CIK 9/ 6 RESEARCH ISSUE RE: WITHOLDING PAYROLL .75 63,75
TAX AND RETROACTIVE COLLECTION.

CJK 97 7 RESEARCH STATE SDI TAX WITHOLDING. 1.25 10625

CJK 9721 CONFERENCE W/ L. CARRIER RS: TAX. .25 21.25

---------------- SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES~rmmocmmwmmomecan

CMR HOURS:  0.57 a $130.00 PER HOUR $65.00

L JK-HOURS: 25 @ $85.00 PER HOUR $191.25

NET TOTAL HOURS:  2.73 NET TOTAL FEES:  $256.25+
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS

8/31 LEXIS RESZARCH. 118.50

9711 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 40.00

QI30 PHOTOCOPIES. 23.20

9/30 FACSIMILIES. 39,00

9/30 TELEPHONE TOLL CHARGES. 7.09

9730 POSTAGE. ‘ 266 ]

0sTs: $230.45/[\
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SIMCT THE LAST STATEMENT:

9127 $735.21 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $6586.68
PLUS: CHERG=ZS LISTED AQQVE: $486.70
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $735.21

LA E S R X X 3

TOTAL AMGUMNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: * $6338.1%7
LR LR T TR

f;L

J




STATEMENT-

4 CELIA M, RUIZ 0CT 11, 1995
F RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONT GOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $7118.52

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415} 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD p |
! K
_—

FILE #1016 0RNSON S HRIT OF MANDATE (10)
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $7118.52

FILE #1016 JOHNZON'S WRIT OF MANDATE €10)
PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
CMR 9/19 REVIEW STATUS. .25 32.50

---------------- SUMMARY_OE“HOURS, RATES & FEESemmmrmmcamewmoean
R A woun w3250,

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCI THE LAST STATEMENT:

9127 F2215.10 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNTS THANK YOU.

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $9301.12
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $32.50
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $2215.10

dkkkhdokh kKo

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: = £7118. SZV/
! hhkkhhhhhkhkh

6,_

STATEMINT DATE: 0CY 11, 1995 FILE #1016

RUTZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT-

13

STATEMENT DATE: 19

¥ 7

oCcT 13- 95 FILE

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

CELIA M. RUIZ 0CT 13, 1995
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO -
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $422.50
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005
GAVILAN JOINT CCOD
g
H
g
=)
FILE #1017 JOHNSON®S DFEH COMPLAINT C10)
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $422.50
FILE #1017 JOHNSON®S DFEH COMPLAINT ¢10)
PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT : HOURS FEES
MK 9718 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DFEH 1.00  130.00
INVESTIGATOR: REVIEW FILE.
MK  9/19 CONFERENCES RE RESPONSE TO DFEH .50 65.00
INVESTIGATOR? TELEPHONE CALL T0
DISTRICT.
JSJ  9/19 REVIEW FILE RE JOHNSON'S DFEH 1.75  227.50
COMPLAINT: CONFER RE SAME.
---------------- SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEFSmmmmec—mmero————
MK HOURS: 1.50 a $130.00 PER HOUR $195.00

FLAT FEE HOURS: $227.50

NET TOTAL HOURS: NET TOTAL FEES: $422.50 u//
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

9427 $130.00 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $130.00
PLUS:  CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $422.50
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: £130.00

A KAk Arkdki it
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: # $422,50 4

Ak Ak Ak 4x

7

#1017




STATEMENT.:

( CELIA M. RUIZ 0CT 11, 1995
RUIZ % SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR BALANCE 00.00,
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111 THANK YOU.

TELEPHONE (415) 395~9005

GAVILAN COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD
GILROY, CA 95020

FILE #1021 JOHNSONTYORT (10)
FILE #1021 JOHNSON TORT ' (10}
NO BALANCE DUE 0.00
L
STATEMENT DATE: OCT 11, 1995 FILE #1021

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT.

( CELIA M., RUIZ
: RUIZ % SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395~-9005

GAVILAN COMMMUNITY COLLEGE
S0S5 SANTA TERESA BLVOD,
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTN: DPR. GLENN MAYLE

R

FILE #1022 JOHNSON - DISCIPLINE

NO BALANCE DUE 0.00
L]
STATEMENT DATE: 0CT 11, 1995 FILE #1022
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
R

ocT 11-»

BALANCE 00.00.,
THANK YOU,

(10}

(10)

1995




STATEMENT-

FACT-FINMDING? PEVIEW OF ARTICLE 15
LAUMGUA S, T8 WITH FACT FINDING PANTL

CELIA M, RUIZ 0CT 11, 1995
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREST, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY 344300.96
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005
-
75
: ~4
GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE , /-
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. R T
GILROY, CA 95020 £/
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE
FILE #1006 UABOR RELATIONS- €10)
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $44300.96
FILE #1006 LAROR REZLATIONS ¢10)
PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
CMR 9/ 1 PREPARATION FOR NEGOTIATION; TRAVEL A 8.00 1040.00
AND MEETING WITH CSEA; NEGOTIATION?
MECTING WITH ADMINISTRATORS.(TD v e
RAS 9/ 1 ASSIST WITH THS PREPARATION OF ISSUESM9.50 1235.00
FOR FACT-FIMDING NEGOTIATION SESSION
WITH CSSA.
DGL 9/ 1 TELSCONS RE SUPVR. MEMO. N sg 42.50
CHR 9/ 2 FOLLOW UP OM FACT-FINDINGS N 1.50 195.00
PREPARATION FOR FACT FINDING.
CMR 9/ 4 PREPARATION FOR FACT~FINDING. N 2.00 260.00
CMR 9/ S PARTICIPATION IN FACT~FINDING PROCES? 13.00 1690.00
DE-BRIEFING AND PREPARATION.
MK 9/ S5 REPRESENT DISTRILT AT FACT FINDING. M 11.50 1495.00
RAS 9/ 5 ATTENDANCE AT FACT-FINDINGS TRAVEL TO 12.25 1592.50
AND FROM, N
DGL 9/ 5 PEVIEW SUPSRVISOR ISSUE; CONFERENCE N .50 42.50
RE SAMEZ,
CHR 9/ & NZGOTIATE WITH CSEA AND AMES. J2.00 260,00
MK 9/ A TELSCON WITH PRESIDENT MAYLE; REVIEW pf 475 97.50
Cf)*ORRESPONDEMCE FROM DISTRICT RE
CONTRACT PROPOSAL.: ..
CHR 9/ 7 TELECON/FAX MEGOTIATE. . & . 2.00 . ..260.00
MK 9f 7 REVIEW MEMO AYND RESEARCH RE N .75 97.50
DISCIPLINARY MATTER REGARDING
ARBALLOD.
CMR 9/ 3 TELECON/FAX NEGOTIATE FACT=-FINDING ) 3.50  455.00
PROVISION.
MK 9/ 8 BEVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OF €ONTRACT N 4.75  617.50
LAYMGUAGE 2% ARTICLE 117 DRAFT COVER
LETTER TO PRESIDZNT MAYLES TELECOMQE@P/
WITH PRESIDINT MAYLE RE PROPOSALS RE
COMTRACT; DRAFT MEMO RE CONTRACT
PROPOSALS.
DGL 9/ 3 SUPERVISOR ISSUF. - / N .50 42.50
CMR 9711 TC WITH PeA2(PAND CARRIER RE ¥ 2.00 260.00




STATEMENT:

CHR

MR

CHR

MK

CJK

CHAR

CHMR

RAS

CJK

CHR

DGL
CHMR

C MR
MK

RAS
5GL
C MR
C MR
CMR

CHMR

QAS

er11

?/11

9711

/11

g/11

9712

?/12

2712

n/12

9713

9/13
9714

9114
9L14

RI14
P7/14
9/15
/15
9715

9715

G115

RE POSSIBLE RESOLUTI
TELECON WITH DR JOYC EGARDING ms. M 2.50
CERONE AND TIMELINES AND PROCEDURES;

REVIEW DRAFT LETTER TO DR. JOYCE AND

MEMO REGARDING PROCEDURES.

TC WITH DR MAYLE RE FACT FINGING AND N .SO
OPTIONS; ARRANGE FOR BOARD MEETING

AND DISCUSSION RE ARBALLO PROCEDURES.

REVIEW STATUS OF USTE M o1.00
RECLASSIFICATION AND GENERAL MANAGER
POSITION; REVIEW PERB PRECEDENT RE
CLASSIFICATION DUTIES AND PETITION RE

CLASSIFICATION.

RESEARCH AND DRAFT DOCUMENTS RE N
VARIOUS MATYERS, INCLUDING CERONE,
CONTRACT PROPOSAL AND BUSINESS GFFICE
1SSUES.

MEMO AND LETTER RE: L. CERONE v 2.50
SRMINATION.

TRAVEL AND MTSTING WITH GOVERNING N 7.50
BOARD RE STATUS AND UPDATE: TC WITH

AMES RSGARDING OUTSTANDING ISSUES:

REVIFW PROCZSS AND PROCEDURES RE FACT
FINDING REPORT.

REVIEW ED CODE AND RULES AND v oo1.00
REGULATIONS RE PROCEDURES AND

PROCESS. D7

TELECON WITH BFEELRPHY'S OFFICE RE  A4.75

MEETING; REVICW OF FORM FACT FINDING
REPORT; PREPARATION OF FACT FINDING

REPORT; CONFERTNCE RE

RECLASSIFICATION ISSUE.

RESEARCH ISSUES RE:TERMINATION OF N 2.50
CERONE g%)

TC WITH'KMES; TC WITH ARL; REVIEW M 2.50
ISSUES OF JURISDICTION AND STATUTORY
TIMELINE; DISCUSS FACT FINDING

REPORT.,

CONFERENCE RS SUPERVISOR'S LETTER. N .50
PRAFT LITTER AND APPROACH TO W 1.00
FACT-FINDING ISSUES.

SUPCRVISOR RECLASSIFICATION ISSUE. pJ 1.00
TELTCONS BIIH DR. MAYLE RE CONTRACT No.2s
[SSUFS. R
PRIPAPATION OF FACT FINDING REPORT. A 5.25
MORK ON LETTER RE SUPERVISOR ISSUE., M 4.25
YEVISW FACTFINDING ISSUESs TC T0 N 2.00
CARRIER AND PEVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE.
REVIEW OF ARBALLO-AND CERONE N .75
DISCIPLINARY MATTERS AND PQOCEDURES.

LETTER TO AMES RE CONCLUDIMG HEARING N .50
ON TIMZ.

CSEA LETTER TO MEGOTIATE; RESPOND TO N .50
MEGOTIATION RF BUSINESS MANAGER AND

USTF MATTER.

PREPARATION OF COPRESPONDENCE TO €. J 2.25
AMIS RS PROGRESSION AND TIMING OF

FACT FINDINGS COMFERENCE AND ANALYSIS

OF ®CSCLASSIFICATION I[SSUF; REVIFW OF
PTELESITFICATION IS3UC

92.50

(2503-10~1006 0CcT 11, 1995 PAGE 2 ).

325.00

65.00

130.00

1235.00

212.50

975.00

130.00

617.50

212.50

325.00

42.50
150.00

130.00
32.50

632.50
361,25
260.00
?7.50
65. 00

65.00

292.50




DIAIEMENT

bGL
CMR
C MR

CHR

CMR
CHMR

RAS

CHR
CMR
RAS
CHR
RAS
CMR

MK

RAS
CJK

CMP

CMR

RAS

CJXK

CMR

RAS

2503-10-1006

9715
9718
9718

9/15

/19

9719

9719

9119

GI20
/21
9/21

9722
9725

R/25

2425
/25

R126

9726

9126

25

2127

127

REVIEW LETTER; REVIEW CASES. N 2.50
FACT FINDING ANALYSIS. C? 3.50
TELECON WITHNPEARL; TELECON WITH AMES A 1.00
RE FACT-FINDING.

CONFERENCE RE STATUS OF NEGOTIATIONS )| .75
AND FURTHER INFORMATION REQUESTED BY

CSzA; TELECON WITH L.. CARRIER RE

SAME . q?.//

CONFERENCES WITH CARKRIER RE FINANCIAL N2.00
INFORMATION; CONFERENCE WITH MAYLE:(L—
CONFERENCE WITH FACTFINDER. |

TC WITH MAYLE RE %%;§o§;/n~o STRATEGY ¥ ,25
WITH FACT FINDER. (-

TC WITH FACTFINDER CHAIR RE oPeNIng N .50
HEAR ING. 3

TELECON WITH LS:%ERRIER rRe FinNanciaL N 2.25
INFORMATION; REVIEW OF SAME:

PREPARATION OF CORRESPONDENCE TO C.

AMES RE SAMS.

NEGOTIATE FINAL FACTS AND ISSUES. N 2.00
NEGOTIATE AND PREPARE, N300
COMFERENCES RE RECLASSIFICATION ISSUES A 2.25
RESEARCH RE BECLASSIFICATION ISSUES.
TELECOM WITHCAEARL/FACT FINOER AND o 1.50
FINAL FACT=FINDING.

CONFERENCE RE EACT FINDING REPORT; N .75
TLECON WITH C{/AMES RE SAME.

PEVIEW, DRAFT AND REVISE FACT FINDINGA 1.50

RIPORT.
REIVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DISTRIET N 2.25
RE T. ARBALLO, TELECON WITH DR.LID v
MAYLE; TELECON WITH L. ORTEGA; (S
CONFERENCE RE STBATEGY; TELECON' WITH

Jo HANSELL. f5

PREPARATION UF FACT FINDING REPORT; AN 5.50
CONFEREMCES RE SAME.

LEGAL RESEARCH RF: RECLASSIFICATION & 1.25
CF ©F TO SUPSRVISOR.

PREPAPE FINAL FACT FINDING REPORT; » 1.00
TSLECON WITH MAYLE RE FEEDBACK AND
CN]RECTION. v

PREPARE FOR CNLLECTIVE BARGAINING r/ .50
MEZTING. :

CONFEREMNCE: RS PROCEDURAL “I1SSUES RE pf 3,25
YUSTE POSITION AND BUSINESS OFFICE
POSITION; PREPARATION OF

CORREIPONDENCE Y0 B. MURPHY RE SAME:
TELECOY WITH C MES RE EXECUTION OF

FACT FIMDING RERQRT BY S./ PEARL:

TELECON WITH S CARLYLS OFFICE RE

SAMS; TeLzcon WITH S.C20LIvema RE

YUSTF POSITION AND ATTENDANCE AT
NEGOTIATION WITH CSEA.

LEGAL PESEARCH RE: RECLASSIFICATION N 3.25
OF SF TQ SUPERVISOR.

PREPARE COLLECTIVE BARGAINING ISSUES; p 2.00
DPAFT LETTER TO MURHPY: REVIEW USTE

AMD RUSINESS MANAGER POSITION. A
RESTARCH LEGAL EFFECT OF DERDGATORY .25
STATEMINTS MADE IN COMTEXT OF LABOR

0CT 11, 1995 PAGE

- 260.00

3

212.50
455.00
130.00

97.50

260.00

32.50
65.00

292.50

390n.00
292.50

195.00
?7.50
195.00

292.50

715.00
106.25

130.00

65.00

422.50

276.25

260.00

52.50

J




RAS 9

CMR 9

CMR @

MK 9

RAS 9

wMeg 9

NFT T

-y ———

COSTS

ar 7
8724
8127
3729
8729
8729
8129
8729
8730
38/30.
3731
¢/ 1
g7 1
er 5
9/ 8
27112
112
2125
9730
/30
9730
2730

PAYMEN

L2727

(2503~10-1006

0CT 11,1995 PAGE

NEGOTIATIONS.

/27 PREPARATION OF CORRESPONDENCE TO B. N 2.00
MURPHY PE YUSTE POSITION AND BUSINESS
DFEICE POSITION; DISCUSSION RE
PROCEDURAL ISSUES PERTINEMT TO ABOVE
POSITIONS; TELECON RE SAME.

/23 TRAVEL TO GAVILAN; PREPARATION AND N
PRESENTATION OF VARIOUS ISSUES:
DISCUSSTON RS FACT FINDING.

/29 FINAL FACT FINDING REPORTZ TELECON N 2.00
WITH PANEL.

/29 REVIEW PROPOSED CSEA CHANGES TO FACT N .25
FINOING REPORT.

/29 TELECON RE STATUS OF FACT FINDING N
R: PORT; RSVIEW CBA LANGUAGE AND
DETERMINE STATUS OF PROPOSALS RE
LONGETIVITY ISSUE.

/29 ORAFT LTR RE LSAVE POLICIES; REVIEW W 1.25
CODE; CONFERENCE RE SAME.

7.25

50

---------- SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES==w=———=me

$130.00 PER HOUR 310757.50
$130.00 PER HOUR $32.50
$130.00 PER HOUR $3900.00
$130.00 PER HOUR $6662.50

CHR HOURS: 82.75
PSC HOURS: Ced5
M¥X HOURS: ~ 30.00
RAS HOURS: 51.25

e e

WM HOURS: 1.25 $130.00 PER HOUR $162.50
DGL HOURS: 8.75 $85.00 PER HOUR 3743.75
€JK HOURS: 9.5 $85.00 PER HOUR $3807.50

QT A4L—HOURS 183.75

—--&t::’:'-._&b‘———— R e e e S e S S o e S ——

ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

HORKING MEAL.
TRAVEL MEAL,
WORKING LUNCH,
MILEAGE,

HOTEL.

MEALS.

TRAVEL MFEAL.
TRAVEL MEAL.
mEAL,

TRAVEL MEAL.
LEXIS RESEARCH,
MILEAGE.

TRAVEL. :
MILzAGE,

FEDZIRAL FXPRESS.
MILEAGE,

TRAVIL MTAL,
DOCUMENT PRZPARATION/WORD PRPOQESSOR.
PHOTOCOPI=S.
FACSIMILIES,
TELEPHONE TOLL CHARGES.

POSTAGE. ‘ 6//f’~——*“““
' rﬂ l,.{?‘STS: %1
T ACTIVEITY STHCE THF LAST STATEMENT:

Y827 ReCEIVED OM ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.

oY

157°1537.,22 P

NET TOTAL FEES: $23066.250

\\MH_H_meFHf,H,J*““”

4j

260.00

942.50

260.00
32.50

65.00

—— -

- -

COSTS

41.66
44,22
32.30
54.00
63.36
20.00
37.24
39.56
5.00
14,89
765.00
55450
546.00
55.50
32.50
27.90
12,49
20.00
186.80
109.00
54,84

- a_m—m
728.46 WV

/




2503-10-1006 ocT 11,1995 PAGE 5 )
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BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $78663.47
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $24794.71
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $59157.22

Kook vk ok ok ok kR

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: * $44300.96./
‘ *h Ak kok Kk kk ek

STATEMENT DATE: 0CT 11, 1995 FILE #1006

RUIZ % SCHAPIRD




STATEMENIT

RUIZ & SCHAPLIRO

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE gz
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. Lo
GILROY, CA- 95020 PR
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE -g ’ 3f}h
(RN
P
N
FILE #1000 SUMMARY FILE (10)

PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF:

FILE #1015 ARBALLO (1M
CURRENT HOURS: 0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 8806.35 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
pLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:
PLUS CUR COSTS: 0.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:
FILE #1019 CONSTRUCTION (10)
CURRENT HOURS: 1.25
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 0.00 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PL IS LATE CHARGES: D.00 PLUS CUR FEES:
PLUS CUR COSTS: 0.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:
FILE #1014 CSEA {10}
CURRENT HOURS:  113.25
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 2314627.86 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS "LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:
PLUS CUR CO3TS: 761.75 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:
»
FILE #1013 DIAL | , (10)
CURRENT HOURS: 0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE:  3505.53 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS .. LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:
PLUS CUR COSTS: 15.52 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:
FILE #1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE (10)
CURRENT HOURS: 5.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE:  6521.40 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLIIS CUR FEES:
PLUS CUR €£DOSTS: 26 .46 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:
FILE #1018 HALEY (10)
CURRENT HOURS: 0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 325.00 MINUS CUR PAYMEMNTS:
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:
PLUS CUR CO'STS: G.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

FILE #1000 SUMMARY FILE (10)

" CELIA M. RUIZ SEPT 14, 1995

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY 3$333124.66

&
$333124. 68

8806.35
0.00
0.00v"

D.or
162.50
162'50v/

6518.04
12337, 50
238209.07,

3449.23
0.0n -
71.82.

669.93
458.75
6586.6%/

325.00
0.00
0.00v

’
Ve

it




- STATEMENT.

(2503~10~1000 SEPT 14, 1995 PAGE 2
FILE ¥1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE (1o

CURRENT HOURS: 16.00

PREVIOUS BALANCE: ?999,66 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 913. 54

PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:  2080.00

PLUS CUR COSTS: 135.10 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 9301.12/
FILE #1017 JOHNSON'S DFEH COMPLAINT (10)

CURRENT HOURS: 1.00

PREVIOUS BALANCE: 87.86 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 87.86

PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: 130. 00

PLUS CUR COSTS: 0.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 130.00
FILE #1012 KARCICH (10)

CURRENT HOURS: 0.00

PREVIOUS BALANCE: 1531.47 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:  1531.47

PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: 0.00

PLUS CUR COSTS: 0.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 0.00,
FILE #1006 LABOR RELATIONS (10)

CURRENT HOURS:  457.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 42204.73 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 2260848
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: 56608. 75
PLUS CUR COSTS: 2548.47 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 78663.47V

TOTAL OF PREVIOUS STATEMENT BALANCES: 302609.386

MINUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT PAYMENTS: 45000.00,///
UNPAID FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENTS: 257609.867
PLUS:  TOTAL OF CURRENT LATE CHARGES: 110400
PLUS:  TOTAL OF CURRENT FEES: 71777.50
PLUS:  TOTAL OF CURRENT COSTS: __3737.30
75514 76

EQUALS: TOTAL BALANCE DUE THIS STATEMENT: 333124,66

3

STATEMENT DATE: SEPT 14, 1995 FILE #1000

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




DRI T

*{ CELIA M. RUILZ SEPT 14, 1995 h

RUIZ & SCHAPIRD
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR BALANCE 00.00,
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111 THANK YOU,

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

FILE #1015 ARBALLO ao

FILE #1015 ARBALLO o (10)
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

8727 3$8806.35 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.

Ak do b ) . S Sk W S S (G e M A W S N N S GE S WS G WD W S Y MR fm e W B W iy e S S MR Ry W W e o

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $8806.35
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: £8806.35
NO BALANCE DUE 0.00

L

STATEMENT DATFE: SEPT 14, 1995 FILc #1015

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT

RULZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005
GAVILAN COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020 :
ATTN: DR. MAYLE _ \) 1
'r\ O |
FILE #1019 CONSTRUCTION (10)
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OFf:
FILE #1019 GONSTRUCTION (10)
PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS
JLS B/29 REVIEW DOCUMENTATION FOR WRIGHT. .25
JLS 8/30 CONF WITH WILLIAM WRIGHT RE .25
CONSTRUCTION ISSUE;
JLS 8/31 CONF WITH W. WRIGHT RE CONSTRUCTION .75
ISSUES; LEAVE MESSAGE FOR J. HANSELL
RE SAME; REVIEW CORRESPONDANCE FROM
EXPERT,
---------------- SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEF§m-cmmum—n
JLS HOURS:  1.25 @ $13D.00 PER HOUR $162.50
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:
PLUS:  CHARGES LISTED ABOVE:
» ’ * ok kk A
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: +
hhhkA A
2071 [N IS = LR FL [N 5 R LA -

1)

STATEMENT DATE: SEPT 14, 1995 FILE #1019

RUIZ & SCHAPIROD

( CELIA M. RUIZ SEPT 14,1995 N

$162.50

3162.50

FEES

32.50
32.50

97.50

T —— - —

0.00
$162.50

hhE Ak A

$162.50V

hhk kkAdh

o



CELIA

D IALLMCING

M. RUIZ ' SEPT 14, 1995

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $238209.07

SAN FRANCISCO, €A 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395~9005

GAVILAN JOINT CONMUNITY COLLEGE

5055 SANTA TERESA BLYD. T
GILROY, CA 95020 A s
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE Y S

PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF:

FILE #1014 CSEA (1

FILE #1014 SUSEA (10)

PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS

WMQ 8/ 1 CONF RE CHARGING PARTY'S FILING; P .25
OPPOSING BRIEFS IN THE 1739 MATTER,

ALC 8/ 1 REVIEW TRANSCRIPTS; EDIT OUTLINE 7 10.75
BRIEDLF

ALC B8/ 2 REVIEW TRANSCRIPTS; EDIT QUTLINE P 9.50
BRIED.

CMR 8/ 3 PREPARE FINAL DISMISSAL. P .50

MK 8/ 3 CONFERENCE RE BRIEF. D 250

WMQ 8/ 3 CONF. RE 1739741 OUTLINE AND » 50
RESPONSIVE PLEADING.

CMR. 8/ 9 ORGANIZE BRIFEF, P .25

MK 8/11 REVIEW TRANSCRIPT EXCERPTS: P 4,75
CONFERENCE RE RESPONSE; REVIEW
SETTLEMENT ISSUES FROM #1759;

. CONFERENCE RE RESPONSE.

MK o 8/14 CONFERENCES RE HEARING 7 2,25
PREPARATION/REVIEW OPPOSITION BRIKF:
CONFERENCE RE LEGAL RESEARCH.

WMQ  8/14 REVIEW CSFA FACTUAL AND LEGAL P 3,75

. ARGUMENTS; RSCH RE BRIEF.

DGL  8/14 REVIEW CASES/STATUTES; CONF RE SAME. © 1.75

HK B/15. REVIEN-OPROSITION BRIEF oomrmmirvn wvrtr P 2030

DGL &/15 REVIEW CASES AND STATUTES, QRGANIZE. P .25

MK 8/16 PEVIEN CORRESPONDENCE FROM OPPOSING 7 5.25
COUNSFL RE SETTLEMENT; TELECON WITH

J. Hansel(Pae SETTLEMENTS CONFERENCES
RE LEGAL RESEARCH, FACTUAL RECORD AND
PREPARATION OF OPPOSITION OSRIEE;
REVIEW BRIZF: TELECON WITH L.
CARRIER; TELECON WITH OR. MAYLE: (D
TELECON WETH L, CARRIER. (9V

DGL B/16 CONFERENCE RE CASE; ORGANIZE CASES; 7 6.26
CRDER CASES FROM PERA; READ BRIEE.

MK 8/17 REVIEY OPPOSITION BRIEF;CONFERENCES 7 5.00
RE LEGAL RESEARCH.

DGL 8/17 READ BRILF AND RESEARCH; CONFERENCE P $.2%

RE SAME,

$238209.07

e

FEFS
32.50
1397.50
1235.00
65.00
65.00
65.00

32.50
617.50

292.50

487.50
148,75
260.00

21.25
682,50

531.2%
650.00

531.25

an



“(2503-10-1014 SEPT 14s 1995 . PAGE 2 )
| P

CMR 8/18 REVIEW BRIEF. 7 1.00 130.09

0GL 8/18 ORGANIZE CASES; PICK UP PERB CASES; 7 6.50 552.50
CONFERENCE RE ANALYSIS.

DGL 8/20 SUMMARIZE CASES FOR BRIFF. T 6.75 573.75

MK 8721 DRAFT AND REVISE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT PS$.50 T715.00
IN #1759; CONFERENCES RE BRIEF IN
H1739/612 TELEPHONE CALLS TO OPPOSING
COUNSEL

WHMQ B8/21 TELECON JUDGE LINK RE DISMISSALS .1 65.00
CONFERENCE RE IMPLICATIONS FOR ‘
1739741 STRATEGY.

DGL  B8/21 CONFERENCE RE CASE SUMMARILES: T 6.50 552.50
RESEARCH.

MK  8/22 REVISE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT IN #1759 75.25 682.50
TELECONS WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL; ORAFT
LETTER TO PERB JUDGE; LEGAL RESEARCH
RE BRIEF,

DGL 8722 LEGAL RESEARCH RE ANALYSIS OF 73,25 276425

- MANDATORY/NO MANDATORY 1SSUE.

MK 8/23 REVIEW LEGAL RESEARCH, CONFERENCE RE 7 2.75 357.50
SUPPLEMENTAL RESEARCH.

DGL 8/23 LEGAL RESEARCH; CONFERENCE RE CASES 7 4.00 340,00
AND ANALYSIS.

DGL.  8/24 LEGAL RESEARCH RE: MANDATORY /NON 7. TS  63.75
MANDATORY ISSUE.

PGL 8728 ORGANIZE/WMRITE MEMD, 7 5.00 425,00

DGL 8/29 LEGAL RESEARCH RE: FACTORS IN 7 .50 42.50
LAY-0FFS FOR BRIEF.

DGL 8/31 OUTLINING ISSUES. 7 5,25 446,25
---------------- SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEFS=-——mweomureane—-
CMR HOURS: 1.75 2 $130.00 PER HOUR $227.50
- MK HOURS: 33.25 3 3130.00 PER HOUR  3$4322.50
WMQ HOURS: 5.00 @ $130.00 PER KOUR $650.00

$130.00 PER HOUP $2632.50

ALC HOURS: 20.25 @
d 385.00 PER HOUR $4505.00

DGL
NET TOTAL

Ay e S P AR i e D R R S e R B A W e e TR W e W S A G AT e D e W W W A S

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

8/14 PHOTOCOPIES.,

8/14 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCFSSDQ.
8718 PHOTOCOPIES.

8/28 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR.
8/31 PHOTOCOPIES.

8731 POSTAGE.

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

8731 36233.62 PAYMEMT RECEIVED QN ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.

8/31 $284.642 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUMT, THANK YOU.
{_’f_
5/&07’

NET TOTAL FEES: $12337.50.C7)

8/31 FACSIMILE, T
cosrs@.

COS5T3S

24,00
96.00
3g.0n
70.00
464,20
0.55




STAFTEMENT-
ﬁ503—10-1014 SEPT 14, 1995

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: _
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

O AL D O A G W S N S dnb ey i e T S A e o oy

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: # $238209.07

STATEHENT DATE: SEPT T4, 1995 FILE #1014

PAGE 3 )

X

$231627.86

$13099.25
$£6518.04V

LS LR E R &E PRI

LR LR 2L Y ER"




STATEMENT ™

( CELIA M, RUIZ SEPT 14+ 1995
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $71.82
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111 o
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005 A

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

FILE #1013 wIAZ (10

PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: £71.82
FILE #1013 DIAZ : (1 0)
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
8/13 TELEPHONE TOLL CHARGES. 7 9,72
8/31 PHOTOCOPIES. P 5.80 | .
COSTS: 715,52 3

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

87129 $3449.23 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT., THANK YOU.

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $3505.53

PLYS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: S15.52V/

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $3449,23
hk A hkk ok ok ok k

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: + $71.82/
" . AAhhkhhkdkhhh ki

e e P s e @ T

3

STATEMENT DATE: SEPT 14, 1995 FILE #1013

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




1"

(~ CELIA n. RUIZ S SEPT 14, 1995 )

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO :
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR . PLEASE PAY --36586.68

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

¢

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. a
GILROY, CA 95020 >
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE {
FILE #1001 GAVILAN GENERAL. LEGAL ADVIGE o
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $6586.68
FILE #1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE (10)
PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
KMW 8/ 9 RESEARCH ON FEE ISSUE. 4,25  361.25 |.
PSC 8/30 ANALYZE HEALTH BENEFITS ISSUE. .75 97.50 -
—————— - ——————— SUMMARY OF HOURS,» RATES & FEES—-~=mm=m=n= -————
PSC HOURS: 0.75 3 $130.00 PER HOUR $97.50
KMW HOURS: 4 3 3$85.00 PER HOUR $361.25

NET TOTAL HOURS: 5.00 /  NET TOTAL FEES: $458.75.

— T e va S S e B M R W G TR W A T e W Aab fep WD G AR S D e S e G Tk G S G PR G B dep m TER R R S R WY WE S S da v

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
8/ 1 LEGAL RESEARCH, - 146.00
8/31 PHOTOCOPIES. : ‘ 111.80
8731 POSTAGE, : - 2.66
8/31 FACSIMILE., ; 16.00=]

. _ : COSTS: (::ifif:ii:;

FPAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

8/29 . $669.93 PAYMENT RECEIVED OM ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $6521.40
PLUS:  CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $735.21
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $669.93

kb okt hdkhhk ki

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: « $6536.68
ERARhhkhh b Rk

&

STATEMENT DATE: SEPT 14, 1995 FILE #1001

RUIZ & SCHAPIRD )




SIATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ
RULZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT CCb

5055 SANTA TERESA BOULEVARD
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTN: DR. MAYLE

FILE #1018 HALEY

FILE #1018 HALEY

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

*

STATEMENT DATE: 1995

SEPT 14,

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

8/29 $325.00 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOou,
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT ¢ $325.00
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $325.00

NO BALANCE pUE 0.00
.
BT A FILY 5rioC

FILE #1018

SEPT 14, 1995 )

BALANCE DO.0O,
THANK You.

(10)

ao




-

STATEMENT-

[ CELIA M. RUIZ SEPT 14, 1995

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $9301.12

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELE PHONE (§15) 395~9005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD
=

FILE #1016 JOHNSON®S"WRIT-OF :KANDATE . (10)

PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $9301,12

FILE #1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE €10)

PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES

MK 8/ 1 DRAFT AND REVISE REPLY BRIEF. 8425 1072.50

MK 3/ 3 REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT REPLY 1.50 195.00

| MEMORANDUM AND PREPARE FINAL FOR
FILING.

MK 8/ 8 ATTEND HEARING RE DEMURRER. 6.00  780.00
|CHR 8/ 9 REVIEW FINAL DISPOSITION OF CASE. .25 32.50

e — e — SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES B FEEG=mmmrmmacons ————

CHR HOURS:  0.25 @ 3130.00 PER HOUR $32.50

URS: 15.75 3 3130.00 PER HOUR  $2047.50
TOTAL HOURS: 16.0 NET TOTAL FEES: $2080.00.

S T e vy L - TN —— — TR R A LS b o G S S vk e e W e e o e b e e B S S >

COSTS ADVANCED SIN THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
[ ]
87/ 3 FAX & FILE SERVICE. 27.50
8/ 7 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSING. 30.00
8/ 8 PARKING. 3.00
8/ 8. MILEAGE. 37.20
8714 FAX FILE. . 20,00
8/31 PHOTOCOPIES, Ra 40

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: ok
8729 $913.64 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK You,
BALAMCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: 37999, 66
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: 32215.10
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $913.64

LA RS EER N EYEES

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: = $9301.12
KAk hk Rk hk ok x4

~

8/31 FACSIMILE. ' 9.
| COSTS: 31359

)



CELIA M. RUIZ T SEPT 14, 1995

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREETY-, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $130.00

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD

=

FILE #1017 JOMNSONTS DFEN COMPLAINT (10)
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $130.00
FILE #1017 JOHNSON®S DFEY COMPLAINT {(10)
PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
MK 8/ 7 PRSPARATION FOR 878 HEARING ON 1.00 130.00

DEMURRER.

,HOURS» RATES & FEE§=—mmmmercomcoman
$130.00 PER HOUR  $130.00

bl el A S — ---c-——---——------m———-u-—-—-—-’---———w

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

8/29 $87.86 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: 387.86
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $130.00
MINUS:. PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $387.86

’ Ahhkhthdhhi AR

hhAAkkhkhk ki ik

#

STATEMENT DATE:  SEPT 14., 1995 FILE #1017

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: 5130.00&//




STATEMENT-

8729

MINUS:

CELIA M, RUIZ

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005§

GAVILAN UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT
5055 SANTA THERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: GLENN MAYLE

FILE #1012 KARCICH

FILE #1012 KARCICH

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

$1531.47 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUN

R BEP 'Y

¥

STATEMENT DATE: SEPT 14, 1995 F

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

SEPT 14, 1995 )

BALANCE 00.00,
THANK YoU.

0

(10

Tr THANK YOU.

SALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $1531.47
PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $1531.47/
NO BALANCE DUE 0.00

T oMoy l,dEd AR

ILE Ri1012




STATEMENT. -~

( CELIA M. RUIZ SEPT 14, 1995
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $78663.47
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395~9005 ;(

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

A
£
2

FILE #1006 LABOR RELATIONS (10) o
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $378663.47
FILE #1006 -LABOR RELATIONS - (10)
PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURSS FEES
CMR 87 1 FACT FINDING PREPARATION. M 3,00 390.00

CMR 8/ 2 REVIEWED RECLASSIFICATION DOCUMENTS o .75  97.50
AND PROCEDURES.

RAS 8/ 2 REVIEW OF FINANCIAL INFORMATION AND 5 4.25  552.50
TESTIMONY; CONF RE SAME; RESEARCH RE
RECLASSIFICATION OF POSITION OUTSIDE
BARGAINING UNIT.

CMR 8/ 3 PREPARF OUTLINE FOR FACT~FINDING. A 3.50  455.00

WK 8/ 3 TELECONS RE DISTRICT MEETING ToO N .25 32.50Q
PREPARE FOR FACT=FINDING. p

RAS 8/ 3 TELECON WITH S. OLIVERA RECH
CLASSIFICATION OF POSITION OUTSIDE
BAPGAINING UNIT; TELECON WITH E.
JOHNSON RE DISTRICT PRACTICE Re

. RECLASSIFICATION OF POSITION OUTSIDE
, BARGAINING UNIT; KEVIEW OF UNFAILP
PRACTICES HEARING TRANSCRIPTS AND
EXHIBITS RE FINANCIAL ISSUES AND PREP
OF SUMMARY: CONFERENCE RE FACT
. EIND ING. '

CMR 8/ 4 PREPARE FACT ‘PINDING-BINDER “OUTLINE-AL- 2,08 390.00

AND AMALYSISz=-: vsminrn..

(%}

5.75 747.50

nK 8/ & MEETING RE FACT-FINDING, REVIEW & 1.00 130.00
CORRRESPONDENCE; CONFERENCE RE
PREPARATION,

RAS 8/ 4 CONFEREMCE RS FINANCIAL ISSUES AND N 5.75 747 .50
FACT FINDING; REVIEW TRANSCRIPT
UNFAIR PRACYTICES HEARING; PREP OF
FINANCIAL ANALYSIS OUTLINE; ANALYSIS

FINANCIAL INFO FOR FACT FINDIHNG.
(MR 8/ TRAVEL AND PREPARATION FOR FACT égz{N 8.00 1040,00
FINDINGs MEETING WITH ADMINISTRAT

RE FACT ffﬁﬁrﬁﬁf“gz;%/ _@1;?/
MK B7 T NMEETINGS WITH OR. E AND L. CA aN7.50 975.00

" FACT-FINDING PREPARMERGN. © (5T
RAS 8/ 7 MEETING WITH G. MAYLE . cARBEFe /7075 1007, 50
/7

il 8 DRAFT LITTEQ TO B, MURPHY RE LEAVF t.25 162.50




MK

RAS

CHMR

MK

WE
RAS

RAS

CMR

MK

- |RAS

RAS

CMR
RAS

435

CHMR

MK

8715

8/15

8/16
8/16

8117
8/17

8/17

8718
8/13
8/18
8/19

3721
8721

8721
322

8§/2¢e

STATEMENT
ﬁ503~1o-1006 SEPT 14, 1995 PAGE

CHANCELLOR'S OFFICEs, SCHOOL SERVICES
OF CALIFORNIA, INC., CALIFORIA POST
SECONDARY EDUCATION, ACCCA, AND
COMMUNITY COLLEGES TO OBTAIN
COMPARATIVE DATA. }/
couran&g;p RE FACT-FINDING;TELEPHONE 1.25
CALL T HN HANSELL? CONFERENCE RE
DOCUMENTS, REVIEW REVISED QUTLINE FOR
FACT~FINDING.

PREPARATION FOR FACT FINDING: »/ 7.00
INCLUDING TELECONS WITH COMMUNITY
COLLEGE AND ORGANIZATIONS TO OBTAIN
COMPARATIVE DATA AND PREPARATION OF
FINANCIAL PRESENTATION. N,

PREPARE VARIOUS FACTUAL ISSUES AND .75
DOCUMENTS.

REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OF ¥ 2.00
FACT-FINDING PRESENTATION; TELECON

WITH L.CARRIER RE FACT-FINDING. J
PREPARE FACT FINDING. 1.00

PREPARATION FOR FACT FINDING; TELFCONK/S 00
WITH CHANCELLOR'S OFFICE TO TO OBTAILN
COMPARATIVE FIMANCITAL DATA; ANALYSIS

OF FINANCIAL ISSUES; AND PREPARATION

OF FINANCIAL PRESENTATION. J
PREPARATION FOR FACT FINDING; TELECON 5.50
WITH CHANCELLOR'S OFFICE AND

COMMUNITY COLLEGES TO OBTAIN

COMPARATIVE DATA; ANALYSIS OF

FINANCIAL ISSUES, DISCUSSION WITH L.Cj)

CARRIER. J
LETTER TO CSEA; REVIEW UNFAIR WITH 4.50
KAPLAN AND ASSISTED HER WITH STRATEGY

WITH BRIEF AND SETTLEMENT; PREPARE

FACT FINDING PROCESS: J
LEGAL PESEARCH; CONFERENCES RE LEGAL N 7.25
RESEARCH.

PREPARATION FOR FACT FINDING; TELECONN 6.25
WITH CHANCELLOR'S OFFICE AND

COMMUNITY COLLEGES TO OBTAIN

COMPARATIVE DATA; PREPARATION OF

FINANCIAL PRESENTATION; CONFERENCE Re
RECLASSIFICATION OF JPA POSITION.
PREPARATION FOR FACT FINDING, - p/ 7.25
INCLUDING ANALYSIS OF FINANCIAL
ISSUES AND PREPARATION OF "

PRESEMTATION.
PREPARE FOR FACT FINDING. N 300
PREPARATION FOR FACT FINDING, N 6.00

INCLUDING REVIEW OF COMPARATIVE DATA;
PREPARATION OF PRESETATION; TELECON

WITH L. CARRIER.

CONFERENCE RE FACT FINDING HEARING: N 1,25
REVIEW COLLECTIVE BARGAINING

AGREEMENTS FROM OTHMER DISTRICTS.

PREPARE FOR FACT FINDING AND HFETIVGIJ 2.50
WITH GAVILAN PDMINISTRATORS rf

OUTSTANOING ISSUES AND STRATEGY. ,
TELECON RE FACT-FINDINGS REVISE N  2.50
PRESENTATION,

3

LA

162,50

?10.00

97.50

260.00

130.00
650.00

715.00

585.00

942450

812.50

42,50

390.00
7860, 00

106.25

325.00

325.00




RAS

454

CMR

MK

RAS

RAS

JsJ

DGL

C MR

MK

454

DGL

C MR
MK

RAS

N

hGL

{Mr
RAS

B/22

8/22

8723

8/23

8/23

87273
8723

8723
8/24

8724
Blf24

8724

8725
8725

3725

B/25

8125

8/26
8726

STATEMENT:
(2503~-10-1006 SEPT 14, 1995 PAGE

PREPARATION FOR FACT FINDING AND v 7.00
PRESENTATION; TELECON RE SWITCHING OF
FLOOK/SCATTINI POSITIONS AND
PREPARATION OF CORRESPONDENCE RE _
SAME,

COMPLETE ANALYSIS OF SELECTIVE v
PROVISIONS OF THE COLLECYIVE
BARGAINING AGREEMENTS TAKEN FROM
OTHER COMMUNITY COLLEGES.

TC WITH FACT FINDER AMES, TC wITH N
CSEAZ REVIEW SUPERVISORIAL [SSUES
PREPARE FACT-FINDING REPORT,

REVIEW COMMENTS RE DRAFT OF N 5.00
FACT-FINDING PRESENTATION;, REVISE
PRESENTATION; CONFERENCES RE

PRESENTATION.

PREPARATION FOR FACT FINDING: REVIEW N 6.50
OF COMPARATIVE DATA; PREPARATION OF
PRESENTATION? TELECON TD OBTAIN

COMPARATIVE DATA. N
PREPARATION FOR FACT FINDING; _MEET 11.75
WITH L. CARRIER RE FINANCIAL £/
PRESENTATION.

CONTINUE COMPARISON OF COLLECTIVE N 1.00
BARGAINING AGREEMENTS AMONG OTHER

COMMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICTS.

LEGAL RESEARCH SUPERVISOR ISSUE; ﬁj 3.50

CONFERENCE RE SAME,
FDyDING PREPA%?%j%N MEETING ALL V ?.50

DA RY MAYLE 8 L RRIER; MEETING
WITH CSEA. N,
MEETING WITH DR. MAYLE IN PREPARATIONMN 9.50
FOR FACT-FINDING.

FINALIZE COMPARISON OF COMMUNITY Noo.25
COLLEGE DISTRICTS® COLLECTIVE

BARGAINING PROVISIONS.

LEGAL RESEARCH; MEMO RE SUPERVISOR A 8.75
STATUS.

FACT~FINDING PREPARATION. N 5,00
PREPARATION FOR FACT-FINDING: REVISEN 6.00
WRITTEN PRESENTAT[ON, TpﬁgPHowij
CONFERENCES WIT Puave

HANSELL AND DR 'Jorcc CONFERENCES RE
STRATTEGY; DRAFT HISTORY Qe e e
NEGOTIATIONSw - ~: R TS
PREPATATION FOR FACT FINDING s N 4.25
ANALYSIS OF COMPARATIVE DATA;

CONFERENCE AND PREPARATON OF

PRESENTATION.

CALLS TO COMMUNITY COLLEGE BISTRICTS A/ 5.50
RE COLLECTIVE BARGAINING AGREEMENTSS

PEVIEW ADDITIONAL COLLECTIVE

BARGAINING AGREEMENTS; INCORPORATE

RELCVANT PROVISIONS INTO CHART.

WRITE AND REVISE MEMO RE SUPERVISOR N 8.50
POSITION.

PREPARE FACT=FINDING. M o200

PREPARATION FOR FACT FIMDINGS N 11.75

PREPARATION OF PRESENTATION AND ALL
CXHIBITS.,

2 )
_/\<

910.00

340.00

455.00

650.00
845.00

1527.50
85.00

297.50

1235.00

1235.00
21.25

743,75

1040,00
780,00

552,50

467.50

722.50

260.00
1527.50




STATEMENT.

2503-10~1006 SEPT 14, 1995 PAGE 5 )
JS4 8/26 FINALIZE COMPARISON OF COLLECTIVE N 1.00 85.00
BARGAINING AGREEMENT PROVISIONS
TABLE.
CMR 8/27 PREPARE FACT FINDING. H 6.00 780.00
MK 8/27 REVIEW AND REVISE FACT~FINDING Jo2.25  292.50
PRESENTATION; DRAFT ADDITIONAL
MATERIAL FOR PRESENTATION.
RAS 8/27 PREPARATION FOR FACT FINDING: N 10.25 1332.50
PREPARATION OF PRESENTATION AND ALL
EXHIBITS.
CHR  8/28 FACT~FINDING PREPARATION. v .00 1040.00
MK~ 8/28 PREPARE FACT FINDING PRESENTATION: N 7.50  975.00
REVIEW PRESENTATION AND PREPARE FOR _
ORAL PRESENTATION,
RAS 8/28 PREPARATION FOR FACT FINDING: No11.7s 1527050
PREPARATION OF PRESENTATION AND ALL
EXHIBITS.
WHQ 8/28 PREPARE STATISTICAL EXHIBITS FOR FACTN 1.25  162.50
CFINDING RE BUDGET DATA. '
JSJ  B/28 PREPARATION FOR FACT FINDING. N 450 382.50
DGL 8/28 UPDATE SUPERVISOR MEMO; RESEARCH RE  2.75  233.75
MEMO .
DGL  8/28 PREPARATION FOR FACT FINDING. M o1.25 106025
CMR  8/29 FACT FINDING. v 12,00 1560.00
MK 8/29 REPRESENT DISTRICT AT A 11.00 1430.00
FACT=FINDING;PREPARATION FOR 8730 '
FACT FINDING SESSION.
RAS 8/29 TRAVEL TO AND ATTENDANCE AT FACT p( 12.00 1560.00
FINDING; PREPARATION FOR SECOND
SESSION OF FACT FINDING. J
IHMQ  8/29 TELECONS F/DA COMM. COLLEGE RE 1.50  195.00
BUDGETED AND ACTUAL RESERVES: COLLATE
DATA PREPARE ORAFT EXHIBIT FOR
FACTFINDINGS JSJ RE COMPARATIVE DATA.
JSJ 8729 PREPARATION FOR FACTFINDING. [ 2 63.75
DGL  8/29 LEGAL RESEARCH; PREPARE MEMO ON N 4.50  382.50
"~ TENTATIVE AGREEMENTS.
CMR  8/30. FACT FINDING. N 10.00 1300.00
RAS 8/30 ATTENDANCE AT AND TRAVEL FROM FACT o 11.25 1462.50
FINDING. :
WMQ 8730 PREP INFO AND EXMIBITS RE RESERVE K 2.75  357.50
PERCEMTAGES AND COMPARITIVE DATA FOR
NEIGHBORING COLLEGES FOR USE IN FACT
FINDING PROCEEDING ASST IN STATUTORY
RESEARCH AND INTERPRETATION RE o I N
BENEFITS PROVISIONS:; TELECON FOOTHILL
DE ANZA COLLEGE RE RESERVES.
IS4 8/30 PREPARATION FOR FACT FINDING HEARING. ¥ 1.50 127,50
DGL 8730 FACT FINDING. V3,50 297.50
DGL 8/30 WRITE MEMO. Na.rs 233,75
CK 8130 RESEARCH RE HEALTH BENEFITS FOR TEMP. N 4.50  332.50
EE®SZ HIRE OF TEMP. £E'S DURING
SUMMER? IF SUPERINTENDENTS AUTHORITY
TO TRANSFER IS NEGOTIABLE.
(MR B/31 FACT FINDING NEGOTIATIONS; SUPERVISED W 3.50 455,00
RE CULARIFICATION.
MK 8731 REPRESENT DISTRICT AT FACT FINDING ™ 11.00 1430.00
FACT FINDING.
DGL  8/31 CONMFERENCE RE MEMO; WRITE MEMD. d2.50 212,50



(2503-10-1006 SEPT 14, 1995

---------------- SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES-wwrommmmmacan—.
CMR HOURS: 118.50 $130.00 PER HOUR $15405.00
MK HOURS: 81.50 $130.00 PER HOUR $10595.00
RAS HOURS: 186.25 $130.00 PER HOUR $24212.50
WMQ HOURS: 8.50 $130.00 PER HOUR $1105,00
JSJ HOURS: 19,75 $85.00 PER HOUR 31678.75
bGL HOURS: 38.00 $85.00 PER HOUR $3230.00

Ly @

CX HOURS: 4.50 385.00 PER Houp $382.50
NET romc‘"‘""‘““uoua‘*l’ﬂ- 00> NET TOTAL rees- $56608.75 .
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
6/15 MEAL WITH CLIENT. 16.98
7/11 MEAL WITH CLIENT. 25.52
8/ 1 LEGAL RESEARCH. . 158,00
8/ 2 MILEAGE, : 55.80
8/ 3 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSINGa 5.00
8/ 7 MILEAGE, ' _ 55.80
8/ 7 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSING. 10.00
B/11 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 2D1.0n
8/13 TELEPHONE TOLL CHARGES. 76.79
8/22 MILEAGE, 55.80
8/23 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSING. 20.00
8/24 MILEAGE. 55.80
8/24 CLIENT LUNCH. 22.76
8726 DOCUMENT PREPARATION. 216,00
B/26 TRANSPORTATION. 7.50
8/27 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSING. 150.00
8/27 DOCUMENT PREPARATION, 216,00
8/28 TRANSPARENCIES, 10.58
8/28 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 50.00
8728 MILEAGE. 27.90
8/28 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 89.60
8/29 MILEAGE. 27.90
8729 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/SUPPLIES, 292.04
8730 MILEAGE. : 55.80
8731 PHOTOCOPIES. 599.20
8731 PDSTAGE. 2.70__
8731 FACSIMILE. T T T TSR T

C0STS: N $2548.47

PAYMENT  ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEHENT:\\\\%_“____#_d-«ﬂ——‘f/t

8729 $22698.43 PAYMENT RECELIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YoU.

-—&—F"aﬁﬁﬁﬂm%n---ﬂ-——-"h----—h——-lw--p—t---u“——v-—lqﬂ-ﬂ——n-o-—--mh'---—.h-mh

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $422046.73
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $59157.22
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $22698.48

Eh Ak kb Ak bk e

TOTAL AMOUNT DUF AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: + $78663.47
Ak kd khkhh hkohk

STATEMENT DATE: SEPT 14, 1995 FILE #1006

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

STATEMENT. :
PAGE 6

)




STATEMENT.

CELIA M. RUIZ SEPT 14, 1995 )
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR BALANCE 00.00,
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 941119 THANK YOU.
TELEPHONE (415) 395-90805
GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN EJMAYLE
FILE #1005 MARKUS (g
FILE #1005 MARKUS (10)
NO BALANCE DUE 0.00
»
STATEMENT DATE: SEPT 14, 1995 FILE H1005
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO J




PROGRAM NAME: (o&f @ INITIAL:

CLAIMANT: ﬂé;249112342>g)45162> DATE:

FISCAL YEAR: / 2% 756

PAYEE #F: S ¢ 3040
CORRESPONDENCE HISTORY: LIST ALL VERBAL AND WRITTEN COMMUNICATION WITH CLAIMANT

DATE MESSAGE (PERSON CONTACTED, PHONE NUMBER, IF APPLICABLE)
Steye £ ngella (403)5/4,9 47/5

7)? Yoo *mﬁm@/mé /0‘? /f.f/,-»tﬁ /@,&Z;u
 Atsss (i Frae

. ﬂ/ézﬂ/ﬁf/‘&cﬁ'f%% W
| Mmjf/m Mﬂww

Lt B4 ZZ MZ@ O(709) get-#0. /ﬂré/ﬁz‘/
JHQ?? /ﬁé ./f‘ﬁ:um At ,@// % aﬂ— ﬁ //-'&w/
e MQMM /M chp _Ar- /;me ;ﬂ f:ﬁ/&_x—vé/

«/%,w_ K & //(112444— Aﬁ{m/
__,.,,4-_—-————”—'““““""“4‘”'

¢



/WUﬁﬁjce.ﬁéDJZﬁ ) ‘C/a/'fzf@/ 7@6” 4_5'@‘/9%/57/ Ao Erer
7/7{(*&9 ’tS 7o c/e?éyf/ 5‘4//2()%7.7@/ //’é’ a%m%(%/&w

W@/f‘y Amf,/f’,s o% /éwd a4 Vazag /’)AVMK’,?>

' 5/3*/ /;‘sﬁ%/ amaf/é?" tﬁz:f:l%c&p@ /fzf/a,f,c e Forece ea//_f@j 5
CB-2 [isted wnder Fact [ind
| Dr.Gean May [e ~—J;f/ef/?7 fondent #sv248 .79
per  PEE S Section & — The & gocks Rer Selarres ond
Expen Ses (%ﬂf%f ?am"mﬂ'ﬁj Cu:w%am'jfj , 7@:}:" E@m//ﬁ
The Schoo/ Scc/_eﬁ 111‘27[&&4@;’\’[‘@4/\43 éay&r'm'/zj [b)aqrd/ are not
e !,mzfvm*;a/f €. | |



STATEMENT.

S

(" CELIA M. RUIZ

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET,
SAN FRANCISCO, CA

AUG
F e

14TH FLGQOR

94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020

11, 1995
Copt

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE ~f o

FILE #1000 SUMMARY FILE

P
P
? g

1) | (1o

PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF:

FILE H1D000 SUMMARY FILE

FILE #1015 ARBALLO~
CURRENT HOURS: 0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE:

FILE H1014(CSEA
CURRENT HO :

41.50

PREVIOUS BALANCE: 225394,
PLUS LATE CHARGES: D.
PLUS CUR COSTS: 338,

FILE #1013 DIAZY”

CURRENT HOURS: 26425

PREVIOUS BALANCE: 56.
PLUS -LATE CHARGES: 0.
PLUS CUR COSTS: 36.

FILE #1001 GAVILAN GENERAL
CURRENT HOURS: 5.50

8806.
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.
PLUS CUR COSTS: 0.

(10)
(GRID
35—~ MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
00 PLUS CUR FEES:
00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:
(19
24 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
00 PLUS CUR FEFS:
62 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:
(13)
30~ MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
00 PLUS CUR FEES:
73 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

LEGAL ABVICE (o

PREVIOUS BALANCE: 5851.47. MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:
PLUS CUR COSTS: 89.93 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:
FILE #1018 HALEY am
CURRENT HOURS: 0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE:  325.00- MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS LATE CHARGES: p.00 PLUS CUR FEES:
PLUS CUR COSTS: 0.00 FEQUALS NEW BALAMNCE:
FILE #1016 JOHNSOH®S WRIT OF MANDATE (o
CURRENT HOURS: 6.75
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 7086.02° MINUS CUR PAYMINTS:
PLUS LATE CHARGES: . 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:
PLUS CUR COSTS: 36.14 FEQUALS NEW BALANCE:

1302619,

g.0¢
0.00
8306.35

C.Df
5395.0N
231627.486

g. o
3412.5N
3505,53

0.00
580, 0n
6521.460

g.nn
0.07
325.00

g.ng
877.50
7999. 66

PLEASE PAY $302609.86

36

s



STATEMENT-

(2503-10-1000 AUG 11, 1995 PAGE >

FILE #1017 JOHNSON'®'S DFEH COMPLAINT (10)
CURRENT HOURS: 0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 87.86- MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 0.00
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: 0.0
PLUS CUR COSTS: D.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 87.86
FILE #1012 KARCICH . : (o
CURRENT HOURS: 0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 1531.10- MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 0.0n
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: 0.00

PLUS CUR COSTS: 0.37 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 1531.47

FILE #1006 ‘LABOR REL;;;;;;j> (10)

CURRENT HOURST  172.75

PREVIOUS BALANCE: 19506.25 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 0.or
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:2 22356.25
pPLUS CUR COSTS: 342.23 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 42204.73

i T B b ey Ak PP A P T A S e e S S N R M SR S W W T e ek b A A S8 e m as s st

TOTAL OF PREVIOQUS STATEMENT BALANCES: 268644.59

MINUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT PAYMENTS: 0.00
UNPALID FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENTS: 268644.59-
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT LATE CHARGES: 0.00
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT FEES: 32621.25
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT COSTS: 1344 .02

EQUALS: TOTAL BALANCE DUE THIS STATEMENT: 302609.86 V//

STATEMENT DATE: AUG 11, 1995 FILE ¥1000

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT.-
CELIA M, RUIZ AUG

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $8806.35
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-92005

9, 199s

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD,

GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

FILE H1015 ARBALLO (1o

PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $8806.35

FILE #1015 ARBALLO - ' (io)

AhkEkhhkkh Axdk

PREVIOUSLY BILLED AND UNPAID AMOUNTS, PLEASE PAY: +* £8806.35
hkhkkkk kkhkdkd

LT e et e m e

STATEMENT DATE: AUG 9, 1995 FILE #1015

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT:

" CELIA M. RUIZ AUG 9, 1995
RUII & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $231627.86

SAN FRANCISCO, €A 94117
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

v

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE ;
S055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. qﬁ’
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

FILE #1014 CSEA a0

PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $231627.86

—

~

e
FILE 1014 CSKEA ' €10)
Lot
!

PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES

ALC 7/ 3 ANALYIE HEARING TRANSCRIPTS. PREPARE G?s.rs'/ 747.50
POST-HEARING BRIEF OUTLINE.

ALC 7/ 5 ANALYZE HEARING TRANSCRIPTS. PREPARE ($/7.75/ 1007.50
POST-HEARING BRIEF OUTLINE.

WMa 7/19 CONF RE BRIEF IN 1739/41: GATHER (P1.50, 195.00
MATERIALS FOR SAME.

ALC 7/24 REVIEW TRANSCRIPTS; EDIT OUTLINE OF (P2.00v 260.09

ALC  T/25 3?55?; TRANSCRIPTS; EDIT QUTLINE OF (P4.75/ 617.50
! .
ALC 7/26 REVIEW TRANSCRIPTSS E01T OUTLINE OF @)s5.257/ 682,50
ALC 7727 REVIEW TRANSCRIPTS; EDIT OUTLINE OF @ 2.257 292.50
ALC 7/28 REVIEW TRANSCRIPTS: EDIT OUTLINE OF (P 3.507 455.00
ALC 7731 REVIEW TRANSCRIPTS; E0LT OUTLINE OF @ B.757 1137.50
ARTEF.

mmmmmmmm = a e SUMHARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES=m=mm=me—mmaoo=-
WMA HOURS:  1.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR £195.00
ALC HOURS: 40,00 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $5200.00

NET TOTAL HOURS: 41.50v NET TOTAL FEES: 3$5395.00
""""""""""""""""" T T T e T T S S e e e
COSTS ADVARCED SIMCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS

7/ 1 LEXIS CHARGES. 20.00

7/ 5 TRANSCRIPT CHARGES. : 372.50

7/ 7 FEDERAL EXPRESS CHARGES. 24.25

7/ 8 TELEPHOHNE TOLL CHARGES. 121.15

7/10 FACSIMILE. 13.00

7/12 PHOTOCOPYING. 72.72

7712 FACSIMWMILE. ' 14.00

7/31 PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. ) 144,00

\7/31 FACSIMILIES. 33,02




STATEMENT.
(2503~10-1014 AUG 9, 1995 PAGE 2 O

COS3TS:s Cﬁ?&BES.éZ

o ve et e oy o v b b Aok A e G o A B P eS A G T TR R M b o R S AR A S T Ml R P S T e e e s

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $225394.24

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $6233.62
” AE Kk kA Rk kh kL

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: * $231627.86
Akkhkhkk kA k4

STATEMENT DATE: AUG 9, 1995 FILE H1014

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT-

(" CELLIA M. RUIZ AUG 9, 1995
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY  $3505.5%
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005 - 75
GAVILAN JOIMT COMMUNITY COLLEGE s
S0S5 SANTA TERESA BLVD. T

GILROY, CA 95020 A
ATTENTION: DR, GLENN MAYLE Yo

FILE #1013 DiAZ (10}
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $3505.53
FILE #1013 DIAZ ' (1)
PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS fEEsS

RAS 7710 REVIEW FILE CONCERNING CENTRAL FACTS &D‘.ODJ/ 130.N0
AND ISSUES; COMFERENCE RE SAME:
CONDUCT RESEARCH RE "OVERLAPPING™
NORK T1SSUE.
JLS 7/11 REVIEW & CALENDAR NOTICE OF HEARING G?.SDV/ 65.00
(.25); DRAFT CLIENT LETTER RE SAHE
(.25).
CMR 7712 REVIEW PERDB AMENDMENT TO coMpLAINT. (B) .25+, 32.50
WHR  7/17 TELECONS TO CSEA RE TRIAL SCHEDULE. gg 225V 32050
WHQ 7/18 TELECON WITH V. LI, COUNSEL FOR CSEA,(D1.25, 162.50"
RE CONTINUATION OF TRIAL DATE;
EXTENSION OF TIME TO ANSWER:
~  AMENDMENT OF COMPLAINT; TELECON WITH
. JUDGE LINK RE SAME; NEW TRIAL DATE;
CONF RE SETTLEMENT POSSIBILITY;
TELECON V. LI RE SAME, |
JUS 7/19 CONF. RE SETTLEMENT STRATEGY .25): (P) .50  65.00
CONF. RE HEARING DATES & AMENDED
COMPLAINT DATE (.25). J/
lWMa  7/19 DRAFT LETTER TO JUDGE LINK RE CONF  (P2.25Y 202.50
CALL FROM COUNSEL; MEMORIALIZE JUDGE
LINK®S RULINGS AND PARTY AGREEMENTS
DRAFT LETTFR TO DR. MAYLE RE SANME;
CALENDAR NEW DATES: MZHMO RE
MITIGATION OF DAMAGES IN DIAL CASE;
REVIEW AMENDED COMPLAINT.
CHR  7/20 REVIEW CLASSIFICATION AND SETTLEMENT (P) 5@ 45.00
ISSUES. _
CHR 7721 PREPARE SETTLEMENT ISSUES AND (EDG.UOV/ 740.00
MEETING, TRAVEL TO CSEA OFFICE AND
NEGOTIATION SESSTON RE DIAZ; TC WITH
MAYLE. gyﬂ /
CHR  7/25 REVIEW CSEAgSETTLEMENT PROPOSALS TC (P)1.75/ 227.50
WITH; LI7 T I C 9()DER; TC ITH
JOYCE: TC WITHIHANSYLL: REVISE
LANGUAGE. f
(CHR 7725 REVIEW NOTES OF CSEA MEETING AND () 2.00Y 260.00




STATEMENT:
(2503-10-1013 AUG 9, 1995 PAGE 3 O

v X

p
DRAFT LETTE CLIENT. géj%/ o ,
CMR 7726 TC uxgﬂggin W: Te WTH JOYCE; Te B)3.50 T 4ss.op

WITH CofPEN; tc with™l1: review anp o

REVISE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT, REVIEW

AND REVISE CLIENT LANGUAGE; FAX FINAL

VERSIONS TO CLIENTS AND CSEA.

PAT 7/26 ORAFT AND REVISE SETTLEMENT @4.25 552.50
AGREEMENT

CMR 7727 SETTLEMENT, 2.00V 260.00

WMa 7727 REVIEW NOTICE OF HEARING IN THE 1732 .25 32.50

(DIAZ) CASE; REVIEW THE 1759
SETTLEMENT.,

---------------- SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES § FEES=m=mrmomemcmocoon

CHMR HOURS: 16.00 & 3130.00 PER HOUR $2080.00
PAT HOURS: 6.25 a 3130.00 PER HOUR $552.50
RAS HOURS: 1.00 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $130,00
JLS HOURS: 1.00 @ $130.00 PER HOUR £130.00
HM@ HOURS: 4.00 a $130.00 PER HOUR £520.00

NET TOTAL HOURS: 26.25¢" NET TOTAL FEES: $3412.50

. iy A em g s vk b b e el e P M G G e aem ke b e et ek e et e R TR A S YRS ) N S D TR A TR WS S A SE Wy O WE G G LA S A 48 Sep Bt e

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
7/3% PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 32.60
7/31 POSTAGE. 4.13

e P A Py b Bt GO Ams M n Bt TUr W W mh ke e e ey A T W ML R S RN P W U e R GE P M R R e em W e mmb W mme bw kS A w A b e e e

GALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: ¥56.30

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $3449.23
hhkkkkhhkhk ki

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: + $3505.53
AAE Rk okok ok k&

STATEMENT DATE: AUG 9, 1995 FILE #1013

RUIT & SCHAPIRO-




STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUILZ AUG 9, 1995
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET. 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY 3652140
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 96111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005S
GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE )C}
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. !
GILROY, CA 95020
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE P
FILE #1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE (0
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $6521. 40
FILE H1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE (10)
PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS .  FEES
ALC 7/ 3 REVISE LETTER TO.G. MAYLE RE 1.00v 130.00C
POTENTIAL DISCIPLINARY STEPS IN €.
JOHNSON'S CASE. REVIEW ATTACHED
DOCUMENTS TO 3E SENT TO DISTRICT.
JLS 7711 REVIEW PENDING MATTERS 3 DETERMINE 25 3250
STATUS.
KMW 7/11 PESEARCH ON PERSONNEL ISSUES. 3.00° 255.00
CMR 7725 REVIEW LAYOFF ISSUES. .7 97.50
CMR 7/26 LAYOFF ISSUES AND USTE ANALYSIS. .50/ 65.00
--------- mmmmm==SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEESmmmmmmmmmm o —m
CMR HOURS: 1.25 2 $130.00 PER HOUR $162.50
~JLS HOURS: 0.25 @ $130.00 PER. HOUP £32.50
ALC HOURS:  1.00 @ $130.00 PER HOUR £130.00
KMW HOURS: ). & $85.00 PER HOUR $255.,00
NET TOTAL HOURS: NET TOTAL FEES:  $580.00
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: CASTS
7/13 TELEPHONE TOLL CHARGES. 5. 89
7/31 PHOTCOPY CHARGES. 13,40
7731 POSTAGE. 0.64
7731 FACSIMILIES. 45.00
COSTS:  (—=)%89.93
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $5851.47
PLUS:  CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: £669.93

hkdkhhhkhhk kh ki

TCTAL AMQUNT DUF AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: & t6521.40
kE Rk kk kk kR kY

STATEMENT DATE: AUG 9, 1995 FILE #1001

RUTZ & SCHAPIRO




— STATEMENT-
CELIA M. RUIZ AUG 9, 1995

RUILZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $325.00
SAH FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD

5055 SANTA TERESA BOULEVARD
GILROY, CTA 95020

ATTN: DR. MAYLE

FILE #1018 HALEY M
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: £325.00
FILE H1018 HALEY : ' (10

Ak kb kkdhkhkhhi

PREVIOQUSLY BILLED AND UNPATOD AMOUNTS, PLEASE PAY: =« £325.00
. Ak hhdk hk ok ki

STATEMENT DATE: AUG 9, 1995 FILE #1018

RUIZ & SCHAPIROD




STATEMENT

d CELIA M. RUIZ " AUG 11, 1995
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY  $7999_66

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 74111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAYIULAN JOINT CCD

|

FILE #1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE ¢io)
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: 17990,66"

FILE #1016 JOHNSON®S WRIT OF MANDATE (1o
PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
MK 7/24 REVIEW OPPOSITION BRIEF; REVIEW FILE. 1.?5/; 227.50
MK 7/31 LEGAL RESEARCH: DRAFT REPLY 5.00/ 650.00

MEMORAND UM. '
---------------- SUMMART OF HOURS, RATES B fEES~mmmmmmmecaae——

MK HOURS: 2 $130.00 PER HOUR 3877.50

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: £0STS
7725 DOCUMENT PREPARATION/WORD PROCESSOR. 10.07
7/28 AMESSENGER SERVICE. 1,34
7/31 PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 22.80
COSTS: (:Ea £36.14
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $7086.02
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $913.64

hdkk ok kokk ok kA

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: * $7999.66

I E R TR ER ERFEES

STATEMENT DATE: AUG 11, 1995 FILE #1016

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT:

4 CELIA M. RUIZ AUG 9, 1995
RUIZ % SCHAPIRO '
4600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $37.86

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-7005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD

=

FILE H1017 JOHNSON'S DFEH COMPLAINT (1o
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENTY OF: $87.86
FILE K1017 JOHNSON'S DFEH COMPLAINT (10

Akt khk A khk hk

PREVIOUSLY BILLED AND UNPAID AMOUNTS, PLEASE PAY: =* 387.36
Ak kk khokkkh kk

STATEMENT DATE: AUG 2, 1995  FILE #1017

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT.

4 CELIA M. RULZ AUG 9, 1995
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET., 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY  $1531.47

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 924111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN UNIFIED SCHOOL OISTRICT
5055 SANTA THERESA BLVD,
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENYION: GLENN MAYLE

FILE #1012 KARCICH (10}
PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $1531.47
FILE #1012 KARCICH ' (10)

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS

7/13 TELEPHONE TOLL CHARGES.

$0.3

COSTS: éfi;

e i v — v

O e o e e e S A S T S N W WS S Ve fale St S S i ey S Y S Sy Gt b ASY ek dve B b

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $1531.10

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $0.37
hk ko Ak Ak kh kK

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYASBLE, PLEASE PAY: + $1531.47

dhkhkk khkhkhk kk ki

STATEMENT DATE: AUG 9, 1995 FILE #1012

RUTZ % SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT:

CELIA

M. RUIZ AUG 9, 1995

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 HMONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR PLEASE PAY $42204.73
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111 ' o
TELEPHONE (415) 375-9005 P

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE 7]
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. Y

GILROY, CA 95020 P
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

FILE #1006 LABOR RELATIONS {(10)

PLEASE DETACH AND RETURN WITH YOUR PAYMENT OF: $42204,.73

FILE #1006 LABOR RELATIONS ' (10)

PROFESSIONAL FEES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES

CMR
CMR

RAS

CHR

RAS

JLS

CHR
CMR
€ MR

JLS
€ MR

RAS

7/10
7110

7/10

7/11

7711

7/11

7712
7712
7112

7712
7713

7/13

REVIEW NEGOTIATION HISTORY; REVIEW (#/) 4.50/ 535.00
CSEA LETTER.

TC TO PEREB RE FACT FINDING; PREPARE () .75V  97.50
STRATEGY FOR PRESENTATION TO MAYLE. '
CONFERENCE RE ISSUES RAISED IN RECENTA)S.50V 715.00
INVESTIGATION; REVIEW FILES

CONCERNING ISSUES RAISED [N

NEGOTIATIONS; CONDUCT RESEARCH

REGARDING WHETHER GROUNDSKEEPING AND

MAINTENANCE WORK MAY BE CONTRACTED

OUT; CONFERENCE RE SAME. :
PREPARATION FOR COLLECTLVE BARGAININGI1.507 1495.00
SESSTON; REVIEW VARIOQUS ISSUES RAISED

8Y CSEA; MEETING WITH DISTRICT

ADMININSTRATORS RE STRATEGY AND

POSITIONS, TABLE BARGAINING; TRAVEL. ,
CONFERENCE RE RESEARCH CONCERNING @) .50V 65.00
MCONTRACTING OUT™ ISSUE.

COMFERENCE RE NEGOTIATIONS, (;)1.25/ 162.50
FACT-FINDING, CONTRACTING OUT OF

CUSTODIAL SFRVICES (.75); CONFERENTES i
RE VALIDITY OF CASE LAW CITED INMa =7 s wmo - o ...
WHELAN LETTER (.50). Y
REVIEW CSEA EFFECTS L;;TER RE DIAZ./ (] -25,,
MEDIATIONS FACT FINBIME LETTER.  ((n)1.507 195.00
CONFERENCE WITH MAYEEY conFeReENCE (5?111137/ 227.50
WITH MURPHY; REVIEW FACT FINDING

LETTER; LETTER TO PERSB.

CONF. RE NEGOTIAYIONS. EEB .50 A5.00
REVIEW FACT-FINDING ISSUES AND 2.75%7 357.50
RESEARCH TIMING AND PRESENTATION.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH KERN COUNT(#)S.00< 650.00
CCD'S COUNSEL REGARDING RECENT CASC

INVOLVING “CONTRACTIN OUT"™ ISSUE:

CONDPUCT SURVEY REGARDING OTHER

COMMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICT'S

B

32.50




. STATEMENT-
2503~10-1006 AUG 9, 1995 PAGE 2

"CONTRACTING QUT™ PRACTICES, CONDUCT
RESEARCH RE IMPASSE PROCEDURES AND

FACT ranxus.g)g/'

CMR  7/14 TC WITH COOPER RE DUTIES OF DIAZ; T
WITH MURPHY RE NEGOTIATION SESSION
AND EXPLORING SETTLING DIAZ; TC WITH-

L (OHANSELL RE MEDIATION AND FACT
/7 FINDING; TC WITH MURPHY RE

FACT-FINDING AND MEDIATION; REVIEY
AARGAINING NOTEBOOK IN PREPARATION
FOR FACT FINDING.

KMN 7/14 TELEPHONE POLL RE COLLECTIVE ®) .75v  63.75
BARGAINING AGREEMENTS.

CMR 7/17 FACT FINDING ISSUES. @) 1.007 130,00

CMR  7/17 REVIEW NEGOTIATION xssueza b @ 1.757 227.51
STRATEGY; TC WITH HANSELES  TC MURPHY.

RAS 7/17 CONFERENCE RE SURVEY INVOLVING ®)1.00/ 130.00
“CONTRACTING OUT™ ISSUE; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH KERN COUNT SCHOOL
LEGAL SERVICES RE RECENT TASE
INVOLVING "CONTRACTING OUT™ ISSUE, ,

KMW 7/17 TELEPHONE POLL RE COLLECTIVE (/1.007  85.00
BARGAINING AGREEMENTS.

CMR 7/18 FACT FINDING AND MEDIATION M1.7157 227.50
PREPARATION.

RAS 7/18 TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH PERB OFFCE () .50v  65.00
RE FATC-FINDING; CONFERENCE WITH CMR
RE SAME.

KMW 7718 TELEPHONE POLL RE COLLEC.TIVE W) .25 21.25
BARGAINING AGREEMENTS. ,

CMR 7/19 TC WITH MURPHY; TC HANSELL? REVIEW  {1.50V 195.00
FACT FINDING AND NEGOTIATION ISSUES.

KMW 7/19 TELEPHONE POLL RE COLLECTIVE @ .25 21.25
BARGAINING AGREEMENTS. :

CHMR 7720 FACT FINDING, @ 1.257 162.50

CMR  7/20 REVIEW STRATEGY AND POSITION ON @ -5V 65.00

CONTRACTING 0QUT.
RAS 7/20 PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO PERB RE G@ 7.03// 210.00
SELECTION OF CMR AS FACT FINDING
PAMEL MEMBER,; REVIEW LETTER FROM PERB
RE LIST OF POTENTIAL FACT FINDING
PANEL CHAIRS, CONFERENCE RE SAME, AND
PREPARFE CORRESPONDENCE TO G. MAYLE RE
SAME, CALENDAR RELEVANT FACT FINDING
DATFS; PREPARE MEMORANDUM OUTLINING
RELEVANT PROCEDURAL DATES?~ CONFERENCE - e
RE POTENTIAL FACT FIMDING PANEL
CHAIR, PREPARE MEMORANDUM REGARDING
FACTS OBTAINED CONCERNING POTENTIAL
FACT FINDING CHATIRS; TELCON WITH KERN
COUNTY SCHOOL SERVICES RE
"CONTQACTING OUT™ ISSUE? CONFERENCE
RE 6, CRIBA NOTICE OF TERMINATION
ISSUE. '
CMR 7/21 REVIEW OUTSTANDING LEGAL AND C}T.Uﬂ/ 130.09
NEGOTIATION ISSUES AND IMPASSES
STRATEGY RE RESOLUTION.
RAS 7/21 PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO G. HMAYLE REC)i.DUV/ 130,00
POTENTIAL FACT FINDING PANEL CHAIRSS;
. RESEARCH RE TERMINATION PROCEDURE FOR R




STATEMENT
(2503-10-1006 AUG 9, 1995 , PAGE
3

CATEGORICALLY FUNDED EMPLOYEFS. -7
CMR 7/22 REVIEW FACTS AND STRATEGIES FOR rAcf(j 2.59,/ 325.00
FINDING.,
C MR 25%5 PREPARATION FOR COLLECTIVE BARGAINING 12.00 1560.00
paole, O & MEETING; TRAVEL TO DISTRICT; MEETING D) $.00¢
fanhenv 1 WITH MAYLE AND ADMINISTRTORS RE A0y
swand t 1 PARAMETERS FOR SETTLING DIAZ UNFAIR}/fg{:;:::D
Joyte v 1 SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATION RE DIAZ; TABLE
BARGAINING RE IMPACT AND EFFECTS AND
OTHER ISSUES.
MK  7/24 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RE IMPASSE AND C)a.sov/ 535.00
OTHER LABOR RELATIONS MATTERSS
CONFERENCE RE CERTIFICATED
TERMINATION; REVIEW BRIEF IN COURT OF
APPEALS CASE RE LEGALITY OF
CONTRACTING OUT SERVLEES;TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH DRUD ov@f;TELEPHONE
CALL TO JOHN HANSELWD :
RAS 7/24 CONFERENCE RE STATUSS ANALYZE (:)3.00y/ 390,00
TERMINATION ISSUE RELATING TO G.
CRIBB AND CONDUCT RESEARCH RE PROPER
TERMINATION PROCEDURE; REVIEW BRIEF
RECEIVED FROM KERN COUNTY RE
CONTRACTING OUT ISSUE; CONFERENCE RE
SAME,

WMa 7724 CONF RE UPDATE ON CASZ; MATERIALS C? .25/ 32.50
FROM ALC.

CMR 7/25 PREPARE FACT FINDING. 5.75/ 747.50

MK éigzs MEETING RE STRATEGY FOR 3.507 1105.00
FACT-FINDING,REVIEW CONTRACT, INITIAL

meade U0 pROPOSALS, AND NOTES OF CONTRACT

guent IMPASSE MEDIATION SESSIONSS DRAET AND

Abret REVISE MEMORANDUM RE ISSUES FOR
FACT—-FINDINGSTELEPHONE CONFERENCES
G1TH eI 0YCE: CONFERENCES RE

~ Y CERTIFICATED TERMINATION,

RAS 7725 CONFERENCE RE STATUS AND FACT 7.00  910.00
FINDING; CONDUCT FURTHER RESEARCH @ b0
CONCERNING TERMINATION PROCEDURE FOR on
FOPS EMPLOYEE; CONFERENCE RE SAME; @z
REVIEW FILE FOR ALL DOCUMENT RELEVANT
TO ISSUES RELATING TO J. WILCOXSON,

G. CRIBB AND "CONTRACTING OUT".

CMR 7726 REVIEW STATEMENT OF ISSUES FOR FACT (M) 2.00V 260.00
FINDING. s - W

MK 7/26 TELEPHONE CONFE&ENCE—HLIH-JT“ﬁ£§SELL ()6.50/ 845.00
RE 1SSUES FOR FACT-FINDINGIREVIEW AND '

REVISE MEMORANDUM RRE ISSUES;REVIEW
COMTRACT ISSUES AGREED UPON DURING
MEDIATION AMD DRAFT MEMORANDUM OF
ISSUES AND PROPOSED LANGUAGE FOR
AGREEMENTS;TELEPHONE COMFERENCE WITH
J. HANSELL RE ISSUES. :

RAS 7/26 PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO G. MAYLE RE 5.25  682.50
G. CRIBB ISSUE; ANALYZE J. WILCONXSON .5 22¢7
ISSUE, INCLUDING REVIEW OF RELEVANT 3.6V
DOCUMENTS AND TRANSCRIPTS: PREPARE
CORRESPONGENCE TO G. MAYLE RE
"CONTRACTING OUT™ ISSUE.

WHMQ  7/26 TELECON RE DIAZ NEGOTIATIONS; REVIEW (M 1.25Y 162.50

/—--4‘\;,'-.
N




CMR

RAS

WM

CMR

CAR

CMR

CHR

MK

RAS

WMQ

MK

RAS

7727

7127

r127

7/28

7/238

7/238

7/28

7/23

7128

7731

7131

STATEMENT-

(2503-10-1006 AUG 9, 1995 , PAGE
A

AND REVISE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT RE

WILCOXSON BACKGROUND INFORMATION.

PREPARATION AND PARTICIPATION IN W) 8.75,/ 1137, 50
COLLECTIVE BARGAINING RE CONTRACTING

OUT, RECLASSIFICATION, SECRETARIAL

RECALL RIGHTS, AND EFFFECTS OF

LAYOFF. s

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO G. MAYLE RE@7.75., 1007.50
J. WILCOXSON ISSUE; PREPARE

CORRESPONDENCE TO G. MAYLS RE

"CONTRACTING OUT™ ISSUE; PREPARE

CORRESPONDENCE TO CSEA RE

"CONTRACTING OUT" ISSUE,

TELCON RE RESEARCH ON ED CODE (¥2.25.7 292.50
PROVISIONS CONCERNING INDUSTRIAL

ACCIDENT AND ILLNESS LEAVES; RESEARCH

REGARDING ABILITY TO RESTRICT LEAVE

TO CERTAIN EMPLOYEES OR TO ADD

QUALIFICATION PERIOD.

TC WITH MURHPHY AND FACT FINDER; #4.00v 520.00
PREPARED ISSUES AND LETTER TO PERH;

REVIEWED OUTSTANDING ISSUES. |
DRAFTED STATUS REPORT T0 DR. MAYLE REM)3.75/ 4B7.50
NEGOTIATION AND FACT FINDING; LETTER

TO MAYLE RE CONTRACTING OUT.

LETTERS TO CLIENT RE SENTORITY RIGHTS2.757 357.50
OF WILCONSON, LETTER TO UNION RE

CONTRACTING OUT; REVISE UPDATE ON

NEGOTIATIONS.

DRAFT UPDATE ON COLLECTIVE C?z;sov/ 325.00
BARGAINING.

REVIEW CSFA DRAFT LIST OF ISSUES FOR  6.00  780.00
FACT-FINDING; CONFERENCE RE @D Y ¥ '
STRATEGY;CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. -

MURPHY, CSEA REPRESENTATIVE RE LIST-7P)2.00 Y,

OF ISSUES AND SSLECTION OF CHAIR OF

FACT-FINDING PANEL;CONFERENCE WITH ™

MR. AMES, CHAIR OF FACT-FINDING

PANEL;ORAFT LETTER TO PERB RE ISSUES,

SELECTION OF CHAIR AND SCHEDULING OF

HEARING; CONFERENCE RE

SCHEDULINGSREVIEW DRAFT LETTERS RE

CONTRACTING DUT.

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO G. MAYLE REZ)8.25/1072.50
Jo. WILCOXSON ISSUE, G. CRIBB ISSUE,

AND "CONTRACTING OUT™ ISSUE;

CONFERENCE RE FACT-FINDING AND ABOVE

ISSUES.

MEMORANDUM TO MK RE ELIGIBILITY FOR (D1.75v 227.50
INDUSTRIAL ACCIDENT LEAVE, ABILITY TO

EXTEND QUALIFICATION PERIOD.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE RE STRATEGY: (¥ 2.000 260.00
CONFERENCES RE STRATEGY; REVIEW

DOCUMENTS. '
CONFERENCE RE RECLASSIFICATION 0F  (@4.s50/ 5R5.00
POSITION OUTSIDE BARGAINING UNIT;

CONFERENCE RE FACT-FINDING AND

PRESENTATION OF EVIDENCE CONCERNING

FINANCIAL ISSUE; REVIEW HEARING

TRANSCRITS RE TESTIMONY CONCERNING




~ STATEMENT.
2503-10-1006 AUG 9, 1995 PAGE 5

FINANCIAL ISSUES.,

i —————— e SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES=mw-mm——mmmmman -

CMR HOURS: 79.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $10335.00
MX HOURS: 27.50 @& 3$130.00 PFR HOUR $3575.00
RAS HOURS: 56.25 & $130.00 PER HOUR $7312.50
JLS HOURS: 1.75 3 $130.00 PER HOUR = $227.50
WMg HOURS: 5.50 & $130.00 PER HOUR $715.00
KMW HOURS: -25 \& $85.00 PER HOUR $£191.25
HET TOTAL HOURSY 172.75 NET TOTAL FEES: $22356.25

e e kel e e R — — I B Gut S il Ve Sy B et e Ve e Veb . R s m A

COSTS ADVANCED STNCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
7F & FACSIMILES, ‘ 21.00
7/ 7 FACSIMILES. 20.00
7/13 TELEPHONE TOLL CHARGES. 2.43
7717 FACSIMILE. 2.00
7/24 MILEAGE, _ 55.80
7124 MILEAGE. ' $5.80
7/27 MILEAGE. 55.80
7/29 DOCUMENT PREAPARTION/WORD PROCESSING. 10.00
7/31 PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 79.40
7731 FACSIMILIES. . 36.00
7/31 FACSIMILIES. 4.00

COSTS: ¢4 3342.23

e . ey S S S e Yeh P g ) s e e Y TS T S S A ey B Wi W Gvm e G e o e e B S v b e dm e B et v

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $19506.25

|PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $22698.48
Rokok ok ok &k ko Kk

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY: % 342204.73

RORORA AR Rk Kk AR

STATEMENT DATE: AUG %, 1995 FILE 21006

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT-

" CELIA M. RUIL . AUG 11, 1995 )
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR BALANCE 00.03.,
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111 THANK YOU. .

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNIYY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA 8LVYD.

GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN E.MAYLE

FILE #1005 MARKUS (10)
FILE #1005 MARKUS ' (10)
NO BALANCE DUE n. o
STATEMENT DATE: AUG 11, 1995 FILE #1005

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

" . =




Ui/ Lus e IR i¥415 395 9707 RUIZ & SCHAPIRO Idooz
STATEMEMT
CELIAM. RUIZ JULY 15, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111 :
TELEPHONE (418) 395-9005 = ‘“““%
1 g [4 j*/
v
GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE 6 ’
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020 ]
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE
SUMMARY FILE (10)
7 AN iif&iiﬂ'f’s‘i"f"‘bLEﬁBﬁ'ﬁ”“"ﬁ”ﬁﬁLﬂ - -Emm&kﬂi?ﬁ?iﬂwm G
FILE # 1000 SUMMARY FILE {10
FILE# 1015 ARBALLD (10)
CURRENT HOURS: 0.00
2REVIOUS BALANCE: $30.40 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $30.40.
PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: $0.00
PLUS CUR COSTS: $0.08 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: $0.00
FILE # 4019 CONSTRUCTION (10)
CURRENT HOURS:  0.00 .
PREVIOUS BALANGE: $23.30 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $23.30-
PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS GUR FEES: $0.00
PLUS CUR COSTS: $0.00 EQUALS NEW BALANGCE! $0.00
LE# 1014 CSEA (30)
CURRENT HOURS: 0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE: - $21,784.08 MINUS GUR PAYMENTS: $15,149.75-
PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES; $0.,00
PLUS CUR COSTS: $7.48 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: $5,641 .81
FILE# 1013 DIAZ {10)
CURRENT HOURS:  0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE; $65.20 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $65.20-
2LUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CURFEES; . £0.00
PLUS CUR COSTS; $0.00 EQUALS NEW BALANGE: L §0.00
FILE# 1023 DIAZ-FMLA (10)
CURRENT HOURS; 0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE: $531.00 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $531.00-
PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES; $0.00
PLUS CUR COSTS: $0.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE; $0.00
FILE# 1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE (10
CURRENT HOURS:  4.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE: $16,458.,73 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 516,459.73-
PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: $500.00 )
PLUS CUR COSTS: $209.61 EQUALS NEW BALANCE; $709.61:
FILE# 1006 LABOR RELATIONS (10)
CURRENT HOURS:  18.50 : : _
PREVIOUS BALANCE: $24,419.76 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $19.455,53-
PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: $2.405.00
PLUS CUR COSTS: $221.93 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: $7.591,21
L |

1



07/16/96  10:10  B415 385 9707 RUIZ & SCHAPIRO @003
! STATEMENT
2503-10-1000 JULY 15, 1998 PAGE 2
FILE® 1026 MACHADO: (10)
CURRENT HOURS:  17.60
PREVIOUS BALANCE: $1,344.70 MINUS GUR PAYMENTS: $0.00
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 50.00 PLUS CUR FEES: $2,259.00
PLUS CUR COSTS: $33.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: $3,635.70-
FILE# 1024 ULP 1883 (10)
CURRENT HOURS:  0.00 .
PREVIOUS BALANCE: $7,480.20 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $0.00
PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: $0.00
PLUS CUR COSTS: $42.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: $7.,522.20
TOTAL OF PREVIOUS STATEMENT BALANCES: $72,138.37
MINUS® TOTAL OF CURRENT PAYMENTS:— T $51.714.91.
UNPAID FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENTS: ’mpd :
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT INTEREST: .~ 3000
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT FEES <77 $8,163.007

PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT COSTS:

EQUALS: TOTAL BALANCE DUE THIS STATEMENT:

STATEMENT DATE: JULY 15,1968 FILE# 1000

RUIZ & SCHAPTIRO

BT
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STATEMENT

. JULY 10, 1996

CELIA M. RUIZ

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
!

GILROY, CA 95020
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE {:. /3

FILE# 1015 ARBALLO (10}

FILE# 1015 ARBALLO ' (10)

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEME.NT:
R128/96 $30,40 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
NG BALANCE DUE:

STATEMENT DATE: JULY 10, 1886  FILE# 1015

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

14



STATEMENT

CELIAM. RUIZ JULY 10, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

800 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 85020

ATTN: DR, MAYLE ) (9:

FILE# 1019 CONSTRUCTION (10)

FILE# 1019 CONSTRUCTION (10)

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: .
~128/96 $23.30 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $23.30

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
NO BALANCE DUE

STATEMENT DATE: JULY 10, 1896  FILE# {019

RUIZ & SCHAPIRQO

i5
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STATEMENY

CELIA M. RUIZ
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD,

GILROY, CA 85020 ' 7
ATTENTION: DR, GLENN MAYLE f

FILE# 1014 CSEA

) (10)
W OO AR O P e A B e

A E U A AR D TR W COR AR O s i e
FILE# 1014 CSEA (10}
COSTS ADVANCED SINGE THE LAST STATEMENT: : COSTS
7/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES. 7.48
: : $7.48

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINGCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
6/28/96  $15,140.75 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVIED, THANK YOU.

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $21,784.08

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE : - $7.48

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: ... 5
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY :3gW %ﬁ‘{j

to o418/

STATEMENT DATE: JULY 15,1998 FILE# 1014

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT

CELIAM. RUIZ
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415} 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 85020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

FILE# 1013 DIAZ

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR

FILE# 1013 DIAZ
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

STATEMENT DATE:

R128/96 © $65.20 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.

JULY 10, 1996

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $65.20

MINUGS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

NO BALANCE DUE:

JULY 10, 1996  FILE# 1013

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

i



STATEMENT

JULY 10, 19586

CELIA M. RUIZ

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE {415) 395-8005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020 . s
ATTN: DR. GLENN MAYLE Y

FILE# 1023 DIAZ-FMLA (10)
FILE# 1023 DIAZ-FMLA (10)
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
A128/96 $531.00 PAYMENT WAS REGEIVED, THANK YOU.
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: ~§531.00

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
NO BALANCE DUE:

STATEMENT DATE: JULY 10,1996 FILE# 1023

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

18
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ATATEMENT
4 CELIAM. RUIZ JULY 15, 1896 W
: RUIZ & SCHAPIRO - N y
: 600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005
GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE Vo
: ;’ -
FILE# 1001 GAVILAN GENERALLEGALABDVICE =~~~ N {10)
S P AN D R R R W Y SO A Y ER O R e
FILE# 1001 GAWMN GENERAL 1| EGAL ADVICE {10)
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT; HOURS FEES
AaD 6/05/96 RESEARCH RE LEASING QUESTIONS. 1.00 120.00
MQ 67067956 REAL ESTATE QUESTION: CODE RESEARCH REGARDING PUBLIC HEARING 1.75 227.50
OBLIGATIONS FOR PROPERTY LEASE: CONF. CMR RE RESULTS.
IAD  6/06/96 RESEARCH RE LEASING QUESTIONS, 1.00 120.00
IS  6/24/96 CONFER WITH GABE REYES RE CLOSED SESSION., .25 32.50
4.00 $500.00
SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES '
JIS HOURS: .25 B $130.00 PER HOR  $32.59
WHO KOURS: 1.75 @ 3$130.00 PER MR $227.50
TAD HOURS: 2.00 R $120.00 PER HOUR  $240,00
‘ NET TOTAL HOXRS:  4.00 NET TOTAL FEES:  $500.00
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: - COS8TS
7/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOFRY CHARGES. - 70,00
7/10/9% CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES. 36.61
7/10/96 CURRENT EACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 103.0Q
. $209.61
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINGE THE LAST STATEMENT:
6728/96  $16.459.73 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $16,459.73
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABQVE : $709. 61

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: mg;,@_.%%%,;g,;
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY : it rashataril

SRR TP S 2y

709. )

STATEMENT DATE: JULY 15,1596  FILE# 1001

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ JULY 10, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-8005

GAVILAN UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT

5055 SANTA THERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020 _
ATTENTION; GLENN MAYLE s
) 7)
' ) 2N }f' i /x
FILE# 1012 KARCICH WA {10}

FILE# 1012 KARCICH ' (10)

NO BALANCE DUE

STATEMENT DATE: JULY 10, 1986  FILE# 1012

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO J

20



STATEMENT

( CELIA M. RUIZ JULY 10, Ts.
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR

SAN ERANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR, GLENN MAYLE

FILE# 1006 LABOR RELATIONS (10)
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
CMR  6/03/96 REVIEW CURRENT STATUS AND PREPARE DRAFT SIDE LETTERS. 1.00 &/ 130.00
2 6/03/96 GAVILAN FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS; REVISE AGREEMENT WITH GCFA; REDRAFT 6.504f  B45.00
AND FINALIZE LETTER TO SANTANA AND SIDE LETTER AGREEMENT; CONFER
RE TERMS OF AGREEMENT.
CMR  6/04/96 PREPARE VARIOUS NEGOTIATION DOCUMENTS. 2.00 /260,00
WMQ  6/04/96 UPDATE RE GCFA NEGOTIATIONS; AMEND AGREEMENT; REVIEW AND 50 1 65.00
APPROVAL. S _
CMR  6/05/96 REVISE UNDERSTANDING; TC WITH COOPER. 1.25 #/  162.50
WMQ  6/05/96 REVISIONS TO GCFA AGREEMENT. 25~ 32.50
WMQ  6/07/96 REVISE MATERIALS FOR FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS. 75 +/ 97.50
R 6/10/96 TC WITH CHILD AND SANTANA; REVISE AGREEMENT. 2.00%,  260.00
LR 6714796 TC WITH MAYLE RE FOLLOW UP; DRAFT FOLLOW UP. 50 +/ 65.00
CMR  6/17/96 REVISE EDIT AGREEMENT AND NEGOTIATION POSITION; TC WITH CHILD. 150+ 195.00
CMR  6/17/96 REVISE AGREEMENT; TC WITH HANSELL; REVIEW ORIGINAL CONTRACT AND 1.00 &/ 130.00
COMPARE CHANGES, .
WMQ  6/17/96 FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS; DRAFT NEW SANTANA LETTER, EDITS TO 1250/ 162.50
AGREEMENT.

, 18.50 $2,405.00

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CHMR HOURS: 9.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1202.50
WMQ HOURS: 9.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1202.50

NET TOTAL HOURS: 18.50 NET TOTAL FEES: $2405.00
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: - COSTS
7/16/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 16.40
7/10/96 GCURRENT TELEPHONE GHARGES. 12.58
7/10/96 CURRENT WORD PROCESSING CHARGES. 20.00
7/10/96 CURRENT TRAVEL, TOLLS & PARKING CHARGES, 54.00
7/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. -119.00
7 $221.98
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

6/28/96  $19,455.53 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: §24 419.76
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOQOVE : $2,626.98

3

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY:

214



STATEMENT

2503-10-1006

JULY 10, 1996

STATEMENT DATE: JULY 10, 1886

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

FILE# 1006

PAGE 2

22



STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ JULY 10, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCGISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-0005

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020

1
GAVILAN JOINT CCD \ )
ATTN: DR. GLENN MAYLE ?

FILE# 1025 MACHADO

(A

FILE# 1025 MACHADO (10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINGE THE LAST STATEMENT: ‘ HOURS FEES
prE 6/03/96 DRAFT FILE MEMO ON RESPONSIVE PLEADING OPTIONS AND STRATEGIES. 2.30 299.00
¢ U 6/05/96 REVIEW MEMO AND COMPLAINT: ARRANGE EXTENSION. .50 65.00
WMQ  6/06/96 MACHADO CASE: TELECON P. WINSLOW RE TIME EXTENSION; LITIGATION 1.25 - 162.50

AIMS; SETTLEMENT PROSPECTS; POSSIBLE DISMISSAL OF CERTAIN CLAIMS
OR PARTIES; CMR RE SAME; REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM EJ.

IAD 6/06/96 REVIEW OF NEW MACHADO DOCUMENTS FROM DISTRICT. 1.00 120.00
WMQ  6/07/96 CONFER RE ERISA ISSUES; REVIEW ERISA AND JURSIDICTIONAL 2.75 357.50
AUTHORITY; EFFECT OF PREEMPTION AND FORUM QUESTIONS.
DEF  6/07/96 WORK ON MEMORANDUM RE 11TH AMENDMENT IMMUNITY, REMOVAL TO FEDERAL 7.40 962.00
COURT, ERISA PREEMPTION AND OTHER RESPONSIVE PLEADING ISSUES.
O 6/10/956 TAD RE SUBPOENA ISSUES; TELCON FROM P, WINSLOW AND RETURN CALL; .40 52.00
: TELECON RE CHANGE OF COUNSEL.
IAD -~ 6/10/96 RESEARCHRE SUBPOENA ISSUES; DRAFTING AND REVISING MOTION BRIEFS 2.00 240.00

FOR STIPULATION EXTENDING TIME.

17.60 $2,258.00

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CMR HOURS:  0.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $65.00
WMQ HOURS: 4.40 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $672.00
IAD HOURS: 3.00 @ $120.00 PER HOUR $360.00
DEF HOURS: 9.70 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1261.00

NET TOTAL HOURS: 17.60 NET TOTAL FEES: $2258.00
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
7/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 9.00
7/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE GHARGES. 6.00
7/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 18.00
$33.00
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $1.,344.70
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABQVE : $2,291.00

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: JULY 10,1996  FILE# 1028

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

3



STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ JULY 10, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415} 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020 O
ATTN: DR. GLENN MAYLE Q

FILE# 1024 ULP 1883 (10)
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COsTS
6£/19/96 COMPUTER RESEARCH. 35.00
0/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 7.00
$42.00
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: £7.,480.20

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE :
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY:

STATEMENT DATE: JULY 10,1996  FILE# 1024

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

24



STATEMENT

FILE# 1021 JOHNSON TORT

FILE# 1021 JOHNSON TORT

CELIA M. RUIZ
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

WILLIS CORROON ADMINISTRATIVE
SERVICES CORPORATION

P.0. BOX 6030 ’

SAN JOSE, CA 95150

ATTN: ROBIN FAWKES

JULY 10, 1986

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

7 6/03/96 DRAFTING AND REVISING INTERVIEW NOTES RE JOHNSON.
I+ 6/04/96 DRAFTING AND REVISING INTERVIEW NOTES RE JOHMSON
IAD 6/05/96 REVIEW OF CYNTHIA SHROYER DOCUMENTS RE J(

.REVISING PAT FREITAS INTERVIEW NOTES; CALLS yﬁ i
PHONE BILLS. 2ol

WMQ  6/06/96 REVIEW INTERVIEW MEMORANDA; DOCUMENTS. &;’
IAD © 6/06/96 REVISION TO MARCIA HANNUM INTERVIEW NOTES J"*/J '

COLLINS AFFIRMATIVE ACTION COMPLAINT.

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: JULY 10,1996  FILE# 1021

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

HOURS FEES |
6.50 780.00
6.50 780.00
5 75 630,00
LA
?’1:Ze3k“ 91.00
360.00

ALy }LQ% 91.00

WMQ  6/07/96 REVIEW AND REVISE CMC STATEMENT; REVIEW F
. - STATEMENT. /ﬁ Gep KL o
6/07/96 CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE MEMORANDU // y el £, 240.00
IAD - 6/10/96 REVISION OF W. COLLINS MEMO; PREPARATIONT </ . e 240.00
-~ CONFERENCE. e m - _
IAD  6/11/96 ATTENDANCE AT JOHNSON CASE MANAGEMENT // 600.00
JOHNSON TELEPHONE RECORDS.
IAD  6/12/96 REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF JOHNSON PHONE RE 480.00
HANNON TO DISCUSS TREATMENT OF PHONE Bl
EMPLOYEES. - -
(A% 6/25/96 REVIEW OF JOHNSON OPPOSITION BRIEFS, 96.00
| ' %4,388.00
SUMMARY OF HOUtw, +urn.
WMQ HOURS: 1.40 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $182.00
IAD HOURS: 35.05 @ $120.00 PER HOUR  $4206.00
NET TOTAL HOURS: 36.45 NET TOTAL FEES: $4388.00
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
7/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 58.00
7/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES. 3.02
7/10/96 CURRENT WORD PROCESSING CHARGES, 20.00
7/10/96 CURRENT TRAVEL, TOLLS & PARKING CHARGES. 42.00
7/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 8.00
. 3131.02
BALANGE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:  $39,241.6¢

PRGN




STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEFPHONE (415) 395-3005

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE

JUNE 17, 1996

R R A S T D S T P e R

FILE# 1000 SUMMARY FILE

FILE# 1015 ARBALLO
CURRENT HOURS: 0.25
PREVIOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES:
PLUS CUR COSTS:

FILE# 1019 CONSTRUCTION
CURRENT HOURS: 0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE:

PLUS LATE CHARGES:
™.US CUR COSTS:

FILE# 1014 CSEA
CURRENT HOURS: 29.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES:
PLUS CUR COSTS:

FILE# 1013 DIAZ
CURRENT HOURS:
PREVIOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES:
PLUS CUR COSTS:

0.50

FILE# 1023 DIAZ-FMLA
CURRENT HOURS:  0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES:
PLUS CUR COSTS:

FILE# 1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE
CURRENT HOURS: 20.25
PREVIOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES:
PLUS CUR COSTS:

FILE# 1016 JOHNSCN'S WRIT OF MANDATE
CURRENT HOURS: 0,00
"REVIOUS BALANCE:
US LATE CHARGES:
PLUS CUR COSTS:

$70.40
$0.00
$0.00

$23.30
$0.00
$0.00

$114,855.67
$0.00
$90.90

$7.414.43
$0.00
$5.20

$531.00
$0.00
$0.00

$27,056.51
$0.00
$183.63

$7,086.02
$0.00
$0.00

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE;

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

(10)

(10)

(10)

(10)

(10)

(10)

(10)

(10)

- $70.00
$30.600
$30.40

$0.00
$0.00
$23.30

$96.832.49.
$3,670.00
$21,784.08

$7,414 .43-
$60.00
$65.20

1$0.00
$0.00
$531.00

$13,390.41-
$2,610.00
$16,459.73

$7.086.02-
$0.00
$0.00

16



STATEMENT

2503-10-1000

FILE# 1012 KARCICH

CURRENT HOURS: 0.00

REVIOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES:
PLUS CUR COSTS:

FILE# 1006 LABOR RELATIONS

CURRENT HOURS: 37.25

PREVIOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES:
PLUS CUR COSTS:

FILE# 1025 MACHADO

CURRENT HOURS: - 10.00

PREVIOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES:
PLUS CUR COSTS:

FILE# 1024 ULP 1883

CURRENT HOURS: 58.50

PREVIOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES:
PLUS CUR COSTS:

JUNE 17, 1996

$6.00
$0.00
$0.00

$50,817.85
$0.00
$141.73

$0.00
$0.00
$212.20

$2.812.30°
$0.00
$10.20

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
© PLUS CURFEES:
EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

TOTAL OF PREVIOUS STATEMENT BALANCES:

MINUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT PAYMENTS:
UNPAID FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENTS: $50,168.41

PLUS:

TOTAL OF CURRENT INTEREST:

PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT FEES:
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT COSTS:

EQUALS: TOTAL BALANCE DUE THIS STATEMENT:

STATEMENT DATE: JUNE 17,1896  FILE# 1000

RUYZ & SCHAPIRC

PAGE 2

(10)
$1,531.1¢
$0.0C
$1,531.1C

(10)
$31.362,32
$4,822.50
$24,419.76

(10)

50.00
$1,132.50
$1.344.70

(10)
$2.812.30

$7,470.00
$7.480.20

$210,667.48
$160,499,07-

$0.00
$19,795.00
$643.86

17



STATEMENT

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

CELIAM. RUIZ JUNE 17, 1996

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:,
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: JUNE 17,1996  FILE# 1015

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

18

GILROY, CA 95020 :
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE /\J
FILE # 1015 ARBALLO (10)
FILE# 1015 ARBALLO (10)
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
IAD  5/16/96 CALL TO DR. MAYLE RE ARBALLO SUBPOENA. .25 30.00
.25 $30.00
SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
IAD HOURS:  0.25 @ $120.00 PER HOUR  $30.00
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
5/30/96 $68.00 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON AGCOUNT, THANK YOU.
6/03/96 $2.00 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $70.40
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE : $30.00




STATEMENT

JUNE 17, 1996

CELIA M. RUIZ

RUIZ & SCHAFIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELLEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN COLLEGE

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTN: DR. MAYLE

FILE# 1019 CONSTRUC

FILE# 1019 CONSTRi_JCTlON

PREVIOUSLY BILLED AND UNPAID AMOUNTS, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE:  JUNE 17, 1996 FILE# 1019

RUIZ & SCHAPIRC

19



STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ JUNE 17, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO -
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-8005

(\/’"
%" > -
w0 e
l 7(? 7?
GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE . {
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. Z} -
GILROY, CA 95020 {
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

# 1014 CSEA (10)

U RS R R

FILE# 1014 CSEA (10)
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
CMR  5/01/96 REVIEW CONTRACT LANGUAGE ISSUE; ULP POSTING COMPLIANCE STATEMENT; 1.75¢  227.50
' FOLLOW ISSUES. _
CMR  5/06/9% PREPARE FOR BOARD MEETING RE VARIOUS ISSUES INCLUDING IMPASSE AND 8.50 1 1,105.00
UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICES; MEETING RE OPTIONS AND STRATEGY; TRAVEL;
CASE PREPARATION.
WMQ  5/06/96 OMR RE BOARD STATEMENT RE: ALJ DECISION; REQUIRED REVISIONS. <25 32.50
IAD  5/06/96 RESEARCH ALAN FODEN JOB DESCRIPTION. 50~ 60.00
IAD  5/09/96 DRAFTING AND REVISING BOARD STATEMENT RE 1739/1741 ULP. 450U 540.00
WMQ  5/10/96 REWRITE BOARD STATEMENT; REVIEW HEARING TESTIMONY; EXHIBITS AND 6.75¢  877.50
PERB DECISION; FACT CHECK; TELECONS RE CONTENT AND APPROACH.
L - 5/10/9 RESEARCH AND REVISION OF BOARD STATEMENT RE ULP 1739/1741. 4.004  480.00
CMR  5/13/96 REVISE BOARD STATEMENT. 1.00¥  130.00
WMQ 5/13/96 TELECON, REVIEW BOARD STATEMENT; CONFIRMATION OF FACTUAL ASPECTS; 75U 97.50
REVIEW EDITS AND FORWARD TO CLIENT.
IAD  5/13/96 REVIEW OF DRAFT BOARD STATEMENT. : 100U 120.00

29.00-  $3,670.00

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CMR HOURS: 11.256 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1462.50
WMQ HOURS:  7.75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1007.50
IAD HOURS: 10.00 @ $120.00 PER HOUR  $1200.00
NET TOTAL HOURS: 29.00 NET TOTAL FEES: $3670.00

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COsTS
6/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 47.40
6/10/96 GURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 43.50

’ $90.90

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
5/30/96 $93,747.42 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.
6/03/96 $3,085.07 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $114,855.67

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE : $3.760.90

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $96,832,49.
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: JUNE 17,1986  FILE# 1014

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT

5/30/96
6/03/96

CELIAM. RUIZ 7 JUNE 17, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020 P i
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE \) ' )

FILE# 1013 DIAZ , | (10)
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: - HOURS FEES
IAD  5/01/96 REVIEW OF BRADSHAW LETTER RE DIAZ, AND LETTER TO DR. MAYLE RE END 50 60.00
OF DIAZ MATTER.
50 $60.00

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
IAD HOURS:  0.50 @ $120.00 PER HOUR $60.00

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
6/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 5.20
o $5.20

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT;
$7.385.43 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.

$29.00 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT : $7,414.43

PLUS; CHARGES LISTED ABOVE : $65.20

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: JUNE 17,1896  FILE# 1013

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT

JUNE 17, 1996

CELIA M. RUIZ

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD :
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTN: DR. GLENN MAYLE

(10

FILE# 1023 DIAZ-FMLA

FILE# 1023 DIAZ-FMLA (10)

PREVIOUSLY BILLED AND UNPAID AMOUNTS, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: JUNE 17,1996  FILE# 1023

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ JUNE 17, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE 7
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. N
GILROY, CA 95020 \'x
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

""""" ) CALERR M A

Pt

FILE# 1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE (10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES

DEF 5/01/96 REVISIONS TO CLIENT LETTER RE PROPER DOCUMENTATION UNDER POLICY .75 97.50
AND CBA PRIOR TO ATTEMPT TO IMPOSE FORMAL DISCIPLINE,

DEF 5/02/96 REVISIONS TO CLIENT LETTER RE SECTIONS ON IMPLEMENTING ANNUAL .75 §7.50
REVIEW SUBJECT TO CBA REQUIREMENTS.

WMQ  5/04/96 REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT LETTER TO H. BELL AND REPRIMAND LETTER TO 1.50 195.00
A. ESTRADA,

DEF  5/07/96 REVISIONS TO LETTER OF REPRIMAND AND CLIENT LLETTER EXPLAINING 1.50 195.00
RATIONALE AND REQUIRED FUTURE ACTIONS TO SUSTAIN FURTHER
DISCIPLINE. ‘

5/08/96 REVIEW & EDIT LETTER OF REPRIMAND & CLIENT COVER LETTER. 1.75 227.50

w.oR  5/09/96 REVISE REPRIMAND, 1.00 130.00

CMR  5/10/96 REVISE AND FINAL REPRIMAND PAPERS. 1.50 195.00

CMR  5/10/96 REVISE AND EDIT STATEMENT. 1.50 195,00

DEF 5/10/96 REVISIONS TO LETTER TO HOWARD BELL, 1.00 130.00

CMR  5/13/96 REPRIMAND ISSUES. 1,00 130.00

JLS 5/14/96 REVIEW FINAL ESTRADA LETTER & SUSPENSION PAPERS, 1.75 227.50

DEF 5/14/96 REVISIONS AND FINALIZATION OF CLIENT LETTER AND LETTER OF .50 65.00
REPRIMAND, TRANSMISSION OF SAME. ‘ ;

CMR  5/15/96 REVIEW VARIOUS ISSUES INCLUDING PART TIME NURSE. 1.00 130.00 ;

1AD 5/15/96 RESEARCH RE PART TIME TEACHERS AND THEIR RIGHT TO BECOME FULL .50 £0.00
TIME TEACHERS.

CMR  5/16/96 REVIEW QUESTIONS RE BROWN ACT; REVIEW ED CODE RE PART TIME NURSE 2.00 260,00

’ AND TC WITH DR MAYLE RE SAME.

JLS 5/22/96 CONTACT MAYLE. .25 32.50

JLS 5/28/96 CONTACT DR MAYLE OFFICE, ' .25 32.50

CK 5/29/96 DRAFT LETTER RE: KERN COUNTY DECISION. 1.75 210,00

20.25 $2,610.00

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CMR HOURS: 8.00 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1040.00
JLS HOURS:  4.00 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $520.00
WMQ HOURS:  1.50° @ $130.00 PER HOUR $195.,00
CK HOURS: 1.75 @ $120.00 PER HOUR $210.00
IAD HOURS:  0.50 @ $120.00 PER HOUR $60.00
DEF HOURS: 4,50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $585.00
NET TOTAL HOURS: 20.25 NET TOTAL FEES: $2610.00

3TS ADVANCED SINGE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
.. 10/96 CURRENT POSTAGE CHARGES. 4.96
6/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 93.20 ;
61.47
|

6/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES.
6/10/96 CURRENT WORD PROCESSING CHARGES, 5.00

23



STATEMENT

2503-10-1001 JUNE 17, 1996 PAGE 2
6/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. o 19.00
$183.63

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
5/30/96 $5,851.47 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOU,

6/03/96 $7.,538.94 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $27,056.51

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE : $2,793.63

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY:

STATEMENT DATE: JUNE 17,1996  FILE# 1001

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT

CELIAM. RUIZ JUNE 17, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD

FILE# 1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE

(10) |

FILE# 1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE (10) o
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: :
5/30/96 $7,086.02 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT THANK YOU.
7 BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $7.086.02
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $7,086.02-

NGO BALANCE DUE

STATEMENT DATE: JUNE 17,1986  FILE# 1016

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111 - |
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT
5055 SANTA THERESA BLVD, -

GILROY, CA 95020
ATTENTION: GLENN MAYLE

FHILE# 1012 KARCICH k

FILE# 1012 KARCICH

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
5/28/96 $1,531.10 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOU,

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

STATEMENT DATE: JUNE 17,1996  FILE# 1012

JUNE 17, 1996

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
NO PAYMENT IS DUE THANK YOU, CREDIT BALANCE

28
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STATEMENT

FILE# 1006 LABOR RELATIONS

CELIA M. RUIZ

RUIZ & SCHAPIRC

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94171

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

JUNE 17, 1986

FILE# 1006 LABOR RELATIONS

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

CMR
WMQ
CMR
DEF

CMR
DEF

CMR
CMR
RAS

CMR

WMQ

IAD
CMR

wMQ
WMQ

CMR
CMR

NEGOTIATIONS.

REV. RECENT PERB CASE,

FOLLOW UP ON FACULTY ISSUE,

ADDITIONAL LEGAL RESEARCH RE: PARITY, ME TOO AND BONUS
AGREEMENTS; NON-ACTIONABLE OPINION STATEMENTS; FAILURE TO
ACTUALLY RELY EVEN IF STATEMENTS ARE UNTRUE; STATUTE OF
LIMITATIONS REQUIREMENT OF ACT NOT RELATED TO ACTION WHICH IS
PRIOR TG ALLOWABLE SIX MONTH PERIQD; LABOR CODE SECTICN 1126
PROVISION FOR COURT TO DETERMINE DISPUTES UNDER COLLECTIVE

5/01/96
5/01/96
5/02/9
5/03/96

BARGAINING AGREEMENTS; STATUTORY PRORIBITION ON PERB DETERMINING

CONTRACT DISPUTES UNLESS ALSO CONSTITUTES A UNFAIR LABOR
PRACTICE. FACTUAL INVESTIGATION RE SAME. DRAFTING OF MOTION TO
DISMISS CHARGE AND NOT ISSUE COMPLAINT,

FACULTY FOLLOW-UP,
DRAFTING OF BOARD RESPONSE REVISIONS TO PETITION ISSUES RAISED RE

1739-41 ULP DECISION. REDRAFTING OF DISCRIMINATION INVESTIGATION
LANGUAGE AND EMPLOYEE COMMUNICATION WITH SUPERVISIOR PRIOR TO
FILING OF GREVIENCE SECTION.

NEGOTIATIONS.

PREPARE NEGOTIATIONS.

CONFER RE EDUCATION CODE DEF]NITION OF PART-TIME EMPLOYEE.
REVISE SETTLMENT PROPOSALS AND PREPARE FINAL SETTLEMENT
AGREEMENT,

FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS WORK; CONF. RE FACULTY CONTRACT; TELECON C.
COOPER; DRAFT AGREEMENT; TELECON RE TERMS; EDIT AND COORDINATE
DRAFT WITH PRIOR PROPOSALS; REVIEW LEGAL RESEARCH RE PAYMENT
STRUCTURING; TEACHER EVALUATION TIMING.

RESEARCH RE SCHOOL DISTRICT'S RIGHT TO PAY TEACHER SALARIES OVER
12 MONTH PERIOD.

REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED AGREEMENT,; TC WITH CLIENT RE SAME; TC
WITH CHILD RE REVISIONS. -V

REVIEW AND FINALIZE GCFA/GJCCD AGREEMENT; REVIEW MEMORANDUM RE
THIRD QUARTER RESULTS.

TELECON C. COOPER; MEMO TO FILE.

FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS.

FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS.

5/08/96
5/10/96

5714796
5/15/96
5/15/96
5/16/96

5/16/96

5/16/96
5/17/96
5/17/9%
5/21/96

5/29/96
5/31/96

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES

CHR HOURS: 12.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1625.00
RAS HOURS:  0.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $65.00
WHMQ HOURS: 12.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1625.00

(10}

HOURS

1.00H
75vbf

FEES
130,00

97.50

65.00

9.25 os b ! 1,202.50

50 v 65.00
soutf 65,00
1,00/ 130.00
1.00N 130.00
50 65.00
150N 195.00
8.75 1.137.50
2.00{ 240.00
3.5or/ 455 .00
2.50/»’ 325.00
50 65.00
1504 195.00
2.00¢ 260.00
3725  $4.822.50
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' STATEMENT
2503-10-1006 JUNE 17, 1996 PAGE o

IAD HOURS: 2.00 @ $120.00 PER HOUR  $240.00
DEF HOURS: 9.75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1267.50

NET TOTAL HOURS: 37.25 NET TOTAL FEES: $4822.50
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
6/10/96 CURRENT POSTAGE CHARGES. 2.80
6/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 46.20
6/10/96 GURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES. : 18.73
6/10/96 CURRENT WORD PROCESSING CHARGES. 5.00
6/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 38.00
6/10/96 CURRENT EXPEDITED MAIL CHARGES. 31.00
DGTWA
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
5/30/96  $19,506.25 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.
6/03/96 - $11,856.07 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:  $50.817.85
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE : $4,964.23

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: JUNE 17, 1996 FILE# 1006

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO J
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STATEMENT

JUNE 17, 1996

CELIA M. RUIZ

RUIZ & SCHAFRIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD,
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTN: DR. GLENN MAYLE

! ) '“

("
FILE# 1025 MACHADO (10)
FILE# 1025 MACHADO {10y
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:- HOURS FEES
IAD 5/29/96 DICTATING AND REVISING MEMO RE TIME LINE FOR MACHADQO RESPONSE. 1.00 120.00
RG 5/29/96 REVIEWED MACHADO COMPLAINT AND DOCUMENTATION. 3.50 297.50
WMQ  5/30/96 REIVEW FILE; DRAFT MEMO RE LITIGATION ISSUES AND POSSIBLE 5.50 715.00

STRATEGY; TELECON RE CASE.
10.06 $1,132.50

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
WMQ HOURS: 5.50 @ $130,00 PER HOUR $715.00
IAD HOURS: 1.00 @ $120.00 PER HOUR $120.00
RG HOURS: 3.50 @ $85.00 PER HOUR $297.50
NET TOTAL HOURS: 10.00 NET TOTAL FEES: $1132.50

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
6/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. , 202.20 |
6/10/96 CURRENT WORD PROCESSING CHARGES., 10.00

$212.20
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $0.00

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE :
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: JUNE 17,1996  FILE# 1025

RUTZ & SCHAPIRO ’J

29



STATEMENT

CELIAM. RUIZ ' JUNE 17, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE {415) 395-9005

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 85020

GAVILAN JOINT CCD ’ g{}
R T
A
ATTN: DR. GLENN MAYLE ([ y
}

FILE# 1024 ULP 1883

FILE# 1024 ULP 1883 . {10)
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
DEF 5/01/96 REVIEW UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE CHARGE AND MATERIALS REGARDING 4,00 520.00

FAILURE TO DISCONTINUE CASH BACK TAX SHELTERED ANUITIES FOR
NON-CLASSIFIED EMPLOYEES, LEGAL RESEARCH RE PERB DECISIONS RE

SAME.

WMQ  5/02/96 TELECON C. AMES; CONF. RE DISMISSAL ARGUMENTS AND FACT ISSUES; 2.25 u 292.50
CONF. RE AMES ROLE; REVIEW LIMITATIONS ARGUMENT,

DEF 5/02/96 RE: MOTION TO DISMISS ULP NO. 1883. LEGAL RESEARCH RE PERB - 925 ¢ 1,202.50

AUTHORITY ON STATUTE OF LIMITATIONS, EQUITABLE TOLLING, DELAYED
DISCOVERY, CONTINUING VIOLATIONS, WAIVER, CONTRACT WAIVER,
-STATEMENTS OF OPINION, CONTRACT INTREPRETATION RULES, REASOMABLE
RELIANCE, IMPASSE DUTIES, IMPASSE ACTIONS AS BASIS FOR ULP,

STANDARD FOR DISMISSAL OF CHARGE WITHOUT ISSUING A COMPLAINT,
NEGOTIATION OF EFFECTS, INFLUENCING NON-UNIT EMPLOYEES, PARITY
AGREEMENTS, BONUS AGREEMENTS, AND EVIDENCE PROPERLY BEFORE BOARD
AGENT AT TIME OF THIS DETERMINATION. FACTUAL INVESTIGATION RE:

SAME AND BARGAINING HISTORY PRE AND POST DECLARATION OF IMPASSE,

WMQ  5/03/96 REVIEW CASES; REVIEW DRAFT OF MOTION TC DISMISS; CONFER RE CASE 5.50 ¢ 715.00
AUTHORITY REQD FOR MOTION.
1AD 5/03/96 REVIEW OF ULP 1883 CHARGE; RESEARCH TO FIND PERB DIGESTS; VISIT 1.50 & 180.00
TG PERB OFFICES,
WMQ  5/04/96 REVIEW AND EDIT MOTION TO DISMISS THE ULP. 7.254 942.50
IAD 5/04/96 RESEARCH AT BOALT HALL LAW LIBRARY RE PERB DIGESTS. _ 5.004 600.00
WMQ  5/05/96 (ULP 1883) WORK ON EDITS AND REVISIONS TO BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF 6.50 ¢ 845.00
DISMISSAL OF CHARGE; REVIEW LEGAL AUTHORITY IN SUPPORT OF
ARGUMENTS.
IAD 5/05/96 RESEARCH AT BOALT HALL LAW LIBRARY RE PERB DIGESTS. 3.00 4 360.00
WMQ  5/06/96 (ULP 1883} REVISIONS TO BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO DISMISS THE 6.75 {f 877.50
CHARGE; CONFER RE TOLLING ISSUES AND AUTHORITY,; CMR RE FACTU
ISSUES; CONF. CALL CMR AND AMES (FACTFINDING PANEL CHAIR);
TELECON PERSB; REVIEW CITE CHECK RESULTS.
IAD 5/06/96 RESEARCH RE RESPONSE TO ULP CHARGE; REVISIONS TO RESPONSE; 4,000 480.00
RESEARCH RE FACTFINDING REPORT BY JUDGE LINK.
DEF 5/06/96 LEGAL RESEARCH AND FACTUAL INVESTIGATION TO FINALIZE MOTION TO 3.25 U/ 422.50
DISMISS ULP 1883. REVISIONS AND CHECKING OF AUTHORITY CITED RE
SAME. '
DEF 5/20/96 REVIEW FAXED MEMO ON TSA RE POSSIBLE SUPPLEMENT TO MOTION TO .25 Y 32.50

DISMISS ULP 1883.

58 .50/ §7.470.00

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
WHQ HOURS: 28.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $3672.50
IAD HOURS: 13.50 @ $120.00 PER HOUR  $1620.00
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- STATEMENT
2503-10-1024

JUNE 17, 1996

DEF HOURS: 16.75 £ $130.00 PER HOUR

3TS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
6/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES.
6/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES.

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
6/03/96 $2,812.30 PAYMENT RECEIVED ON ACCOUNT, THANK YOU.

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

NET TOTAL HOURS: 58.50 NET TOTAL FEES:

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE : $7,480.20
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY;

STATEMENT DATE: JUNE 17,1996  FILE # 1024

PAGE 2
$2177.50
$7470.00

COSTS

7.20

3.00

$10.20

$2,812.30

32.812.30
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/RN . —
STATEMENT

e

I : CELIA M. RUIZ

o RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

MAY 21, 1996

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 85020

ATTENTION: DR, GLENN MAYLE

FILE# 1000 SUMMARY FILE

FILE# 1015 ARBALLO.
CURRENT HOURS:  0.00

PREVIOUS BALANCE: $68.40 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $0.00

PL.US LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: $0.00

PLUS CUR COSTS: $2.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: §70.40
FILE# 1019 CONSTRUCTION (10

CURRENT HOURS: 0.00

PREVIOUS BALANCE: $23.30 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $0.00

PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: $0.00

PLUS CUR COSTS: $0.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: $23.30
i .# 1014 CSEA (10}

CURRENT HOURS: 23.00

PREVIOUS BALANCE: $111,770.60 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $0.00

PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: $2,947.50

PLUS CUR COSTS: §137.57 EQUALS NEW BALANGE: $114,855,67
FILE# 1013 DIAZ (10)

CURRENT HOURS: 0.00 .

PREVIOUS BALANCE: $7.385.43 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $0.00

PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: $0.00

PLUS CUR COSTS: $29.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: $7,414.43
FILE# 1023 DIAZ-FMLA (10

CURRENT HOURS: 0.00 '

PREVIOUS BALANCE: $531.00 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $0.00

PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: $0:00 -

PLUS CUR COSTS: $0.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: $531.00 .
FILE# 1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE (10

CURRENT HOURS: 57.70 .

PREVIOUS BALANCE: $19,526.57 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: £9.00-

PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: $7.316.00

PLUS GUR COSTS: $222.94 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: §27,056.51
FILE# 1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE (10)

CURRENT HOURS:  0.00 .

PREVIOUS BALANCE: $7,086.02 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $0.00

“LUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: $0.00

Us CUR COSTS: EQUALS NEW BALANCE: $7.086.02

$0.00

(10
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STATEMENT

'2503-10-.000

FILE# 1006 LABOR RELATIONS
CURRENT HOURS: 87.75
PREVIOUS BALANCE:

PLUS LATE CHARGES:

" JS CUR COSTS:

FILE# 1024 ULP 1883
CURRENT HOURS: 22.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES:
PLUS CUR COSTS:

MAY 21, 1996

$38,961.78
~$0.00
$448.57

$0.00
$0.00
$24.80

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE;

TOTAL OF PREVIOUS STATEMENT BALANCES:

MINUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT PAYMENTS:

UNPAID FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENTS: $185,344.10

PLUS:

PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT I
TOTAL OF CURRENT FEES:
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT COSTS:

NTEREST:

EQUALS: TOTAL BALANCE DUE THIS STATEMENT:

STATEMENT DATE: MAY 21,1996  FILE# 1000

RUIZ & SCHAPIROQO

PAGE 2

(10)
$0.00
$11,407.50
$50,817.85

(10)
$0.00

$2,787.50
$2,812.30

$185,353.10
$9.00-

$0.00
$24,458.50
$864 .88




STATEMENT

MAY 17, 1996

CELIA M. RUIZ

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO -
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOO
SAN FRANCISCOQ, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. ‘

GILROY, CA 95020
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

(10)

FILE# 1015 ARBALLO

FILE# 1015 ARBALLO (10)

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COS3TS
5710796 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 2.00

: T 32.00

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: 568,40

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: MAY 17,4896 FILE# 1013

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT

MAY 17, 1996

CELIAM. RUIZ

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN COLLEGE _
5065 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTN: DR. MAYLE ]
| N\

FILE# 1019 CONSTRUCTION (10)

FILE# 1019 CONSTRUCTION (10)

PREVIOUSLY BILLED AND UNPAID AMOUNTS, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: MAY 17,1996  FILE# 1018

RUIXZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT

FILE# 1014 CSEA

CELIA M. RUIZ

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

FILE# 1014 CSEA

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

DEF

DEF

DEF

DEF

Gk
DEF

CMR
DEF

DEF

CMR

DEF

DEF

CMR
WMQ

1AD

4/03/96

4/05/96

4/08/96

4/09/96

4/12/96
4/15/96

4/18/96
4/18/96
4/19/96

4/22/96
4/22/96

A/24/96

4/25796
4/25/96

4/25/9%6
4/25/96

FACTUAL INVESTIGATION OF POSSIBILITY OF ISSUES RAISED IN ESTRADA
DISCIPLINE AS FOUNDATION FOR COMPLIANCE HEARING OR OTHER NEGATIVE
ACTIONS BY UNION AGAINST DISTRICT.

REVIEW FINAL ORDER SENT BY PERB. DRAFT LETTER TO PERB SAN
FRANCISCO OFFICE RE COMPLIANCE WITH TERMS OF ORDER.

TELEPHONE CALL TO PERB RE COMPLIANCE DATE OF FINAL DECISION BASED
ON LETTER ACCOMPANYING FINAL DECISION. FILE MEMO RE SAME.
CONFIRMING LETTER TQ PERB RE SAME. DRAFT OF COMPLIANCE
NOTIFICATION LETTER TO SAN FRANCISCO REGICNAL DIRECTOR AS
REQUIRED BY ORDER.

TELEPHONE CALL WITH PERB RE COMPLIANCE REPORT AS REQUIRED BY
FINAL ORDER. REVISE COMPLIANCE LETTER.

PREPARE COMPLIANCE REPORT.

REVISIONS TO COMPLIANCE LETTER TO PERB. FACTUAL INVESTIGATION RE
SAME.

REVIEW FINDINGS AND ISSUE ON WHETHER DISTRICT CAN OPEN
INVESTIGATION.

FACTUAL INVESTIGATION REGARDING ACTUAL STEPS TAKEN N COMPLIANCE
WITH FiNAL ORDER.

REVIEW LETTER FROM ANITA MARTINEZ OF SAN FRANCISCO PERB RE
WRITTEN NOTICE OF COMPLIANCE ACTIONS TAKEN RE ORDER. FACTUAL
INVESTIGATION RE COMPLIANCE ACTIONS, REVISE LETTER TO PERB RE
SAME.

PREPARE TRANSCRIPTS AND QVERVIEW FOR BOARD PREGENTATION; ATTEND
BOARD.

REVIEW LETTER FROM REGIONAL DIRECTOR OF PERB RE SPECIFIC
REQUIREMENTS FOR COMPLIANCE NOTIFICATION. FACTUAL INVESTIGATION
RE SAME, INCLUDING STATUS OF NAMED PARTIES AND UNION ATTEMPTS TO
NEGOTIATE, REVISE LETTER TO PERB RE SAME.

FACTUAL INVESTIGATION RE DETAILS REQUIRED BY MARTINEZ LETTER
REGARDING WRITTEN NOTIFICATION OF COMPLIANCE WITH PERB ORDER.
REVISIONS TO COMPLIANCE LETTER BASED ON SAME. LEGAL. RESEARCH RE
TREATMENT OF FACULTY PETITION AS PART OF BOARD REVIEW OF
COMPLIANGE WITH PERB ORDER ALLOWING FOR DISCUSSION AT CLOSED
SESSION. :

REVIEW ISSUES RE INVESTIGATION.

REVISE AND EDIT TRUSTEE'S STATEMENT RE 1739/41 MATTER; CONFER RE
CHANGES; REVISE SUBSEQUENT DRAFT.

RESEARCH RE TESTIMONY DURING ULP 1739/1741 HEARINGS;

REVIEW DOCUMENTS ON FILE REGARDING REQUESTS TGO NEGOTIATE AND
OTHER SPECIFIC COMPLIANGCE REPORT ISSUES OF FACT. REVISE
COMPLIANCE LETTER TO PERB RE SAME,

MAY 17, 1998

1.50 &

2.00

501/,

1.75 rﬁ/

4.25 w?
1.50 #/

20

FEES
162.50
357.50

227.50

97.50

65.00
32.50

130.00
55.00

162.50

195.00

195.00

260.00

65.00
227.50

510.00
195.00



STATEMENT
| 2503-10-1014 MAY 17, 1996 PAGE 2

23. og,fm

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CMR HOURS:  3.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $455.00
WMQ HOURS:  1.75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $227.50
IAD HOURS: 4.25 @ $120.00 PER HOUR $510.00
DEF HOURS: 13.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1755.00
NET TOTAL HOURS: 23.00 NET TOTAL FEES: $2947.50

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: ‘ COSTS
5/10/96 CURRENT POSTAGE CHARGES. 2.15
5/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. : 98.40
5/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES. '_ ©3.02
5/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. _34.00

$137 57

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT : $111,770.60
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE:  MAY 17,1996 FILE# 1014

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ ) MAY 17, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCGISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-8005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD,

GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR, GLENN MAYLE LE

FILE# 1013 DIAZ

FILE# 1013 DIAZ

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COsTS
5/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 29.00
$25.00
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT : $7,385.43

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE 00,

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: MAY 17,1996  FILE# 1013

RUIZ & SCHAPIROQ
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STATEMENT

Y CELIA M. RUIZ MAY 17, 1996

RUIZ & SCHAFPIRO

8600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVIILAN JOINT CCD
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTN: DR. GLENN MAYLE ‘3 { /

[ S BRI WA ST H ¢ A SO R FOR U8 o R R o P

FILE# 1023 DIAZ-FMLA

PREVIOUSLY BILLED AND UNPAID AMOUNTS, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: MAY 17, 1996  FILE# 1023

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT

CELIAM. RUIZ MAY 17, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 84111

TELEPHONE {415) 395-8005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE ¥
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD, st
GILROY, CA 95020 &
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE e

1001 GAVILAN GENERAL

Fere o

FILE# 1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE (10}
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
DEF  4/02/96 LEGAL RESEARCH RE EDUCATION CODE DISCIPLINE PROVISIONS AS APPLIED 3.25 422,50
TO FACTS OF CASE AT HAND. DRAFT PORTION OF MEMORANDUM RE SAME,
REVISE MEMORANDUM.
DEF  4/03/96 REVIEW DISTRICT HANDBOOCK, POLICY MANUAL, COLLECTIVE BARGAINING C 3.25 422.50

AGREEMENT FOR CLASSIFIED EMPLOYEES, AND OTHER DOCUMENTS RE
ABILITY TO DISCIPLINE AS WELL AS FORMAL REQUIREMENTS TO IMPLEMENT
DISCIPLINE, LEGAL RESEARCH RE SAME. DRAFT SECTIONS OF MEMORANDUM
RE EVALUATION PROCEEDURE AS REQUIRING STRICT COMPLIANCE WITH
FORMAL CB8A PROVISIONS TO AVOID ULP, GRIEVANCE AND/OR COMPLIANCE

HEARING.

1 4/04/96 LETTERS TO M. BRADSHAW RE MARIA DIAZ - SETTLEMENT AND RELEASE. .50 60.00
L 4/04/96 RESEARCH RE EDUCATION CODE DISCIPLINE SECTIONS APPLICABLE TO .75 97.50
‘ CASE. CONFERENCE WITH JLS RE SAME. REVISIONS TO MEMORANDUM RE
SAME. .
1AD 4/05/96 REVISIONS TO LETTER TO M. BRADSHAW RE MARIA DIAZ SETTLEMENT - .75 90.00

SIGNING OF RESIGNATION AND RELEASE IN CONJUNCTION WITH SETTLEMENT
OF WORKERS’ COMP CLAIMS.

DEF  4/08/96 PREPARATION OF SUSPENSION DOCUMENTS AND SUPPORTING ATTACHMENTS 2.25 292.50
AND EXHIBITS. REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS RE SAME.

CMR  4/11/96 REVIEW ULP AND TC WITH AMES; TC WITH MAYLE AND AMES; FOLLOW UP. 3.50 455,00

DEF 4/12/96 REVIEW MEMORANDUM AND DICTATE LETTER TO DR. MAYLE RE NEED TQ HAVE .50 65.00
HUMAN RESOURCES UPDATE AND IMPLEMENT CERTAIN POLICIES SUCH AS
FAMILY LEAVE ACT PROVISIONS.

CMR  4/15/96 PREPARE ESTRADA TERMINATION. 1.00 130.00

DEF  4/15/96 DICTATE LETTER REGARDING CHANGES TO EMPLOYMENT POLIGIES TO COMPLY .50 65.00
WITH NEW AND REVISED LEAVE PROVISIONS.

DEF  4/15/96 LEGAL RESEARCH RE SUSPENSION OR LETTER OF WARNING AS ALTERNATIVE .75 97.50
TO DISMISSAL.

DEF 4/16/96 REVISE LETTER REGARDING MEMORANDUM OF CHANGES IN STATUS OF LAW. .25 32.50

DEF 4/17/96 LEGAl. RESEARCH REGARDING CONTRACTING OUT OF FUNCTIONS CURRENTLY .50 65.00
PERFORMED BY DISTRICT EMPLOYEES.

tAD 4/18/96 REVIEW OF MARIA DIAZ LETTER FROM M. BRADSHAW. .25 30.00

DEF 4/18/96 |LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING USE OF QUTSIDE WORKERS AND/OR .50 65.00
CONTRACTING OUT OF BARGAINING UNIT FUNCTIONS.

DEF 4/19/96 REVISE SUSPENSION PAPERS. DRAFT SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS. .75 97.50

WMQ  4/22/96 ESTRADA MATTER: REVIEW FILE AND DEF DRAFTS; REVIEW MATERIALS RE 1.70 221.00
ESTRADA FROM ULP CASES, ANALYZE ATTENDANCE HISTORY; CONF. CMR RE
RECOMMENDATIONS. :

DFEE  4/22/96 ANALYZE AND PREPARE SUMMARY OF ABSENCES AS TO CONNECTION WITH 1.75 227.50
WEEKEND AND/OR HOLIDAY PERIQDS, FACTUAL INVESTIGATION RE SAME,

Wivid  4/23/96 1D RE ANALYSIS OF ATTENDANCE DATA; STATISTICAL REVIEW; 1.50 185.00

SIGNIFICANCE; HOLIDAY AND WEEKEND ATTENDANCE PATTERNS; OUTCOMES
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STATEMENT

2503-10-1001

IAD

i

DEF

IAD

DEF

WMQ
DEF

DEF

4723796

4/24/96

4/24/96

4725796

4125796

4/26/96
4/26/96

4729796
4/29/96

4/30/96

MAY 17, 1996

CALCULATING AND ANALYZING ESTRADA ABSENCES FOR PATTERNS OF
ABSENCES; PREPARATION OF WRITTEN MEMOS RE SAME.

DRAFTING AND REVISING BOARD'S RESPONSE TO COMMUNICATIONS FROM
“CONCERNED EMPLOYEES" RE JUDGE LINK'S DECISION ON ULP 1739/1741;
REVIEW OF TRANSGRIPTS OF ULP HEARINGS.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH HOWARD BELL REGARDING 5TATUS OF
PERFORMANCE APPRAISAL FOR PAST YEAR, PROCEEDURE TO FOLLOW FOR
UPCOMMING APPRAISAL, ABSENCES IN PAST MONTH, AND DECISION TO
CHANGE FROM A NOTICE OF PROPOSED SUSPENSION TO AWRITTEN
REPRIMAND TO BE PLACED IN PERSONNEL FILE. FACTUAL INVESTIGATION
REGARDING PRIOR ORAL AND WRITTEN WARNINGS. REVIEW DISTRICT
POLICIES AND PROCEEDURES REGARDING DISCIPLINE AND WARNINGS. LEGAL
RESEARCH RE PROCEEDURE TO FOLLOW FOR PLACEMENT OF WARNING IN
PERSONNEL FILE. REVISE DRAFT DOCUMENTS TO EMPLOYEE RE SAME.
DRAFTING AND REVISING LETTER TO DR. MAYLE RE BOARD'S RESPONSE TO
COMMUNICATIONS FROM GAVILAN EMPLOYEES; REVIEW OF TRANSCRIPTS OF
ULP HEARINGS RE SEXIST/RACIST REMARKS IN THE MAINTENANCE
DEPARTMENT.

REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS PROVIDED BY DISTRICT REGARDING USE OF WORKERS
COMPENSATION LEAVE AND POTENTIAL FOR LITIGATION OF DISABILITY
DISCRIMINATION OR RETALIATION CLAIM. DRAFT PORTIONS OF CLIENT
LETTER RE SAME. REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING REQUESTS FOR
ACCOMODATION AND ACCOMODATIONS MADE WITH AND WITHOUT REQUEST.
REVISE LETTER TO ESTRADA RE ABSENCES.

DRAFTING OF CLIENT LETTER EXPLAINING RATIONALE FOR ISSUING LETTER
OF REPRIMAND RATHER THAN PROPOSING DISCIPLINE, FOCUSING ON THE
UNIQUE FACTUAL CIRCUMSTANCES, THE ISSUE OF PROGRESSIVE

DISCIPLINE, THE ISSUE OF PERFORMANCE APPRAISAL REQUIREMENTS, THE
ISSUE OF REQUIREMENTS FOR PLACING NEGATIVE MATERIALS IN PERSONNEL
FILES, ETC.

REVIEW AND REVISION OF SPECIAL MEETING AGENDA, :

DRAFT ANALYSIS OF PROPER PROCEEDURES TO FOLLOW UNDER THE EXISTING
PROVISIONS OF THE CBA TO ALLOW FOR COST-EFFECTIVE AND SUSTAINABLE
DISCIPLINARY ACTIONS IN THE FUTURE. REVISE CLIENT LETTER RE SAME.
FINAL REVISIONS TO LETTER OF REPRIMAND. DRAFTING OF CLIENT LETTER
EXPLAINING RATIONALE FOR CURRENT ACTION, PROPER IMPLEMENTATION OF
GURRENT ACTION, FACTUAL ISSUES WHICH PLAYED SIGNIFICANT ROLE IN '
DECISION TO TAKE CURRENT ACTION, PROPER FUTURE DOCUMENTATION AND
PERFORMANCE APPRAISALS TO ALLOW DISTRICT TO HAVE BETTER POSITION
TO IMPLEMENT FORMAL DISCIPLINE IN FUTURE IF ATTENDANCE DOES NOT
SIGNIFICANTLY IMPROVE. REVISIONS TO SAME.

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CMR HOURS: 4.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $585.00
WMQ HOURS:  4.45 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $578.50
IAD HOURS: 18.50 @ $120.00 PER HOUR  $2220.00
DEF HOURS: 30.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $3932.50
NET TOTAL HOURS: 57.70 NET TOTAL FEES: $7316.00

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

4/26/96
5/10/96
5/10/96
5/10/96
5/10/96
5/10/96

COMPUTER RESEARCH.

CURRENT POSTAGE CHARGES.

CURRENT PHOTQCOPY CHARGES.

CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES.

CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES.
CURRENT MESSENGER SERVICE CHARGES.

MENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
5/15/96

$3.00 CREDIT FOR ERROR ON 2/20/98 STATEMENT.

PAGE 2

5.50 660.00
5.00 600.00
3.25 422.50
5.50 660.00
2.75 357.50
1.25 162.50
3.25 422.50
1.00 120.00
2.50 325.00
3.50 455.00
57.70 $7.316.00
COSTS

62.00

1.33

75.20

32.14

29.50

22.77

$222.94
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) STATEMENT
[ 2503-10-1001 MAY 17, 1996 _ PAGE 3

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $19,526.57

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE : $7.,538.94

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $39..00-
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: MAY 17,1986  FILE# 1001

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

26



STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415} 395-3005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD

FILE# 1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE

660 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR

MAY 17, 1996

FILE# 1016 JOMHNSONS WRIT OF MANDATE

STATEMENT DATE: MAY 17, 1996  FILE# 1016

PREVIQUSLY BILLED AND UNPAID AMOUNTS, PLEASE PAY

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT

CELIAM. RUIZ

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

500 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 84111

TELEPHONE (415} 395-3005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

MAY 17, 1996

GILROY, CA 95020
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

FILE# 1006 LABOR RELATIONS

EHR

CMR
MT

CMR
DEF

CMR
DEF

DEF

CMR

DEF

CMR

WMQ

DEF

whMQ

DEF

CHR

CMR

4/01/96
4701796

4/02/96
4/02/96

4/04/96
4/04/96

4/05/96

4/08/96
4708796

4/09/96

4/09/96

4/09/96

£/10/96
4/10/96
4/11/96
4/11/96
4/12/96

FILE# 1006 LABOR RELATIONS

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINGE THE LAST STATEMENT:

TC WITH MAYLE AND SCHAPIRO; PREPARE NEGOTIATION STRATEGY.
REVIEW COLLECTIVE BARGAINING; ED. CODE REQUIREMENTS RE: ISSUES IN
HIRING TEMPORARY EMPLOYEES AND CONSULTANTS FOR BUSINESS SERVICES
DEPT.

PREPARE STATISTICS.

CONFERENCE RE PROPOSAL FOR NEXT NEGOTIATING SESSION. LEGAL
RESEARCH RE REGRESSIVE BARGAINING.

PREPARE COUNTER PROPOSAL.

REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS NECESSARY TO DRAFT RESPONSE TO UNION PROPOSAL
NUMBER 4. CONFERENCE RE SAME. DRAFT COUNTER-PROFOSAL AND
RATIONALE FOR RELEVANT SECTIONS. REVISE SAME, LEGAL RESEARCH RE
POTENTIAL CHARGE OF REGRESSIVE BARGAINING BASED ON CHANGES IN
DISTRICT PROPOSAL. DRAFT MEMORANDUM RE SAME. LEGAL RESEARCH RE
ABILITY TO EXCLUDE UNIONS DEMAND THAT LIFE INSURANCE BE INCLUDED

IN CAFETERIA BENEFIT PLAN, DRAFT MEMORANDUM RE SAME

LEGAL RESEARCH RE IRS RULES ON CAFETERIA BENEFIT PLANS AND
REGRESSIVE BARGAINING CASELAW FOR CHANGES TO BARGAINING
PROPOSALS. REVISE FILE MEMORANDUM RE SAME. PREPARE FOR NEXT
BARGAINING SESSION.

PREPARATION FOR FACULTY NEGOQTIATIONS; ATTEND FACULTY
NEGOTIATIONS.

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MR. FREY OF CTA REGARDING FACULTY
SALARY COMPARISON RANKINGS. MEMORANDUM AND CONFERENCE RE SAME,
REGRESSIVE BARGAINING, AND THE EXCLUSION OF LIFE INSURANCE FROM
CAFETERIA BENEFIT PLAN. PREPARE RANKING CHARTS FOR NEGOTIATING
SESSION. ' : _
PREPARATION FOR NEGOTIATIONS.

TELECON RE FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS; QUANTITATIVE ANALYSIS OF WAGE
GROWTH IN OTHER CCDS: COMPARISON WIiTH GEOGRAPHIC REGION; PREPARE
GRAPHICS OF RESULTS FOR USE IN NEGOTIATIONS.

CONFERENCE RE PREPARATIONS FOR SALARY ISSUE NEGOTIATIONS
PREPARATION OF RANKINGS CHARTS AND COMPARISONS OVER FIVE YEAR
PERIOD. REVIEW AND REVIZE DOCUMENTS RE SAME.

CONTINUE WORK ON FACULTY NEGOTIATION MATERIALS, SALARY AND
DEMOGRAPHIC ANALYSES, MSG FROM CMR RE WVE COMPUTER MODEL.
REVIEW, PREPARE AND REVISE DOCUMENTS RE SALARY NEGOTIATIONS.
CONFERENCE RE FIVE YEAR COMPARISONS OF SIMILAR SCHOOLS. PREPARE
DOCUMENTS RE SAME,

REVIEW FINANGIAL INFORMATION AND DATA.

CONTINUE WORK ON SALARY DATA FOR FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS, CONF. RE
SAME: CONFER RE ADDITIONAL ANALYSIS, GRAPHICS.

FINANCIAL ANALYSIS IN PREPARATION FOR NEGOTIATIONS.

(10)
HOURS
1.50M

2.00 ¥

50
gg i

12

5.25

FEES

195

65,
3z.

130,
552.

617.

975.

130.

185,

682.

227.

617.

227.

195.
357,

130.
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STATEMENT g ¢

r F
2503-10-1008 MAY 17, 1996 U ; z{% [ PAGE 2
WMQ  4/12/96 CONTINUE WORK ON DATA ANALYSIS FOR FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS, CHARTS, 3,250 422 .50
CMR  4/15/96 PREPARE FOR FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS. 2.00 260.00
v 7 4/15/96 TELECON RE FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS; REVISE DRAFTS OF EXHIBITS FOR 6.75N  877.50

FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS, INC. NEW DATA.
CMR  4/16/96 PREPARATION FOR NEGOTIATION; NEGOTIATION SESSION. 5.00 ;{ 650,00
WMQ  4/16/96 TELECON W/ A.R. RE NEW FIGURES. .25 32.50
CMR  4/18/96 REVIEW BUDGET AND PROPOSALS: PREPARE ROSTER; REVIEW DATA IN 1.004  130.00
PREPARATION.
WMQ  4/18/96 CONF FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS; DATA ANALYSIS; POSSIBLE CONTINGENCY .50 y 65.00
PROPOSAL.
CMR  4/19/96 FOLLOW-UP INVESTIGATION. 750 97.50
CMR  4/22/96 FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS., 4,00 #/ 520.00
CMR  4/23/96 PREPARE FACULTY NEGOTIATION AND COUNTER BASED UPON CONTINGENCY 1.75 227.50
LANGUAGE.
WMQ  4/23/96 REVIEW CCD BUDGET DATA; TELECON LARRY SCHAPIRC RE CONTEMPLATED 4.00J 520.00
PROPOSAL, DRAFT PROPOSAL NO. 6 AND RATIONALE; DRAFT LTR TO GEM;
CONFER RE PROPOSAL AND TSA ISSUES.
CMR  4/24/96 PREPARE GOUNTER PROPOSALS. 1.00N 130.00
WMQ  4/24/96 FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS: REVISE PROPOSAL NO. 6; CONFER RE OPTIONS TO 1.50 195.00
AVOID IMPASSE.
CMR  4/25/96 REVISED AND DRAETED NUMEROUS PROPOSALS TO REVIEW WITH DR MAYLE 2 50N 325.00
FOR APPROVAL: FAXED LETTER TO MAYLE RE CONTINGENCY LANGUAGE;
PREPARE FOR NEGOTIATIONS. J
WMQ  4/25/96 FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS; REVIEW DR. MAYLE'S EDIT TO PROPOSAL; CONFER .25 32.50
RE PROPOSAL. .
CMR  4/26/96 FOLLOW UP AND PREPARE PROPOSALS AND STATISTICS ON DEFICIENCY 1.00 p{ 130.00
SPENDING AND ENDING FUND BALANGE.
WMQ  4/26/96 ANALYZE RESERVE BALANGE DURING PAST FIVE YEARS; RESULTS OF 3 .50;4 455,900
OPERATIONS: DEFICIT SPENDING PATTERNS, .
CMR  4/29/96 PREPARE AND PARTICIPATE IN FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS. 4008 520.00
verq  4/29/96 GCONFER RE FINANCIAL RESULTS VS. SALARY GROWTH; TELECON RE IMPASSE 75T, 97.50
: ISSUES: ID RE RESEARCH ON IMPASSE. .
1.00L  130.00

CMR - 4/30/96 FOLLOW UP ON IMPASSE ISSUES.
B7.75  $11,407.50

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CHMR HOURS: 3B8.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $5005.00
WMQ HOURS: 33.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $4355.00
MT HOURS: 2.60 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $260.00
DEF HOURS: 13.75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1787.50

NET TOTAL HOURS: 87.75 NET TOTAL FEES: $11407.50
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
5/10/96 CURRENT POSTAGE CHARGES. 5.50
5/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 130.00
5/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES. 40.57
5/10/96 CURRENT WORD PROCESSING CHARGES. 10.00
5/10/96 CURRENT TRAVEL, TOLLS & PARKING CHARGES. 180.00
5/10/96 - CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 34.50
5/10/96 CURRENT EXPEDITED MAIL CHARGES, 48.00
$448.57
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $38,961.78

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: MAY 17,1986  FILE# 1008

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ MAY 21, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 85020

ATTN: DR. GLENN MAYLE

FILE# 1024 ULP 1883 (10)
FILE# 1024 ULP 1883 (10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS ¥ FEES
CMR  4/12/96 FOLLOW UP ON NEW ULP AND FACTUAL ISSUES, Vil 97.50
CMR  4/15/96 PREPARE RESPONSE. 1.00 7 130.00
CMR  4/15/96 PREPARE RESPONSE.. 1.00 < 130.00
WMGQ  4/18/96 REVIEW AND ANALYZE CHARGE; TELECON PERB RE EXTENSION; 4,50 - - 5B5.00

CONFIRMATION LETTER; CMR AND DEF RE RESPONSE TO CHARGE; L.GL RSCH
RE TIMELINESS ISSUE; RSCH RE IMPASSE AND FACTFINDING PROCEDURES;
REPRESENTATIONS DURING BARGAINING.
WMQ  4/19/96 NEW 1883 ULP CHARGE; REVIEW FACTFINDING FILES, FACTUAL STATEMENTS 5.25 ~ 682.50
AND BASIS; BENEFIT PROPOSALS; LIBRARY RESEARCH RE FACTFINDING AND
SETTLEMENT ENFORCEMENT.
AN 4/19/96 REVIEW OF ULP 1883; RESEARCH RE GAVILAN DEFENSES AND STRATEGY, 6.50:¢ 780.00
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE RE STRATEGY AND DEFENSES; RESEARCH AT PERB
LIBRARY RE CASES ON GOOD FAITH DUTY DURING IMPASSE, AND PERB'S

POWER TO ENFORCE AGREEMENTS BY THE PARTIES. L
wMQ  4/20/96 BEGIN WORK ON RESPONSE TO 1883 CHARGE; REVIEW EERA CASES, 1.50% 195.00
CMR  4/22/96 REVIEW |SSUES WITH BOARD; DISCUSS ISSUES WITH DR MAYLE AND REVIEW .TS’I 97.50
FILE IN PREPARATION.FOR MEETING.
IAD 4/30/96 RESEARCH RE PERB IMPASSE PROCEDURES. 51 50.00

22.00 $2,787.50

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CMR HOURS:  3.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $455.00
WMQ HOURS: 11.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1462.50
TAD HOURS: 7.25 @ $120.00 PER HOUR $870.00
NET TOTAL HOURS: 22.00 NET TOTAL FEES: $2787.50

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
5/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. _ 24.80
T T$24.80

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $0.00

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: MAY 21,1996  FILE# 1024

RUIZ & SCHAPIRC




CELIAM. RUIZ
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREE
SAN FRANCISCO, ca 9411
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT Co

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD,
GILROY, CA 95020

FILE# 1000 SUMMARY FILE

FILE# 1015 ARBALLO -
CURRENT HOURS: 0.25
PREViOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES;
PLUS CUR COosTS:

FILE# 1019 CONSTRUCTION
CURRENT HOURS: 0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE:

PLUS LATE CHARGES:

- PLUS CUR cOSTS:

F' ¥ 1014 CSEA
v ~RRENT HOURS: 78,75
PREVIOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES;
PLUS CUR COsTs:

ILE# 1013 DIAZ
CURRENT HOURS: 30.75
PREVIOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES;
PLUS CUR COSTs:

'LE# 1023 DIAZ-FMLA
CURRENT HOURS: .00
PREVIOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES:,
°LUS CUR CosTs:

E# 1001 GAVILAN GENE
‘URRENT HOURS: 12.50
‘REVIOUS BALANCE:

LUS LATE CHARGES;

LUS CuURr COsTS;

RAL LEGAL ADVICE

#1018 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE
JRRENT HOURS: 0.00

REVIOUS BALANGE:
US LATE CHARGES:
' “UR cosTs:

7, 14TH FLOOR
1

MMUNITY COLLEGE

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

STATEMENT

$1,500.80 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
$0.00 PLUS CUR FEES.
$2.80

375.60 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
$0.00 PLUS CUR regs;

$0.00, EQUALS NEw BALANCE:
$120,889 .69 . MINUS cuRr PAYMENTS:
$0.00 PLUS CUR FEEs:
$162,17. EQUALS NEW BALANCE:
$1,997.90

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS;
30.00/’ PLUS CUR FEES:

$2,290.33 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:
$531. 00 MINUS cuRr PAYMENTS:
$0.00 PLUS CUR FEEs:
30,00 EQUALS NEw BALANCE;
$24,125.98

MINUS cur PAYMENTS:
$0.00 PLUS CUR FEEs:

$783.60 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

$7,086.02 MINUS cur PAYMENTS:
$0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:

$0.00 EQUALS NEW BALANGE:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

{\"} Ri=cre o2

APRIL 12, 1806

(10)

(10)

319,258 76.] .
$9,977.50
$111,770.60

(10)

(10)

{(10)

$1,595,00

(10)




.
'y

STATEMENT

2503-10-1000

APRIL 12, 1996

FILE# 1017 JOHNSON'S DFEH COMPLAINT

CURRENT HOURS:  0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE:
LUS LATE CHARGES:

PLUS CUR COSTS:

FILE# 1021 JOHNSON TORT
CURRENT HOURS: 79.00
PREVIOUS BAILLANCE:

PLUS LATE CHARGES:
PLUS CUR COSTS:

FILE# 1006 LABOR RELATIONS
CURRENT HOURS: 119.25
PREVIOUS BALANCE:

PLUS LATE CHARGES;
PLUS CUR COSTS:

$6.40 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
$0,00 PLUS CUR FEES:
$0.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:
$23,832.26 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
$0.00 , PLUS CUR FEES:
$283.9 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:;
$30,647.62 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS;
30.00 PLUS CUR FEES:
$536.35 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

TOTAL OF PREVIOUS STATEMENT BALANCES:

MINUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT PAYMENTS:

UNPAID FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENTS: $159,931.33

PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT INTEREST:
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT FEES:
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT COSTS:

EQUALS: TOTAL BALANCE DUE THIS STATEMENT:

STATEMENT DATE: APRIL 12,1996 FILE# 1000

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

PAGE 2
(10)
$0.00
$0.00
36,46
(10}
$14,560.09
1,0 3000 $10,030. 0r
~44_42§z1%$5_ﬁ $19,586.11
10,2130
16,5¢ (10)
$7.724 .69.
$15,502.50
$38.961.78
$210.693.27
$50,761.94.
$0.00
$40,955.00




s " STATEMENT

CELIAM. RUIZ : APRIL 12, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020 ,
ATTENTION: DR, GLENN MAYLE ) O
I~

FILE# 101

HARE I A AR

FILE# 1015 ARBALLO

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES

IAD 3/27/96 REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM M. BRADSHAW RE ARBALLO SUBPOENA. .25 30.00
25 $30.00

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
IAD HOURS:  0.25 @ $120.00 PER HOUR $30.00

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
4/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES, ’ 2.80
$2. 80

YMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
+/15/96 31,465.20 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $1,500.80

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE : $32.80

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY:.

STATEMENT DATE: APRIL 12, 1996 FILE# 1015

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

10



ot STATEMENT

CELIAM. RUIZ APRIL 12, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD, ,,
GILROY, CA 95020 | O
ATTN: DR. MAYLE f

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
3/15/96 $52.30 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU,

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY:

TS emmsesenmnoe s 2DUerte Dinsesl L INT T gty e emim s R
- FESS T o TR, G geeere—— w

e "o ot T St R e
e . —_————— e e

STATEMENT DATE: APRIL 12,1996  FILE# 1019

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

11



STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ _ APRIL 12, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

A s

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE | /
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD., P9
GILROY, CA 95020
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE LA

FILE# 1014 CSEA

FILE# 1014 CSEA : (10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
CMR  3/01/96 REVIEW OPTIONS AND ALTERNATIVES TO APPEAL ULP 1039/41, C2.004 260.00
WMQ 3/01/96 REVIEW ALJ OPINION IN 1739/41; POSSIBLE APPEAL ISSUES AND 3.254 . 422.50
GROUNDS; TELECON PERB RE APPEAL: TELECON CMR.
KON 3/01/96 CONFER RE: ANALYZING APPEALABILITY OF ALJ'S PROPOSED QRDER; 4.75 & 617.50
REVIEW PROPOSED ORDER & POST HEARING BRIEES TO DETERMINE POSSIBLE
BASES FOR APPEAL,

KON 3/02/96 RESEARCH RE: STANDARD OF REVIEW BY PERB FOR PROPOSED ORDER: 3.004  390.00
, PREPARE MEMO RE: SAME. ,

CMR  3/04/96 TC WITH WHELAN AND LETTER TO PEARL.

YN 3/04/96 FINALIZE MEMO RE: STARD OF APPEAL RE: ALJ ORDER: CONEER RE:
RESULTS OF RESEARCH; RESEARCH POTENTIAL CLAIMS AGAINST CSEA FOR
DISTRIBUTION OF SUMMARY OF ALJ'S ORDERS; PREPARE DEMAND LETTER TO
CSEA RE: DISTRIBUTION OF SUMMARY; ANALYZE ALJ ORDER AND
POST-HEARING BRIEFS TO DETERMINE APPEALABLE FACTUAL AND LEGAL
ISSUES.

KON 3/05/96 PREPARE ANALYSIS OF ALJ DECISION FOR POSSIBLE APPEAL:; DRAFT MEMO 5.75¢  747.50
RE: SAME; CONFER RE; DECISION ANALYSIS AND STRATEGY: PREPARE
LETTERS TO CSEA AND PERB RE: EXTENSION OF TIME TO APPEAL
DECISION; PREPARE CHRONOLOGY OF FAGTS RELIED ON BY ALJ IN SUPPORT
OF DECISION.

CMR  3/06/96 PREPARE FACT SUMMARY FOR BOARD OF EDUCATION; TC WITH PERE: 1.504 195,00
PREPARE EXTENSION OF TIME; TC WITH DR MAYLE RE FUTURE COURSE OF
ACTION: LETTER TO PEARL RE MEETING; TC TO PARKER: TC TO PEARL.

KON 3/06/96 REVIEW AND REVISE ANALYSIS OF ALJ DECISION; PREPARE MEMORANDUM 7.00  910.00
FOR BOARD ANALYZING; PREPARE REQUEST TO PERB FOR EXTENSION OF
TIME TO APPEAL ALJ DECISION. ‘ 7

KON 3/07/36 DRAFT LETTER TO CSEA RE: POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT: REVIEW AND REVISE 7.50 97500 | :
MEMO FOR BOARD ANALYZING ALJ DECISION; PREPARE STATEMENT FOR —— |
PUBLIC DISTRIBUTION RE: ALJ DECISION; PREPARE STATEMENT FOR BOARD i
PRESIDENT TO READ AT PUBLIC MEETING; PREPARE LIST OF ANTICIPATED
QUESTIONS AND PROPOSED ANSWERS FOR BOARD; ANALYZE REPORT OF FAGT
FINDING PANEL FOR INCONSISTENCIES W/ ALJ DECISIONS.

130.00
715.00

88
BN

(S ]

JLS 3/08/96 DRAFT, REVIEW & EDIT BOARD QUESTIONS & ANSWERS, BOARD ORAL 5.75 L/ 747.50
STATEMENT & SUMMARY.
KON  3/08/96 REVIEW AND REVISE MEMO FOR BOARD ANALYZING ALJ DECISION; 5.50 y/ 715.00

STATEMENT FOR PUBLIC DISTRIBUTION RE: ALJ RULING; STATEMENT FOR
BOARD PRESIDENT TO MAKE TO PUBLIC AND LIST OF ANTICIPATED
QUESTIONS AND PROPOSED ANSWERS FOR THE BOARD.

3/12/96  PREPARATION FOR BOARD MEETING; PARTICIPATION AT BOARD MEETING: 6.00/  780.00
TRAVEL, ,
WMQ - 3/12/96 REVIEW ALJ DECISION; DRAFT STATEMENT FOR PRESIDENT AND BOARD. 2.50 ¢/ 325.00

WMQ  3/13/96 CONFER RE BOARD MEETING, PERB MATTER, .25 o/ 32.50 |

12



STATEMENT

2503-10-1014 : APRIL 12, 1996 PAGE 2

DEF 3/18/96 RE 1014A REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE 3.50(/ 455, 0(
PROPOSED ORDER, LEGAL RESEARCH RE ABILITY TO AVOID UNFAIR LABOR
PRACTICE PROCEEDURE IN FUTURE BY BRINGING A COMPLIANGE HEARING.
CMR  3/19/96 PREPARE FOLLOW UP. 50 2/ 65.0¢
DEF  3/21/96 1014A. CONFERENCE WITH CMR RE COMPLIANGE HEARINGS AS POSSIBLE 250 3250
METHOD TO AVOID FILING UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE CHARGES IN UPCOMMING
NEGOTIATIONS. FACTUAL INVESTIGATION RE SAME. TELEPHONE CONFERENCE
WITH SPECIALIST AT PERB RE SAME. DRAFT MEMO RE SAME.
JLS  3/22/96 REVIEW POSTING REQUIREMENTS & CONFER WITH DR. MAYLE RE SAME. 50 (/ 65.00
WMQ  3/22/96 TELECONS PERB -- STEWART, CHISHOLM, SMITH AND MCMONIGLE RE 1.50 ¢/  195.00
COMPLIANCE AUTHORITY; GEN COUNSEL ROLE IN ENFORGEMENT: LTRS TO
PERB AND WHELAN; CONFER RE APPEAL DECISION. |
WMQ  3/23/96 MEMO TO CMR RE PERB COMPLIANCE HEARINGS. 5 97 50
CMR  3/26/96 REVIEW POSTING. 1.00 ¥ 130.00
DEF  3/26/96 1014A. REVISE MEMORANDUM RE COMPLIANCE HEARINGS. CONFERENGE WITH 2.9  292.50
CMR RE SAME AND OTHER COMPLIANCE {SSUES SUCH AS POSTING AND
NOTIFICATION, REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE SAME. DRAFT LETTER TO MR, MAYLE

RE SAME. |
CMR  3/27/96 LETTER TO DR MAYLE RE POSTING AND FOLLOW UP. 50 65.00
DEF  3/27/96 CONFERENCE RE MEMORANDUM ON COMPLIANCE HEARING AND INFORMATION 2.50 )  325.00

REQUESTED BY DR, MAYLE. DRAFT AND REVISE LETTER TO DR. MAYLE RE
SAME, FINALITY OF PROPQOSED ORDER, IMPLEMENTATION OF SPECIFIC
REQUIREMENTS OF ORDER, POSTING REQUIREMENT ISSUES AND
NOTIFICATION OF COMPLIANCE REQUIREMENT,

. 76.75 $9,977.50

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CHR HOURS: 12.50 & $130.00 PER HOUR  $1625.00
JLS HOURS:  6.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $812.50
WMQ HOURS:  8.25 @ $130.00 PER HOIR  $1072.50
KON HOURS: 39.00 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $5070.00
DEF HOURS: 10.75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1397.50
NET TOTAL HOURS: 76.75 NET TOTAL FEES: $9977.50

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:; COSTS
4/10/96 CURRENT POSTAGE CHARGES, 915
4/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 154.00
4/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES. | 1.02

. 4/10/96 CURRENT WORD PROCESSING CHARGES, . 5.00
$162.17

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
9/01/95 $18,965.27 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU - CREDIT FOR PAST PAYMENT NOT
CREDITED.
3/15/96 $293.49 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.

ST T TRESE S =0T T BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:  $120,889.69
- e T o JREUS: - GHARGES - LISTED-ABOVE - ~«. - $10+139.67
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: __ $19.258 76-
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY:

STATEMENT DATE: APRIL 12,1996 FILE# 1014

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

13



STATEMENT

CELIAM. RUIZ APRIL 12, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

8§00 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCQ, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415} 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020 N 0
ATTENTION: DR, GLENN MAYLE /\

FILE# 1013 DIAZ

FILE# 1013 DIAZ | (10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS -FEES
JUS 3/01/96 CONFER RE VIDECTAPING, .25 32.50
CMR  3/04/96 PREPARE RELEASE ON DIAZ RESIGNATION. .50 65.00
1AD 3/04/96 LETTER TO M. BRADSHAW RE REQUEST FOR DIAZ DOCUMENTS: DRAFTING 3.50 420.00

RELEASE AND RESIGNATION LETTER; LETTER TO M. BRADSHAW RE RELEASE
AND RESIGNATION LETTER;

tAD 3/06/96 STRATEGY MEETING RE MARIA DIAZ. .25 30,00
MT 3/07/96 REVIEW AND REVISE LETTER TO DR. MAYLE RE: FMLA ISSUES. .75 - 97.50
IAD  .3/08/96 LETTER TO M. BRADSHAW RE DIAZ RELEASE AND TERMINATION. .50 60.00
CMR  3/11/96 REVIEW SETTLMENT POSSIBILITIES. ' .50 65.00
EMR  3/11/96 REVIEW FILE. .50 65.00
B 3/12/96 CALLS TO M. BRADSHAW RE DIAZ DOCUMENTS LETTER TO M. BRADSHAW RE .75 90.00
SAME.
CMR  3/13/96 REVIEW INVESTIGATION; UPDATE STATUS OF RESIGNATION; PREPARE 1.00 130.00
TERMINATICN.
‘HIAD 3/13/96 REVIEW OF INVESTIGATOR'S REPORT; REVIEW OF INVESTIGATOR'S VIDEQ 2.25 270.00
TAPES OF DIAZ; CALL TO INVESTIGATOR; RESEARCH RE NOTICE OF
TERMINATION.
CMR  3/14/96 RELEASE AND TERMINATION. 1.50 195.00
WMQ 3/14/96 CONFER RE DIAZ INVESTIGATION; REVIEW VIDEO SURV.; PLAN ADDITIONAL 75 97.50
INVESTIGATION.
iAD 3/14/96 REVIEW OF INVESTIGATOR'S VIDEO AND INVESTIGATION REPORT; CALLS TO 1 2.00 240.00

INVESTIGATOR DARREL BUMGARNER; LETTER TO DARREL BUMGARNER:
STRATEGY MEETING; CALLS TO JOHN HANSELL RE INFORMATION FOR NOTICE
OF TERMINATION; REVIEW OF JOHN HANSELL'S LOG AND OTHER DISTRICT
DOCUMENTS FROM HIM; DRAFTING OF NOTICE OF TERMINATION.

CMR  3/15/96 PREPARE TERMINATION. 1.00 130.00

JLS 3/15/96 CONFER RE VIDEOTAPING. .25 32.50

TAD. 3/15/96 CALLS TO JOHN HANSELL; DARREL BUMGARNER, AND M. BRADSHAW RE MARIA 1.00 120.00
DIAZ, .

IAD 3/16/96 LETTER TO M. BRADSHAW RE RELEASE AND RESIGNATION LETTER: DRAFTING 2.75 330,00
AND REVISING NOTICE OF TERMINATION RE DIAZ.

CMR  3/1B/96 PREPARE TERMINATION, .50 65.00

JLS 3/18/%6 REVIEW & EDIT NOTICE OF TERMINATION; CONFER RE SAME. 75 97.50

IAD 3/18/36 REVISIONS TO DIAZ NOTICE OF TERMINATION: REVIEW OF MARIA DIAZ 2.25 270.00

VIDEO FROM FRIDAY, MARCH 15; DRAFTING AND REVISING LETTER TO
VICTORIA LI AT CSEA RE DIAZ,

DEF 3/18/96 REVIEW DOCUMENTS, CONFERENCE RE STATUS, FACTUAL INVESTIGATION RE 1.25 162.50
ABILITY TO TERMINATE,

"R 3/19/96 PREPARE TERMINATION. .50 65.00

L0 3/19/96 REVISIONS TO DIAZ NOTICE OF TERMINATION AND CALL TO DR. MAYLE'S 1.50 180.00

OFFICE; REVISIONS TO LETTER TO VICTORIA LI AT CSEA; CALLS TO JOHN
HANSELL; PROOF OF SERVICE LETTER TO GAVILAN. ]

14



e STATEMENT

2503-10-1013 APRIL 12, 1996 PAGE 2

DEF  3/19/96 REVIEW AND REVISE MEMORANDUM RE OBLIGATIONS UNDER EMLA AND OTHER 1.25 162.50
LEAVE STATUTES AS TO DIAZ. CONFERENCE RE NEED TO REVISE PERSONEL
POLICY AND PRACTICE RE SAME.,

DEF  3/19/96 REVISE LETTER TO LI RE ADDITIONAL TRAINING: CONFER RE: SAME. 1.00 130.00

CMR  3/20/96 FOLLOW UP ON RESIGNATION STATUS. .25 32.50

IAD  3/20/96 CALL TO JOHN HANSELL AND ANNA MARIE AT DIAZ'S ATTORNEY'S OFFICE: 1.00 120.00
FAX TO RUCKA O'BOYLE ET AL. RE RELEASE AND TERMINATOIN LETTER.

DEF  3/28/96 REVISE MEMORANDUM RE NEEDED POLICY REVISIONS. 50 65.00

30.75 " $3.820 00

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CHR HOURS: 5.75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $747.50
JLS HOURS: 1,25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $162.50
WMQ HOURS:  0.75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $97.50
IAD HOURS: 17.75 @ $120.00 PER HOUR  $2130.00
MT HOURS: 0.75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $97.50
EMR HOURS: 0.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR 565,00
DEF HOURS: 4.00 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $520.00
NET TOTAL HOURS: 30.75 NET TOTAL FEES: $3820.00

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
3/29/96 VIDEO SURVEILLANCE FEES, ' " 2,135.69
3/29/96 COMPUTER RESEARCH. 111.00
4/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 41.60
4/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES. 2 04

$2,290.33

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
3/15/96 $722.80 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $1,997.90

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE : $6,110.33

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $722.80
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: APRIL 12,1998 FILE# 1013

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO J

15



STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ APRIL 12, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO T
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD .
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD, | b
GILROY, CA 95020 _ N1/
ATTN: DR. GLENN MAYLE , f

FILE# 1023 DIAZ-FM

FILE# 1023 DIAZ-FMLA - (10)

PREVIOUSLY BILLED AND UNPAID AMOUNTS, PLEASE PAY

D e T TIPS i

s
9
2

O v L S 2 e SN e .

STATEMENT DATE: APRIL 12, 1996  FILE # 1023

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENYT

CELIAM. RUIZ APRIL 12, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO —
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR :

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415} 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE SN f
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. \ L/
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

FILE# 1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE

SE Q] Y
FILE# 1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE (10)
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
1AD 3/04/96 FMLA ADVICE LETTER REVISIONS, 3.00 360.00
DEF  3/21/96 REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN FILE REGARDING POSSIBLE TERMINATION., 75 97.50
DEF  3/25/96 REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND CONDUCT FACTUAL INVESTIGATION RE HISTORY OF .75 97.50

ABSENCE AND HISTORY OF DISCIPLINE. '

DEF  3/27/96 LEGAL RESEARCH AND FACTUAL INVESTIGATION RE DISTRICT'S COMPLIANCE 1.50 195.00

WITH FAMILY MEDICAL LEAVE ACT AND OTHER SIMILAR LEGISLATION,
DRAFT MEMORANDUM RE SAME.

DEF  3/27/96 PREPARE CHRONOCLOGY OF ABSENCES TO BE INCORPORATED INTO 50 §5.00
DISCIPLINARY NOTICE. ‘
DEF  3/28/%9 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH HOWARD BELL RE PERFORMAMCE, WRITE-UPS, 2.73 357.50

PROGRESSIVE DISCIPLINE, UNION STEWARD ISSUE, ULP ISSUE, AND
STRATEGY. CONFERENGCE WITH CMR RE SAME. FACTUAL INVESTIGATION RE
HANDBOOK, POLICIES, CBA AND OTHER DOCUMENTS GOVERNING IMPOSITION
OF DISCIPLINE,
DEF  3/29/96 DRAFT MEMORANDUM BASED ON REVIEW OF SPECIFIC FACTUAL 3.25 422,50
CIRCUMSTANCES OF CASE. FACUAL INVESTIGATION RE PROGRESSIVE
DISCIPLINE, UNION INVOLVEMENT IN UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE CASE,
DOCUMENTATION OF EMPLOYEE MISCONDUCT IN FILE, LACK OF FORMAL
WRITTEN WARNINGS, FREQUENT ORAL WARNINGS, POTENTIAL RUN FOR
POSITION OF UNION SHOP STEWARD, AND MR. BELL'S INVOLVEMENT IN
ULP. TELEPHONE CALL WITH MR. BELL RE SAME AND PAYMENT TO ESTRADA
OF SALARY FOR DAYS HE WAS NOT ENTITLED TO ANY SUM AND OPTIONS RE
RECTIFICATION OF PAY ISSUE. BEGIN DRAFTING OF FORMAL DISCIPLINARY -

NOTICE.
12.50 $1,595.00
' SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES

IAD HOURS:  3.00 @ $120,00 PER HOUR $360.00

DEF HOURS:  9.50 @ $130,00 PER HOUR  $1235.00

NET TOTAL HOURS: 12.50 NET TOTAL FEES: $1595.00
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
1/31/96 WORKING MEAL, 31.55
3/29/96 COMPUTER RESEARCH. 556.00
4/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 55.20
4/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES. 31.94
4/10/96 CURRENT WORD PROCESSING CHARGES, 60.00
4/10/96 CURRENT EXPEDITED MAIL CHARGES, 49.00

$783.69

*AYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
3/15/96 $6,978.10 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.




STATEMENT

.2503-1&%1001

APRIL 12, 1996

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE :

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: APRIL 12,1896 FILE# 1001

RUXZ & SCHAPIRC

PAGE 2

$24,125.98
$2,378.69
$6,978.10
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STATEMENT

*'*~—_-_-
CELIA M. RUIZ APRIL 12, 1996

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415} 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

FILE# 1006 LABOR RELATION

e e

FILE# 1006 LABOR RELATIONS {(10)
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: ‘ HOURS FEES
CMR  3/01/96 TC WITH PERB; TC WITH CSEA RE MEETING. .75 97.50
CMR  3/01/96 PREPARATION; MEETING WITH DR MAYLE AND NEGOTIATION TEAM RE 6.50 & 845.00
COUNTER PROPOSAL.
RAS  3/01/96 CONFER RE: PERB INQUIRY. .25 &/ 32.50
CMR  3/03/96 DRAFT AND REVISE PROPOSALS, 5.00 ) 650.00
CMR  3/04/96 REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSAL, 1,50 ~/ 195.00
RAS  3/04/96 CONFER RE: PERB INQUIRY. .25 pd 32.50
MT 3/04/96 REVIEW UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE CHARGE AGAINST CSEA; TELECON W/ MS. J5 U 97.50
ROSE (PERB).
CMR 3/05/96 REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSALS AND BACK UP DATA. 2.504) 325.00
v 3/05/96 PREPARE FOR BOARD MEETING; REVIEW ISSUES AND OPTIONS FOR APPEAL; 7.50 4/ 975.00
MEETING WITH DR. MAYLE RE SAME MEETING WITH GOVERNING BOARD RE
SAME,
JLS 3/05/96 CONFER RE DISTRICT'S UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE CHARGE. 25 v 32.50
CMR  3/06/96 REVISE FACULTY PROPOSALS; REVISE BACK UP DATA FOR COLLECTIVE 2.000) 260.00
BARGAINING; TC WITH DR. COOPER (BE CANCELLATION; TC WITH DR MAYLE
RE BOARD MEETING; c25
CMR  3/06/96 PREPARE FOLLOW UP DATA FOR NEGOTIATIONS. D -V 97.50
RAS  3/06/96 CONFER RE: FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS: REVIEW DATA. 1.00 A/ 130.00
CMR  3/07/96 LETTER TO PEARL. .50 65.00
CMR  3/07/96 PREPARE BOARD STATEMENT, ' 1.00 130.00
CMR  3/07/96 PREPARE NEGOTIATIONS. B0 FS £5.00
RAS  3/07/96 PREPARE DATA FOR FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS. 2.25 = 292 50
MT 3/07/96 CONFER RE: SALARY COMPARISON STUDY; TELECON W/ COMPTON, SANTA 1.75 £/ 227.50
CLARITA, IMPERIAL, HARTNELL, NAPA, AND REDWOODS COMMUNITY
COLLEGES RE: REQUESTS FOR SALARY INFORMATION.
CMR  3/08/96 REVIEW AND REVISE STATEMENTS FOR GOVERNING BOARD; TG WITHDR. _.._7.50 975.00
MAYLE RE SAME, s
CMR  3/08/96 PREPARE FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS; CONFERENCE WITH MAYLE AND CHILD: 1.00 A/ 130.00
FAX INFORMATION TO CHILD; LETTER TO FACULTY RE NEGOTIATION BY
WRITTEN PROPOSALS. _
MT 3/08/96 REVIEW LETTER FROM PERB RE ULP CHARGE VS. CSEA: REVIEW BACKGROUND 1.00 U 130.00
MATERIALS; CONFER RE: STRATEGY.
MT 3/08/96 TELECON W/ IMPERIAL, VICTOR VALLEY AND REDWOODS COMMUNITY 1.25 &/ 162.50
COLLEGES RE: REQUESTS FOR SALARY INFORMATION; REVIEW INFORMATION
FROM HARTNELL AND REDWOODS.
CMR  3711/96 REVIEW MEMO AND TC RE STRATEGY AND OPTIONS. .50 o/ £5.00
CMR  3/11/96 REVIEW MEMOS TO GAVILAN AND TC RE SAME; ULP REVIEW. 504 65.00
3 3/11/96° PREPARE DATA FOR FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS. , 75 +/ 97.50
e o 3/11/96 CONFERENCE RE: STATUS AND STRATEGY RE: ULP CHARGE AGAINST CSEA: 5L/ 97.50
REVIEW BACKGROUND MATERIALS.
MT 3/11/96 TELECON W/ YUBA, COMPTON, AND CABRILLO RE: SALARY COMPARISON 50 2 65.00
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CMR  3/12/96

S 3/12/96
MT 3/12/96
CMR  3/13/9%6
CMR  3/13/96
RAS  3/13/96
MT 3/13/%
MT 3/13/96
CMR  3/14/96
MT = 3/14/9%
CMR  3/15/96
CMR  3/18/96
MT 3/18/96
MT 3/18/96
~wMR  3/19/96
MT 3/19/96
MT 3/19/96
DEF  3/19/%
CMR  3/20/96
MT 3/20/96
MT 3/20/%6
DEF  3/20/9
CMR  3/21/9%
DEF  3/21/96
CMR  3/22/96
AF 3/22/96
MT 3/22/96

APRIL 12, 1996

STUDY: REVIEW INFC PROVIDED BY REDWOQODS CCD.

PREPARE NEGOTIATIONS, PROPOSALS AND COMPARATIVES.

COLLECT DATA FROM CHANCELLOR'S OFFICE AND OTHER COMMUNITY
COLLEGES REGARDING FACULTY SALARIES AND BENEFITS.

TELECON W/ MS. ROSS! (PERB); PREPARE MEMORANDUM RE AMENDED ULP
CHARGE VS. CSEA.

REVIEW OUTSTANDING ISSUES; UPDATE ON BOARD MEETING.

PREPARE FOR NEGOTIATION.

COLLECT DATA FROM CHANCELLOR'S OFFICE AND OTHER COMMUNITY
COLLEGES REGARDING FACULTY SALARIES AND BENEFITS; REVIEW
FINANCIAL DOCUMENTS,

TELECON W/ MS. ROSS] (PERB) RE: EXTENSION OF TIME TO FILE AMENDED
CHARGE.

TELECON W/ COMPTON, CABRILLO AND IMPERIAL COMMUNITY COLLEGES RE:
SALARY COMPARISON STUDY; ANALYZE SALARY AND BENEFITS STRUCTURES
OF VARIOUS COMMUNITY COLLEGES,

PREPARE NEGOTIATION.

CONFER RE: SALARY ANALYSIS; PREPARE MEORANDUM RE: SALARY
ANALYSIS.

PREPARE FOR NEGOTIATIONS; PARTICIPATE IN FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS;
DE-BRIEF AND STRATEGIZE.

NEGOTIATION PREPARATION.

REVIEW CSEA LETTER RE NEGOTIATION OF BUSINESS SERVICE OFFICER
POSITION; COORbINATE AMENDED ULP CHARGE RE DR. MAYLE'S OFFICE;
TELECON W/ JFBANSELL; TELEGON W/ G. MILLER AT CSEA.

REVIEW FISCAL DATA ABSTRACT FROM CHANCELLOR'S OFFICE: TELECON W/
ATTORNEY SCHAPIRO RE REQUEST FOR INFORMATION: TELECON W/
SJEVERGREEN, WEST VALLEY, NAPA, MT. SAN JACINTO, HARTNELL, YUBA,
REDWOOD, AND SANTA CLARITA COMMUNITY COLLEGES RE REQUESTS FOR
FURTHER INFORMATION RE SALARY ANALYSIS; TELECON W/ COMMUMITY
COLLEGES LEAGUE OF CALIFORNIA RE SALARY DATA.

FOLLOW UP CN NEGOTIATION.

TELECON W/ MS. MILLER AT CSEA; CONFER RE STATUS OF AMENDED ULP
CHARGE; TELECON W/ g ﬁANSELL RE: BACKGROUND INFORMATION ON
AMENDED ULP CHARGE; TELECON Wf GAVILAN PERSONNEL OFFICE RE JOB
DESCRIPTIONS; PREPARE AMENDED ULP CHARGE; REVIEW BACKGROUND
DOCUMENTS RE SAME,

UPDATE COMPARABILITY ANALYSIS; TELEPHONE CONFERENGE W/ WEST
VALLEY AND MT SAN JACINTO RE SAME; CONFER RE STATUS.

REVIEW FAX FROM MAYLE, REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE COMPARISONS WITH OTHER
DISTRICTS RE SALARY, TSA'S, BENEFITS, ETC., REVISE PROPQSAL RE

SAME.

PREPARE NOEGOTIATIONS.

FOLLOW-UP W/ GAVILAN RE: JOB DESCRIPTIONS; REVIEW JOB
DESCRIPTIONS RE AMENDED CHARGE,; REVISE AMENDED ULP CHARGE RE
SAME.

TELECON W/ REDWOODS HUMAN RESOURCES AND BUDGET QFFICES RE SALARY
ANALYSIS; UPDATE COMPARABILITY ANALYSIS RE SALARY SURVEY: TELECON
W/ SJ/IEVERGREEN RE SALARY ANALYSIS.

FACTUAL INVESTIGATION REGARDING COMPARABLE FACULTY SALARY AND
BENEFITS. TELEPHONE CALLS TO HUMAN RESOURCES OFFICES AT
COMPARABLE SCHOOLS RE SAME AND AVAILABILITY OF TSA'S. REVISE
DISTRICT PROPOSAL NUMBER 3. CONFERENCE RE: SAME.

PREPARE TO NEGOTIATION.

REVIEW COMPARISON DOCUMENTS RE RATIONALE FOR PROPOSAL NUMBER 3.
REVISE SAME. DRAFT RANKINGS CHARTS, COMPARISONS, AND MEMO RE SAME
FOR USE IN NEGOTIATIONS.

PREPARATION FOR NEGOTIATION; MEETING WITH DR, MAYLE RE
NEGOTIATION; NEGOTIATION; DE BRIEFING.

REVIEW LETTER FROM PERB RE AMENDED ULP CHARGE.

TELECON W/ COMMUNITY COLLEGE LEAGUE OF CALIFORNiA RE REQUEST FOR
FURTHER INFORMATION.

-0

/' pPacE 2

1.00 &~/ 130.00
1.25 &/ 162.50

.50 65.00
.50 65.00
.50 «/ 65,00

2,50~ 325,00

25 U 32.50
4.25 »/  552.50
2.00 4~/  260.00
1,75/ 227.50
6.00 /780,00
6.50 &/ 845,00

.75 ¢/ 97.50

2.75 357.50

1,00 ~ 130.00
2.75 ¢ 357.50

1.50 &/ 195.00 |
1.7 A7 227.50

2.50 ~ 7 325.00
1.75 v 227.50

1.50 & 195.00

5.25 /  682.50

2,00 260.00
5.50 A7 715,00

7.0 ~/ 975,00

.25 U 32.50
25 ./  32.50

J
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DEF
CMR

DEF

CMR
DEF

3/22/96
3/26/96
3/26/96
3/28/96

3/29/96
3/29/96

4/02/96

APRIL 12, 19396

REVIEW CHANGES TO PROPOSAL NUMBER THREE,

FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS; REVIEW BUSINESS MANAGER ULP,

CONFERENCE RE UNION RESPONSE TO LAST PROPOSAL AND ISSUE OF
ACADEMIC CALENDAR IMPLEMENTATION. REVIEW AND REVISE DOCUMENTS RE
CHARTING COMPARISONS OF FACULTY SALARY,

LEGAL RESEARCH RE IMPLEMENTATION OF ACADEMIC CALENDAR PRIOR TO
AGREEMENT ON NEW COLLECTIVE BARGAINING AGREEMENT.
PREPARATION FOR FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS; TRAVEL.

CONFERENCE RE INTERNAL REVENUE RULES UNDER SECTION 125A WHICH
MIGHT IMPACT ON ABILITY OF DISTRICT TC MAKE PROPOSAL FOR NEW
COLLECTIVE BARGAINING AGREEMENT THAT WOULD RESTRICT SPENDING
OPTIONS IN CAFETERIA PLAN TO EXCLUDE ANY EXPENSES OTHER THAN
MEDICAL, DENTAL AND VISION INSURANCE. INITIAL INVESTIGATION OF

TAX CODE RULES ON SAME.

TELECON RE BUSINESS OFFICER'S POSITION AND UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE
CHARGE.

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CMR HOURS: 72.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $9392.50
RAS HOURS: 8.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1105.00
JLS HOURS: 0.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $32.50
MT HOURS: 24.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  3$3152.50
DEF HOURS: 14.00 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1820.00
NET TOTAL HOURS: 119.25 NET TOTAL FEES: $15502.50

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

4/10/96
4/10/96
4/10/96
'10/96
/10/96

CURRENT POSTAGE CHARGES,

CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES.

CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES.

CURRENT TRAVEL, TOLLS & PARKING CHARGES.
CURRENT EXPEDITED MAIL CHARGES.

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

3/15/96

$7.724.69 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE :

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

B e PR

STATEMENT DATE: APRIL 12,1996 FILE# 1006

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

e T T
I =, A Rt TP

.25 0
1.25 &
.25 &/
75 i/

3.50 M
25 A

25 ¢

PAGE 3

32.50
162.50
32,50
97.50

455,00
32.50

32.50

119,26 $15,502.50

H

COSTS
3.94
141.60
24.61
332.20
34.00

$536.35

R b gtater bl 2 §- bl ¥

330,647.62
$16,038.85




 STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ APRIL 12, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN COMMUNITY COLLEGE 0@’
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD _ L{« .
GILROY, CA 95020 C -
FILE# 1021 JOHNSON TORT
FILE# 1021 JOHNSON TORT
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
WMQ  3/01/96 REVIEW OPPOSITION MOTION; REVIEW AUTHORITY RE EXCLUSIVITY ISSUE. 1.20 156,00
WMQ  3/02/96 REVIEW AND ANALYZE OPPOSITION PAPERS AND THEORY: REVIEW AND 1.50 195.00
ANALYZE PLAINTIFF'S DECISIONAL AUTHORITY; OUTLINE REPLY BRIEF TO :
MOTION TO STRIKE: BEGIN QUTLINE OF REPLY BRIEF TO DEMURRER
OPPOSITION.
WMQ  3/04/96 REVIEW AMENDMENT TO OPPOSITION; REVIEW CONTRARY AUTHORITY, ESP. .30 39,00
LAVITSANOS.
IAD  3/04/96 REVIEW OF JOHNSON OPPOSITION BRIEFS; CALL TO OPPOSING COUNSEL'S 2.2 270,00
OFFICE RE PROPER ATTORNEY OF RECORD, .
IAD  3/05/96 CALL FROM W. PARDUE RE OPPOSITION PAPERS TO MOTIONS: REVIEW OF .50 60.00
JOHNSON MATERIALS; LETTER TO W. PARDUE RE MOTIONS.
Q  3/06/96 TELECON RE FIRST AMENDED OPPOSITION TO DEMURRER TO PLAINTIFF'S .20 26.00
" COMPLAINT, RESPONSE.
IAD  3/06/96 REVIEW OF PLAINTIFE'S AMENDED OPPOSITION, 1.00 12000
WMQ  3/07/96 REVIEW FIRST AMENDED OPPOSITION TO DEMURRER: APPLICATION OF .50 65.00
‘ LAVITSANOS TO PLS AUTHORITY.
JLS  3/11/96 DRAFT LETTER TO INSURANCE COMPANY. .20 26.00
WMQ  3/11/9 LGLRSCH RE PRIVATE SUITS TO ENFORCE CBA; EXCLUSIVITY UNDER EERA: 2.30 299.00
PERB JURISDICTION.
KON  3/11/96 RESEARCH RE: STANDING TO SUE FOR BREACH OF COLLECTIVE BARGAINING ¢ 3.50 455.00
AGREEMENT.
WMQ  3/12/96 TELECON CMR RE AUTHORITY FOR POSSIBLE NEGOTIATED DISPOSITION. .20 26.00
CMR.. 3/13/96 REVIEW LETTER AND TC WITH MAYLE RE NEW DEVELOPMENT: REVIEW 1.00 130,00
LITIGATION.
WMQ  3/13/96 CONFER RE DEMURRER AND MOTION TO STRIKE; TELECONS FROM COURT .50 65.00
CLERK RE HEARING AND PLAINTIFF'S AMENDED RESPONSE., o
IAD  3/13/96 REVIEW OF JOHNSON'S MEMO TO DR. MAYLE RE POSSIBLE TERMINATON; ~~" ™7~ (7" 5" 60.00
RESEARCH RE INDIVIDUAL EMPLOYEE'S RIGHT TO ENFORCE COLLECTIVE
BARGAINING AGREEMENT IN CIVIL COURTS.
CMR  3/14/96 REVIEW DEMURRER AND SETTLMENT OPTIONS: REVIEW CURRENT SITUATION 2,00 260.00
RESEARCH ANALYSIS.
WMQ  3/14/96 REVIEW MOTION AND OPPOSITION: QUTLINE REPLY BRIEF. 1.30 169.00
WMQ  3/16/96 REVIEW AUTHORITY AND REVISE QUTLINES FOR BRIEF: EXCLUSIVITY 1.20 156.00
ISSUE.
WMQ  3/17/96 DRAFTING AN DREVISIONS TO REPLY MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF 8.80 1,144.00
DEMURRER; REPLY MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO STRIKE
© PUNITIVE DAMAGE REQUEST; DRAFT REQUEST FOR JUDICIAL NOTICE.
JLS  3/18/96 REVIEW & EDIT DEMURRER & MOTION TO STRIKE. 1.80 234.00
v UtQ 3/18/96 REVIEW NEW MOORPARK CASE ON 3602 ISSUE; DRAFT INSERT FOR BRIEF: 7.70 1.001.00
CONTINUE DRAFTING AND REVISION OF REPLY BRIEFS IN SUPPORT OF
MOTION TO STRIKE AND DEMURRER, ESP. NEW CONTRACT ALLEGATIONS:
FINALIZE BRIEFS; BEGIN PREPARATION FOR ARGUMENT; TELECON OPPOSING J
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s
COUNSEL'S OFFICE.,
0 3/18/96 REVISIONS TO JOHNSON MOTION MATERIALS; RESEARCH RE JUDIGIAL C 4.5 540.0¢
NOTICE OF COLLECTIVE BARGAINING AGREEMENT: REVIEW OF JOHNSON
' BRIEFS AND PREPARATION FOR MOTIONS.
CMR  3/20/96 FOLLOW UP ON DEMURRER, .50 65.00
JLS  3/20/96 REVIEW, EDIT & STRATEGIZE JOHNSON AT ISSUE & CASE MANAGEMENT 1.30 169,00
MEMO; RESPOND TO INS CO LETTER; STRATEGIZE FOLLOW UP & DRAFT MEMO
RE SAME.
WMQ  3/20/96 PREPARATION FOR ORAL ARGUMENT. 1.70 221.00
IAD  3/20/96 DRAFTING AND REVISING AT-ISSUE MEMO AND CASE MANAGEMENT 8.00 960.00
CONFERENCE QUESTIONNAIRE; CALLS TO SANTA CLARA SUPERIOR COURT RE
SCHEDULING OF MOTION AND TENTATIVE RULINGS; PREPARATION FOR
JOHNSON MOTION; MEMO TO W.M. QUINN RE TENTATIVE RULINGS, AT-ISSUE
MEMO AND ORGANIZATION PLAN FOR MOTION.
JLS  3/21/96 CONFER RE DEMURRER. : .50 65.00
WMQ  3/21/96  TRAVEL (2.1) PREPARATION AND ARGUMENT (3.4) RE DEMURRER: EDIT 6.00 780.00

LETTERS TO CLIENT AND OPPOSING COUNSEL (.2)) REVIEW JLS LETTER;
INS. ADMIN'R LTR; RESPONSE; RE CASE SUMMARY {.3).
1AD 3/21796 TRAVEL TO AND FROM SANTA CLARA COURT; PLEADING OF MOTIONS:; REVIEW 6.25 750,00
OF CASE MANAGEMENT CONFERENCE MEMO: REPORTING LETTERS TO CLIENT
AND INSURANCE ABJUSTER. ‘
CMR  3/22/96 FOLLOW UP ON DEMURRER AND SETTLEMENT. 1.00 130.00
WMQ  3/22/96 TELECON WM PARDUE RE PLAINTIFF'S SETTLEMENT OFFER; UPCOMING CMC; 3.30 429.00
POSSIBLE RESCHEDULING; PLAINTIFF'S DISCOVERY PLANS; SRVC OF CMC
FILING (.2); REVIEW WRIT PAPERS (.4); REVIEW DFEH PAPERS {.2n
CONF. RE SETTLEMENT POTENTIAL (.2): WORK ON LITIGATION SUMMARY

: (2.3).
IAD  3/22/96 REVISIONS TO REPORTING LETTER TO DR. MAYLE RE MOTIONS. 75 ©90.00
WMQ  3/23/96 DRAFT/REVISE LITIGATION SUMMARY (2.3); MEMO TO CMR RE SETTLEMENT 3.20 416.00

OFFER AND POSSIBLE STRATEGY AND MEDIATION: AND DRAFT LETTER TO
CLIENT RE SAME (.9).

LMR - 3/28/96 REVIEW DISCIPLINARY ISSUES; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE. 1.50 195,00

JLS 3/28/96 REVIEW CLIENT LETTER & SETTLEMENT (.20); REVIEW INS CO LETTER 70 81.00
(.10); REVIEW CHRONOLOGY & ASSESS TERMINATION (.40).

WMQ  3/28/96 TELECON RE STATUS OF MATTER;: INSURANCE LETTER. 10 13.00

IAD 3/28/96 CALLS TO SANTA CLARA SUPERIOR COURT RE JUDGMENT ON MOTIONS. 25 30.00

CMR  3/29/96 MEET W/ DR. MAYLE RE: NEW COMPLAINTS. 1.00 136,00

79.00 $10,030.00

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CMR HOURS:  7.00 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $910.00
JLS HOURS:  4.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $585.00
WMQ HOURS: 40.00 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $5200.00
IAD HOURS: 24.00 @ $120.00 PER HOUR  $2880.00
KON HOURS:  3.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $455,00
NET TOTAL HOURS: 79.00 NET TOTAL FEES: $10030.00

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
3/29/96 COMPUTER RESEARCH. _ 61.00
4/10/96 CURRENT POSTAGE CHARGES. 7.76
4/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES, : 118.00
4/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES. 7.45
4/10/96 CURRENT TRAVEL, TOLLS & PARKING CHARGES. 89.73

$283.94

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
3/15/96 $14,560.09 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMERNT: $23,832.26

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE : $10,313.94

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY
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STATEMENT DATE: APRIL 12, 1996

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

FILE# 1021

PAGE 3
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T STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ APRIL 12, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO | -
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD

# 1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE (10

FRCRRIN ™ # PR AN & B SE PP B0 S R4 SR R A b AR A RO R FErTm b Ry

FILE# 1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE (10

PREVIOUSLY BILLED AND UNPAID AMOUNTS, PLEASE PAY:

STATEMENT DATE: APRIL 12,1986 FILE# 1016

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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T STATEMENT

CELIAM. RUIZ APRIL 12, 1896
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO .
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-3005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD

FILE# 1017 JOHNSON'S DFEH C

FILE# 1017 JOHNSON'S DFEH COMPLAINT (10)

PREVIOUSLY BILLED AND UNPAID AMOUNTS, PLEASE PAY:

STATEMENT DATE: APRIL 12,1996 FILE# 1017

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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i il CELIAM. RUIZ MARCH 18, 1996 o
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO .
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-3005 [ ‘-}
[ ) L
. ~
P S S:.; f’kf
S 'f E '
GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE p 4
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. Rt
GILROY, CA 95020 K*\J
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE
FILE# 1000 SUMMARY FILE (10)
FILE# 1015 ARBALLO- (10)
CURRENT HOURS:  0.00 ‘
PREVIOUS BALANCE: $1,465.20 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $0.00
PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: $0.00
PLUS CUR COSTS: $35.60 v EQUALS NEW BALANCE: $1,500. 80
FILE# 1019 CONSTRUCTION (10)
CURRENT HOURS:  0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE: $52.30 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $0.00
PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: $0.00
PLUS GUR COSTS: $23.30 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: 375.5{)H
. £ 1014 CSEA . (10
CURRENT HOURS:  3.00 ‘ /ﬂﬁ
PREVIOUS BALANCE: $135,403.31 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $15,000.00-
PLUS LATE CHARGES: _ $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: 00+
PLUS CUR COSTS: $96.38 . EQUALS NEW BALANCE: $120,889.69
FILE# 1013 DIAZ ' (10)
CURRENT HOURS:  9.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE: $779.10 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $0.00
PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: $1,125.000
PLUS CUR COSTS: $93.80/  EQUALS NEW BALANCE: $1.997.9¢")
FILE# 1023 DIAZ-FMLA (10)
CURRENT HOURS:, 4.25
PREVIOUS BALANCE: $0.00 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $0.00
PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 . PLUS CURFEES: $510.00
PLUS CUR COSTS: | $21.00;, EQUALS NEW BALANCE: $531.00
FILE# 1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LLEGAL ADVICE (10)
CURRENT HOURS: 82.25 :
PREVIOUS BALANCE: $12,829.57 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: 50,00
PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: $10,465. 00y
PLUS CUR COSTS: $831.41 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: $24,125.98
FILE# 1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE (10}
CURRENT HOURS:  0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE: 47,086, 02 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $0.00
TLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00°  PLUS CURFEES: $0.00~
+US CUR COSTS: $0.00v  EQUALS NEW BALANCE: $7,086.02
]
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FILE# 1017 JOHNSON'S DFEH COMPLAINT (10)
CURRENT HOURS:  0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE: $0.00 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $0.00
US LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: $0.00 -
~¢US CUR COSTS: $6.40 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: $6.40,
FILE# 1021 JOHNSONTORT (10)
CURRENT HOURS: 69.25
PREVIOUS BALANCE: $14,560.09 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: / $0.00
PLUS LATE CHARGES: " 3000 PL T SL80.50 $8.607.50
PLUS CUR COSTS: -"3664.67 > EQUALS NEWBALANCE: =/ ) 7 $23.832.26
, IR 2L LA
FILE# 1006 LABOR RELATIONS 727 ;{10)
CURRENT HOURS: 18.25
PREVIOUS BALANCE: $27,230.94 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS: $0.00
PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES: $2,335.00
PLUS CUR COSTS: $1,081.68 EQUALS NEW BALANCE: $30,647.62
TOTAL OF PREVIOUS STATEMENT BALANCES: $199,406.53
MINUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT PAYMENTS: $15,000.00-.

UNPAID FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENTS: $184,406.53

PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT INTEREST: $0.60
$23,432.50
$2,854.24

PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT FEES:
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT COSTS:

EQUALS: TOTAL BALANCE DUE THIS STATEMENT:

STATEMENT DATE: MARCH 18,1886 FiLE# 1000

RUIZ & SCHAPIROC




STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ MARCH 14, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRQ

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 85020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

FILE# 1015 ARBALLO (10)

FILE# 1015 ARBALLO , (10)

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
3/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 5.60
3/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 7.00
3/10/96 CURRENT EXPEDITED MAIL CHARGES. 23,00

' $35.60
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $1,465,20

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE:
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY:

$35.60

STATEMENT DATE: MARCH 14,1996 . FILE# 1015

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT

CELIAM. RUIZ

RUIZ & SCHAPIRC

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN COLLEGE

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD,
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTN: DR. MAYLE

FILE# 1019 CONSTRUCTION

FILE# 1019 CONSTRUCTION

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
2/28/96 COMPUTER RESEARCH.
3/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES.

STATEMENT DATE: MARCH 14, 1996

MARCH 14, 1996

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE :
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

FILE# 1019

RUYZ & SCHAPIRO

12




STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ MARCH 14, 1896
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: PR, GLENN MAYLE

FILE# 1014 CSEA

FILE# 1014 CSEA ) (10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVIGES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
WMQ  2/05/96 PREPARE DRAFT OF LETTER TO ALJ LINK, REVIEW 1739/1741 FILES, C .50 65.00
WMQ  2/06/96 DRAFTLETTER TO ALJ LINK; TELECON TO M WHELAN OFFICE. ¢ .25 32.50
MMQ  2/12/96 REVIEW LETTER TO LINK; REVIEW CSEA AND COLLEGE POST TRIAL BRIEFS; < 1.50 195.00
CONF, CMR RE: POSSIBLE ADDITIONAL FILINGS. .
WMQ  2/28/96 TELECON PERB RE CHARGE AGAINST CSEA; KRISTIN ROSI; MEMO TO e .75 97.50
. JLS/CMR. '
3.00- $390.00

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
WMQ HOURS:  3.00 @& $130.00 PER HOUR $390.00

L _ sTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
3/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 50.00
3/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES. , 0.38
3/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 26.00
3/10/96 CURRENT EXPEDITED MAIL CHARGES. 2000

$96.38

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
2/22/96 $15.000.00 THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $135,403.31

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE : $486.38

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: 0
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

N A . V. S LI SR SV R SR s

TOTTTTE TR eI ARTTTTTIN AN A VLI TR TR

STATEMENT DATE: MARCH 14, 1996 FILE# 1014 .

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

i3



ST STATEMENT

CELIAM. RUIZ MARCH 14, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCQ,.CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415} 385-5005

GAVIAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020 } /’“)
II“

ATTENTION: DR, GLENN MAYLE

KSR L O

FILE# 1013 DIAZ (10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
DGL  2/01/96 PSYCHIATRIC EXAM ISSUE MEMORANDUM. 2.00 240.00
DGL  2/02/956 PSYCHIATRIC EXAM ISSUE - MEMO. 2.25 270.00
CMR  2/06/96 REVIEW DOCUMENTS ON DIAZ MATTER; TC WITH WORKERS COMP ATTORNEY; 1.00 130.00
TC WITH HANSELL. '
CMR  2/07/96 PREPARE TERMINATION CASE. 1.00 130.00
CMR  2/08/96 PREPARATION FOR DISMISSAL. .50 65.00
CMR  2/13/96 WORKERS COMP ISSUE AND MEDICAL CERTIFICATION ISSUE. .50 65.00
CMR  2/16/96 REVIEW AND REVISE CERTIFICATION AND CASE PREPARATION. .50 65.00
CMR  2/20/96 TERMINATION. .50 65.00
CMR  2/22/96 TERMINATION PREPARATION. .50 65.00
‘ 2/22/96 CALL TO M. BRADSHAW RE REQUEST FOR DOCUMENTS IN MARIA DIAZ .25 30.00
MATTER.

9.00 $1,125.00

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CMR HOURS: 4,50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR " $585.00
DGL HOURS: 4.25 @ $120.00 PER HOUR $510.00
IAD HOURS: 0.25 @ $120.00 PER HOUR $30.00

NET TOTAL HOURS:  9.00 NET TOTAL FEES: $1125.00
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: cosTs
2/28/96 COMPUTER RESEARCH. 85.00
3/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. ‘ 2.80
3/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 6.00
- $93.80
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $779.10

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: MARCH 14,1996 FILE# 1013

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

14



STATEMENT

EILE# 1023 DIAZ-FMLA

FILE# 1023 DIAZ-FMLA (10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES

IAD 2/07/96 PHONE CALL TO M. BRADSHAW RE PRIVATE INVESTIGATOR, AND PROVIDING .25 30.00
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO WITH COPIES OF MEDICAL REPCRTS AND DEPOSITION
TRANSCRIPTS.

IAD 2/09/66 RESEARCH RE FMLA/CFRA AND MEDICAL CERTIFICATION BY EMPLOYEES. .50 50.00

IAD 2/13/96 REVIEWING LAW ON MEDICAL CERTIFICATION OF EMPLOYEES UNDER 2.75 330.00
FMLA/CFRA; DRAFTING AND REVISING LETTER TO J. HANSELL RE MEDICAL

- CERTIFICATION.
IAD 2/15/96 RESPONSE TO J. HANSELL'S REQUEST RE DIAZ MEDICAL CERTIFICATION, .50 60.00
|AD 2/16/96 PHONE CONVERSATION WITH J, HANSELL RE DIAZ MEDICAL CERTIFICATION, .25 30.90
: 4.25 $510.00

COSTS ADVANCED SINGE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
3/10/96 GURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. , 13.00
3/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES, 8.00

§21.00

CELIAM. RUIZ MARCH 14, 1996
RUIZ & SCHARIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-3005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020
ATTN: DR. GLENN MAYLE ) f)

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
IAD HOURS: 4.25 @ $120.00 PER HOUR  $510.00

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE .
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY:;

R T R Y Solbul S T TUF | vl S-S Tula, RV Wi RS L SRS X R S E e o bbbt b Mt ket bt

s T e 2 B e S g e L i = S L Eacl - S

STATEMENT DATE: MARCH 14,1996 FILE# 1023

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

15



STATEMENT

CMR

CMR
RAS
JLS

CMR

RAS

g

3
hAS
CMR
JLS
WMQ
CMR
RAS

LS

VWMQ
IAD
MT

CMR
RAS

LS
L ‘LJ

LS
IAD

CELIAM. RUIZ

RUIZ & SCHAFPIRQ

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE }\

GILRQOY, CA 95020
ATTENTION: DR, GLENN MAYLE

FILE# 1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE

2/01/96

2/05/96
2/05/96
2/05/96
2/06/96

2/06/96

2/06/96
270779
2/12/96
2/13/96
2/13/96
2/13/96
2/14/96
2/14/96

2/14/96

2/14/96
2/14/96
2/14/%6

2/15/96
2/15/96

2715796
2/15/96
2/15/96
2/16/96
2/16/96

MARCH 18, 1986

. PROFESSIONAL SERVEéES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

REVIEW VARIOUS PENDING MATTERS INCLUDING DIAZ, GRAND JURY AND
JOHNSON MATTERS, :

GRAND JURY ISSUE.

REVIEW SUBPOENA AND CONFER RE: SAME.

REVIEW DIAZ MATTER & RECOMMEND COURSE OF ACTION.

REVIEW SUBPOENA; TC WITH MAYLE RE REASONABLE NOTICE AND NEED TO
PROTECT CONFIDENTIAL COMMUNICATIONS; TC TO WIES AND LETTER TO DA,
CONFER RE: GRAND JURY SUBPOENA; PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO SPECIAL
ASSISTANT D.A. REGARDING SUBPOENA.

CONFER RE SUBPOENA FOR RECORDS.

CONFER RE: GRAND JURY SUBPOENA,

PREPARE CORRESFPONDENCE RE: BROWN ACT REQUIREMENTS.

FOLLOW UP ON GRAND JURY MATTER.

GRAND JURY INVESTIGATION.

CONFER RE FRIDAY HEARING; TELECON FROM BILL LARSEN, ADA;

REVIEW RESEARCH AND DECLARATIONS IN-PREPARATION FOR HEARING.
STRATEGIZE RE: GRAND JURY SUPOENA AND MOTION TO COMPEL HARPSTER
TESTIMONY: RESEARCH RE: CONFLICTS OF INTEREST, EX-PARTE
COMMUNICATIONS, NOTICE REQUIREMENTS FOR SUBPOENAS, SECRECY
REQUIREMENTS, AND OFHER MATTERS RE: SAME; PREPARE MEMORANDUM,.
EXAMINE GRAND JURY ISSUES; PREPARE FOR HEARING; CONFERENCES RE
SAME: STRATEGIZE RE LEGAL AUTHORITIES IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING;
REVIEW HARPSTER DEC; REVIEW RUIZ DEC, REVIEW SPEROW DEC; REVIEW
RESPONSE & OBJECTION; REVIEW CCP SECTION 1991,

MEMORANDUM TO FILE RE: GRAND JURY.

RESEARCH RE FMLAJ/CFRA COMPLIANCE FOR GAVILAN COLLEGE.

RESEARCH RE: SCOPE OF AND EXCEPTIONS TO ATTORNEY/CLIENT PRIVILEGE
AND WAIVER ISSUES RE: GRAND JURY SUBPOENA; RESEARCH IMPACT OF
EXERCISE OF PRIVILEGE; REVIEW REQUIREMENTS OF SUBPOENA AND
PREPARE OBJECTION TO PRODUCTION OF PRIVILEGED DOCUMENTS; RESEARCH
RE: ADVICE OF COUNSEL DEFENSE IMPLICATIONS, RIGHT TG COUNSEL AT
GRAND JURY PROCEEDINGS; PREPARE RESEARCH MEMORANDUM RE:
ATTORNEY/CLIENT ISSUES; PREPARE CHRONOLOGY MEMORANDUM RE: GRAND
JURY SUBPOENA,

PREPARATION FOR HEARING; TRAVEL AND COURT APPEARANCE.

CONFER RE: GRAND JURY SUPOENA AND MOTION TO COMPEL HARPSTER
TESTIMONY; RESEARCH RE: NOTICE REQUIREMENTS.

PREPARE FOR HEARING RE GRAND JURY; STRATEGIZE RE ARGUMENT.
RESEARCH RE GRAND JURY "REASONABLE NOTICE" ISSUE.

RESEARCHING ADVICE LETTER RE FMLA COMPLIANCE.

STRATEGIZE MEDICAL LEAVE ISSUES.

REVISIONS TO BROWN ACT ADVICE LETTER.

(10)

HOURS
1.00

.50
.50
.25
75

.25
.25
1.50
1.00
.50
3.25
2.50
1.00

.5

DO P
» .
(5]
oo

3.75
1.00
3.00

.25
1.25

" FEES
130.00

65.00
65.00
32.50
97.50

227.50

32.50
32.50
195.00
130.00
65.00
422.50
325.00
1,430.00

877.50

325.00
780.00
1,235.00

747.50
260.00

487.50
120.00
360.00

32.50
150.00




oot

- . STATEMENT
[2503-10-1001 MARCH 18, 1996 PAGE 3

CMR  2/20/96 FOLLOW UP ON GRAND JURY ISSUE; DIAZ AND JOHNSON DEMURRER. 4.00 520.00

IAD  2/22/96 REVISIONS TO GROUND RULES FOR FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS. 25 30.00

\ 2/22/96 FMLA ADVICE LETTER/ RESEARCH AND DRAFTING. 5.95 630.00

. 2/27/9 FMLA ADVICE LETTER AND REVIEW OF GAVILAN POLICY MANUAL AND 1.25 15000
CLASSIFIED EMPLOYEE HANDBOOK; CALL TO DEPARTMENT OF LABOUR.

IAD  2/27/96 REVISION OF GROUND RULES FOR FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS. J5— 90,00

IAD  3/06/96 FMLAADVICE LETTER. 3.50 420,00

82.25  $10,465.00

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CMR HOURS: 15.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $2015.00
RAS HOURS: 17.00 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $2210.00
JLS HOURS: 11.75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1527.50
WMQ HOURS:  5.75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $747.50
IAD HOURS: 22.75 @ $120.00 PER HOUR  $2730.00
MT HOURS: 9.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1235.0C

NET TOTAL HOURS: 82.25 NET TOTAL FEES: $10465.00
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
2/28/96 COMPUTER RESEARCH. 260.50
2/28/96 COMPUTER RESEARCH. 42.00
3/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 200,20
3/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES, 15.71
3/10/96 CURRENT WORD PROCESSING CHARGES. - 80.00
3/10/96 CURRENT TRAVEL, TOLLS & PARKING CHARGES. ' 90.00
3/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 143,00
$831.41
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $12,829,57
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE $11,295.41

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: MARCH 18,1886  FILE# 1001

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT

CELIAM. RUIZ MARCH 14, 1896
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

* TELEPHONE (415} 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD

FILE# 1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE (10

FILE# 1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE (10)

PREVIQUSLY BHLED AND UNPAID AMOUNTS, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: MARCH 14,1956 FILE# 1016

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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"' STATEMENT
CELIAM. RUIZ MARCH 14, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD

FILE# 1017 JOHNSON'S DFEH COMPLAINT - (10)
FILE# 1017 JOHNSON'S DFEH COMPLAINT (10)

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS

3/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 6.40

' $6.40

BALANCE FROM THE LAST' STATEMENT: $0.00

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

e LT S T2 2 Vol o S oW o W S G P~ MY A L N S N PO N A P

STATEMENT DATE: MARCH 14,1996 FILE# 1017

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT
CELIAM. RUIZ ) MARCH 14, 1986
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 84111
TELEFPHONE (415} 395-9005

GAVILAN COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD
GILRQY, CA 95020

FILE# 1021 JOHNSON TORT (10)

FILE# 1021 JOHNSON TORT (10)

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
WMQ  2/02/96 RSCH AND DRAFTING OF DEMURRER TO COMPLAINT. 5.50 715.0¢
IAD  2/02/96 PREPARING CASE LAW BINDER; RESEARCH RE JOHNSON DEMUR. 4,25 510.0C
WMQ  2/03/96 DRAFTING AND REVISIONS TO DEMURRER. 4,00 520.0¢
WMQ  2/04/96 DRAFTING AND REVISIONS TO DEMURRER. , 2,50 325.0C
WMQ  2/05/96 WORK ON DEMURRER, 1.00 130..0C
IAD  2/05/96 RESEARCH RE MOTION TO STRIKE PUNITIVE DAMAGES PLEADINGS; RESEARCH 8.00 960..0¢

RE MOTION FOR JUDICIAL NOTICE.

IAD 2/06/96 RESEARCH, REVISION AND PREPARATION OF DEMURRER MATERIALS. 3.00 360.0(

IAD 2/07/96 REVISING AND RESEARCHING DEMURRER MATERIALS, 2.25 270.0C

~“MR  2/08/96 PREPARATION OF DEMURRER. .50 65 0C

4Q  2/08/96 DRAFT, REVISE, EDIT DEMURRER, MEMO OF POINTS AND AUTHORITIES; 8.75 1,137.5(

REQUEST FOR JUDICIAL NOTICE; MOTION TC STRIKE AND MPA IN SUPPORT.

tAD 2/08/96 REVISING AND RESEARCHING DEMURRER MATERIALS,; PHONE CALLS TO DR. 8.25 990.0(
MAYLE, KENNETH NAKATA AND M. KAPLAN. .

JLS 2/09/96 REVIEW & EDIT DEMURRER MPA, MOTION TO STRIKE, NOTICE, REQUEST FOR 2.25 292.5(
JUDICIAL NOTICE & PROPOSED ORDER.

WMQ  2/09/96 REVISE, EDIT FILINGS, ARRANGE FILING IN 8J. 4.75 617.5(

IAD 2/09/96 REVISING AND PREPARING DEMURRER, MOTION TO STRIKE AND JUDICIAL 5.25 630.0(
NOTICE FOR FILING,

CMR  2/12/96 DEMURRER, .50 65.0(

IAD 2/12/96 ODRAFTING AND REVISING LETTER TO DR. MAYLE RE MOTIONS; REVIEW OF 1.50 180.0(
JOHNSON DOCUMENTS. '

1AD 2/22/96 STRATEGY AND TIMING RE OPPOSITION AND REPLY TO OPPOSITION, 1.00 120.0

IAD 2/24/96 RESEARCH RE OPPOSITION BRIEF. .50 60. 0

IAD 2/26/96 ADVICE LETTER RE FMLA. 4.75 570.0(

IAD 2/26/96 MEMO RE TIMING OF PROCEEDINGS IN JOHNSON MATTER. ' .50 60.0(

IAD 2/27/96 ORGANIZING CASES AND REVIEW OF CALDWELL DECISION. .25 30.0(

69.25 $8.607.5l

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CMR HOURS: 1.00 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $130.00
JLS HOURS: 2.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $292.50
WHMQ HOURS: 26.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  §3445.00
JAD HOURS: 39,50 @ $120.00 PER HOUR  $4740.00

NET TOTAL HOURS: 69.25 NET TOTAL FEES: $8607.50
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COST:
2/28/96 COMPUTER RESEARCH. 325.01
410/96 CURRENT PHOTOCCPY CHARGES. 222.60
3/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES. 25.3
3/10/96 CURRENT TRAVEL, TOLLS & PARKING CHARGES. 61.7

3/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 30.00

20



STATEMENT

2:503-10-1021

MARCH 14, 1986

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE:
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY:

STATEMENT DATE: MARCH 14,1986 FILE# 1021

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

~ $664.67

PAGE 3

$14,560.09

29



‘ ) STATEMENT
(I CELIAM. RUIZ MARCH 18, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR

SAN FRANCISCO, CA §4111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

FILE# 1006 LABOR RELATIONS (10)
FILE# 1006 LABOR RELATIONS T (10)
IPROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
CMR  2/06/96 REVIEW JOB DESCRIPTION FOR CSEA. < .50 65.00
CMR  2/07/96 NEGOTIATIONS - DIAZ AND PERB ISSUES. 7.00 A/ 910.00
RAS  2/08/96 REVIEWDOCUMENTS; TELECON W/ PERB RE: STATUS OF UNFAIR PRACTICE c 504 - 65.00
CHARGE REGARDING BUSINESS OFFICE POSITION; PREPARE MEMORANDUM RE:
SAME.
RAS  2/09/9 PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO PERB OFFICE. .75 97.50
CMR  2/12/96 PREPARED FOR NEGOTIATION. 50+ 65.00
CMR  2/13/96 PREPARE FACULTY NEGOTIATION. 50 & €5.00
IAD  2/13/96 DRAFTING AND REVISING GROUND RULES FOR GAVILAN FACULTY 3.75//  450.00
NEGOTIATIONS. :
t 2/16/96 REVIEW REVISIONS TO CSEA CONTRACT; LETTER TO GCFA RE SCHEDULING 1.00 4/ 130.00
‘ MEETINGS.
CMR  2/23/9 PREPARE FOR NEGOTIATION. ' 507/ 65.00
CMR  2/26/96 UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE CHARGE. C1.50¢  195.00
CMR  2/27/96 REVIEW UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE CHARGE AND OPTIONS, < .75l 97.50
CMR  2/28/9 FOLLOW UP ON UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE CHARGE, c1.004  130.00

18.25 $2,335.00

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CMR HOURS: 13.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1722.50
RAS HOURS: 1.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $162.50
IAD HOURS:  3.75 @ $120.00 PER HOUR $450.00

NET TOTAL HOURS: 18.25 NET TOTAL FEES: $2335.00
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT; COSTS
2/28/96 COMPUTER RESEARCH, 160.00
2/28/96 COMPUTER RESEARCH, 267.00
3/16/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 117.20
3/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES. 24.48
.3/10/96  CURRENT TRAVEL, TOLLS & PARKING CHARGES. 270.00
3/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. ' 230.00
3/10/96 CURRENT EXPEDITED MAIL CHARGES, 13.00
: $1,081.68
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $27.230.94

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: MARCH 18,1986 FILE# 1006

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT
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LT CELIAM. RUIZ
. RUIZ & SCHAPIRO -

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILRQY, CA 95020 :
ATTENTION: DR, GLENN MAYLE

FILE# 1000 SUMMARY FILE

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE

FILE# 1000 SUMMARY FILE

FILE# 1015 ARBALLO -
CURRENT HOURS: 11.50
PREVIOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES:
PLUS CUR COSTS:

FILE# 1019 CONSTRUCTION
CURRENT HOURS: 0.25
PREVIOUS BALANCE:

PLUS LATE CHARGES:
PLUS CUR COSTS:

E# 1014 CSEA
CURRENT HOURS:
PREVIOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES:
PLUS CUR COSTs:

2.25

FILE# 1013 DIAZ
CURRENT HOURS:
PREVIOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES:
PLUS CUR COSTS:

6.00

FILE# 1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE
CURRENT HOURS: 53.25

PREVICUS BALANCE:

PLUS LATE CHARGES:

PLUS CUR COSTS:

FILE# 1016 JOHNSQN'S WRIT OF MANDATE
CURRENT HOURS: 0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES:
PLUS CUR COSTS:

FILE# 1017 JOHNSON'S DFEH COMPLAINT
CURRENT HOURS: 0.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE:
PLUS LATE CHARGES:
2LUS CUR COSTS:

$24,313.91
$0.00
$5.20

$2,223.81
$0.00
$19.80

$165,461.52
$0.00

$18.49 ./

$58.50
$0.00
$2.80v

$13,680.15
$0.00

$140.60, /

$7.286.02
$0.00
$0.00

$1,060.01
30.00
$0.00

v

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANGE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

FEB 20, 1996 —

0

(10)
(10)

(10}

(10)

(10

(10)

(10)

(10)

$24,313.91-
$1.460.00
$1,465.20.

$2,223.81-
$32.50
$52.304

$30,351.70-

$275.00M

$135,403.31

$2.20-}

$720,00/]
$779.10

$7,828,68-

$6,837.504

$12,829.57

$200.00+]

$0.00
$7.,086.02y

$1,060.01-
$0.00
$0.00

A3

¢
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STATEMENT

7503-10-1000 FEB 20, 1996

FLE# 1021 JOHNSON TORT
CURRENT HOURS: 115.25

FILE# 1022 JOHNSON - DISCIPLINE
CURRENT HOURS: 0.00

FILE# 1006 LABOR RELAT!ONS
CURRENT HOURS: £58.00

TOTAL OF PREVIOUS STATEMENT BALANCES:

MINUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT PAYMENTS:
UNPAID FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENTS: $167,609.86
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT INTEREST:

" PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT FEES:
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT COSTS:

EQUALS: TOTAL BALANCE DUE THIS STATEMENT:

T RS e P —

T T e v v e

STATEMENT DATE: FEB 20,1986 FILE# 1000

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

PREVIOUS BALANCE: $334.29 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
P1 US LATE CHARGES: $0.00° PLUS CUR FEES:
S CUR COSTS: $495.09 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE: , $6.80 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:
PLUS CUR COSTS: : $0.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

PREVIOUS BALANCE: $40,224.67 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS LATE CHARGES: $0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:
PLUS CUR COSTS: $142.19 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

PAGE 2
(10

$334.29.
$14,065.00
$14,560.09 |

(10)

$6.80-
$0.00
$0.00

(10}
$20,718.42.

$7,582.50
$27,230.94

$254,649.68
$87,035.82-

$0.00
$30,972.50
$824.17

— /T
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SHAICmOaite

CELIA M. RUIZ FEB 20, 1996

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMURNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD,

GILROY, CA 85020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

FILE# 1015 ARBALLO

FILE# 1015 ARBALLO (10)

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: FEB 20,1996 FILE# 1015

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
CMR  1/02/96 FOLLOW UP ON TERMINATION. .25 32.50
IAD  1/03/96 DRAFTING AND REVISING OF LETTER TO DR. MAYLE RE HEARING OFFICER'S .75 90.00
DECISION.
MK 1/05/96 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH HEARING OFFICER; TELEPHONE GONFERENCE 1.7 227.50
WITH DR. MAYLE; DRAFT LETTER TO DR. MAYLE; REVIEW DECISION:
: REVIEW MEMO RE BROWN ACT PROCEDURES.
“IAD  1/05/96 REVIEW OF HEARING OFFICER'S DECISION: TC TO L. ORTEGA. 1.25 150.00
:[CMR  1/08/96 REVIEW PROCEDURES AND DECISION FOR BOARD MEETING: TC WITH MAYLE 2.00 260.00
, RE PROCESS,
IAD  1/08/96 PHONE CALL TO L. ORTEGA RE ARBALLO DECISION. .25 30.00
‘IMK  1/09/96 ATTEND BOARD MEETING RE ARBALLO TERMINATION. . 3.00 390.00
{29 1/09/96 TELECON W/ L. ORTEGA RE ARBALLO DECISION AND FUTURE STEPS. .50 60.00
. R 1/17/96 ASSIST WITH HEARING PREPARATION. 1.00 130.00
‘laD  1/30/96 ORGANIZE ARBALLO DOCUMENTS. .75 90.00
‘ 11,50 ~ $1.460.00
SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CHR HOURS:  3.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $422.50
MK HOURS:  4.75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $617.50
IAD HOURS:  3.50 @ $120.00 PER HOUR  $420.00
NET TOTAL HOURS: 11.50 NET TOTAL FEES: $1460.00
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
2/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 5.20
$5.20
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
1/24/96  $19,015.48 THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.
2/07/96 $5,298.43 THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $24,313.91
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE : $1,465.20

16




STATEMENT

RUIZ & SCHAFIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE {415) 395-9005

GAVILAN COLLEGE {
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD, [ 3
GILROY, CA 95020 i/
ATTN: DR. MAYLE Y{\
FILE# 1019 CONSTRUCTION (10)

FILE# 1019 CONSTRUCTION (1)

" CELIA M. RUIZ FEB 20, 1996

"MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: FEB 20,1996 FILE# 1019

RUOIZ & SCHAPIRO

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: . HOURS FEES
LS 1/03/96 UPDATE RE CONSTRUCTION ISSUES WITH M. KAPLAN, .25 32.50
: .25 $32.50
SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
JLS HOURS: 0,25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $32.50
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
2/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 19.80
$19.80
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
1/96 $0.21 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU,

¢rV7/96 $2,223.60 THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT,
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $2,223.81
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE : $52.30
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STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ:

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

500 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

FILE# 1014 CSEA

FEB 20, 1996

FILE# 1014 CSEA

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
WMQ 1/31/96 CONFER RE 1739/41 FOLLOWUP.
DGL  1/31/96 RRESEARCH ULP CHARGE DOCUMENTS,

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
WMQ HOURS:  0.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR - $65.00
_ DGL HOURS:  1.75 @ $120.00 PER HOUR $210.00
NET TOTAL HOURS: 2.25 NET TOTAL FEES:;  $275.00

COSTS ADVANCED SINGE THE LAST STATEMENT:
77/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES.
" )/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES.

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
1/16/96 $15,000.00 FEE PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.

1/24/96 $333.63 THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.
2/07/96 $15,000.00 THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.
2/07/96  $18.07 COST PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.

STATEMENT DATE: FEB 20,1986 FILE# 1014

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:  $165,461.52

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE : $293.49

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY:;

(10)

HOURS FEES

.50 65.00
1.75 210.00
2.25 $275.00

COSTS
12.00
6.49
$18.49
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STATEMENT

DGL
DGL
DGL
DGL

CELIAM. RUIZ

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD,

GILROY, CA 65020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

FILE# 1013 DIAZ

FILE# 1013 DIAZ

1/24796
1/25/96
1/26/96
1/27/96

FEB 20, 1996

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

RESEARCH RE MEDICAL LEAVE ISSUE.
BACKGROUND AND STATUTORY RESEARCH.
RESEARCH.

PSYCHIATRIC EXAMINATION ISSUE,

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
DGL HOURS:  6.00 @ $120.00 PER HOUR $720.00

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
*A0/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES.

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
2/07/96

$2.20 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YQU,

[

HOURS FEES

.75 90.00

1.00 120.00

2.00 240,00

2.25 270.00

6.00 $720.00

COSTS

280

$2.80

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $58.50
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE : $722.80
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT $2.20-

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: FEB 20,1996 FILE# 1013

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT

RAS
CMR
RAS
CMR
RAS
RAS

RAS

LS

IAD

LS

CMR

CMR
CMR

CMR

RAS
IAD

CMR

"CELIA M. RUIZ

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE VS s

FILE# 1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE

1/02/96
1/03/96
1/12/96
1/18/96
1/19/96
1/22/96

1/23/96

1/23/96
1/23/96
1/24/96
1/24/96

1/25/96

1/25/96

1/26/96
1/29/96

1/30/96

1/30/96
1/30/96

1/31/96
1/31/96

FEB 20, 1995

FILE# 1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

PREPARE DISCIPLINARY PROCEDURES.

TC WITH MAYLE RE OUTSTANDING ISSUES.

PREPARE DISCIPLINARY PROCEDURES.

MEETING WITH DR. MAYLE RE NEGOTIATIONS AND OUTSTANDING ISSUES.
STRATEGIZE RE GRAND JURY INVESTIGATION AND UPCOMING TASKS.
STRATEGIZE RE GRAND JURY INVESTIGATION; REVIEW SUBPOENA; CONDUCT

RESEARCH REGARDING PROCEDURES GOVERNING CONSULTING CONTRACTS WITH

DISTRICT; REVIEW RELEVANT DOCUMENTS.

CONDUCT RESEARCH RELEVANT TO GRAND JURY INVESTIGATION, INCLUDING
PERMISSIBLE METHODS OF DISCOVERY, ATTENDANCE OF COUNSEL DURING
QUESTIONING, PROCEDURAL REQUIREMENTS RELATING TO SUBPOENAS AND
RELATED MATTERS. _

CONFER RE CLOSED BOARD SESSION; CONFER WITH G. MAYLE RE SAME,
REVIEW & FINALIZE SAME,

RESEARCH AND DRAFTING OF LETTER RE SPECIAL BOARD MEETINGS;
AGENDAS,

CONDUCT RESEARCH OF ISSUES RELATED TO GRAND JURY INVESTIGATION;
PREPARE MEMORANDUM RE SAME.

REVIEW & FINALIZE REVISED AGENDA NOTICE & COVER LETTER RE GRAND
JURY; CONFER RE STANDARD AGENDA FORM FOR ALL CLOSED SESSIONS;
REVIEW GAVILAN NOTICE & LEFT WORD RE SAME; REVIEW GRAND JURY
QUESTIONNAIRE.

PREPARATION FOR MEETING WIiTH BOARD; REVISE MEMORANDUM TO
GOVERNING BOARD RE PROCESS AND PROCEDURES; TRAVEL; MEETING WATH
DR. MAYLE; MEETING WITH GOVERNING BOARD.

CONDUCT RESEARCH OF ISSUES RELATED TO GRAND JURY INVESTIGATION;
PREPARE MEMORANDUM RE SAME.

PREPARE FOR BOARD TESTIMONY AND PRESENTATION TC GRAND JURY.
PREPARATION FOR MEETING WITH BOARD MEMBERS RE GRAND JURY; MEETING
WITH ADMINISTRATORS; TRAVEL.

TC WITH VARIOUS COUNSEL AND SIEGEL; TC WITH MAYLE; TC WITH DARE
SUBPOENA; REVIEW OUTSTANDING ISSUES IN PREPARATION FOR MEETING.
CONFER RE; GRAND JURY INVESTIGATION.

RESFARCH AND DRAFTING OF LETTER ON PROCEDURE FOR SPECIAL -
MEETINGS, CLOSED EXECUTIVE SESSIONS, AND CLOSED SESSION AGENDAS.
TRAVEL TO SAN JOSE; PREPARATION FOR MEETING; MEETING IN ADVANCE
RE ISSUES; DEBRIEFING.

CONFER RE: GRAND JURY INVESTIGATION.

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CMR HOURS: 24.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $3152.50

HOURS FEES
.25 32,50
.25 32.50
.50 65.00

A 4,00~ 520.00
.50 65.00

2.75 357.50
4.00 520.00
.75 97.50
4.00 480.00
5.50 715.00
1.00 130.00
6.50 845.00
4.75 617.50
1.00 130.00
5.00 650.00
1.00 130.00
.25 32.50
4,50 540,00
6.50 845.00
.25 32.50
53.25  $6.837.50
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STATEMENT

1/24/96
2/07/96

Cw. _ 'S ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
2/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES.
2/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES.
2/10/96 CURRENT WORD PROCESSING CHARGES,
2/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES.

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT!
$5,045.65 THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.
$2.783.03 THANKYOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE:
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY::

STATEMENT DATE: FEB 20,1996 FILE# 1001

RUTIZ & SCHAPIRO

2503-10-1001 FEB 20, 1996 PAGE 2
' RAS HOURS: 18.75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $2437.50
JLS HOURS: 1.75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $227.50
IAD HOURS: 8.50 @ $120.00 PER HOUR  $1020.00
HET TOTAL HOURS: 53.25 NET TOTAL FEES: $6837.50

COSTS
75.40
22.20

5,00
38.00

$140.60

$13,680.15

$6,978.10
$7.828.608-
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STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ FEB 20, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAFIRO

500 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 335-3005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD

FILE# 10168 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE

FILE# 1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE (i)

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
1/24/96 $1.00 PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YQU.
2/07/96 $195.00 THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $7.286.02
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: :3200.00-

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: FEB20, 1996 FILE# 1016

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT

CELIAM. RUIZ . FEB 20, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIROQ

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD

FILE# 1017 JOHNSON'S DFEH COMPLAINT (10)
FILE# 1017 JOHNSON'S DFEH COMPLAINT {10}
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
1/24/96 $72.16  THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.
2/07/96 $987.85 THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT,
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $1,060.01

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: 060,01~
NO BALANCE DUE:

STATEMENT DATE: FEB 20,1996 FILE# 1017

RUXZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT

CMR
MK
IAD
LS
IAD
CMR
LS
IAD
MK

Ji <

1AL
IAD
CMR
IAD
CMR
LS

tAD
LS

IAD
AD
IAD
MK
LS
IAD
IAD
IMMQ
IAD
WMQ
(AD
LS

(AD

LILS

CMR

" CELIA M. RUIZ

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 84111

TELEPHONE (415} 395-9005

GAVILAN COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD
GILROY, CA 95020

FILE# 1021 JOHNSONTORT

FEB 20, 1996

1/02/96
1/02/96
1/02/96
1/03/96
1/03/96
1/04/96
1/04/96
1/04/96
1/05/96

1/05/96

1707796

1/08/96
1/09/96
1/09/96
1/10/96
1/10/96

1/10/96
1/11/96

1/11/96
1/12/96
1/16/96
1/17/96
1/17/96
1/17/%6
1/18/96
1/19/96
1/15/96
1/22/96
1/22/96
1/23/96

1/23/96
1/24/96
1/24/96
1/25/96

FILE# 1021 JOHNSONTORT

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

REVIEW COMPLAINT AND ASSIGN RESEARCH.

REVIEW RESEARCH RE DEMURRER.

WORK ON DEMURRER TO COMPLAINT.

CONSIDER INSURANCE COVERAGE.

REVIEW OF STATEMENT OF CHARGES.

REVIEW COMPLAINT AND POTENTIAL DEMURRER.

DRAFT LETTER TO KEENAN RE COVERAGE.

RESEARCH RE JOHNSON DEMURRER,

REVIEW LETTERS RE INSURANCE COVERAGE; CONFERENCE RE LEGAL
RESEARCH.

CONFER WITH KEENAN & ASSOCIATES RE JOHNSON CLAIM TENDER; DRAFT
MEMO SUMMARIZING SAME; DRAFT CONFIRMING CLIENT LETTER RE SAME.
REVIEW OF JOHNSON COMPLAINT AND DEMURRER MATERIALS.
RESEARCH RE PREP OF DEMURRERS.
ASSIST ON DEMURRER.
RESEARCH RE DEMURRERS.
PREPARE RESPONSE.

DRAFT INSURANCE RELATED CORRESPONDANCE; CONFER WITH ROBIN FAWKES
RE COVERAGE; DRAFT MEMO SUMMARIZING SAME.

RESEARCH RE DEMURRERS.

CONFER WITH WORKERS COMP ATTY & DRAFT MEMO & LETTER RE SAME;
CONFER WITH KEENAN & ASSOC; DRAFT MEMO RE SAME,

RESEARCH Rz DEMURRERS.

STRATEGY MEETING; RESEARCH RE DEMURRERS.

RESEARCH & DRAFTING CF DEMURRER,

LEGAL RESEARCH,

DRAFT LETTER TO R. FAWKES,

RESEARCH & DRAFTING OF DEMURRER,

RESEARCH & DRAFTING OF DEMURRER.

REVIEW COMPLAINT AND PRELIMINARY DRAFT OF DEMURRER ARGUMENT.
RESEARCH & DRAFTING OF DEMURRER.

CONFER RE DEMURRER STRATEGY, CALDWELL ISSUE.

RESEARCH & DRAFTING OF DEMURRER.

STRATEGHZE RE DEMURRER, MOTION TO STRIKE, JUDICIAL NOTICE
REQUEST; REVIEW OPPOSING COUNSEL LETTER.

PHONE CALL TO B. PARDUE RE: POSTPONEMENT; LETTER CONFIRMING
POSTPONEMENT; RESEARCH AND DRAFTING OF DEMURRER.

REVIEW & EDIT STIPULATION & ORDER; CONFER WITH COURT CLERK RE
SAME; CONFER WITH INSURANCE COMPANY RE SAME.

DRAFTING APPLICATION AND ORDER FOR POSTPONEMENT OF TIME TO
RESPOND; PHONE CALLS TO SANTA CLARA COURT.

REVIEW DEMURRER AND RESPONSE.

t

—
.

— o

e L) P

[AC B WIS 5 I =Y

O = ] L
A e v e s

FEES
585.00
97.50
90.00
32.50
210.00
195.00
65.00
180.00
65.00

65.00

150.00
516.00
455.00
840.00
130.00
162.50

540.00
162.50

780.00
630.00
840.00
260.00

32.50
360.00
900.00
130.00
720.00

97.50
960,00
162.50

330.00
97.50
210.00

130.00
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STATEMENT

2’5_0:?-_16-"302"1 FEB 20, 1996 PAGE 2
IAD  1/25/96 RESEARCH AND DRAFTING OF DEMURRER; DRAFTING OF NOTICE OF ENTRY OF 5.50 660.00
ORDER. :
CM®  1/26/96 RESEARCH DEMURRER ISSUES. 1.00 130.00
I/ 1/26/96 RESEARCH AND DRAFTING OF DEMURRER. 6.50 780.00
AL 1/27/96 RESEARCH AND DRAFTING OF DEMURRER. 525 630.00
IAD  1/28/96 RESEARCH AND DRAFTING OF DEMURRER. 2.5 270.00
IAD  1/29/96 RESEARCH AND DRAFTING OF DEMURRER. 2 50 300.00
IAD  1/31/96 REVISIONS TO DEMURRER; PLANNING STRATEGY. 1.00 12600

1{5.75 “§14.065.00

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CHR HOURS: 12.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1625.00
M< HOURS: 3.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $422.50
JLS HOURS:  6.00 @ $130,00 PER HOUR  $780.00
WMQ HOURS:  1.75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $227.50
IAD HOURS: 91.75 @ $120.00 PER HOUR $11010.00
RET TOTAL HOURS: 115.25 NET TOTAL FEES: $14065.00

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
2/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES, 220,00
9/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 3.00
2/10/96 CURRENT MESSENGER SERVICE CHARGES. 272.09

$495.09

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

1/24/96 $305.97 THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.
2/07/96 $28.32 COST PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $334.29
PLUS; CHARGES LISTED ABOVE : $14,560.09

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

$334,29-

STATEMENT DATE: FEB 20,1996 FIiLE# 1021

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT

- CELIA M. RUIZ FEB 50, 1996

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN COMMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. A
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTN: DR. GLENN MAYLE

FILE# 1022 JOHNSON - DISCIPLINE (10)

FILE# 1022 JOHNSON - DISCIPLINE (10)

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
2/07/96 $6.80° COST PAYMENT WAS RECEIVED, THANK YOU.

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT
NO BALANCE DUE

' St wE T LIt 4 T b gD REFITEAT AT T

STATEMENT DATE: FEB 20,1996 FILE# 1022 -

RUIZ & SCHAPIRQ
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STATEMENT

DGL
DGL
MK

RAS

CMR
MK

RAS

CMR

DGL
CMR
RAS
DGL
RAS

CMR
RAS

CMR

IAD

CMR

CMR

LS

e wS

OGL

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.

GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

1/04/95

1/05/95
1/02/96
1/02/96
1/03/96
1/03/96

1/03/96
1/03/96

1/04/96

1/04/96
1/04/96
1/05/96
1/05/96
1/05/96
1/08/96

1/09/96
1/09/96

1/10/36
1/10/36
1/11/9%6
1/12/9
1/12/96
1/12/96
1/16/96

1/16/96
1/18/9

i CELIAM. RUIZ

RUIZ & SCHAPIRG -

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415} 395-9005

FILE# 1006 LABOR RELATIONS

FILE# 1006 LABOR RELATIONS

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

CONFER RE: BUSINESS MANAGER POSITION; UNFAIR PRACTICE CHARGE
RESEARCH,

UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE CHARGE RESEARCH.

REVIEW MATERIALS RE EMPLOYEE ELVIRA JOHNSON.

RESEARCH RE UNFAIR PRACTICE CHARGE,

TC WITH MAYLE RE FACULTY AND CSEA NEGOTIATIONS,

REVIEW DOCUMENTS, TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE LINK,TELEPHONE

CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL;DRAFT LETTERS TO OPPOSING
COUNSEL;TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DR. MAYLE RE MISC. LABOR
MATTERS. :
CONFER RE ULP - BUSINESS OFFICER'S POSITION; RESEARCH RE SAME.
CONFER RE: BUSINESS OFFICE MANAGER POSITION; UNFAIR PRACTICE
CHARGE RESEARCH.

PREPARE UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE CHARGE,

STRATEGIZE RE UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE CHARGE FGOR BUSINESS OFFICER' 8

POSITION AND RELATED MATTERS; RESEARCH RE SAME.

CONFER RE: BUSINESS MANAGER POSITION; UNFAIR PRACTICE CHARGE
RESEARCH, .

DRAFT LETTER TO PEARL RE FACULTY NEGOTIATION ON ANNUITY; PREPARE
ULP RE BUSINESS MANAGER POSITION.

RESEARCH RE UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE CLAIM; PREPARE SAME.

UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE CHARGE RESEARCH.

RESEARCH RE UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE CLAIM; PREPARE SAME.

REVIEW QUTSTANDING ISSUES WITH CSEA.

STRATEGIZE RE UNFAIR PRACTICE ISSUES; PREPARE UNFAIR PRACTICE
CLAIM; PPREPARE PETITION FOR UNIT MODIFICATION; RESEARCH RE TIME
LIMITS APPLICABLE TO VACANT POSITIONS.

REVIEW UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE CLAIM.

RESEARCH RE REASSIGNMENT OF TEACHERS DURING THE MIDDLE OF THE
SCHOOL YEAR WITHOUT A LOSS IN WORK HOURS.

PREPARATION FOR NEGOTIATION; TRAVEL AND MEETING WITH
ADMINISTRATORS FOR NEGOTIATION; DEBRIEFING RE OUTCOME AND FOLLOW
up.

PREPARE AND FINAL UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE CHARGE.

PREPARE ULP CHARGE; PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO DR. MAYLE; CONFER
RE RECLASSIFICATION PETITION.

REVIEW & EDIT UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE CHARGE; CONFER WITH J.

HANSELL RE SAME; CONFER WITH LARRY CARRIER RE SAME; STRATEGIZE RE
SAME, ’}m

PREPARE FOR FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS; TC WITH COOPER RE SAME.
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE RE PETTION FOR UNIT MODIFICATION.
RESEARCH RE REQUIREMENT OF WRITTEN CONTRACT.

FEB 20, 1986

(10)

(10)

HOURS FEES
& 1.2 [/ 150,00
“ .25 L 3000

3.50 455.00
=1.504  195.00
- 32.50

3.00 390.00

<= .75 ¢ 97.50
- 1.25 £/ 150.00
= .15 L . 97.50
=-1.50 44  195.00

€ 1.25(f 150.00
g 1,26 4 162.50

= 3,754  487.50
- .25/ 30.00
G~ 5,250 682.50
< 2.00 260.00
- 3.254/ 422 .50
< 1.00 ¥ 130.00
C 2.50 300.00

8.50 4/ 1,105.00

& 2,250
—-€ 3.75f

£ 1.25 ¢/
1.00 "/

1.00
2.00’/

27

292.50
487.50

162.50 -
130.00

130.00
240.00




. STATEMENT e
T AT .
2503-10-1006 FEB 20, 1996 = SO PAGE 2

/J z ”

RAS  1/19/96 PREPARE UNFAIR LABOR PRACTICE CHARGES REGARDING BUSINESS OFFICE -6 .75 ¢y 97.50
POSITION FOR FILING.

CMR  1/22/96 PREPARATION FOR NEGOTIATION. 1.504/ 195.00

C 1/25/96 GATHER MATERIALS FOR FACULTY NEGOTIATIONS; PREPARE GROUND RULES; 1.50A) 195,00
DISCUSSION RE SCHEDULING OF MEETINGS. '

RAS  1/29/96 TELECON W/PERB RE STATUS OF ULP CHARGE AND RELATED ISSUES; £ .5y 97.50
PREPARE MEMORANDUM RE SAME.

RAS  1/31/96 CONFER RE: REQUEST FOR JUDICIAL NOTICE. 25 32.50

59.00 $7.582.50

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CHR HOURS: 20.00 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $2600.00
MK HOURS: 6.50 @ $138.00 PER HOUR $845.00
RAS HOURS: 22.50 @ $130,00 PER HOUR  $2925.00
JLS HOURS: 1.25 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $162.50
DGL HOURS:  6.25 @ $120.00 PER HOUR $750.00
[AD HOURS:  2.50 . @ $120.00 PER HOUR $300.00
NET TOTAL HOURS: 59,00/ NET TOTAL FEES: $7582.50

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
2/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 95 60
2/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES. 9.65
2/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES, 15. 00
2/10/96 CURRENT MESSENGER SERVICE CHARGES. ' 7.94
2/10/96 CURRENT EXPEDITED MAIL CHARGES. 14.00

$142.19

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINGE THE LAST STATEMENT:
1/724/96 $12,849.24 THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.
2/07/96 $7.,869.18 THANKYOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $40,224.67

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE : $7,724.69

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $20,718,42-
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

s

STATEMENT DATE: FEB 20,1896 FILE# 1006

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT

LOEC =l s

EA CELIA M. RUIZ
 RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

™
GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE Q{
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROQY, CA 85020
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

JAN 12, 1996

1995

FILE# 1000 SUMMARY FILE

FILE# 1015 ARBALLO

CURRENT HOURS: 4225 f* 1 ¢t Hlusin 7

PREVIOUS BALANGE: el 35,795, 42
. PLUSLATE CHARGES: "y, ({45 0.00

PLUS CUR COSTS: 118.43v"
FILE# 1019 CONSTRUGTION !

CURRENT HOURS: 17.00 e

L
PREVIOUS BALANGE: b tLaion 675.67
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00
'US CUR COSTS: 13.66 /

FILE# 1014 CSEA Do

CURRENT HOURS:  0.00 \ ?-‘\‘\“9‘@

PREVIOUS BALANGE: 171,107.32

PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00

PLUS CUR COSTS: 18.07 |/
FILE# 1013 DIAZ ( -7

CURRENT HOURS:  0.00 w

PREVIOUS BALANGE: b\)t\[‘ oy 70.20

PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00

PLUS CUR GOSTS: 2.20
FILE# 1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE

CURRENT HOURS: 19.25

PREVIOUS BALANCE:- . 12,643.82

PLUS LATE CHARGES: Cus dokur \ 0.00

PLUS CUR COSTS: 288.03
FILE# 1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE

CURRENT HOURS:  1.50

PREVIOUS BALANCE: 7,386,52

PLUS LATE CHARGES: - \X{, . .00

PLUS CUR COSTS: @m"\ 4.00

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:

EGUALS MEW BALANCE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:

PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS CUR FEES:

EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

16,779.94
'5.180.00j
24,313.91+

675.467
2,210.00+
2.223.81/3

1

5,663.87-
0.00
165,461.52v/

13.90-
0.00
58.50

1,746.70-
2.495.060
13,680.15

C

299.50-
185,00
7.286.02+

48
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STATEMENT

[2502-70-1000 JAN 12, 1996

FILE # “1017 JOHNSON'S DFEH COMPLAINT
CURRENT HOURS: 725
PREVIOUS BALANCE: s 9,729.16 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
US LATE CHARGES: \\-. 0.00 ,  PLUS CUR FEES:

. -US CURCOSTS: | 45.35" EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

FILE# 1021 JOHNSON TORT w
CURRENT HOURS:  0.00 A ; LQ’M‘_ :

"PREVIOUS BALANCE: . ' 435.97 - MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:
PLUS CUR COSTS: 28,32 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

FILE# 1022 JOHNSON - DISCIPLINE
CURRENT HOURS:  6.00

PREVIOUS BALANCE: &\ w!\_‘[u,\’& 0.00 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS LATE CHARGES: s 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:

PLUS CUR COSTS: 6.80 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

FILE# 1012 KARCICH -

CURRENT HOURS: . 0.00 /}

PREVIOUS BALANCE: . 65.00 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES:

PLUS CUR COSTS: ' 0.00 EQUALS NEW BALANCE;

FILE# 1006 LABOR RELATIONS

CURRENT HOURS: 55.75
PREVIOUS BALANCE: \XL}\ 44 ,566.11 MINUS CUR PAYMENTS:
PLUS LATE CHARGES: 0.00 PLUS CUR FEES;

-OLUS CUR COSTS: 706.68 EQUALS NEW BALANCE:

TOTAL CURRENT HOURS: 143.00

TOTAL OF PREVIOUS STATEMENT BALANCES:

MINUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT PAYMENTS:
UNPAID FROM PREVIOUS STATEMENTS: $235,233,20
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT INTEREST:
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT FEES:
PLUS: TOTAL OF CURRENT COSTS:

EQUALS: TOTAL BALANCE DUE THIS STATEMENT:

STATEMENT DATE:  JAN 12,1996 FILE# 1000

RUXIZ & SCHAPIRO

PAGE 2

9,657.00-
942.504
1,060.01:

" 130.00-
0.00
334.29.)

6.00
0.00
6.80y"

65.00-
0.00
0.00

12,210.62-
7.162.50 | -
40,224 67V

$282,475.19
$47,241.99- 1
$0.00

$18,185.00
$1,231.48
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STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ
, RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE ( ) '
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. | I\
GILROY, CA 96020 l
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE -

JAN 12, 1996

1AD
IAD
1AD
MK

tAD

lt‘tD

- IMK

CMR

12122795

12/01/95
12/62/95
12/03/9%

12/04/95
12/04/95

12/05/95

- 12/26/95

12/27/9%

12/28/95

FILE# 1016 ARBALLO

/

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

DRAFTING CROSS-EXAMINATION OF ARBALLO; GALLS TO L. ORTEGA, T.7*~
RUIZ RE DRAFTING OF OPENING STATEMENT.

DRAFTING CROSS-EXAMINATION OF ARBALLO; REVISING INDEX; ORGANIZING
ARBALLO EXHIBITS.

DRAFTING CROSS-EXAMINATION OF ARBALLO; REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS FOR
HEARING AND PREPARATION FOR HEARING.

ATTEND HEARING,

TRAVEL TO AND FROM GAVILAN COLLEGE; ATTENDANCE AT ARBALLO
HEARING, 147 .00

PHONE CALLS TO L. ORTEGA AND DR. OWENS RE REVIEW OF HEARING.
ORGANIZING ARBALLO FILE AND EXHIBITS; PREPARATION OF BINDERS FROM
HEARING.

TELPHONE CALL TO HEARING OFFICER; REVIEW BRIEF OF OPPOSING
COUNSEL.

REVIEW STATUS OF CASE.

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CHR HOURS: 0.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $65.00
MK HOURS: 10.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $1365.00
IAD HOURS: 31.25 @ $120.00 PER HOR  $3750.00
NET TOTAL HOURS: 42.25. RET TOTAL FEES: $5180.00

KCOSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

1/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES,

1/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES.

1/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES.

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
$16,779.94 THANKYOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT,

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE:

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

HOURS FEES
8.25 990.00
5.00 600.00
2.50 300.00

10.00  1,300.00
10.00  1,200.00
2.00 240.00
3.50 420.00
.50 §5.00
.50 £5.00
42,25 ~ $5,180.00
COSTS

28.00

23.43

67.00

$118.43

$35,795.42
$5,298.42
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STATEMENT DATE: JAN 12, 1996 FILE # 1015

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO




STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ JAN 12, 1996
«RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR

SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN COLLEGE

5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTN: DR. MAYLE

EYACH ANB RETURNWITH YOUR PAVMENTO

FILE# 1019 CONSTRUCTION

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

{PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINGE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
MW 11730795 TELEPHONE CALL W/ GAVILAN COLLEGE REGARDING LIBRARY CONTRACT .50 65.00
: . ISSUES; RESEARCH.
PWMW  12/01/95 RESEARCH GAVILAN COLLEGE, NOTlCE QF SUBST. COMPLETION, RELEASE OF 12.25 1,592.50
RETENTION, P.C SECTION 20104.50; TELEPHONE CALL WITH GAVILAN.
WMW  12/01/95 RESEARCH GAVILAN COLLEGE, NOTICE OF SUBST. COMPLETION, RELEASE OF 1.25 162.50
RETENTION, P.C. SECTION 20104.50; TELEPHONE CALL WITH GAVILAN. .
LS 12/11/95 CONFER WITH WRIGHT RE NEW CONSTRUCTION ISSUES; STRATEGIZE WITH .50 65.00 ;
C.RUIZ & M. KAPLAN RE SAME. i
MWMW  12/18/95 TELEPHONE CALL WITH HANSEL RE LIBRARY PROJECT. .25 32.50
.8 12/22/95 REVIEWWRIGHT LETTER RE FAROTTE NEGOTIATIONS. ' .25 32.50
WK . 12/28/95 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DR. MAYLE; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH 1.50 195.00
JOHN HANSELL; REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE;TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH
WILLIAM WRIGHT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DR. MAYLE.
MWMW  12/28/95 TELEPHONE CALL W/ KAPLAN; TC TO EXPERTS; TC W/ CHANCELLOR'S : .50 65.00
OFFICE;
17.00  $2,210.00
SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
MK HOURS: 1.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $195.00
JLS HOURS: 0.75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $97.50
WMH HOURS: 14.75 © $130.00 PER HOUR  $1917.50
NET TOTAL HOURS: 17.00 NET TOTAL FEES: $2210.00
ICOSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
1/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 5.60
1/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 8.00
$13.60
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
12722795 $675.46 THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $675.67
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $2,223.80
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $675,46-
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STATEMENT

[2503-10-1019 JAN 12, 1996 PAGE 3

1 r

STATEMENT DATE: JAN 12, 1996 FILE # 1019

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT

CELIAM. RUIZ
| RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEFHONE (415} 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. ’
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

YIRS

OUR PAYMENT:

JAN 12, 1896

FILE# 1014 CSEA
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
1/10/96 CURRENT POSTAGE CHARGES.

1/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES.
1/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES.

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
12/22/95 $5,663.87 THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.

STATEMENT DATE: JAN 12,1996

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

FILE# 1014

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:

PLUS: GHARGES LISTED ABOVE :
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY:

COSTS
1.60
15.60
0.87
$18.07

$171,107.32
$18.07
3
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STATEMENT

CELIAM. RUIZ

.RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

- TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE . L
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. '

GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

JAN 12, 1996

t
i
i
1
I
1
'

FILE# 1013 DIAZ
[COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
1/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES.

PAYMENT AGTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
12/22/95 $13.90 THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.

STATEMENT DATE: JAN 12,1886

RUIZ & SCHAPIRCO

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE :

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY:

FILE# 1013

COSTS

2,20

$2.20

1
H
i
1
[
i
1
1
i




STATEMENT .
: CELIA M. RUIZ JAN 12, 1996
. . RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415} 395-9005

675?

- GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE - - -~ 4 =
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD. (
GILROY, CA 95020
ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE / -

FILE# 1001 GAVILAN GENERAL LEGAL ADVICE

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
RAS 12/05/95 TELECONFERENCE WITH D.A. REGARDING GRAND JURY INVESTIGATION. 1.00 130.00 |
CMR  12/07/95 ADVICE RE NURSING STUDENT; ADVICE RE HERNANDEZ. .50 65.00 |
ICK  12/07/95 RESEARCH QUESTION WHETHER CLASSIFIED SUPERVISOR MAY REVIEW @1—00’
PERSONNEL FILE OF CLASSIFIED EMPLOYEES. '
CMR  12/08/95 TC TO GRAND JURY FOREMAN AND DA RE SITE VISIT ON WEDNESDAY; .75 97.50
FOLLOW-UP; TC WITH MAYLE.
RAS 12/08/95 CONFER REGARDING GRAND JURY INVESTIGATION AND RELATED RESEARCH; 75 97.50
CONTACT GRAND JURY FOREPERSON AND DISTRICT ATTORNEY.
CMR  12/11/95 TC WITH DA RE GRANDJURY. 1.75 221.50
¢ 12/11795 TC WITH COOPER AND MAYLE RE HERNANDEZ. .75 97.50
Re.o  12/11795 CONFER RE: GRAND JURY INVESTIGATION COMMUNICATIONS. .25 32.50
JSJ  12/12/95 STRATEGIZE RE BUSINESS OFFICER ISSUE. m
CMR  12/13/95 TC WITH DA RE GRAND JURY VISIT; RESEARCH; TG WITH DR. MAYLE RE DA - 1.25 162.50
' DISCUSSION.
RAS 12/13/95 CONFER RE: COMMUNICATION W/ DISTRICT ATTORNEY. .25 32.50
CMR 12/14/95 FOLLOW-UP ON ARBALLO AND JOHNSON ISSUES." 1.00 130,00
RAS 12/14/95 CONDUCT RESEARCH RE BROWN ACT AND GRAND JURY SECRECY REQUIREMENT; 4.00 520.00

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO GRAND JURY RE SAME; PREPARE
CORRESPONDENCE TO G. MAYLE REGARDING SAME;

RAS 12/20/95 REWVISE DISCIPLINARY PROCEDURES. —— 357.50

MK 12/21/95 REVIEW AND CORRECT DRAFT CSEA CONTRACT; DRAFT LETTER ENCLOSING U C2.00 ;
CONTRACT TO DR. MAYLE. -

RAS 12/21/95 REVISE DISCIPLINARY PROCEDURES: CONFER RE: APPLICABLE LAW. a 50 65.00 )

MK  12/28/95 PREPARE AUDIT LETTER. 50

19.25 $2.,495.00

SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CMR HOURS:  6.00 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $780.00
MK HOURS: 2.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $325.00
RAS HOURS: 9.50 ® $130.00 PER HOUR  $1235.00
JSJ HOURS:  0.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $65.00
CK HOURS: 0.75 @ $120.00 PER HOR $90.00

NET TOTAL HOURS: 19.25 NET TOTAL FEES: $2495.00
(CMATS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:! COSTS
~ J/95 COMPUTER RESEARCH. 190.00
1/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES, 1.60




STATEMENT

2503-10-1001 JAN 12, 1996

1/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES.
1/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES.

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
12/22/95 $1,746.70 THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.

STATEMENT DATE: JAN 12, 1986

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE:

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

FILE# 1001

$288,03

PAGE 2

20.43
76.00

$12,643.82
$2,783.03
$1,746.70-
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STATEMENT

CELIA M. RUIZ JAN 12, 1996
. RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANGISCO, CA 94111
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

. GAVILAN JOINT CCD

EAS

LT S

FILE# 1016 JOHNSON'S WRIT OF MANDATE

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE :
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: JAN 12,1886 FILE# 1016

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: HOURS FEES
CMR 12/27/95 PREPARE LITIGATION ISSUES. 1,50 195.00
1.50 $195.00
SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CHR HOURS: 1.50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR ~ $195.00
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS |
1/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 4,00 °
$4.00 .
+ AYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
12/22/95 $299.50 THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT,
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $7.386.52




STATEMENT

CELIAM. RUIZ

RUIZ & SCHAFIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14THFLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 84111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT CCD

g -

JAN 12, 1996

FILE# 1017 JOHNSON'S DFEH COMPLAINT

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY:

STATEMENT DATE: JAN 12,1936 FILE# 1017

HOURS FEES
MK 12/15/95 DRAFTLETTER TO DR. MAYLE RE DFEH RESOLUTION. .25 32.50
MK 12/27/95 REVIEW SUPERIOR COURT COMPLAINT,TELEPHONE CONFERNCE WITH DR. 6.00 780.00
MAYLE RE COMPLAINT,LEGAL RESEARCH.
CMR 12/28/95 CONFERENCE RE COMPLAINT. .50 65.00
MK 12/28/95 CONFERNCE RE LEGAL RESEARCH, .50 65.00
7.25 $942.50
SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CMR HOURS: 0,50 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $65.00
MK HOURS: 6.75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR $877.50
NET TOTAL HOURS: 7.25 NET TOTAL FEES:  $942.50
COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
1/10/96 CURRENT POSTAGE CHARGES, 0.55
1/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 9.80
1/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 35.00
$45.35
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
12/22/95 $9.657.00 THANK YCU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $9,729.16
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE : $987.85
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: 39,657,000
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" STATEMENT
CELIAM. RUIZ ‘ JAN 12,1996
b AUIZ & SCHAPIRO
600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
i SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111
: TELEPHONE (415} 395-9005

o GAVILAN COMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD
GILROY, CA 95020

FILE# 1021 JOHNSON TORT

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE.THE LAST STATEMENT:

COSTS
1/10/96 CURRENT POSTAGE CHARGES. 0.32
1/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 28.00
528.32
PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
12/22/95 $130.00 THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.
BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $435.97

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE :
MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: JAN 12,1996 FILE# 1021

RUXZ & SCHAPIRC




STATEMENT

[+ ‘ CELIAM. RUIZ JAN 12, 1996
- PUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111

TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN COMMMUNITY COLLEGE
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTN: DR. GLENN MAYLE

FILE# 1022 JOHNSON - DISCIPLINE

COSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: | COSTS
1/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 6.80
$6.80

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:
PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE :
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY:

STATEMENT DATE:  JAN 12,1996 FILE# 1022

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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STATEMENT

CELIAM. RUIZ , JAN 12, 1996
RUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111 '
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

"GAVILAN UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT
5055 SANTA THERESA BLVD.
GILROY, CA 95020
ATTENTION: GLENN MAYLE

FILE# 1012 KARCICH

FILE# 1012 KARCICH

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
12/22/95 $65.00 THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT:

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT
NO BALANCE DUE:

STATEMENT DATE: JAN 12,1986 FILE# 1012

RUXIZ & SCHAPIRO

$65.00 .
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STATEMENT

CELIAM. RUIZ

" TRUIZ & SCHAPIRO

600 MONTGOMERY STREET, 14TH FLOOR
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94111 ’
TELEPHONE (415) 395-9005

GAVILAN JOINT COMMUNITY COLLEGE .
5055 SANTA TERESA BLVD.,
GILROY, CA 95020

ATTENTION: DR. GLENN MAYLE

JAN 12, 1996

RAS

DGL
CMR

CMR
RAS

CMR

RAS

DGL
MK

RAS
MK

CMR
MIK
RAS

LIS
LS
DGL
LSS
DGL
RAS

DGL

IMK

RAS .

12/01/95

12/01/95

12/04/95
12/04/95
12/05/95
12/05/95

12/06/95
12/07/95

12/07/95

12/07/95
12/11/95

12/11/95
12/12/95

12/13/95
12/13/95
12/18/95

12/18/95
12/19/85
12/19/95
12/20/95
12/20/95
12/22/95

12/22/95
12/26/95

FILE# 1006 LABOR RELATIONS

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO G. MAYLE REGARDING ISSUES SURROUNDING
R. HERNANDEZ POSITION; CONDUCT RESEARCH REGARDING SAME.
RESEARCH RE 60/40 POSITION.

FOLLOW UP ON VARIOUS NEGOTIATION ISSUES.

CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: R. HERNANDEZ.

REVIEW VARIOUS COLLECTIVE BARGAINING ISSUES.

CONFER RE: HERNANDEZ AND VARIOUS OUTSTANDING ISSUES; RESEARCH RE:
LAYOFF AND REEMPLOYMENT RIGHTS AND RECLASSIFICATION PROCEDURE;
PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO G. MAYLE RE R. HERNANDEZ,

PREPARE FOR COLLECTIVE BARGAINING.

PREPARE FOR COLLECTIVE BARGAINING SESSION; ALL DAY NEGOTIATION
SESSSION.

CONFER RE: TIME LIMIT AFFECTING SUBSTITUTIONS INTO VACANT

POSITIONS; CONDUCT RESEARCH RE: SAME; TELECONFERENCE W/ J, GELT
REGARDING RECLASSIFICATION PROCEDURE; PREPARE MEMORANDUM RE:
SAME, y

RESEARCH RE: SUBSTITUTE EMPLOYEES. 57
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CAROL COOPER RE CERTIFICATED
ISSUE;REVIEW PROPOSED CSEA CONTRACT REVISIONS, TELEPHONE /—b/’o
CONFERENCE WITH JOHN HANSELL; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DR.MAYLE.
CONFER RE: RE. HERNANDEZ POSITION AND RELATED ISSUES; REVISE
CORRESPONDENCE RE: SAME.

CONFERENCE RE RESEARCH ON BUSINESS MANAGER ISSUE; CONFERENCE CALL
WITH CMR AND DR. MAYLE RE GRAND JURY.

REVIEW OUTSTANDING ISSUES,

TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DR. MAYLE RE LABOR RELATIONS MATTER.
REVIEW STATUS AND QUTSTANDING ISSUES, INCLUDING BUSINESS

OFFICER'S POSITION; REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE: SAME.

CONFER RE BUSINESS OFFICER ISSUE.

RESEARCH BUSINESS OFFICE MANAGER ISSUE.

RESEARCH RE TRANSFER OF WORK ISSUES.

LEGAL RESEARCH STRATEGIZING RE TRANSFER OF BARGAINING UNIT WORK.
RESEARCH RE TRANSFER OF WORK ISSUE.

PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO G, MAYLE RE: RECLASSIFICATION OF M,

YUSTE POSITION; REVIEW ISSUES SURROUNDING BUISINESS OFFICER'S
POSITION.

CONFER RE; TRANSFER OF WORK RESEARCH.

REVIEW CSEA CONTRACT,DRAFT LETTER TO DR. MAYLE RE CONTRACT,

HOURS
5.00

N o175
A 1.00

2.25
o .75
.. 4.50

s 2:00 'V/

—£12.004

Cc 2.25
< 1.75
o 2.00

1,50
.50

.50
.25
M 1.50

W50
# 3.75
C 2,25
C .50
< 2.50
1) 2.00

C .25
o 2.00

/1.

FEES
650.00

210.00
130.00
292.50

57.50
585.00

260.00
560.00

292.50

210.00
260.00

195.00
65.00

65.00
32.50
195.00

65.00
487.50
270.00

65.00
300.00
260.00

30.00
260.00
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STATEMENT

2503-10-1006 JAN 12, 1996 PAGE 2
. N ‘ : - /.‘
| ' N
TELEPHONE CALL TO JOHN HANSELL RE CONTRACT; MISC. LABOR ISSUES. A
CMR  12/27/95 UPDATE ON OUTSTANDING ISSUES; BUSINESS MANAGER ETC. 1,00 130.00
" 12/27/95 CONFERENCE RE BUSINESS OFFICE MANAGER ISSUES. A 50 65.00
w#R  12/28/95 REVIEW OUTSTANDING ISSUES RE BUSINESS MANAGER, nJ .50 65.00
MK 12/28/95 CONFERENCES RE BUSINESS OFFICE ISSUE. ~J 50 65.00

55.75 $7.162.50;

~ SUMMARY OF HOURS, RATES & FEES
CMR HOURS: 17.75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $2307.50 -~
MK HOURS: 5.75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $747.50 -
RAS HOURS: 19.00 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $2470.00
JSJ HOURS: 4,75 @ $130.00 PER HOUR  $617.50
. DGL HOURS: 8,50 @ $120.00 PER HOUR  $1020.00
NET TOTAL HOURS: 55.75 NET TOTAL FEES: $7162.50

ICOSTS ADVANCED SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: COSTS
11/30/95 COMPUTER RESEARCH. 312.00
12/07/95 WORKING LUNCH, 14.61
1/10/96 CURRENT POSTAGE CHARGES, : 6.52
1/10/96 CURRENT PHOTOCOPY CHARGES. 278.60
1/10/96 CURRENT TELEPHONE CHARGES. 22.20
1/10/96 CURRENT FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION CHARGES. 17.00
1/10/96 CURRENT EXPEDITED MAIL CHARGES, ) 55.75
$706.68

3‘ 307

PAYMENT ACTIVITY SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT:
12/22/95 $12,210.62 THANK YOU FOR YOUR PAYMENT.

BALANCE FROM THE LAST STATEMENT: $44,566.11

PLUS: CHARGES LISTED ABOVE: $7,869.18

MINUS: PAYMENTS SINCE THE LAST STATEMENT: $12,210,62
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE, PLEASE PAY

STATEMENT DATE: JAN 12,1986 FILE# 1006

RUIZ & SCHAPIRO
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State Controller’s Office School Mandated Cost Manual

1.

Collective Bargaining

Summary of Chapters 961/75 and 1213791

The Rodda Act repealed Education Code Atticle 5 (commencing with § 13080), of Chapter 1 of
Division 10 and added Chapter 10.7 (commencing with § 3540) to Division 4 of Title 1 of the
Government Code, relating to public educational employment relations.

The Rodda Act, which became operative July 1, 1976, repealed the Winton Act and enacted
provisions requiring the employer and employee to meet and negotiate, thereby creating a collective
bargaining atmosphere for public school employers. It also established the Public Employment
Relations Board (PERB). PERB is responsible for issuing formal interpretations and rulings regarding
collective bargaining under the Rodda Act. :

Government Code Section 3547.5 as added by Chapter 1213, Statutes of 1991, requires school
districts to publicly disclose major provisions of a collective bargaining agreement after negotiations
but before the agreement becomes binding.

On July 17, 1978, the Commission on State Mandates (COSM), (formerly Board of -Control)
determined that Chapter 961, Statutes of 1975, resulted in state mandated costs that are
reimbursable pursuant to Part 7 (commencing with Government Code § 17500) of Division 4 of
Title 2.

On August 20, 1998, COSM determined that Chapter 1213, Statutes of 1991, resulted in state
mandated costs that are reimbursable pursuant to Part 7 {commencing with Government Code
§ 17500} of Division 4 of Title 2.

Eligible Claimants

Any school district (K-12), county office of education, or community college district that incurs
increased costs as a direct result of this mandate is eligible to claim reimbursement of these costs.

- Appropriations

These claiming instructions are issued following the adoption of the amended parameters and
guidelines by COSM. To determine if this program is funded in subsequent fiscal years, refer to the
schedule “Appropriation for-State Mandated Cost Programs” in the Annual Claiming Instriictions for
State Mandated Costs issued in October of each year {0 county superintendents of schools and
superintendents of schools.

4. Types of Claims

A. Reimbursement and Estimated Claims

A claimant may file a reimbursement and/or an estimated claim. A reimbursement claim details
the costs actually incurred for a prior year. An estimated claim shows the costs to be incurred for
the current fiscal year.

B. Minimum Claim

Section 17564(a) of the Government Code provides that no claim shall be filed pursuant to
Section 17561 unless such a claim exceeds $200 per program per fiscal year. However, any
county superintendent of schools, as fiscal agent for the school districts, may submit a combined
claim in excess of $200 on behalf of districts within the county even if an individual district's claim
does not exceed $200. A combined claim must show the individual claim costs for each district.
Once a combined claim is filed, all subsequent fiscal years relafing to the same mandate must be
filed in @ combined form. The county superintendent receives the reimbursement payment and is
responsible for disbursing funds to each participating school district. A school district may
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State Controller's Office " School Mandated Cost Manual

withdraw from the combined claim form by providing a written notice of its intent to file a separate
claim to the county superintendent of schools and the State Controller’s Office at least 180 days
prior to the deadline for filing the claim.

5, Filing Deadline

A. Initial Claims- ~County offices of education and school districts that submitted 1998-88 fiscal year
claims for professional and consultant services at the $100 per hour rate may amend their claims
to be reimbursed at the $135 per hour rate.

Pursuant to Government Code Section 17561, Subdivision {d)(1)(A), initial claims must be filed
within 120 days from the issuance date of claiming instructions. Accordingly:

(1) Amended reimbursement claims for the 1998-99 fiscal year must be filed with the State
Controfler's Office and postmarked by August 3, 2000. If the amended reimbursement claim
is filed after the deadline of August 3, 2000, the approved amount of the difference between
the $100 and $135 rate change must be reduced by a late penalty of 10%, nof to exceed
$1,000. Claims filed more than one year after the deadline will not be accepted.

(2} An amended 1999-00 estimaled claim for professional and consultant services at the $135
per hour rate may be filed with the State Controller's Office and postmarked by
August 3, 2000. Timely filed amende_d estimated claims will be paid before late claims.

B. Annually Thereafter

Refer o the item "Reimbursable State Mandated Cost Programs” contained in the cover letter for
mandated cost programs issued annually in October that identifies the fiscal years for which
claims may be filed. If an “x” is shown for the program listed under “19_ /19 Reimbursement
Claim” andfor 1 9_!20_Est|mated Claim,” claims may be filed as follows:

(1) An estimated claim filed with the State Controller's Office must be postmarked by January 15
of the fiscal year in which costs will be incurred. Tlmely filed estimated claims will be paid
before tate claims.

After having received payment for an estimated claim, the cltaimant must file a reimbursement
claim by January 15 of the following fiscal year. If the school district fails to file a
reimbursement claim, monies received for the estimated claim must be returned to the State.
If no estimated claim was filed, the school district may file a reimbursement claim detailing
the actual costs incurred for the fiscal year, provided there was an appropriation for the
program for that fiscal year. For information regarding appropriations for reimbursement
claims, refer to the "Appropriation for State Mandated Cost Programs” in the previous fiscal
year's annual claiming instructions,

(2) A reimbursement claim detailing the actual costs must be filed with the State Controller's
Office and postmarked by January 15 following the fiscal year in which costs will be incurred,
If the claim is filed after the deadliine but by January 15 of the succeeding fiscal year, the
approved claim must be reduced by a late penalty of 10%, not to exceed $1,000. Cilaims filed
more than one year after the deadline will not be accepted.

6. Reimbursable Activities

The objective of the reporting forms is to determine the Rodda Act costs incurred during the current
year and compare them with the adjusted costs incurred in the base year under the Winton Act. The
first three claim components listed below apply to both the Winton Act and Rodda Act. Components D
through F, which apply to the Rodda Act, represent activities that were not required under the Winton

Act,
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State Controller's Office School Mandated Cost Manual

A. Determining Bargaining Units and Exclusive Representation

The cost of determining appropriate bargaining units, exclusive representation and
representatives are reimbursable. Activities determined to be eligible reimbursements for this
component are as foilows:

(1) Bargaining Unit Lists
Development of proposed lists for the bargaining unit determination hearings.
(a} Contract services necessary for development of proposed lists.

{b) Salaries and benefits of district employees and related costs necessary to develop
proposed lists.

(2) PERB Hearings

Representation costs for the school employer at PERB hearings held to determine the
bargaining units and their exclusive representative.

(a) Salaries and benefits of district employees used to prepare for and represent employer at
hearings.

(b} Contract services used to prepare for and represent the employer at hearings.

{3) Substitutes

The cost of hiring substitutes to replace the employer and exclusive bargaining unit withesses
required testifying at PERB hearings. The claimant must include with the claim, a list of
teacher witnesses, their job classifications, and the date they were required to testify.

The cost of substitute release time for employee witnesses asked to attend PERB hearings
by bargaining units, but not required to testify, is not eligible for reimbursement in this -
component.

{4) Travel

" Travel Expenses incurred by district employer representatives required to attend PERB
hearings. Reimbursement shall reflect the rate specified by the regulations governing
employees of the local school district. However, the reimbursement cannot exceed the rate
adopted by the Board of Control for state employees.

() Transcript
The cost of preparing one transcript per PERB hearing is reimbursabie.
B. Election of Unit Representation ‘ ’ .

The cost of elections and decertificaticn elections of unit representatives is reimbursable in the
event PERB determines that a question of representation exists and orders an election held by
secret ballot. The claimant must inciude with the claim, any PERB agreements or orders that
state how the election must be held.

Activities eligible for reimbursement for this component are as follows:
{1} Precinct Voting List

The salaries, benefits, and related cost of developing and preparing a precinct list, if required
by PERB.

(2) Ballot Tally Observers

The salary and benefits of a school employer representative, if required by PERB to observe
the ballot count.

Revised 4/00 , Chapters 961/75 and 1213/91, Page 3 of 11



State Controlier’s Office School Mandated Cost Manual

C. Cost of Negotiations

Costs associated with receipt of the exclusive representative’s initial contract proposal, holding
public hearings, providing a reasonable number of copies of the employer's contract proposal to
the pubiic, development and presentation of the initial district contract proposal, negotiation of the
contract, reproduction and distribution of the final contract agreement. The claimant must include
with the claim, a listing of the dates of all negotiation sessions held during the fiscal year of claim.

Activities determined to be eligible for reimbursement of this component are as follows:
(1) Representative’s Contract Proposal
The employer's cost of analyzing the exclusive representative’s initial contract proposal.

(a) Salaries and benefits for public school employer representatives and supporting
personnel participating in planning sessions and related contract services.

~ (2) Public Hearings
The cost of holding public hearings related to the contract negotiations.
(3) Public Distribution of Proposed Contract

The cost of providing a reasonable number of copies of the district's proposed contract to the
public.

(a) Reproduction of copies of the initial contract proposal for the district's supervisory,
management, and confidential representatives are reimbursable.

{b) A reasonable number of copies of the initial contract for distribution to the public is
reimbuirsable.

{(4) District Contract Pro'posal

The cost of employer salaries and benefits necessary for development and presentation of
the initial district proposal and related contract services.

(5) Negotiation
The cost of negotiating a contract with the employee representatives.

(a) Salaries and benefits for district employer representatives participating in negotiations
and related contract services. Reimbursable costs for a maximum of five school! district
representatives per unit per negotiating session wiil be reimbursed.

{by Substitutes hired so that exclusive bargaining unit representatives can attend
negotiations. List the job classification of the bargaining unit representative who required
a substitute. List the dates and time the substitute worked. Substitute costs for a
maximum of five representatives per unit negotiating per sessicn are reimbursable.

(6) Public Distribution of Final Contract
The cost of reproduction of the contract and distribution of the final contract agreement.

{a) Reproduction of copies of the initial contract for distribution to the district's supervisory,
management, and confidential employee representatives.

{b) A reasonable number of copies of the final contract for purposes of public information.
The following costs are not eligible for reimbursement of this component:

{c) The cost of copies of the final contract provided to the collective bargaining unit
meimbers.

(d) The salaries of union representatives.
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D.

Impasse Proceedings

The cost of impasse proceedings is reimbursable. Activities determined to be reimbursable for
this component are as follows:

(1) Mediation
Representation costs for the school employer at mediation sessions are reimbursable.

(a) Salaries and benefits for district employees to prepare and represent the employer at the
sessions, Cost for a maximum of five public school employer representatives per
mediation session will be reimbursed.

(b) Contract services used to prepare for and represent the employer at the sessions.

(c) The cost of substitutes hired to allow exclusive bargaining unit representatives to attend
impasse proceedings. List the job classification of the employee withesses and the dates
and time of their attendance at mediation sessions. Reimbursement to a public school
district employer is limited to the cost of hiring a maximum of five substitutes to replace
five representatives so they can attend a mediation session.

(d) The cost of renting facilities for the sessions.
(eY The cost of the mediator is not eligible for reimbursement.
(2) Fact Finding
The cost of development and publication of the findings of the panel.
() All the costs of the district employer representative serving on the fact-finding panel.

(b) Fifty percent of the cost of the fact-finding panel mutuvally incurred by the employer
representative and the employee bargaining unit representative. This may include the
cost of teacher substitutes so that withesses can attend fact-finding proceedings and the
rental of facilities required to conduct the fact-finding hearing.

{(c) Special costs imposed on the district for the development of unique data required by a
fact-finding panel. Describe the special costs and explain why this data would not have
been required by a fact-finding panel under the Winton Act.

E. Collective Bargaining Agreement Disclosure

Disclosure of collective bargaining agreement affer the negotiation and before adoption by the
governing body, as required by Government Code Section 3547.5 and California State
Department of Education Management Advisory 92-01 (or subsequent replacement}.

(1) Prepare the disclosure forms and documents.

(2) Distribute a copy of the disclosure forms and documents to board members with a copy of the
proposed agreement. '

(3) Make a copy of the disclosure forms and documents and the proposed agreement available
to the public, prior to the day of the public meeting.

{(4) Train employer's personnel to prepare the disclosure forms and documents.
(5) Materials and supplies necessary to prepare the disclosure forms and documents.

For items (1) through (3) above, list the date(s) of the public hearing{s) at which the major
provisions of the agreement were disclosed in accordance with the requirements of Government
Code Section 3547.5 and the Depariment of Education Advisory 92-01 (or subsequent
reptacement).

Procedures or formats that exceed those or duplicate activities required under any other statute
or executive orders are not reimbursable under this component,
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State Controller’'s Office School Mandated Cost Manual

F. Contract Administration

The cost of contract administration and adjudication of contract disputes either by arbitration or
litigation is reimbursable.

Activities determined to be reimbursable for this component are as follows:

(1)

(4)

Training Sessions

Reasonable costs incurred for a reasonable number of training sessions held for supervisory
and management personnel regarding contract administration and interpretation of the
negotiated contract.

Grievances

(a) Salaries and benefits of public school personnel involved in adjudication of contract
disputes along with related contract services.

(b) Substitutes hired so that representative of an exclusive bargaining unit can attend
adjudication hearings regarding contract disputes. List the job classifications of the
employee withesses and the dates and time they were required to attend adjudication
hearings.

{c) The cost of one transcript per hearing is reimbursable.
Contract Disputes Presented Before PERB

(a) Public school employer costs regarding contract disputes that are presented before
PERB.

{b) Litigation costs incurred by a public school employer as a defendant in a court suit
involving contract disputes may be reimbursable. {See (4) "Appeal of PERB Ruling,”
below, if claimant is the plaintiff).

(c) Expert witness fees if the witness is called by the public schoo! employer.

(d) Reasonable reproduction costs for copies of a new contract that is required as a result of
a dispute.

(e) A public schocl employer’s portion of an arbitrator's fees (60% of costs) for adjudicating
grievances.

Appeal of PERB Ruling

Reasonable claimant costs associated with a contract dispute are reimbursable when the
claimant is the plaintiff in a court suif to appeal a PERB ruling and the claimant is the
prevailing party.

(8) The costs incurred become eligible for reimbursement in the fiscal year in which the
appeal process has been exhausted.

{b) The claimant must include with the claim a copy of the court’s ruiing.

(¢) If the claim includes costs associated with more than one appeal, the costs associated
with each appeal must be shown separately.

No reimbursement is allowed where the public school employer has filed action directly with
the courts without first submitting the dispute to PERB, if required.

No reimbursement shall be provided for filing of a brief with the court by a person who is not
party to a litigation {(i.e., amicus curiae).

The following costs are not eligible for reimbursement of this component:

(d) Contract interpretations conducted at staff meetings.
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(e) Personal development and informational programs (i.e., classes, conferences, seminars,
workshops) and time spent by employees attending such meetings.

(fy Labor/management non-adversarial training sessions

(g) Purchase of books and subscriptions for personal development and information
purposes.

G. Unfair Labor Practice Charges.

The cost of unfair labor practice adjudication process and public notice complaints are
reimbursable.

Activities determined to be reimbursable for this component are as follows:
(1) Unfair Labor Practice Presented to PERB

(a) Salaries and benefits of public school district representatives and related contract
services. :

(b) The cost of substilutes hired to replace representatives of an exclusive bargaining unit
required to attend adjudication hearings regarding unfair labor practice charges.

(¢) The cost of a transcript for each PERB hearing.

(d} Reasonable repreduction costs.

(e) Expert witness fees if the witness is called by the public school district.
(2) Appeal of a PERB Ruling

Claimant costs associated with the appeal of a PERB unfair labor practice decision are
reimbursable if the claimant is the prevailing party.

(a) The costs incurred become eligible for reimbursement in the fiscal year in which the
appeal process has been exhausted.

(b} The claim must include a copy of the court's ruling.

{c) If the claim includes costs associated with more than one appeal, the costs associated
with each appeal must be shown separately.

The following costs are not eligible for reimbursement of this component:
(d) Appeal of an unfair labor practice if PERB is the prevailing party.

(e) The filing of a brief with the court by a person who is not party to the litigation (ie.,
amicus curiae). :

7. Reimhursement Limjtations
A. Fringe Benefits

The actual fringe benefit costs may be claimed if supported by an itemized list of the costs, such
as for: Retirement, social security, health and dental insurance, workers’ compensation, etc.. if no
itemization is submitted, twenty one percent of direct salary may be used for computing the fringe
benefit costs.

B. Contract Services

The contract services guidelines in 8.A.(3) shall prevail, except that the reimbursable fee for
. collective bargaining contract services will not exceed $135 per hour. Additionally, annual retainer
fees shall be based on a fee not greater than $135 per hour. The claims that are based on annual
retainers shall contain a certification that the fee is no greater than $135 per hour. Reasonable
expenses will also be paid if identified on the monthly billings of consultants. However, travel
expenses for consultants and experts (including attorneys) hired by the claimant shall not be
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reimbursed in an amount hlgher than that received by state employees as establlshed under Title
2, Division 2, Section 700ff, California Code of Regudations.

C. Travel Expenses

Reimbursement of business and travel expenses is limited to an amount and type of that which
can be claimed by state employees. Refer to Appendix B, State of California, Travel Expense
Guidelines, for current per diem rates.

D. Other Revenue Sources

Any offsetting savings or reimbursement the claimant received from any source including, but not
fimited to, service fees collected, federal funds, and other state funds as a direct result of this
mandate shall be identified and deducted so only net Jocal cost is claimed.

E. "Governing Authority

Salarfes and expenses of the governing authority e.g. the Board of Trustees and Superintendent
of Schools, are not reimbursable as a direct cost. These are costs of general government as
described by the federal guideline “Cost Principles and Procedures for Establishing Cost
Allocation Plans and Indirect Cost Rates for Grants and Contracts with the Federal Government,”
ASMB C-10.

F. Quantify “Increased” Costs

Determination of increased costs for each of these components requires the cost of current year
Rodda Act activities to be offset (reduced) by the cost of the base year Winton Act activities. The
Winton Act base year is generally fiscal year 1974-75,

Winton Act base year costs are adjusted by the Implicit Price Deflator (IPD} prior to offset against
~ the current year Rodda Act costs for claim components, 6.A., 6.B., and 6.C. The IPD shall be
listed in the annual claiming instructions.

Base Year ' Adjustment '
1974-75 1.490 1979-80 FY
1974-75 : 1.560 1980-81 FY
1974-75 1.697 1981-82 FY
1974-75 1.777 1982-83 FY

The cost of a claimant's current year Rodda Act activities are offset (reduced) by the cost of the
base year Winton Act activities either by matching each component when claimants can provide
sufficient documentation to segregate each component of the Winton Act base year activity costs
or, by combining ail three components when claimant cannot satisfactorily segregate each
component of the Winton Act base year costs.

All allowable activity costs for Rodda Act -components, 6.D., 8.E., 6.F., and 6.G., are increased
costs since there were no similar activities required by the Winton Act; therefore no Winton Act
base year offset is to be calculated.

8. Claiming Forms and Instructions

The diagram "Hflustration of Claim Forms” provides a graphic presentation of forms required to be filed
with a claim. A claimant may submit a computer generated report in substitution for forms CB-1 and
CB-2 provided the format of the report and data fields contained within the report are identical to the
claim forms included in this program. The claim forms provided for this program can be duplicated

Revised 4/00 Chapters 961/75 and 1213/91, Page 8 of 11
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and used by the claimant to file estimated or reimbursement claims. The State Controller's Office will
revise the manual and claim forms as necessary.

A. Form CB-2, Compenent/Activity Cost Detail

This form is used to segregate the detailed costs by claim component. A separate form CB-2
must be completed for each cost component being ciaimed. Costs reported on this form must be
supported as follows:

(1)

2

(3)

(4)

Salaries and Benefits

Identify the employee(s) and/or show the classification of each empioyee(s) invelved.
Describe the mandated functions performed by each employee and specify the actual time
spent, the productive hourly rate, and related fringe benefits.

Reimbursement of personnel services includes compensation paid for salaries, wages, and
employee fringe benefits. Employee fringe benefits include regular compensation paid to an
employee during periods of authorized absences {e.g. annual leave, sick leave) and the
employer's contribution to social security, pension plans, insurance, and workers'
compensation insurance. Fringe benefits are eligible for reimbursement when distributed
equitably to all job activities that the employee performs,

Source documents required to be maintained by the claimant may include, but are not limited
to, employee time records that show the employee’s actual time spent on this mandate. The
worksheet used to compute the hourly salary rate must be submitted with your claim. Actual
benefit percent must be itemized. If no itemization is submitted, fwenty one percent (21%)
must be used for computation of claim costs. Identify the classification of employees
committed to functions required under the Winton Act and those required by Chapter 961,
Statutes of 1975.

Materials and Supplies

Only expenditures that can be identified as a direct result of this mandate may be claimed.
List the cost of materials consumed or expended specifically for the purpose of this mandate.
The cost of materials and supplies that are not used exclusively for the mandate is limited to
the pro rata portion used to comply with this mandate. Purchases shali be claimed at the
actual price after deducting cash discounts, rebates, and allowances received by the
claimant, Supplies that are withdrawn from inventory shall be charged based on a recognized
method of costing, consistently applied.

Source documents required to be maintained by the claimant may include, but are not limited
to, invoices, receipts, purchase orders, and other documents evidencing the validity of the
expenditures. '

Confract Services

Show the name(s) of professionals or consultants separately, specify the functions performed
relative to the mandate, length of appointment, and the itemized costs of such services.
Invoices must be submitted as supporting documentation with the claim. The maximum
reimbursable fee for contract services is $135 per hour. Annual retainer fees shall be no
greater than $135 per hour. Reasonable expenses will also be paid as identified on the
monthly billings of consultants.

Source documents required to be maintained by the claimant may include, but are not limited
to, contracts, invoices, and other documents evidencing the validity of the expenditures.

Travel

Travel expenses for mileage, per diem, lodging, and other employee entitlements are
reimbursable in accordance with the rules of the local jurisdiction. Give the name(s) of the
traveler(s), purpose of fravel, inclusive dates, destination points, and costs.

Revised 4/00 Chapters 961/75 and 1213/91, Page 9 of 11
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Source documents may include, but are not limited to, employee travel expense claims,
receipts and other documents evidencing the travel expenses.

For audit purposes all supporting documents must be retained for a period of two years after the
end of the calendar year in which the reimbursement claim was filed or last amended, whichever
is fater. Such documents shall be made available to the State Controller's Office on request.

B. Form CB-1, Claim Summary

This form is used to summarize direct costs by cost component and compute allowable indirect
costs for the mandate. The direct costs summarized on this form are derived from form CB-2 and
carried forward to form FAM-27. ' .

Scheol districts and county offices of education may compute the amount of indirect costs utilizing
the State Department of Education’s Annual Program Cost Data Repert J-380 or J-580 rate, as
applicable. Community college districts must use one of the following three alternatives: A
federally approved rate hased on OMB Circular A-21; the State Controller's FAM-29C that utilizes
CCFS-311.

C. Form FAM-27, Claim for Payment

This form contains a certification that must be signed by an authorized officer of the school
district. All applicable information from form CB-1 must be carried forward to this form in order for
the State Controller's Office to process the claim for payment.

- Revised 4/00 Chapters 961/75 and 1213/91, Page 10 of 11
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illustration of Forms

Form CB-2, Component/Activity Cost Detail
Compiele a separate form CB-2 for each cost component claimed.

A.  Dstermining Bargalning Units and Exclusive Representation

[ (1) Bargaining Unit Lists
! (2) PERB Hearings
[ {3) Substitutes
[ : . {4) Travel Costs
{6) Transcripts

Form CB-2 B. Election of Unit Representation
Component/Activity L (1) Precinet Voting List
Cost Detail - (2) Ballot Tally Observers

| C. Cost of Negotiations

(1) Representative's Contract Proposal

(2) Public Hearings

{3y Public Distiibution of Proposed Contract
(4) District Contract Proposal -

(5) Negotiation

{8) Public Distribution of Final Contract

D. Impasse Proceedings
Form CB-1
. (1) Mediation
Claim Summary {2) Fact Finding
E. Collective Bargaining Agreement Disclosure
(1} Prepare Disclosure Forms and Documents
(2) Distribute Forms and Documents
{3y Copy Forms and Documents
{4y Train Employer's Parsonngl
FAM-27 {5) Purchase Necessary Supplies
Claim ‘ F. Contract Administration
for Payment (1) Training Sessions
(2) Grievances

(3) Contract Disputes Presented to PERB
(4) Appeal of a PERB Ruling

G. Unfair Labor Practice Charges

{1} Unfair Labor Practice Presented to PERB
(2} Appeal of a PERB Ruling

Revised 4/00 Chapters 961/75 and 1213/91, Page 11 of 11






Adopted: October 22, 1980

Amendments Adopted: 8/19/8 1
(Amendments applicable only to claims for costs incurred
after June 30, 1981)

Amended: 3/17/83

Amended: 9/29/83

Amended: 12/15/83

Amended: 6/27/85

Amended: 10120188

Amended: 7122193

Amended: 8/20/98

Amended: 1/27/00
f\mandates/1998/pga/pga-12/pgfinal.doc
Document Date: December 1, 1999

PROPOSED AMENDMENT
TO
CONSOLIDATED PARAMETERS AND GUIDELINES

Chapter 961, Statutes of 1975
Chapter 1213, Statutes of 1991

Collective  Bargaining
and
Collective Bargaining Agreement Disclosure

An act to repeal Article 5 (commencing with Section 13080) of Chapter 1 of Division 10 of the
Education Code, and to add Chapter 10.7 (commencing with Section 3540) to Division 4 of
Title 1 of the Government Code, relating to public educational employment relations, and
malting an appropriation. This bill, which was operative July 1, 1976, repealed the Winton Act
and enacted provisions to meet and negotiate, thereby creating a collective bargaining
atmosphere for public school employers. Chapter 1213, Statutes of 1991 added section 3547.5 to
the Government Code. Government Code section 3547.5 requires school districts to publicly
disclose major provisions of a collective bargaining agreement after negotiations, but before the
agreement becomes binding.

A. Operative Date of Mandate

The provisions relating to the creation, certain duties of, and appropriations for the
Public Employment Relations Board were operative on January 1, 1976. The
provisions telating to the organizational rights of employees, the representational rights
of employee organizations, the recognition of exclusive representatives, and related

. procedures were operative on April 1, 1976, The balance of the added provisions were
operafive on July 1, 1976,
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The provisions relating fo Collective Bargaining Agreement Disclosure added by Chapter
1213, Statutes of 1991 were operative on January 1, 1992, The California Department of
Education issued Management Advisory 92-O 1 dated May 15, 1992, to establish the

public disclosure format for school district compliance with the test claim statute.

Period of Claim

Only costs incurred after January 1, 1978 may be claimed. The initial claim should
have included all costs incurred for that portion of the fiscal year from January 1,
1978, to June 30, 1978.

Pursuant to language included in the 1980-81 budget, claims shall no longer be
accepted for this period. All subsequent fiscal year claims should be filed with the
State Controller’s Office for processing.

The test claim on Chapter 12 13, Statutes of 199 1 was filed with the Commission on
December 29, 1997. Accordingly, the period of reimbursement for the provisions
relating to disclosure begins July 1, 1996. Only disclosure costs incurred after July 1,
1996 may be claimed.

Mandated Cost

Public school employers have incurted costs by complying with the 1'equi1'2:ments of
Section 3540 through 3549.1 established by Chapter 961, Statutes of 1975. In
addition, some costs have been incurred as a result of compliance with regulations
promulgated by the Public Employment Relations Board (PERB). Since these activity
costs (referred fo collectively as “Rodda Act” activities and costs in this document), in
many respects, simply implement the original legislation, it is intended that these
parameters and guidelines have embodied those regulations or actions taken by PERB
prior to December 3 1, 1978.

County Superintendent of Schools Filing

If the County Superintendent of Schools files a claim on behalf of more than one school
district, the costs of the individual school district must be shown separately.

Governing  Authority

The costs for salaries and expenses of the governing authority, for example the School
Superintendent and Governing Board, are not reimbursable. These are costs of general
government as described by the federal guideline entitled “Cost Principles and
Procedures for Establishing Cost Allocation Plans and Indirect Cost Rates for Grants
and Contracts with the Federal Government, " ASMB C-[ 0.



F. Certification
The following certification must accompany all claims:

IDOHEREBY CERTIFY:

THAT Section 1090 to 1096, inclusive, of the Government Code and
other applicable provisions of the law have been complied with; and

THAT I am the person authorized by the local agency to file claim for funds
with the State of California.

Signature of Authorized Representative

Date
Title
Telephone  Number
G. Claim Components (Reimbursable Costs)

Reimbursable activities mandated by Chapter 961, Statutes of 1975 and Chapter 12 13,
Statutes of 1991 are grouped into seven components, G1 through G7. The cost of
activities grouped in components Gl , G2, and G3 are subject to offset by the histotic
cost of similar Winton Act activities as described in H2.

1. Determination of appropriate bargaining units for representation and
determination of the exclusive representatives.

a. Unit Determination: Explain the process for determining the composition
of the cettificated employee council under the Winton Act, and the
process for determining appropriate bargaining units including the
defermination of management, supervisory and confidential employees,
under Chapter 961, Statutes of 1975, if such activities were performed
during the fiscal year being claimed.

b. Determination of the Exclusive Repiesentative: Costs may include
receipt and posting of the representation and decertification notices and,
if necessary, adjudication of such matters before the PERB.




C. Show the actual increased costs including salaries and benefits for
employer representatives andfor necessary costs for contracted services
for the following functions:

1

@)

()

)

)

(6)

Development of proposed lists for unit determination hearings if
done during the fiscal year being claimed. Salaries and benefits
must be shown as described in Item H3,

Representation of the public school employer at PERB hearings
to determine bargaining units and the exclusive representative.
Actual preparation time will be reimbursed. Salaries and benefits
must be shown as described in Item H3.

If contracted services are used for either (a) or (b) above,
contract invoices must be submitted with the claim. Contract
costs must be shown as described in Item HS.

Indicate the cost of substitutes for release time for employer and
exclusive bargaining unit witnesses who testify at PERB
heatings. The job classification of the witnesses and the date
they were absent must also be submitted. Release time for
employee witnesses asked to attend the PERB hearing by
bargaining units will not be reimbursed.

Identify the fravel costs for employer representatives to any
PERB hearing. Reimbursement shall reflect the rate specified by
the regulations governing employees of the local public school
employer.

Cost of preparation for one ftranscript per PERB hearing will be
reimbursed.

Elections and decertification elections of unit representatives are reimbursable in
the event the Public Employment Relations Board determines that a question of
representation exists and orders an election held by secret ballot.

a. Submit with your claim any Public Employment Relations Board
agreements or orders which state how the election must be held.

b. If a precinct voting list was required by PERB, indicate the cost of its
development, Salaries and benefits must be shown as described in Item

H3.

C. The salary and benefits of a school employer representative, if required
by PERB for time spent observing the counting of ballots, will be
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reimbursed. The representatives’ salary must be shown as described in
Item H3.

Negotiations : Reimbursable functions include -- receipt of exclusive
representative’s initial contract proposal, holding of public hearings, providing a
reasonable number of copies of the employer’s proposed contract to the public,
development and presentation of the initial district contract proposal, negotiation
of the contract, reproduction and distribution of the final contract agreement.

a. Show the costs of salaries and benefits for employer representatives
participating in negotiations. Contracted services will be reimbursed.
Costs for maximum of five public school employer representatives per
unit, per negofiation session will be reimbursed. Salaries and benefits
must be shown as described on Page 7, Item H3.

b. Show the costs of salaries and benefits for employer representatives and
employees participating in negotiation planning sessions. Contracted
services for employer representatives will be reimbursed. Salaries and
benefits must be shown as described in Item H3.

c. Indicate the cost of substitutes for release time of exclusive bargaining
unit representatives  during negotiations. Give the job classification of
the bargaining unit representative that required a substitute and dates the
substitute worked. Substitute costs for a maximum of five
representatives per unit, per negotiation session will be reimbursed. The
salaries of union representatives are not reimbursable.

d. Reasonable costs of reproduction for a copy of the initial contract
proposal and final contract, which is applicable and distributed to each
employer representative (i . e . supervisory, management, confidential) and
a reasonable number of copies for public information will be
reimbursed. Provide detail of costs and/or include invoices. Costs for
copies of a final contract provided to collective bargaining unit members
are not reimbursable.

¢. If contract services are used for a. and/or b. above, confract invoices
must be submitted. Contract costs must be shown as described in Item
H5.

f. A list showing the dates of all negotiation sessions held during the fiscal

year being claimed must be submitted.



4.

Impasse Proceedings

a.

Mediation

(1)

)

)
G
©)

Costs for salaries and benefits for employer representative
personttel are reimbursable. Contracled services will be
reimbursed. Costs for a maximum of five public school
employer representatives per mediation session will be
reimbursed. Salaries and benefits must be shown as described in
Item H3.

Indicate the costs of substitutes for the release time of exclusive
bargaining unit representatives during impasse proceedings. The
job classification of the employee witnesses and the date they
were absent shall be indicated. Costs for a maximum of five
representatives per mediation session will be reimbursed.

Renting of facilities will be reimbursed.
Costs of the mediator will not be reimbursed.
I contract services are used under 1, contract invoices must be

submitted with the claim. Coniract costs must be shown as
described in Item HS.

Facl-finding publication of the findings of the fact-finding panel. (To
the extent fact-finding was required under the Winton Act during
the 1974-75 fiscal year, costs are not reimbursable.)

(D

@

(3)

All costs of the school employer panel representative shall be
reimbursed. Salaries and benefits must be shown as described in
Item H3.

Fifty percent of the costs mutually incurred by the fact-finding
panel shall be reimbursed. This may include substitutes for
release time of witnesses during fact-finding proceedings, and the
rental of facilities required by the panel.

Special costs imposed on the public school employer for the
development of unique data required by a fact-finding panel will
be reimbursed. Describe the special costs and explain why this
data would not have been required by a fact-finding panel under
the Winton Act. Salaries and benefits must be shown as
described in Item H3.



Collective Bargaining Agreement Disclosure

Disclosure of collective bargaining agreement after negotiation and before adoption by
governing body, as required by Governrnent Code section 3547.5 and California State
Department of Education Management Advisory 92-01 (or subsequent replacement),
attached to the amended Parameters and Guidelines, Procedurcs or formats which
exceed those or which duplicate activities required under any other statute or executive
order are not reimbursable under this item.

a. Prepare the disclosure forms and documents, as specified.

b. Distribute a copy of the disclosure forms and documents, to board members,
along with a copy of the proposed agreement, as specified.

C. Make a copy of the disclosure forms and documents and of the proposed
agreement available to the public, prior to the day of the public meeting, as
specified.

d. Training employer’s personnel on preparation of the disclosure forms and

documents, as specified.

€. Supplies and materials necessary to prepare the disclosure forms and
documents, as specified.

For 5. a, b., and c., list the date(s) of the public hearing(s) at which the major provisions
of the agreement were disclosed in accordance with the requirements of Government
Code section 3547.5 and Department of Education Advisory 92-01 (or subsequent
replacement).

Contract administration and adjudication of contract disputes either by
arbitration or litigation. Reimbursable functions include grievances and
administration and enforcement of the contract.

a. Salaries and benefits of employer personnel involved in adjudication of
confract disputes. Coniracted services will be reimbursed. Salaries and
benefits must be shown as described in Item H3.

b. Indicate substitutes necessary for release time of the representatives of an
exclusive bargaining unit during adjudication of contract disputes. The
job classification of the employee witnesses and the dates they were
absent shall also be indicated.

C. Reasonable costs incurred for a reasonable number of training sessions
held for supervisory and management personnel on contract
administration/interpretation of the negotiated confract are reimbursable.
Contract interpretations at staff meetings are not reimbursable.
Personal development and informational programs, ie., classes,
conferences, seminars, workshops, and time spent by employees
attending such meetings are not reimbursable. Similarly, purchases of
books and subscriptions for personal development and information
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purposes ate not reimbursable. Salaries and benefits must be shown as
described in Ttem H3.

d. The cost of one ftranscript per hearing will be reimbursed.

c. Reasonable public school employer costs associated with a contract
dispute which is litigated are reimbursable, as follows:

I Reasonable public school employer costs associated with issues of
contract disputes which are presented befoxe PERB are
reimbursable.

2. Reasonable public school employer cost of litigation as a
defendant in the court suit involving contract disputes may be
reimbursable.

3. Where the public school employer is the plaintiff in a court suit
to appeal a PERB ru ing, costs are reimbursable only if the
public school employer is the prevailing party (after ali appeals,
final judgment).

4, No reimbursement is allowed where the public school employer
has filed action directly with the courts without first submitting
the dispute to PERB, if required.

5. No reimbursement shall be provided for filing of amicus curiae
briefs.
f. Expert witness fees will be reimbursed if the witness 1s called by the

public school employer.

g, Reasonable reproduction costs for copies of a new contract which is
required as a result of a dispute will be reimbursed.

h. If contract services are used under “a” above, copies of contract invoices
must be submitted with your claim. Contract costs must be shown as
described in Item HS.

i. Public school employer’s portion of arbitrators’ fees for adjudicating
grievances, representing 50 % of costs, will be reimbursed.

Unfair labor practice adjudication process and public notice complaints.



a. Show the actual costs for salaries and benefits of employer
representatives.  Services confracted by the public school employer are
reimbursable. Salaties and benefits must be shown as described in Ifem
H3.

b. Indicate cost of substitutes for release time for representatives of
exclusive bargaining units during adjudication of unfair practice charges.

C. The cost of one transcript per PERB hearing will be reimbursed.
d. Reasonable reproduction costs will be reimbursed.
£. Expert witness fees will be reimbursed if the witness is called by the

public school employer.

f. If confract services are used under “a” above, contract invoices must be
submitted. Contract costs must be shown as described in Item HS3.

g. No reimbursement for an appeal of an uvafair labor practice decision
shall be allowed where the Public Employee Relations Board is the
prevailing  patty.

h. No reimbursement for filing of amicus curiae briefs shall be allowed.

H. Supporting Data for Claims--Report Format for Submission of Claim,

I

Description of the Activity: Follow the outline of the claim components. Cost
must be shown separately by component activity. Supply wotkload data
requested as part of the description to support the level of costs claimed. The
selection of appropriate statistics is the responsibility of the claimant.

Quantify “Increased” Costs: Public school employers will be reimbursed for
the “increased costs” incurred as a result of compliance with the mandate.

a. For component activities G1 , G2, and G3:

i Determination of the “increased costs” for each of these three
components requires the costs of current year Rodda Act activities to be
offset [reduced] by the cost of the base-year Winton Act activities. The
Winton Act base-year is generally fiscal year 1974-75.

Winton Act base-year costs are adjusted by the Implicit Price Deflator
priot to offset against the current year Rodda Act costs for these three
components. The Implicit Price Deflator shall be listed in the annual
claiming instructions of the State Controller. :
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2. The cost of a claimant’s current year Rodda Act activitics are offsct
[reduced] by the cost of the base-year Winton Act activities either: by
matching each component, when claimants can provide sufficient
documentation to segregate each component of the Winton Act base-year
activity costs; or, by combining all three components when claimants

cannot satisfactorily segregate each component of Winton Act base-year
costs ,

b. For component activities G4, G6, and G7:

All allowable activity costs for these three Rodda Act components are
“increased costs” since there were no similar activities required by the

Winton Act; therefore, there is no Winton Act base-year offset to be
calculated.

BASE YEAR ADJUSTMENT

1974-1975 1490 1979-80 FY
f 1.560 1980-81 FY
i 1.697 1981-82 FY
" 1777 1982-83 FY
n -1.884 1983-84 TY

Salary and Employees’ Benefits: Show the classification of the employees
involved, amount of time spent, and their howtly rate. The worksheet used to
compute the hourly salary rate must be submitted with your claim. Benefits are
reimbursable. Actual benefit percent must be itemized. If no itemization is
submitted, 2 1 percent must be used for computation of claim costs. Identify the
classification of employees committed to functions requited under the Winton
Act and those required by Chapter 961, Statutes of 1975.

Services and Supplies: Only expenditures which can be identified as a direct
cost as a result of the mandate can be claimed.

Professional and Consultant Services: Separately show the name of
professionals or consultants, specify the functions the consultants performed
relative to the mandate, length of appointment, and the itemized costs for such
services. Invoices must be submitied as supporting documentation with your
claim. The maximum reimbursable fee for contracted services is $100 $135 per
hour. Annual retainer fees shall be no greater than $360 $135 per hour.
Reasonable expenses will also be paid as identified on the monthly billings of
consultants. However, travel expenses for consultants and experts (including
attorneys) hired by the claimant shall not be reimbursed in an amount higher
than that received by State employees, as established under Title 2, Div. 2,
Section 700ff, CAC. '
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Allowable Overhead Cost: School districts must use the Form J-380 (or
subsequent replacement) non-restrictive indirect cost rate provisionally approved
by the California Department of Education.

County Offices of Education must use the Form J-580 (or subsequent
replacement) non-restrictive indirect cost rate provisionally approved by the
California Department of Education.

Community College Districts must use one of the following thiee alternatives:
s A Federally-approved rate based on OMB Circular A-21 ;

The State Controller’s FAM-29C which uses the CCFS-3 11; or

Seven percent (7%).
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0001-000-6100-2000- 295 -00600000- -98-01-064- RECOVERED 369.00
92 6110-295-0001-2000 OPEN MEETINGS CH 641/86 (SCH) 2000/2001

DC982052 More pages. ..
PAYEE NBR: S43060 PGM NBER: 11 FY: 1995/1996

T = AR OVERPAYMENTS

Date: 03/27/2006 Time: 1:31:31 PM
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LRSF086 DIVISION OF ACCOUNTING AND REPORTING 03/27/06
BUREAU OF LOCAL REIMBURSEMENTS 13:31:32
ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE'S COLLECTIONS

PAYEE NBR: S43060 NAME: GAVILAN JT COMM COLL DIST PGM NBR: 11
CHAPTER: 6110-295-0001-1995 PGM: COLLECTIVE BARGAIN CH 961/75 FY: 1995/1996
TO ACL CODE: 0001-000-6100-1995- 295 -00000000~- -98-01-096-~175

ORIGINAL OVERPAYMENT AMT: 126,146.00

NEW OVERPAYMENT BALANCE;

RECOVERY/BLOCKING SOURCE RECOVERY/BLOCKED INDICATOR AMOUNT
PGM NBR CHAPTER RECOVERY SOURCE DESC FY
0001-000-6100-2000- 295 -00000000- -98-01-048- RECOVERED 3,853.00

42 6110-295-0001.-2000 MNDTD REIMB CH 486/75 (SCHOOL) 2000/2001

0001-000-6100-2000- 295 ~00000000~- -98-01-096- RECOVERED ‘40,888.00
11 6110-295-0001-2000 COLLECTIVE BARGAIN CH 961/75 2000/2001
0001-000-6100-1997- 295% -00000000- -98-01-048- RECOVERED : 1,347.00

42 6100-295-0001-1997 MNDTD REIMB CH 486/75 (SCHOOIL) 1997/1998

DC982052 More pages. ..
PAYEE NBER: 543060 PGM NBR: 11 FY: 1995/1996

T = AR OVERPAYMENTS

Date: 03/27/2006 Time: 1:31:34 PM
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LRSFO86 DIVISION OF ACCOUNTING AND REPORTING 03/27/06
' BUREAU OF LOCAL REIMBURSEMENTS 13:31:38
ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE'S COLLECTIONS

PAYEE NBR: S43060 NAME: GAVILAN JT COMM COLL DIST PGM NEBR: 11
CHAPTER: 6110-295-0001-1955 PGM: COLLECTIVE BARGAIN CH 961/75 FY: 1995/1996
TO ACL CODE: (001-000-6100-1995- 295 -00000000- ~-98-01-096-175

ORIGINAL OVERPAYMENT AMT: 126,146,00

NEW OVERPAYMENT BALANCE:

RECOVERY/BLOCKING SOURCE RECOVERY/BLOCKED INDICATOR AMOUNT
PGM NBR CHAPTER RECOVERY SOURCE DESC FY
0001-000-6100-1996~ 285 -00000000- -98-01-048- RECOVERED 9,608.00

42 6100-295-0001-1996 MNDTD REIMB CH 486/75 (SCHOOL)  1996/1997

0001-000-6100-1298- 295 -00000000- ~98-01-048- RECOVERED 2,420.00
42 6110-295-0001-1998 MNDTD REIMB CH 486/75 (SCHOOL) 1998/1999

0001-000-6100-1297~ 295 -00000000- -98-01-0596- RECOVERED 4,808.00
11 6100-295-0001-1997 COLLECTIVE BARGAIN CH 961/75 1997/1998

DC982052 More pages. ..
PAYEE NBR: S43060 PGM NBR: 11 FY: 1995/1996

T = AR COVERPAYMENTS

Date: 03/27/2006 Time: 1:31:40 PM
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LRSF086 DIVISION OF ACCOUNTING AND REPORTING 03/27/06
BUREAU OF LOCAL REIMBURSEMENTS 13:31:42
ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE'S COLLECTIONS

PAYEE NBR: £43060 NAME: GAVILAN JT COMM COLL DIST PGM NBR: 11
CHAPTER: 6110-295-0001-1995 PGM: COLLECTIVE BARGAIN CH 961/75 FY: 1995/1996
TO ACL CODE: 0001-000-6100-1995- 285 ~-00000000~- -98-01-096-175

ORIGINAL OVERPAYMENT AMT: 126,146,000

NEW OVERPAYMENT BALANCE:

RECOVERY/BLOCKING SOURCE RECOVERY/BLOCKED INDICATOR AMOUNT
PGM NBR CHAPTER RECOVERY SOURCE DESC FY
0001-000-6100-1998- 295 -00000000~ -98-01-096- RECOVERED 40,810.00
11 6110-295-0001-19598 COLLECTIVE BARGAIN CH 961/75 1998/1999
0001-000-6100-1998~ 295 -00000000~ -98-01-064- RECOVERED 305.00
92 £110-295-0001-1998 OPEN MEETINGS CH 641/86 (SCH) 1998/1999
0001-000-6100-1998- 285 -00000000- -98-01-048- RECOVERED 3,693.00

42 6110-295-0001-19298 MNDTD REIMB CH 486/75 (SCHOOL) 1998/1999

DC982052 More pages. ..
PAYEE NBR: S43060 PGM NBR: 11 FY: 1995/1996

¥ = AR OVERPAYMENTS

Date: 03/27/2006 Time: 1:31:43 PM
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LRSF086 - DIVISION OF ACCOUNTING AND REPORTING 03/27/06
BUREAU OF LOCAL REIMBURSEMENTS 13:31:47
ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE'S COLLECTIONS

PAYEE NBR: S43060 NAME: GAVILAN JT COMM COLL DIST PGM NBR: 11
CHAPTER: 6110-295-0001-1995 PGM: COLLECTIVE BARGAIN CH 261/75 FY: 1995/1996
TO ACL CODE: 0001-000-6100-1995- 295 -00000000- -98-01-096-175

' ' ORIGINAL OVERPAYMENT AMT: 126,146.00

NEW OVERPAYMENT BALANCE:

RECOVERY/BLOCKING SOURCE RECOVERY/BLOCKED INDICATOR AMOUNT
PGM NBR CHAPTER RECOVERY SOURCE DESC FY
0001-000-6100-1996- 603 -00000000- - - - - RECOVERED 1,124.00

42 6110-295-0001-1995 MNDTD REIMB CH 486/75 (SCHOOL) 1995/1996

0001-000-6100-1996- 603 -00000000- - - - - RECOVERED 379.00
92 6110-295-0001-1995 OPEN MEETINGS CH 641/86 (SCH) 1995/1996

DC982051 Last page...
PAYEE NBR: 543060 PGM NBR: 11 FY: 1995/1996

I. = AR OVERPAYMENTS

Date: 03/27/2006 Time: 1:31:50 PM
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LRSF080 DIVISION OF ACCOUNTING AND REPORTING  03/27/06
BUREAU OF LOCAL REIMBURSEMENTS 13:23:59
PAYMENTS FOR A CLAIM/PAYEE/PROGRAM/FISCAL YEAR '

PAYEE NBR: S43060  PAYEE NAME: GAVILAN JT COMM COLL DIST PGM NBR: 11
CH NBR: 6110-295-0001-1995 PGM: COLLECTIVE BARGAIN CH 961/75 FY: 1995/1996
TOT FYTD PAID AMT: 290,270.00 BAL DUE CLM: .00 PGM TYPE: MAN
FNL APRVD CLM AMT: .00 BAL DUE ST: .00 1ST TIME PGM: N
CL, TYP PMT TYP MAN PAY DT FILED . CLAIM AMT  ADJUSTMENT AMT
APPROVED AMT  FNL APRVD AMT  PRO PCT AMT BEFORE AR  BAL DUE CLAIM
AR OFFSET AMT WARRANT AMT  ISSUE DATE  CLAIM SCHED NBR
A 103 N 00/00/0000 - .00 .00
.00 .00 .00000000 .00 .00
.00 .00 00/00/0000 MA123371
A A02 N 11/25/1996 348,966.00 .00
348,966, 00 73,966.00 .20644583 15,270.00 58,696 .00
.00 15,270.00  01/30/1997 MAG1222A

DC982052 More pages...
PAYEE NBR: 543060 PGM NBR: 11 FY: 1995/1996
F 0= CLMS FOR A PGM/FY PF11= WARRANT INFORMATION PF9= INTEREST PAY INFO

Date: 03/27/2006 Time; 1:24:07 PM
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LRSF080 DIVISION OF ACCOUNTING AND REPORTING 03/27/06
BUREAU OF LOCAL REIMBURSEMENTS 13:24:10
PAYMENTS FOR A CLAIM/PAYEE/PROGRAM/FISCAL YEAR

PAYEE NBR: 543060 PAYEE NAME: GAVILAN JT COMM COLIL DIST PGM NBR: 11
CH NBR: 6110-295-0001-1995 PGM: COLLECTIVE BARGAIN CH 961/75 FY: 1995/1996
TOT FYTD PAID AMT: 290,270.00 BAL DUE CLM: .00 PGM TYPE: MANW
FNI, APRVD CLM AMT;: .00 BAL DUE ST: .00 18T TIME PGM: N
CL TYP PMT TYP MAN PAY DT FILED CLATM AMT ADJUSTMENT 2aMT
APPROVED AMT FNL APRVD AMT PRO PCT AMT BEFORE AR BAL DUE CLAIM
AR CFFSET AMT WARRANT AMT ISSUE DATE CLAIM SCHED NBR
- E EOL N 11/30/1995 275,000.00 ' .00
275,000.00 275,000.00 1.00000000 275,000.00 .00
.00 275,000.00 01/24/1996 MA512278

DC382051 Last page...
PAYEE NBR: 543060 PGM NBR: 11 PY: 1995/1996
F 0= CLMS FOR A PGM/FY PF1l1l= WARRANT INFORMATION PF9= INTEREST PAY INFO
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LRSF081 DIVISION OF ACCOUNTING AND REPORTING 03/27/06
BUREAU OF LOCAL REIMBURSEMENTS 11:42:31
CLAIM ADJUSTMENT DETAIL LIST

PAYEE NBR: CC43060 GAVILAN JOINT COMM COLL DIST
PGM NBR: 232 : COLLECTIVE BARGAINING {CC)
CHAPTER: 961/75 FY: 1995/1996  CLAIMED AMOUNT: 348,966.00
FINAL APRVD DATE: 10/24/2005 TOTAL ADJUSTMENTS AMOUNT : -348,966.00
ADJUSTMENT LETTER DATE: 00/00/0000 FINAL APRVD CLAIM AMT: 0.00
ADJ DATE FNL APR DATE LTR DATE TYPE ADJUSTOR AMOUNT
TREASON
10/24/2005 10/24/2005  00/00/0000 D  COACNNA ~184,842.00

NO SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION

08/10/2004 10/24/2005 00/00/0000 D COACEML -164,124.00
PRIOR PYMT TO/FR ANOTHER PGM :

PROJECTED APPROVED AMOUNT=> 164,124,.00

DC982051 Last page...
PAYEE NBR: CC43060 PGM NBR: 232 FY: 1995/1996

I "= ADD ADJ PF5= MODIFY ADJ PFé6= DELETE ADJ PF10= CLMS FOR A PGM/FY .

ate: 03/27/2006 Time: 11:42:41 AM
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p faiyieusly detected.

Thank you for choosing Webroot Softwarel

Software Download and Installation Instructions for Spy Sweeper 3-User Pack

You must use the key code below to install Spy Sweeper 3-User Pack on multiple PCs. The key code s
valid for 3 installations.

S3GB-ONLN-AADI-GZZU-PARL

Step 1: Close Spy Sweeper if you have a version running.

Step 2: Determine which operating system you are currently using:

Slep 2A: If you are using Windows XP or Vista, click here to siart the download.

hitp:/fsales.webrool comdownloads/registeredilinkslen/SpySweeperRegSetup_1.exa
Step 2B: If you are using Windows 2000, click here {o start tha download.

htip:fsales. webroot comfdownloadsiregisteredilinksfen/SpySweeper5SRegSetup 1.exe

For security feasons, all download links will expire in 72 hours.
Siep 3: When prompled, select Save and make note of where the file is saved to your computer.

Step 4: Locate the file you saved on the deskiop or in the location you specified and double-click the file
to start the installation.

Step 5: When prompled, enter your key code:

SSGB-ONLN-AADLGZZU-PARL

Step 6: Continue to follew the instructions as they appear.
Siep 7: Repeat thesa instructions when installing Spy Sweeper 3-User Pack on your other PCs.

Installation Tips and Troubleshooting

Need more halp? See our Install Guide at:

hitp:iiveebroot.custhelp.com

For securily reasons, the download link witl expire in 72 hours. If you need a replacement link after that
time, ses the Webroot Support page at: hitp/Avww . webroot comicompanylsupporl/

if you have trouble clicking on the download link, cut and paste or type the web site address directly into
your browser address bas. The web site address is case sensitive; make sure you use lower-case lefters
or the link will not work.

When entering your key code during instaliation, you can use cut and paste by using your mouse to
highlight the full key code, select Copy from the Edit menw. When prompted for the key code, place your
cursor in the first key code entry box and select Paste from the Edit menu. Your key code uniquely
identifies your product installation, protecting your sofivare and enabling you to access future product
updates more convenientiy.

Free Scan Customers

After installing Spy Sweeper, parform a full sweep of your PC to disable spyware that the Free Scan
previously detected.

Your Key Code

Your key code uniquely identifies your product installation, protecting your software and enabling you to

https:/iiwww, L(jebl‘oot.corm’slmppingcart/gf:tsoftwarewb.php
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access future product updates more conveniently. We do not use it for any other purpose than to register
your product with us.

Note: Spy Sweeper 3-User Pack customers wil use the same key code for each installation. The key
code is valid up to three installations.

Usage License

You have purchased one or more licensed copies of Spy Sweeper. You have the right to use and install
one licensed copy per computer. For more details, please read the full license agresment included with
the installation program displayed during setup.

Thanks again. Please fee! free to contact us if there's anything else we can do 1o support your ongoing
need for enhanced privacy, performance and peace of mind.

The Webroot Team
Webroot Software, Inc.

hitphrarer wigbrool.ecom

Page 2
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Tot§ l $29.95

:1onal Product Information:
efender Antivirus 2009(3 PCs, 1 year) - Thank you for choosing BitDefender Antivirus 2009.
il discover a product which w1Il increase your compuiet's security while still being simple to use.

?
sBltDefendm Antivirus 2009 download link :

http //download bitdefender.com/windows/installer/en/bitdefender_antivirus.exe

. T e foHowmg guide will explain:

,:. ;

i How to install and register the ploduct

¥

3

ow to configure the virus protection
Vho to call when you need assistance.

' ]%’OW to update the product and virus signatures

{OTE: Store this e-mail and the purchase confirmation message in a safe place where they can be

Juegd

retri -!ij/ed even after a computer failure. We recommend printing or storing them on read-only media like

L

CD+d 7Y0u‘1£ need this information for reference and for:

il
| i

P1 ioduct mstallatton

) Reg1st1at1on

http://kb.bitdefender.com/KB454-en--Registering-BitDefender-2009.html

‘ Updates

effectwely protect your computer, it is essential to keep your antivirus up to date. By default,
efendm is configured to update automatically. To learn about advanced update options, read the
ng article:

’ttD //kb.bitdefender.com/KB446-en--Updating-BitDefender-2009.html

LIVG Assistance!

! i http:/www.bitdefender.com/site/Live-Assistance.html
Ema:l Technical Assistance:

Jppgn@bltdefendel .com

Email Commelcial Assistance

!
E Pt
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hitp {;[us.mg203.mail.yaho0.com/dc/launch?.partnerbc&.rand=6sip1‘jmj6g01'd 3/22/2009
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Receipt |

h1er Receipt

kéaep this for your records.

| 1i1e: March 22, 2009 10:09 PM
#: E000016713840

i
fiption Price

i

Quantit :
y :

i
eeper 3-User %

‘efrupted Protection

§ t Software will conveniently protect your PC from ongoing security threats by automatically renewing your subscription at
disrd subscription renewal price plus applicable tax. You're always In control as you will be notiffed by e-mail before the
oit of your subscription to confirm your renewal and provide you with cancellation optiens. When you purchase your
: ! ition, you authorize Webroot to use the contact and biiling Information you provide to automatically renew your subscription.
If youddo not want to be automatically renewed, you may discontinue this service at any time. For additional information on auto
al and cancellation options click here.

t

Name ;,ghawn Sliva
il:k3labs@att. net

Billing;l_nfarmatton

I P.Q. Box 808
[Dorado
Province: California
Zip/Pos Eal Code: 95623

Countéy: UNITED STATES

;
|

 Webroot  Partners  Press Room  Contact Us  Sitemap  PRIVACY  Legal

Copyright 2009 Webroot Software, Inc.

htips:/fwany, \L ebroot.convshoppingeart/receipt.php

i
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lespitdefender

My BitDefender | ContactUs | Forum

All CountriesRegions v {Search| 6o

o e,

' .
. Company Defense Center Downloads Solutions Support Partners s
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Bilting >> Shipping >> Varify Order >> Order Completed >>

= Prind ,

-Order Date: 3/21/2009

Order Number: 5000520014
‘Merchant of Record: Digital River

Digital River, Inc.
9625 West 76¢h Street
Eden Prairie, MN
55344

us

Billing Address;

Shawn Silva

P.Q. Box 8086-

EL DORADQ, CA 95623
us

-1 BitDefenderAntivimszﬂog(:i PCs, 1 year) $20.95 $29.95 0%

Electronic Download

Sub-Tota! $29.95
Tax $0.00

/<97 #:,é WIS IR ENIWERSL Totl  $2096

i

Print

E—commérce services are plovided by Digital River Inc., a(n} BitDefendsr, LLC. e-commerce reseller. Privacy Policy Terms and
Conditions

" Virue Scanner | Company  Broducts  Support  Parinership  PuyNow  Forum
SiteMap Site Feedback Global Sites Privacy Policy Legal Terms

All Rigiits Reserved. Copyright {c} 2009 BYTDEFENDER

’

i_f_alriver.com/DRHM/servlet/ControllerServlet?Action=DisplaylnvoicePage&SiteID=defender&Local... 3/21/2009 1:13:35 PM

hitps://store.qi
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Frm : bitdefender.uk.cs@digitalriver.com (bitdefender.uk.cs@digitalriver.com)
To: llabs@att net

Dat : Saturday, March 21, 2009 1:11:53 PM

Sub ;:ct BitDefender, LLC. - Order Confirmation (Order #5000520014)

Dea fShawn Silva,
Tha d{ you for ordering from BitDefender, LLC. on March 21, 2009. The following email is a summary
of y ‘ur order, Please use this as your proof of purchase. If you paid by credit card, please look for

bitds fendel com on your credit card billing statement.
i

Not 'i If your 01del contams download p1oducts you can compkete the download by fooking up your

Ord &Date Mal 21,2009 3:11:32 PM

Shatin Silva
PQ&%X%S

EL ]?ORADO CA 95623

(914)445-1073

3lab~“@att net-

‘i
Sllip ping Address:
POk Box 808

EL ];DORADO CA 95623

Plouct SKU: ML11011003-EN

Pm]uct Name; BitDefender Antivirus 2009(3 PCs, | year)
Qty Prdered: 1

Amdunt: $29.95

Licd Jpse Key: 6D7B9E7393F3EBI0OE8S6

£,

1
A
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http /uo mg203.mail.yahoo.com/dc/launch?.pariner=sbc&.rand=6siprjmj6g0rd 3/22/2009
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Visit Our Website @
www.sacpetsearch.com

CITY oF SACRAMENTO

ANIMAL CARFE SERVICES
2127 Front Street Sacramento, CA 95818
Ph: 916 808 - 7387 fFax 916 - 808 53846

MICROCHIP # [ "_'|!@.T,';'JL[;’M'!*'{,';'J'"_" J

" Thank you for microchipping your pett In conjunction with AVID, yourinformatjon wi’[l_
be registered in the national Microchip Express database.

You can access and updoié your'microchip regisfrc;tion free-of-charge in 2 ways: -

+ Via the Internef at hitp:/ /www microchlpexpress com

+ Cail Clh/ of SocramenTo Ammol Care Serwces at (916) 808 7387 -

When you fog.into your account, you.can do the fo[iowmg

+ Update your address and phone number(s)
+ Add an emall.address, oh‘emo’re con‘rocTs veterinary. rnformehon & even a digital phofo of your pef

6, 3 ' Step 1 -~ Go to hﬁp //www mlcrochpexpress com

YU
G "i : Srep 2 — tnter your 9- CIIQET A\/ID m|crochlp number (no hyphens or spaces)
Step 3 -- Enter your last name (in lower case) as ’rhe password

Step 4 — Edi’f and submif your changes

Il!’\!![’l”!;'ﬂ'i*zzfz*nag 3 »HQWTGCHANGEYOURPASSWOR&

_' Once youlog info your account, we recommend that you chonge the possword To make this
change; go to the section titled “Registered Owner Information” and click on MAKE CHANGES,

‘. : : |



